THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY
PROCUREMENT DEPARTMENT
75 North Pace Blvd.
Pensacola, FL 32505

RFP/BID AWARD NOTICE

DATE:
February 11, 2025

RFP TITLE & REFERENCE:
Food Processing: USDA Commodities
RFP #250502

DESCRIPTION OF PURCHASE:

An annual agreement to provide processing of USDA commodity items into ready to use products for
use in preparation of school meals as stocked and distributed by the Central Warehouse for school
cafeterias throughout the District. Responders meeting specifications with the aggregate low price for
the commodity/lot were awarded in each area. Fifty (50) items were offered and thirty-five (35) items
are recommended for award. Fifteen (15) items were not awarded due to no responses being
received or sample products were not approved in taste tests. Iltems will be purchased as needed
to meet breakfast and lunch menu requirements. Recommend RFP award(s) to the lowest
responder(s) meeting specifications.

Effective Dates: July 1, 2025 through June 30, 2026

REQUESTED BY:

Food Services

SUPPLIER NAME:

Brookwood Farms Inc, Siler City, NC
Del Monte Foods, Walnut Creek, CA
Don Lee Farms, Inglewood, CA
Gold Creek Foods, Gainesville, GA
Hormel, Sales Austin, MN

JTM Provisions, Harrison, OH

Land O' Lakes, Arden Hills, MN
Nardone Bros, Hanover Township, PA
Rich Chicks, Gardena, CA

Tyson, Springdale, AR

ITEMS AWARDED: ESTIMATED ANNUAL EXPENDITURE:

$ 16,500.00
638,784.00
420,735.00

47,010.00
388,575.00
195,405.00
301,384.00
520,995.00

50,972.00

709,693.00

O NNPE,AONMNDW-=-

AMOUNT OF PURCHASE:
$3,290,053.00 Est. / Yr.

FUNDING SOURCE:
Food Services Fund (4110)

METHOD OF PROCUREMENT:

ECSD RFP

Responses Received: 20 Responses Rejected: 0

DATE AND TIME POSTED:

February 11, 2025, 2:10 p.m. Central Time

9500PUR101 (11/10) Retention - 5 Years




DATE: February 11, 2025
RFP NBR: 250502
RFP TITLE: Food Processing: USDA Commodities

Item No.

Vendor

THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY
PROCUREMENT DEPARTMENT
75 NORTH PACE BOULEVARD
PENSACOLA, FLORIDA 32505

RFP TABULATION

Albie's Food

Bongards,

Awarded Items are highlighted

Brookwood Farms

Del Monte Foods

Chicken, 8-Piece,

Products, LLC,
Gaylord, MI

Chanhassen, MN

Inc, Siler City, NC

Butterball, Garner,
NC

Inc, Walnut Creek,
CA

ES Foods,
Woodbury, NY

Foster Poultry
Farms, LLC,
Livingston, CA

Gold Creek Foods,
LLC, Gainesville,
GA

Don Lee Farms,
Inglewood, CA

Hormel Food Sales,
LLC, Austin, MN

Breaded (0516550)
Brand:

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Commodity Code#:

Portion Size:

Portions / Case:

Case Size:

Fee For Service /

Case:
Total Price / Portion

(Includes DF $
Value):
Chicken, 8-Piece,

No Bid

Roasted (0516540)
Brand:

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Commodity Code#:

Portion Size:

Portions / Case:

Case Size:

Fee For Service /

Case:
Total Price / Portion

(Includes DF $
Value):
Chicken,
Drumstick, Roasted

(NEW ITEM, NO ID
NUMBER)
Brand:

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

LY, MY, SU

No Bid

No Bid

Commodity Code#:

Gold Creek

Portion Size:

100103

Portions / Case:

3.150z.

Case Size:

163

Fee For Service /

8/ 41b

Case:
Total Price / Portion

68.80 / Serving
422 | Case

(Includes DF $
Value):
Chicken, Thigh,

.857

Roasted (NEW
ITEM, NO ID
NUMBER) -

DELETED
Brand:

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

SU, MY, LY

No Bid

No Bid

Commodity Code#:

Gold Creek

Portion Size:

100103

Portions / Case:

3.71 oz.

Case Size:

138

Fee For Service /

Case:
Total Price / Portion

8/ 41lb
65.28 / Case
473 | Serving

(Includes DF $
Value):
Chicken Filet,

.987

Whole Muscle,

Small, Breaded

(0516580)
Brand:

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

AU, MY, LY

No Bid

No Bid

Commodity Code#:

Gold Creek

Portion Size:

100103

Portions / Case:

20z

Case Size:

256

Fee For Service /
Case:

8/41b

Total Price / Portion

64.32 / Serving
.251 | Case

(Includes DF $

Value):

443




Item

Albie's Food Products,

Bongards,

Brookwood Farms

Del Monte Foods

ES Foods,

Foster Poultry

Gold Creek Foods,

Don Lee Farms,

Hormel Food Sales,

No. Vendor LLC, Gaylord, MI Chanhassen, |, “sier City, NC Butterball, Garner, NC Inc, Walnut Creek, | \yoodbury, NY Lf\z;";:h')"';% A | LLC, Gainesville, GA | Inglewood, CA LLC, Austin, MN
Chicken Breast Filets, Whole Muscle, . . . . . . . . .
6 Breaded (0516930) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid MY, LY No Bid No Bid
Brand: Gold Creek
Commodity Code#: 100103
Portion Size: 4 oz.
Portions / Case: 128
Case Size: 8/4lb
. . .498 |/ Serving
Fee For Service / Case: 63.68 / Case
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): .866
Chicken Breast Filet, Hot and Spicy, Whole . . . . . . . . .
7 Muscle, Breaded (0516620) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid MY, LY No Bid No Bid
Brand: Gold Creek
Commodity Code#: 100103
Portion Size: 4 oz.
Portions / Case: 128
Case Size: 8/41lb
. X .456 / Serving
Fee For Service / Case: 58.40 | Case
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): .825
g | Chicken Te“de's('o‘g‘qhs‘:go';”““'e' Breaded No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid AU, MY, LY No Bid No Bid
Brand: Gold Creek
Commodity Code#: 100103
Portion Size: 4.5 oz. - 3 Tenders
Portions / Case: 113
Case Size: 8/41lb
i : 58.88 / Serving
Fee For Service / Case: .521 | Case
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): 939
9 Popcorn Chi?:"g;‘é;:.,%‘;"k' Breaded No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid AU, MY AU, MY, LY No Bid No Bid
Brand: Foster Farms Gold Creek
Commodity Code#: 100103W 100103
Portion Size: 10 pcs. 12-.25 oz. pcs.
Portions / Case: 112 170
Case Size: 6/5lb 8/4lb
: . 48.96 / Serving
Fee For Service / Case: 51.31 288 / Case
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): .82 .505
10 | Popcorn Chicken, Spicy, Breaded (0516880) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand:
Commodity Code#:
Portion Size:
Portions / Case:
Case Size:

Fee For Service / Case:

Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value):




Item Albie's Food Pr Bongards, g 0\ wood Farm Del Monte Foods ESF Foster Poultry Id Creek F Don Lee Farms, | Hormel F I
o, Vendor bfLsc, Z‘Zﬁuorﬁf’i’ﬁts’ ChanBassen, Ine, Siler (c:litya, NG | Butterball, Garner, NC | Inc, W""g‘;\‘ Creek, Woidlfuor;shv  Farms, LLC, L?.%,d éiiisviﬁz?(s;k Isgle:vio:, cA | LLC A::t?n,s:n:ls,
ivingston, CA
11 | Chicken B’fg::;gg)' ‘_"g‘é’l'_%."r"é‘gc'e' Grilled No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid AU, MY, LY No Bid No Bid
Brand: Gold Creek
Commodity Code#: 100103
Portion Size: 3 oz.
Portions / Case: 170
Case Size: 8/41lb
. .555/ Servin
Fee For Service / Case: 94,40/ Casg
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): 923
12 | Garlic B:::Zlﬁh&ke‘:lz"&a;:’gr;o‘;v’ Moz. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand:
Commodity Code#:
Portion Size:
Portions / Case:
Case Size:
Fee For Service / Case:
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value):
13 Chicken Fajita Strips (0516690) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid MY, LY No Bid No Bid
Brand: Gold Creek
Commodity Code#: 100103
Portion Size: 2.14 oz.
Portions / Case: 239
Case Size: 8/41lb
. .266 / Servin
Fee For Service / Case: 63.52/ Caseg
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): .630
14 Beef, Mini Burgers (0515190) - DELETED No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand:
Commodity Code#:
Portion Size:
Portions / Case:
Case Size:
Fee For Service / Case:
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value):
15 Beef Crumbles (0516970) AU No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid MY No Bid
Brand: Albie's Don Lee Farms
Commodity Code#: 100154 100154
Portion Size: 4/5Ibs 291/2.20 oz.
Portions / Case:
Case Size: 8/10 4/10 Ib.
Fee For Service / Case: 46.00 83.20
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): 1.08 .6297




Item Albie's Food Pr Bongards, g 0\ wood Farm Del Monte Foods ESF Foster Poultry Id Creek F Don Lee Farms, | Hormel F I
o, Vendor bfLsc, Z‘Zﬁuorﬁf’i’ﬁts’ ChanBassen, Ine, Siler (c:litya, NG | Butterball, Garner, NC | Inc, W""g‘;\‘ Creek, Woidlfuor;shv  Farms, LLC, L?.%,d éiiisviﬁz?(s;k Isgle:vio:, cA | LLC A::t?n,s:n:ls,
ivingston, CA
16 | Beef Taco Meat, Reduced Sodium (0516170) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand:
Commodity Code#:
Portion Size:
Portions / Case:
Case Size:
Fee For Service / Case:
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value):
17 Beef Meatballs (0516190) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid MY No Bid
Brand: Don Lee Farms
Commodity Code#: 100154
Portion Size: 2.000z. / 4-0.50
oz.
Portions / Case: 240/2.00 oz.
Case Size: 1
Fee For Service / Case: 63.00
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): .7006
18 Ground Beef Patties (0516115) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid MY No Bid
Brand: Don Lee Farms
Commodity Code#: 100154
Portion Size: 2.50 oz.
Portions / Case: 200
Case Size: 1
Fee For Service / Case: 60.31
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): 719
19 Frankfurters, Turkey (0516070) No Bid No Bid No Bid AU No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid MY
Brand: Butterball / Butterball LLC Jennie-O
Commodity Code#: 100124W / 100124D 612620
Portion Size: 2o0z. 2 oz.
Portions / Case: 160 160
Case Size: 1 4
Fee For Service / Case: 29.78 39.33
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): .3855 .4487
20 Pepperoni, Turkey, Sliced (0512140) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid MY
Brand: Jennie-O
Commodity Code#: 213008
Portion Size: 1.37 oz.
Portions / Case: 233
Case Size: 8
4.34/1b
Fee For Service / Case: or
86.80
.5098

Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value):




Item Albie's Food Pr Bongards, g 0\ wood Farm Del Monte Foods ESF Foster Poultry Id Creek F Don Lee Farms, | Hormel F I
o, Vendor bfLsc, ?;Zf,umﬁf’k’nfts’ ChanBassen, Ine, Siler (c:litya, NG | Butterball, Garner, NC | Inc, Wa'g‘l‘\‘ Creek, Woidlfuor;shv  Farms, LLC, L?.%,d éiiisviﬁz?(s;k Isglevevio:, cA | LLC A::t?n,s:n:ls,
ivingston, CA
21 Turkey Sausage, Patty (0516210) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid MY
Brand: Butterball Jennie-O
Commodity Code#: 100124D 613203
Portion Size: 1.41 oz. 1.025 oz.
Portions / Case: 226 160
Case Size: 1 2
Fee For Service / Case: 36.59 28.74
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): .3116 .2761
21 Turkey Sausage, Patty (0516210) No Bid No Bid No Bid See Above No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid M
Brand: Jennie-O
Commodity Code#: 613810
Portion Size: 1.17 oz.
Portions / Case: 137
Case Size: 2
Fee For Service / Case: 28.69
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): .3357
22 Sausage Link, Turkey (0516200) No Bid No Bid No Bid AU No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid MY
Brand: Butterball Jennie-O
Commodity Code#: 100124D 614003
Portion Size: 1.41 0z. 1.025 oz.
Portions / Case: 226 160
Case Size: 1 2
Fee For Service / Case: 36.59 29.56
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): .3116 .2812
23 Turkey (0516312) No Bid No Bid No Bid AU No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid My
Brand: Butterball Jennie-O
Commodity Code#: 100124W 878403
Portion Size: 3.35 0z. 2.93 oz.
Portions / Case: 114 219
Case Size: 12 9
3.96/1b
Fee For Service / Case: 78.40 or
158.88
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): 1.0247 .9545
24 | Turkey Ham, Deli Style, Pre-Sliced (0516220) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid MY
Brand: Butterball Jennie-O
Commodity Code#: 100124D 256503
Portion Size: 3.58 oz. 3.06 oz.
Portions / Case: 80 62
Case Size: 12 12
Fee For Service / Case: 42.33 27.48
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): .8531 7742
25 | Roast Turkey B'e(:;‘ig;'é)s‘y'e' Pre-Sliced No Bid No Bid No Bid AU* No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid MY
Brand: Butterball Jennie-O
Commodity Code#: 100124W 209918
Portion Size: 3.35 0z. 3 oz.
Portions / Case: 114 96
Case Size: 12 12
Fee For Service / Case: 68.53 47.85
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): .9250 7575




Item Albie's Food Pr Bongards, g 0\ wood Farm Del Monte Foods ESF Foster Poultry Id Creek F Don Lee Farms, | Hormel F I
o Vendor bfLsc, %Zf,uorﬁf’khfts‘ ChanBassen, Ine, Siler (c:litya, NG | Butterball, Garner, NC | Inc, Wa'g‘l‘\‘ Creek, Woidlfuorg:,shv  Farms, LLC, L?.%,d éiiisviﬁz,dts;k I:gle:vio:, cA | LLC A::t‘i’n,s:n;s,
ivingston, CA
26 Turkey Breast Sticks (0517710) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid MY
Brand: Jennie-O
Commodity Code#: 136374
Portion Size: 1.2 oz.
Portions / Case: 200
Case Size: 200
Fee For Service / Case: 103.38
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): .6397
27 Bacon, Turkey (0517540) No Bid No Bid No Bid AU No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid MY
Brand: Butterball Jennie-O
Commodity Code#: 100124D / 100124W 271106
Portion Size: 1.43 oz. 12/0.625 Ib
Portions / Case:
Case Size: 4/ 6lbs 12
Fee For Service / Case: 34.74 87.30
. . .8132/ Portion
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): .2817 1626 / Slice
28 Pork, BBQ, Shredded (0516940) No Bid No Bid MYy No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand: Brookwood Farms
Commodity Code#: 100193
Portion Size: 51b
Portions / Case:
Case Size: 4
Fee For Service / Case: 33.00
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): 0.815
29 Macgr.;’(;‘i'u?:,‘,dvﬁ:eé:;}, R;gg%.';g(‘)’o';ed' No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid MY, LY No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand: ES Foods
Commodity Code#: 110242
Portion Size: 6 oz.
Portions / Case: 80
Case Size: 6/51Ib
Fee For Service / Case: 45.58
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): .7353
Cheese Sauce, Shelf Stable Pouch,
30 Cheddar, Reduced Sodium (0517610) - No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
DELETED
Brand:
Commodity Code#:
Portion Size:
Portions / Case:
Case Size:
Fee For Service / Case:
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value):




Item

No. Vendor
31 Cheese Sauce Froz.en, Pouch, Cheddar,
Reduced Fat, Reduced Sodium (0517610)

Albie's Food Products,

LLC, Gaylord, MI

Bongards,
Chanhassen,
MN

Brand:
Commodity Code#:
Portion Size:
Portions / Case:

No Bid

No Bid

Brookwood Farms
Inc, Siler City, NC

No Bid

Butterball, Garner, NC

Del Monte Foods
Inc, Walnut Creek,
CA

ES Foods,
Woodbury, NY

Foster Poultry
Farms, LLC,

No Bid

Livingston, CA

Gold Creek Foods,

Case Size:
Fee For Service / Case:

MY, LY

ES Foods
110242

No Bid

No Bid

LLC, Gainesville, GA

Don Lee Farms, | Hormel Food Sales,
Inglewood, CA

LLC, Austin, MN

Brand:

Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value):
32 |Cheese Sauce, White, Shelf Stable (0517650)

6/5

No Bid No Bid

Commodity Code#:

No Bid

No Bid

240/2 oz.

No Bid

6

Portion Size:
Portions / Case:

No Bid

45.53

No Bid

.2734

Case Size:
Fee For Service / Case:

No Bid

No Bid

Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value):
33

No Bid

No Bid

Cheese Portions, Refrigerated, Moz.zarella

No Bid

String (0517030)
Brand:

No Bid

Commodity Code#:

AU, MY

Portion Size:

Bongards

No Bid

No Bid

Portions / Case:

110242

Case Size:

1

No Bid

No Bid

Fee For Service / Case:

No Bid

34

168

No Bid

No Bid

Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value)

Cheese Portions, Sticks, Refrigerated,

16.30

No Bid

Reduced Fat (0517670)
Brand:

No Bid

2215

Commodity Code#:

MU

Portion Size:

Bongards

No Bid

No Bid

Portions / Case:

110242

Case Size:

1o0z.

No Bid

No Bid

Fee For Service / Case:

No Bid

168

No Bid

Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value):

Cheese Cubes, Refrigerated, Reduced Fat
(0517660)

20.91

No Bid No Bid

Brand:

No Bid

.2449

Commodity Code#:

No Bid

Portion Size:

No Bid

No Bid

Portions / Case:

Case Size:

No Bid

No Bid

Fee For Service / Case:

No Bid

No Bid

Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value):

No Bid No Bid




Item
No.

Vendor

Albie's Food Products,
LLC, Gaylord, MI

Bongards,
Chanhassen,
MN

Brookwood Farms
Inc, Siler City, NC

Butterball, Garner, NC

Del Monte Foods
Inc, Walnut Creek,
CA

ES Foods,
Woodbury, NY

Foster Poultry
Farms, LLC,
Livingston, CA

Gold Creek Foods,
LLC, Gainesville, GA

Don Lee Farms,
Inglewood, CA

Hormel Food Sales,
LLC, Austin, MN

36

Tomato Catsup, Shelf Stable, Low Sodium
(0507090) - DELETED

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Brand:

Commodity Code#:

Portion Size:

Portions / Case:

Case Size:

Fee For Service / Case:

Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value):

37

Tomato Catsup, Shelf Stable, Individual
(0507100) - DELETED

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Brand:

Commodity Code#:

Portion Size:

Portions / Case:

Case Size:

Fee For Service / Case:

Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value):

38

Tomato Catsup, Shelf Stable, Low Sodium,
Individual (0507100) - DELETED

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Brand:

Commodity Code#:

Portion Size:

Portions / Case:

Case Size:

Fee For Service / Case:

Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value):

39

Diced Tomatoes (NEW ITEM, NO ID
NUMBER) - DELETED

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Brand:

Commodity Code#:

Portion Size:

Portions / Case:

Case Size:

Fee For Service / Case:

Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value):

40

Canned Salsa, Shelf Stable, Low Sodium
(0502393)
- DELETED

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Brand:

Commodity Code#:

Portion Size:

Portions / Case:

Case Size:

Fee For Service / Case:

Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value):




Item
No.

Vendor

Albie's Food Products,
LLC, Gaylord, MI

Bongards,
Chanhassen,
MN

Brookwood Farms
Inc, Siler City, NC

Butterball, Garner, NC

Del Monte Foods
Inc, Walnut Creek,
CA

ES Foods,
Woodbury, NY

Foster Poultry
Farms, LLC,
Livingston, CA

Gold Creek Foods,
LLC, Gainesville, GA

Don Lee Farms,
Inglewood, CA

Hormel Food Sales,
LLC, Austin, MN

41

Salsa, Shelf Stable, Dipping Cup, Low
Sodium (0507350) - DELETED

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Brand:

Commodity Code#:

Portion Size:

Portions / Case:

Case Size:

Fee For Service / Case:

Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value):

42

Marinara Sauce, Shelf Stable, Low Sodium
(0505200) - DELETED

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Brand:

Commodity Code#:

Portion Size:

Portions / Case:

Case Size:

Fee For Service / Case:

Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value):

43

Marinara Sauce Dipping Cup, Shelf Stable,
Low Sodium (NEW ITEM, NO ID NUMBER) -
DELETED

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Brand:

Commodity Code#:

Portion Size:

Portions / Case:

Case Size:

Fee For Service / Case:

Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value):

44

Spaghetti Sauce, Shelf Stable, Low Sodium
(0508050) - DELETED

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Brand:

Commodity Code#:

Portion Size:

Portions / Case:

Case Size:

Fee For Service / Case:

Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value):

45

Tomato Sauce (0502380) - DELETED

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Brand:

Commodity Code#:

Portion Size:

Portions / Case:

Case Size:

Fee For Service / Case:

Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value):




: Bongards, Del Monte Foods Foster Poulti
Al FaoaProduts, | Chanhasson, (HouO00EHTE | Gutarbal, Garner NG | tne, WaintCrook, | e godtly | Fams Lic, | S4CreskFaode, | Donteo Farma, | HarmelFond Sae
ivingston, CA
46 | BBQ sas‘t':gi;“?&;g;‘fz'i)"‘_"’[’;Esfg#é"g Shelf No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand:
Commodity Code#:
Portion Size:
Portions / Case:
Case Size:
Fee For Service / Case:
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value):
47 Fruit Cup, Mixed (0501101) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand: Del Monte
Commodity Code#: 100220
Portion Size: 4 oz.
Portions / Case: 72
Case Size: 72
Fee For Service / Case: 22.14
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): .307
47 Fruit Cup, Mixed (0501101) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand: Del Monte
Commodity Code#: 100225
Portion Size: 4 0z.
Portions / Case: 72
Case Size: 72
Fee For Service / Case: 26.05
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): .362
48 Fruit Cup, Variety Flavors (0501120) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid SA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand: Del Monte
Commodity Code#: 100220
Portion Size: 4 oz.
Portions / Case: 72
Case Size: 72
Fee For Service / Case: 21.48
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): .30
48 Fruit Cup, Variety Flavors (0501120) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid SA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand: Del Monte
Commodity Code#: 100225
Portion Size: 4 oz.
Portions / Case: 72
Case Size: 72
Fee For Service / Case: 22.81
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): .32
49 | Pizza, Whi Gra;géf;‘f:;e' Round, Ind. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand:
Commodity Code#:
Portion Size:
Portions / Case:
Case Size:
Fee For Service / Case:
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value):
s0 | Fizza Me"i°a'(‘o§';3’7'§'7x‘)’ith°”‘ Beans No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand:
Commodity Code#:
Portion Size:
Portions / Case:
Case Size:

Fee For Service / Case:

Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value):




Tabatchnick Fine

It;m Vendor JTM Corporate, Harrison, |Land O’ _Lakes, Sp:g?;ﬁ;,RI':t:ods Nardone Bros. Baking Co., National Fo_od g:,'?;f"é,:;g; Red Gold LLC. Rich Chicks, Gardena, Foods, Somerset, Tyson, Springdale,
0. OH Arden Hills, MN Hanover, PA Group, Novi, M| Elwood, IN AR
Inc., Dunmore, PA (ofo] NJ
1 Chicken, 8-Piece, Breaded (0516550) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid MY
Brand: Tyson
Commodity Code#: 100103D / 100103W
Portion Size: 4.7 --8.4 oz.
Portions / Case: 82
Case Size: 4/7.411b
Fee For Service / Case: 57.79
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): 1.128
2 Chicken, 8-Piece, Roasted (0516540) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid MY
Brand: Tyson
Commodity Code#: 100103D / 100103W
Portion Size: 3.75 -- 6.50 oz.
Portions / Case: 78
Case Size: 4/5.77
Fee For Service / Case: 46.11
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): .9561
3 | Chicken, D’“;"g:';';ima;é;‘; (NEWITEM, No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid MY, SU No Bid No Bid No Bid MY, SU
Brand: Pilgrims Tyson
Commodity Code#: 100103 100103DD
Portion Size: 4.00 oz. 3.75-6 oz.
Portions / Case: 84 95
Case Size: 6 4/751b
Fee For Service / Case: 60.16 54.48
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): .6915 .9641
3 | Chicken, D'“;l“g'lgkm'},agsé?g (NEWITEM, No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid See Above No Bid No Bid No Bid MY, SY
Brand: Tyson
Commodity Code#: 100103D
Portion Size: 5.05 oz.
Portions / Case: 95
Case Size: 4/7.51b
Fee For Service / Case: 54.47
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): .9622
4 |Chicken, Thﬁ%’:\hgg;?ﬁegéfsﬂsgm' NoID No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid M, SU
Brand: Tyson
Commodity Code#: 100103DD
Portion Size: 3.7 oz.
Portions / Case: 78
Case Size: 4/5.77 1b
Fee For Service / Case: 57.51
1.1039

Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value):




Maid-Rite

Pilgrims Pride

Tabatchnick Fine

Item JTM Corporate, Harrison, |Land O’ Lakes, " Nardone Bros. Baking Co., National Food Red Gold LLC. Rich Chicks, Gardena, Tyson, Springdale,
No. Vendor PO oH Arden Hills, MN |:§?‘33:¥n§:§d§A Hanover, PA Group, Novi, MI | €= g(;eeley. Elwood, IN Foods, ‘Z‘j’"e’se" M
5 [Chicken Filet, Wh‘(’(":n‘;g')e’ Small, Breaded No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid MY No Bid AUMY
Brand: Rich Chicks Tyson
Commodity Code#: 100103 100103W
Portion Size: 2.05 oz. 2.12 oz.
Portions / Case: 156 226
Case Size: 4 4/75Ib
Fee For Service / Case: 57.94 56.32
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): .57 .4591
6 Chicken Béf::;:é'?;§'1‘é‘g‘g)e Muscle, No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid AU, MY No Bid MY No Bid MY
Brand: Pilgrims Rich Chicks Tyson
Commodity Code#: 100103 100103 100103W
Portion Size: 3.40 oz. 4.10 oz. 4 0z.
Portions / Case: 122 78 120
Case Size: 6 4 6/51b
Fee For Service / Case: 67.48 57.94 81.52
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): .5623 1.13 1.0636
7 Chmke",&;ﬁif;g'f:;::; (a(;‘sdwsg,",%‘)" Whole No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid MY No Bid MY
Brand: Rich Chicks Tyson
Commodity Code#: 100103 100103W
Portion Size: 4.10 oz. 3.75 oz.
Portions / Case: 78 132
Case Size: 4 4/7.7351b
Fee For Service / Case: 58.74 59.90
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): 1.14 .8346
g | Chicken Te“de's(’o‘g‘qhs‘ggo';"“sc'e' Breaded No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid AU, MY No Bid MY No Bid M
Brand: Pilgrims Rich Chicks Tyson
Commodity Code#: 100103 100103 100103W
Portion Size: 4.80 oz. 4.10 oz. 4.14 oz.
Portions / Case: 100 78 120
Case Size: 6 4 4/7.7475 b
Fee For Service / Case: 57.61 57.94 61.63
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): .5704 1.13 .9394
9 Popcorn Chi‘;'g;;‘ég:)‘;“k' Breaded No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid AU, MY No Bid No Bid No Bid M
Brand: Pilgrims Tyson
Commodity Code#: 100103 100103D / 100103W
Portion Size: 5 pieces 3.36 oz. pieces
Portions / Case: 156 156
Case Size: 6 4/ 8.19751b
Fee For Service / Case: 46.56 51.00
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): .2985 4737




Item Ve JTM Corporate, Harrison, |Land O’ Lakes, M_a|d-R|te Nardone Bros. Baking Co., National Food Pilgrims Pride Red Gold LLC. Rich Chicks, Gardena, Tabatchnick Fine Tyson, Springdale,
No. endor OH Arden Hills, MN | Specialty Foods Hanover, PA Group, Novi, M | CO™P- Greeley, Elwood, IN Foods, Somerset, AR
Inc., Dunmore, PA (ofe] NJ
10 | Popcorn Chicken, Spicy, Breaded (0516880) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid MY
Brand: Tyson
Commodity Code#: 100103D / 100103W
Portion Size: 3.30 oz.
Portions / Case: 159
Case Size: 4/ 8.1975 b
Fee For Service / Case: 50.91
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): 4642
11 | Chicken B’fgg};&‘i Winole Muscle, Grilled No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid AU, MY
Brand: Tyson
Commodity Code#: 100103W
Portion Size: 3 oz.
Portions / Case: 54
Case Size: 2/5Ib
Fee For Service / Case: 39.18
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): 1.105
1 | Garlic B:::;II‘;h(';‘fe"sg'(e(j‘s‘:’g:';o‘;"’ Moz. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid My No Bid No Bid
Brand: Rich Chicks
Commodity Code#: 100103
Portion Size: 2.60 oz.
Portions / Case: 123
Case Size: 4
Fee For Service / Case: 67.18
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): 1%%;0
13 Chicken Fajita Strips (0516690) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid AU, MY No Bid No Bid No Bid MY
Brand: Pilgrims Tyson
Commodity Code#: 100103 100103D / 100103W
Portion Size: 217 2.8 oz.
Portions / Case: 221 171
Case Size: 6 6/5lb
Fee For Service / Case: 59.02 57.63
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): .2671 .6964
14 Beef, Mini Burgers (0515190) - DELETED No Bid No Bid MY No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand: Maidrite
Commodity Code#: 75156-93421
Portion Size: 1.25 oz.
Portions / Case: 384
Case Size: 301b
Fee For Service / Case: 52.65
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): 167.58




Maid-Rite

Pilgrims Pride

Tabatchnick Fine

Item 'TM Corpor: Harrison, |Land O' Lak " Nardone Bros. Bakin . National Fi R Id LLC. Rich Chick: rden: Tyson rin I
nc., Dunmore, PA (ofe] NJ
15 Beef Crumbles (0516970) AU, MY No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid MY
Brand: JTM Tyson
Commodity Code#: CP5868 100154
Portion Size: 2.44 oz. 2.4 0z
Portions / Case: 6/30lb / 196 serv. 267
Case Size: 6 8/5Ib
Fee For Service / Case: 39.02 58.74
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): .7258 673
16 | Beef Taco Meat, Reduced Sodium (0516170) MY No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid AU, MY
Brand: JTM Tyson
Commodity Code#: CP5250 100154
Portion Size: 3.17 oz. 2.7 oz.
Portions / Case: 151 71
Case Size: 6 4/3lb
Fee For Service / Case: 44.33 36.00
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): 7128 1.1430
16 | Beef Taco Meat, Reduced Sodium (0516170) MY No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid See Above
Brand: JTM
Commodity Code#: CP5258
Portion Size: 3.03 oz.
Portions / Case: 158
Case Size: 6
Fee For Service / Case: 39.26
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): .5649
17 Beef Meatballs (0516190) AU, MY No Bid MY No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid MY
Brand: JTM Maidrite Tyson
Commodity Code#: CP5030 75156-94105 100154
Portion Size: 2.80 oz. 2.50z. 2.50z.
Portions / Case: 171 192 192
Case Size: 6 6/5Ib 5/61Ib
Fee For Service / Case: 61.41 54.15 68.31
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): .8728 .7687 .8324
17 Beef Meatballs (0516190) AU, MY No Bid See Above No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid MY
Brand: JTM Tyson
Commodity Code#: CP5035 100154
Portion Size: 2.60 oz. 2.50z.
Portions / Case: 184 192
Case Size: 6 5/61b
Fee For Service / Case: 62.82 47.22
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): .8040 .8766




Maid-Rite

Pilgrims Pride

Tabatchnick Fine

Item 'TM Corpor: Harrison, |Land O' Lak . Nardone Bros. Bakin B National Fi R Id LLC. Rich Chick: rden: Tyson rin |
Inc., Dunmore, PA (ofe] NJ
18 Ground Beef Patties (0516115) MY No Bid MY No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid MY
Brand: JTM Maidrite Tyson
Commodity Code#: CP5670 75156-93320 100154
Portion Size: 2.45 oz. 2.00 oz. 2.3 0z
Portions / Case: 195 240 140
Case Size: 6 301b 1/ 20.131b
Fee For Service / Case: 49.20 49.65 38.45
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): .9618 .9035 .9593
18 Ground Beef Patties (0516115) MY No Bid See Above No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid See Above
Brand: JTM
Commodity Code#: CP5661
Portion Size: 2.20 oz.
Portions / Case: 228
Case Size: 6
Fee For Service / Case: 55.47
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): .6838
18 Ground Beef Patties (0516115) MY No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid See Above
Brand: JTM
Commodity Code#: CP5659
Portion Size: 2.50 oz.
Portions / Case: 196
Case Size: 6
Fee For Service / Case: 54.04
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): .7606
19 Frankfurters, Turkey (0516070) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand:
Commodity Code#:
Portion Size:
Portions / Case:
Case Size:
Fee For Service / Case:
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value):
20 Pepperoni, Turkey, Sliced (0512140) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand:
Commodity Code#:
Portion Size:
Portions / Case:
Case Size:

Fee For Service / Case:

Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value):




Item
No.

Vendor

JTM Corporate, Harrison,
OH

Land O' Lakes,
Arden Hills, MN

Maid-Rite
Specialty Foods
Inc., Dunmore, PA

Nardone Bros. Baking Co.,

Hanover, PA

National Food
Group, Novi, M|

Pilgrims Pride
Corp., Greeley,
co

Red Gold LLC.

Elwood, IN

Rich Chicks, Gardena,

Tabatchnick Fine
Foods, Somerset,
NJ

Tyson, Springdale,
AR

21

Turkey Sausage, Patty (0516210)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Brand:

Commodity Code#:

Portion Size:

Portions / Case:

Case Size:

Fee For Service / Case:

Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value):

22

Sausage Link, Turkey (0516200)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Brand:

Commodity Code#:

Portion Size:

Portions / Case:

Case Size:

Fee For Service / Case:

Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value):

23

Turkey (0516312)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Brand:

Commodity Code#:

Portion Size:

Portions / Case:

Case Size:

Fee For Service / Case:

Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value):

24

Turkey Ham, Deli Style, Pre-Sliced (0516220)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Brand:

Commodity Code#:

Portion Size:

Portions / Case:

Case Size:

Fee For Service / Case:

Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value):

25

Roast Turkey Breast, Deli Style, Pre-Sliced
(0516340)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bld

Brand:

Commodity Code#:

Portion Size:

Portions / Case:

Case Size:

Fee For Service / Case:

Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value):




Item . ! M:aid-Rite i . Pilgrims Pride . . Tabatchnick Fine .
No. Vendor JTM Corporate, Harrison, |Land O .Lakes, Specialty Foods | Nardone Bros. Baking Co., National qud Corp., Greeley, Red Gold LLC. Rich Chicks, Gardena, [Foods, Somerset, | Tyson, Springdale,
OH Arden Hills, MN | Inc., Dunmore, PA Hanover, PA Group, Novi, M| cO Elwood, IN CA NJ AR
26 Turkey Breast Sticks (0517710) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand:
Commodity Code#:
Portion Size:
Portions / Case:
Case Size:
Fee For Service / Case:
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value):
27 Bacon, Turkey (0517540) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand:
Commodity Code#:
Portion Size:
Portions / Case:
Case Size:
Fee For Service / Case:
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value):
28 Pork, BBQ, Shredded (0516940) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand:
Commodity Code#:
Portion Size:
Portions / Case:
Case Size:
Fee For Service / Case:
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value):
29 Ma";’:(;‘i'u?‘:“dvﬁ:‘féf;’n '-‘;3‘5"1;2;'0';‘*"' MY No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid AY, MY No Bid
Brand: JTM Land O' Lakes Tabatchnick
Commodity Code#: 5743 110242 110242
Portion Size: 6.00 oz. 6 oz. 5.2 oz.
Portions / Case: 80 80 61.54
Case Size: 6 6 4
Fee For Service / Case: 59.45 58.74 29.81
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): .9224 734 7377
29 M"‘casr:(;‘ihf"]"dvﬁ:‘leéf;}‘ R(gg%;g;’o';ed' % See Above No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid See Above No Bid
Brand: JTM
Commodity Code#: 5756
Portion Size: 6.00 oz.
Portions / Case: 80
Case Size: 6
Fee For Service / Case: 40.00
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): .6275




Item
No.

29

Vendor

JTM Corporate, Harrison,
OH

Land O' Lakes,

Maid-Rite
Specialty Foods

Macaroni and Cheese, Red. Fat, Red.

Arden Hills, MN

Nardone Bros. Baking Co.,

Pilgrims Pride

Sodium, Whi Grain (0517600) MY

Brand:
Commodity Code#:

JTM

See Above

Inc., Dunmore, PA
No Bid

Hanover, PA

No Bid

National Food
Group, Novi, M|

No Bid

Corp., Greeley,
co

No Bid

Red Gold LLC.

Elwood, IN

Rich Chicks, Gardena,

Tabatchnick Fine
Foods, Somerset,
NJ

Portion Size:
Portions / Case:

5776
6.00 oz.

No Bid

No Bid

See Above

Tyson, Springdale,
AR

No Bid

Case Size:

80

Fee For Service / Case:

49.10

30

Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value):
Cheese Sauce, Shelf Stable Pouch,

.7945

Cheddar, Reduced Sodium (0517610) -

DELETED
Brand:

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Commodity Code#:
Portion Size:
Portions / Case:

110242
3oz

Land O' Lakes

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Case Size:

212

Fee For Service / Case:

6

Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value):

42.25

31

Cheese Sauce Froz.en, Pouch, Cheddar,

199

Reduced Fat, Reduced Sodium (0517610) Ly

No Bid

Brand:

JTM

No Bid

No Bid

Commodity Code#:

5715

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Portion Size:
Portions / Case:

6 /30 Ib bags / 252 serv.

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Case Size:

6

Fee For Service / Case:

Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value):

46.89
.2501

31 Cheese Sauce Froz.en, Pouch, Cheddar,
Reduced Fat, Reduced Sodium (0517610)

AU, MY

No Bid

Brand:

No Bid

No Bid

Commodity Code#:

JTM
5735

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Portion Size:
Portions / Case:

6/30Ib bags /252 serv.

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Case Size:

Fee For Service / Case:

6

32

Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value):

51.89

.2699

Cheese Sauce, White, Shelf Stable (0517650)

Brand:

No Bid

No Bid

Commodity Code#:

Land O' Lakes

No Bid

Portion Size:

110242

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Portions / Case:

3 oz.

No Bid

Case Size:

212

No Bid

Fee For Service / Case:

6

Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value):

49.91

.235




Item . ! M:aid-Rite i . Pilgrims Pride . . Tabatchnick Fine .
No. Vendor JTM Corporate, Harrison, |Land O .Lakes, Specialty Foods | Nardone Bros. Baking Co., National qud Corp., Greeley, Red Gold LLC. Rich Chicks, Gardena, [Foods, Somerset, | Tyson, Springdale,
OH Arden Hills, MN | Inc., Dunmore, PA Hanover, PA Group, Novi, M| cO Elwood, IN NJ AR
33 | Cheese Portions, Refrigerated, Moz zarella No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
String (0517030)
Brand: Land O' Lakes
Commodity Code#: 110242
Portion Size: 1 o0z.
Portions / Case: 168
Case Size: 168
Fee For Service / Case: 15.94
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): .094
34 | Cheese ;‘e’;‘:;’;z' Fs;'t°('(‘)§'1';g%‘i’e’a‘ed' No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand: Land O' Lakes
Commodity Code#: 110242
Portion Size: 1 0z.
Portions / Case: 168
Case Size: 168
Fee For Service / Case: 21.42
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): 127
35 | Cheese Cubes, F:g;'}gzg‘)ed' Reduced Fat No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand: Land O' Lakes
Commodity Code#: 110242
Portion Size: 1 0z.
Portions / Case: 200
Case Size: 200
Fee For Service / Case: 36.98
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): .184
3g | Tomato Ca:;;'g;osg%‘;'f [S)té‘l'_’éeT'Eng Sodium No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid MU No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand: Red Gold
Commodity Code#: 100332
Portion Size: .60 oz.
Portions / Case: 1140
Case Size: 6/101b
Fee For Service / Case: 30.19
. . 38.49/ Case
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): 03/ Serv.
37 | T O e orion) DL ETED No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid MU No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand: Red Gold
Commodity Code#: 100332
Portion Size: 1000/ 9 gm. packet
Portions / Case: 1000
Case Size: 1000
Fee For Service / Case: 19.23
22.59/ Case

Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value):

.02 / Serv.




Item . ! M:aid-Rite i . Pilgrims Pride . . Tabatchnick Fine .
No. Vendor JTM Corporate, Harrison, |Land O .Lakes, Specialty Foods | Nardone Bros. Baking Co., National qud Corp., Greeley, Red Gold LLC. Rich Chicks, Gardena, [Foods, Somerset, | Tyson, Springdale,
OH Arden Hills, MN | Inc., Dunmore, PA Hanover, PA Group, Novi, M| cO Elwood, IN NJ AR
3g | Tomato Catsup, (so';z'.;%:)b_'%éfgé%d'”m’ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid MU No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand: Red Gold
Commodity Code#: 100332
Portion Size: .32 oz.
Portions / Case: 1000
Case Size: 1000
Fee For Service / Case: 21.70
. . 25.54 / Case
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): 03/ Serv.
39 Diced T;SG?S;)(PSEVLEFEMD’ NOID No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid MU No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand: Red Gold
Commodity Code#: 100332
Portion Size: 2.10z.
Portions / Case: 291
Case Size: 6/101b
Fee For Service / Case: 29.70
. : 29.70/ Case
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): 10/ serv.
Canned Salsa, Shelf Stable, Low Sodium
40 (0502393) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid MU No Bid No Bid No Bid
- DELETED
Brand: Red Gold
Commodity Code#: 100332
Portion Size: 1.5 0z.
Portions / Case: 412
Case Size: 6/101b
Fee For Service / Case: 35.37
. . 40.08/ Case
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): 10/ Serv.
41 | Salsa Shell ?;gg;e‘,:s%')p_pl')“EngEbL°w No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid MU No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand: Red Gold
Commodity Code#: 100332
Portion Size: 3oz
Portions / Case: 84
Case Size: 84
Fee For Service / Case: 33.40
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): Ss_fza/cclf:e
R S e No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid MU No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand: Red Gold
Commodity Code#: 100332
Portion Size: 3oz
Portions / Case: 168
Case Size: 168
Fee For Service / Case: 64.79
68.56 / Case

Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value):

.41/ Cup




Item . ! M:aid-Rite . . Pilgrims Pride . . Tabatchnick Fine .
No. Vendor JTM Corporate, Harrison, |Land O .Lakes, Specialty Foods | Nardone Bros. Baking Co., National Fo.od Corp., Greeley, Red Gold LLC. Rich Chicks, Gardena, [Foods, Somerset, | Tyson, Springdale,
OH Arden Hills, MN | Inc., Dunmore, PA Hanover, PA Group, Novi, M| cO Elwood, IN NJ AR
42 | Marinara s?&';:é;)ge)'f g'EaLbI'E‘?r’ESW Sodium No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid MU No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand: Red Gold
Commodity Code#: 100332
Portion Size: 1.5 0z.
Portions / Case: 420
Case Size: 6/101b
Fee For Service / Case: 35.98
. . 41.83 / Case
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): 10/ serv.
Marinara Sauce Dipping Cup, Shelf Stable,
43 | Low Sodium (NEW ITEM, NO ID NUMBER) - No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid MU No Bid No Bid No Bid
DELETED
Brand: Red Gold
Commodity Code#: 100332
Portion Size: 2.50z.
Portions / Case: 168
Case Size: 168
Fee For Service / Case: 52.13
. . 57.98 / Case
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): 35/ Serv.
a4 | S S ey D e No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid MU No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand: Red Gold
Commodity Code#: 100332
Portion Size: 1.2 0z.
Portions / Case: 530
Case Size: 6/101b
Fee For Service / Case: 31.63
. . 39.87 / Case
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): 08/ Serv.
45 Tomato Sauce (0502380) - DELETED No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid MU No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand: Red Gold / Vine Ripe
Commodity Code#: 100332
Portion Size: 106 oz.
Portions / Case: 318
Case Size: 6/101b
Fee For Service / Case: 23.74
. . 30.95/ Case
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): 10/ serv.
46 | BB S I aovazi) DELETER No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid MU No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand: Red Gold
Commodity Code#: 100332
Portion Size: 10z.
Portions / Case: 250
Case Size: 250
Fee For Service / Case: 33.69
35.33/ Case

Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value):

.14 / Serv.




ltem Maid-Rite Pilgrims Pride Tabatchnick Fine
N Vendor JTM Corporate, Harrison, |Land O' Lakes, | Specialty Foods | Nardone Bros. Baking Co., National Food Corp., Greeley, Red Gold LLC. Rich Chicks, Gardena, |[Foods, Somerset, | Tyson, Springdale,
0. OH Arden Hills, MN | Inc., Dunmore, PA Hanover, PA Group, Novi, MI co Elwood, IN CA N, AR
47 Fruit Cup, Mixed (0501101) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid L, MY No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand: Zee Zees
Commodity Code#: 100212
Portion Size: 4.5 o0z.
Portions / Case: 72
Case Size: 72
Fee For Service / Case: 21.96
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): .6154
48 Fruit Cup, Variety Flavors (0501120) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid L, MY No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand: Zee Zees
I X 100220-Peaches
Commodity Code#: 100225-Pears
Portion Size: 4.5 0z.
Portions / Case: 72
Case Size: 72
. . 22.63 / Peaches
Fee For Service / Case: 905 / Pears
. ) . .6311/ Peaches
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): 6022 / Pears
49 | Pizza, WhiGrain, Cheese, Round, Ind. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
(0517440)
Brand: Nardone Bros.
Commodity Code#: 110244
Portion Size: 5.40 oz.
Portions / Case: 60
Case Size: 60
. . 39.08 / Case
Fee For Service / Case: 65 / Portion
. . X 52.91/ Case
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): 88/ Serv.
so | Pz Mex"’a'(‘o?sﬁ’;'g;g')’“h°“t Beans No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand: Nardone Bros.
Commodity Code#: 110244
Portion Size: 5.20 oz.
Portions / Case: 96
Case Size: 96
. X 59.53 / Case
Fee For Service / Case: 62/ Serv
- . . 62.85 / Case
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): 65/ Serv.
RFP TABULATION, RECOMMENDATIONS, AND PROTEST Notes:

RFP tabulations with award recommendations are posted for 72 hours in the
Procurement Department Office and are also posted to the School District's
website address at: http://escambiaschools.org/Page/1048. Notices will not be

automatically mailed. Failure to file a protest within the time prescribed in Section
120.57(3) Florida Statutes will constitute a waiver of proceedings under Chapter
120 Florida Statutes, or failure to post the bond or other security required by law
within the time allowed for filing a bond shall constitute a waiver of proceedings

under Chapter 120 Florida Statutes.

| hereby certify that the prices and bidders reflected herein are valid, and have been
received in compliance to Escambia County School Board Policy and Florida Law.

Allison Watson, Director
Procurement Department

m = minimum ship quantities
mu = minimum ship quantity bid is not acceptable for that item

n = new item

nu = new item was not approved

ny = new item was approved
s - sample required

su - sample not approved
sy - sample approved

my=minimum ship quantity is acceptable

sa = split award. 50% of total quantity awarded for each item.
* - no longer approved due to increased sodium levels



