THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY
PROCUREMENT DEPARTMENT
75 North Pace Blvd.
Pensacola, FL 32505

BID AWARD NOTICE

DATE: BID TITLE & REFERENCE:
May 16, 2025 Frozen Dessert Novelties for Direct Delivery
to School Cafeterias, Bid #251502

DESCRIPTION OF PURCHASE:

An annual agreement with two (2), one (1) year renewal options to provide direct delivery of
frozen dessert novelties to school cafeterias as stocked and distributed by the Central
Warehouse for school cafeterias throughout the District. Nine (9) items were bid and
eight (8) items are recommended for award. One (1) item was not awarded due to no bids
being received or sample products were not approved in taste tests. Items will be purchased
as needed to meet frozen dessert novelty requirements. Bid award(s) to the lowest bidder(s)
meeting specifications.

Effective Dates: August 1, 2025 through July 31, 2026

REQUESTED BY:

Food Services

SUPPLIER NAME:

Davis Ice Cream Alabama, LLC
dba Ice Cream Warehouse, Mobile, AL

AMOUNT OF PURCHASE: FUNDING SOURCE:
$68,229.50 Est. / Yr. Food Services Fund (4110)

METHOD OF PROCUREMENT:

ECSD Bid Bids Received: 2 Bids Rejected: 0

DATE AND TIME POSTED:
May 16, 2025, 5:00 p.m. Central Time

9500PUR101 (11/10) Retention - 5 Years



Date: 05/16/2025

Bid Number: 251502

Bid Title: Frozen Dessert Novelties for Direct
Delivery to School Cafeterias

THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY
PROCUREMENT DEPARTMENT
75 NORTH PACE BOULEVARD
PENSACOLA, FLORIDA 32505
BID TABULATION

Where two prices are shown, the top price is unit or portion price needed to
determine low cost because of vendor differences in case count. Bottom price is

the bid case/pack size

Awarded items are
highlighted

ITEM: Fudge Bar Ice Cream Sandwhich, Low Fat Ice Cream Cup, Low Fat Ice Cream Cone, Low Fat Crunch Bar, Low Fat
QUANTITY: 100 cs 1200 cs 1150 cs 1350 cs 1600 cs
0530320 0530210 0530200 0530200 0530320
Item Number 1 2 3-DELETED 4 5
Hershey Creamery #1 .38 .63 44 fa .69 A7
Pensacola, FL 13.68 15.12 21.12 16.56 16.92
Hershey Creamery #2 See Above .39 ay See Above See Above See Above
Pensacola, FL 18.72
Ice Cream Warehouse #1 43 .55 No Bid .49 .50
Mobile, AL 10.25 13.16 11.75 12.00
Ice Cream Warehouse #2 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid .56
Mobile, AL 13.50




ITEM: Fruit Bar, Low Fat Creamsicle, Vanilla-Filled, Low Fat Cream Bar Variety Flavor, Low Fat Cream Push Pop, Low Fat
cs cs cs cs
QUANTITY: 300 100 500 500
0520150 0530XXX 0530XXX 0530XXX
Item Number 6 7 8 9
Hershey Creamery 1.41 No Bid .38 au .655
Pensacola, FL 33.84 13.68 15.60
Ice Cream Warehouse 43 43 .43 .59
Mobile, AL 10.25 10.25 10.25 14.25
Notes: BID TABULATION, RECOMMENDATIONS, AND PROTEST

au= alternate unacceptable
ay = alternate approved

fa = 2 of 3 flavors were approved, Vanilla and Strawberry

Bid tabulations with award recommendations are posted for 72 hours in the
Procurement Department Office and are also posted to the School District's
website address at: http://escambiaschools.org/Page/1048. Notices will not
be automatically mailed. Failure to file a protest within the time prescribed
in Section 120.57(3) Florida Statutes will constitute a waiver of proceedings
under Chapter 120 Florida Statutes, or failure to post the bond or other
security required by law within the time allowed for filing a bond shall
constitute a waiver of proceedings under Chapter 120 Florida Statutes.

I hereby certify that the prices and bidders reflected herein are valid, and
have been received in compliance to Escambia County School Board Policy
and Florida Law.

Allison Watson, Director
Procurement Department
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