
THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY 
PROCUREMENT DEPARTMENT 

75 North Pace Blvd. 
Pensacola, FL 32505 

BID AWARD NOTICE 

DATE: BID TITLE & REFERENCE: 
March 22, 2024 Breakfast and Lunch Entrees, Bid 

#241202 
DESCRIPTION OF PURCHASE: 

An annual agreement with a one (1) year renewal option to provide breakfast and lunch entrees as 
stocked and distributed by the Central Warehouse for school cafeterias throughout the District. 
Seventy-eight (78) items were bid and sixty-four (64) items are recommended for award. Fourteen (14) 
items were not awarded due to no bids being received or sample products were not approved in taste 
tests. Items will be purchased as needed to meet breakfast and lunch menu requirements. Bid award(s) 
to the lowest bidder(s) meeting specifications. 

Effective Dates: May 1, 2024 through April 30, 2025 

REQUESTED BY: 

Food Services 

SUPPLIER NAME: ITEMS AWARDED: ESTIMATED ANNUAL EXPENDITURE: 

Bake Crafters, McDonald TN     3   $ 243,480.00 
Butler Foods, Cantonment, FL   19 1,661,488.50 
Churchfield, Santa Ynez CA    10 549,360.50 
Foster Farms, Livingston CA   1 128,520.00 
Gold Creek, Gainesville GA   4 571,410.00 
Goodman – Don Lee, Inglewood CA   1       35,556.00 
Hormel, Austin, MN 7     453,871.00 
House of Raeford, Raeford NC  2       76,815.00 
JTM Provisions, Harrison OH  1     120,765.00 
Maid Rite, Dunmore PA  2     269,100.00 
Nardone, Hanover Township PA 2     694,610.00 
Rich Chicks, Gardena CA 1       84,735.00 
S.A. Piazza, Clackamas OR  1     277,840.00 
S&F Foods, Romulus MI  1     124,560.00 
Super Bakery, Cleveland OH  3     375,156.00 
Tyson, Springdale AR   6   1,007,465.00 

AMOUNT OF PURCHASE: FUNDING SOURCE: 

$6,674,732.00 Est. / Yr. Food Services Fund (4110) 

METHOD OF PROCUREMENT: 

ECSD Bid Bids Received: 25   Bids Rejected: 2 
DATE AND TIME POSTED: 

March 22, 2024, 3:40 p.m. Central Time 

9500PUR101 (11/10) Retention - 5 Years 



DATE: March 22, 2024 

BID NBR: 241202
BID TITLE: Breakfast and Lunch Entrees

Where two prices are shown, the top price is unit or portion price needed to determine low cost because of vendor differences in case count 
Bottom price is the bid case/pack size

ITEM Cereal Bar Oatmeal Round Pastry Bagel
Frozen Frozen Whole Grain Cream Cheese

Quantity: 2,200 cs 1,100 cs 650 cs 2,500 cs
0505990 0517000 0517060 0516980

ITEM NUMBER 1 2 3 4
Arlington Valley Farms
Hudson, OH No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bake Crafters Food Co.
McDonald, TN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Butler Foods 0.5788 0.5704 0.5565
Cantonment, FL No Bid 41.67 41.07 40.07
Churchfield Trading Co 0.4350 * 0.5490 ly 0.5400 ly 0.5250 ly
Santa Ynez, CA 20.90 lymy 39.54 my 38.91 my 37.87 my
ES Foods
Woodbury, NY No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Foster Poultry Farms LLC
Livingston, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Gold Creek Foods
Gainesville, GA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Goodman - Don Lee
Inglewood, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Hormel Food Sales
Austin, MN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
House of Raeford Farms
Raeford, NC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Integrated Food Service
Gardena, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
JTM Provisions
Harrison, OH No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Maid Rite Specialty Food
Dunmore, PA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Nardone Bros Baking Co
Hanover Township, PA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
National Food Group
Novi, MI No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Proview Foods
Syosset, NY No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Rich Chicks
Gardena, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
S.A. Piazza & Assoc.
Clackamas, OR No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
S&F Foods
Romulus, MI No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Schwan's Food Service
Marshall, MN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Super Bakery Inc.
Cleveland, OH No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tasty Brands 0.5807 0.5800
Syosset, NY No Bid No Bid 55.75 71.34 au
Tyson
Springdale, AR No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Awarded Items are highlighted
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ITEM Pretzel Bites Muffin, Variety Muffin, Variety Cinnamon Rolls
Frozen Small, Frozen Small, SS Mini

Quantity: 500 cs 3,000 cs 3,000 cs 1,000 cs
0517700 0517151 0517151 0517210

ITEM NUMBER 5 - DELETED 6 7-DELETED 8
Arlington Valley Farms
Hudson, OH No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bake Crafters Food Co. 0.3560
McDonald, TN No Bid 34.25 No Bid No Bid
Butler Foods 0.3013 0.5789
Cantonment, FL No Bid 28.92 au No Bid 41.68
Churchfield Trading Co 0.3830 ly 0.5490 ly
Santa Ynez, CA No Bid 36.79 my No Bid 39.55 my
ES Foods
Woodbury, NY No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Foster Poultry Farms LLC
Livingston, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Gold Creek Foods
Gainesville, GA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Goodman - Don Lee
Inglewood, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Hormel Food Sales
Austin, MN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
House of Raeford Farms
Raeford, NC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Integrated Food Service
Gardena, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
JTM Provisions
Harrison, OH No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Maid Rite Specialty Food
Dunmore, PA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Nardone Bros Baking Co
Hanover Township, PA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
National Food Group
Novi, MI No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Proview Foods
Syosset, NY No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Rich Chicks
Gardena, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
S.A. Piazza & Assoc.
Clackamas, OR No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
S&F Foods
Romulus, MI No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Schwan's Food Service
Marshall, MN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Super Bakery Inc. 0.3249
Cleveland, OH No Bid 38.98 my No Bid No Bid
Tasty Brands 0.59
Syosset, NY No Bid No Bid No Bid 42.48 au
Tyson
Springdale, AR No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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ITEM Breakfast Bread Mini Pancakes Pancake Frank French Toast
Slice, Variety Frozen Wrapped Frozen Sticks

Quantity: 1,700 cs 1,000 cs 250 cs 3,000 cs
0517350 0516990 New Item 0517010

ITEM NUMBER 9 10 11 12
Arlington Valley Farms
Hudson, OH No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bake Crafters Food Co. 0.4370
McDonald, TN No Bid No Bid No Bid 21.01 my
Butler Foods 0.4556 * 0.5211 ny 0.4421
Cantonment, FL No Bid 32.80 89.10 my 53.05
Churchfield Trading Co 0.4720 ly
Santa Ynez, CA No Bid 34.02 my No Bid No Bid
ES Foods
Woodbury, NY No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Foster Poultry Farms LLC
Livingston, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Gold Creek Foods
Gainesville, GA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Goodman - Don Lee
Inglewood, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Hormel Food Sales
Austin, MN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
House of Raeford Farms 0.48882 ny
Raeford, NC No Bid No Bid 83.10 my No Bid
Integrated Food Service
Gardena, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
JTM Provisions
Harrison, OH No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Maid Rite Specialty Food
Dunmore, PA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Nardone Bros Baking Co
Hanover Township, PA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
National Food Group
Novi, MI No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Proview Foods
Syosset, NY No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Rich Chicks
Gardena, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
S.A. Piazza & Assoc.
Clackamas, OR No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
S&F Foods
Romulus, MI No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Schwan's Food Service
Marshall, MN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Super Bakery Inc. 0.5824 *
Cleveland, OH 43.68 my No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tasty Brands
Syosset, NY No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tyson - A 0.5220
Springdale, AR No Bid No Bid 85.09 au No Bid
Tyson - B 0.5525
Springdale, AR No Bid No Bid 33.15 au No Bid
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ITEM Doughnuts Croissant Filled Waffles, Mini Waffle, Dutch
Frozen WG Frozen Frozen

Quantity: 6,000 cs 500 cs 900 cs 5,000 cs
0517091 New Item 0517021 0516490

ITEM NUMBER 13 14 15 16
Arlington Valley Farms 0.6500 au 0.4250 au
Hudson, OH No Bid 70.20 l,m 40.80 l,m No Bid

Bake Crafters Food - A 0.6890 ay 0.7950 my 1.0270
McDonald, TN 49.67 my 79.56 sa 46.25 my No Bid

Bake Crafters Food - B 0.8510 my

McDonald, TN No Bid 85.14 sa No Bid No Bid
Butler Foods 0.5289 0.5042
Cantonment, FL No Bid No Bid 38.08 24.20
Churchfield Trading Co 0.4970 ly 0.4590 ly
Santa Ynez, CA No Bid No Bid 35.80 my 22.04 my
ES Foods
Woodbury, NY No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Foster Poultry Farms LLC
Livingston, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Gold Creek Foods
Gainesville, GA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Goodman - Don Lee
Inglewood, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Hormel Food Sales
Austin, MN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
House of Raeford Farms
Raeford, NC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Integrated Food Service
Gardena, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
JTM Provisions
Harrison, OH No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Maid Rite Specialty Food
Dunmore, PA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Nardone Bros Baking Co
Hanover Township, PA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
National Food Group
Novi, MI No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Proview Foods
Syosset, NY No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Rich Chicks
Gardena, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
S.A. Piazza & Assoc.
Clackamas, OR No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
S&F Foods
Romulus, MI No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Schwan's Food Service
Marshall, MN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Super Bakery Inc. 0.3833
Cleveland, OH 30.66 my No Bid No Bid No Bid

Tasty Brands-A 0.8092 0.4891
Syosset, NY No Bid 87.39 au No Bid 46.95 au

Tasty Brands-B 0.4747

Syosset, NY No Bid No Bid No Bid 53.17 au
Tasty Brands-C 0.4200

Syosset, NY No Bid No Bid No Bid 30.24 au
Tasty Brands-D 0.4200

Syosset, NY No Bid No Bid No Bid 30.24 au
Tyson
Springdale, AR No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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ITEM Oats Texas Toast Pizza, Cheese Pizza, Individual Cheesy Bread
Quick Garlic Round, Individual Mexican, No Bean Pull Apart

Quantity: 20 cs 4,500 cs 7,000 cs 5,000 cs 3,000 cs
0506121 0517220 0517440 0517670 0517690

ITEM NUMBER 17-DELETED 18 19 20 21
Arlington Valley Farms
Hudson, OH No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bake Crafters Food Co-A 0.2570 0.9770 au
McDonald, TN No Bid 30.95 my No Bid No Bid 70.41 m
Bake Crafters Food Co-B 0.9970 au
McDonald, TN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 71.81 m
Butler Foods 0.7331 0.5968
Cantonment, FL No Bid No Bid 52.78 au No Bid 66.84
Churchfield Trading Co 0.8820 ly
Santa Ynez, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 63.53 my
ES Foods
Woodbury, NY No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Foster Poultry Farms LLC
Livingston, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Gold Creek Foods
Gainesville, GA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Goodman - Don Lee
Inglewood, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Hormel Food Sales
Austin, MN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
House of Raeford Farms
Raeford, NC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Integrated Food Service
Gardena, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
JTM Provisions
Harrison, OH No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Maid Rite Specialty Food
Dunmore, PA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Nardone Bros Baking Co 0.9000 0.6600
Hanover Township, PA No Bid No Bid 54.13 63.14 No Bid
National Food Group
Novi, MI No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Proview Foods
Syosset, NY No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Rich Chicks
Gardena, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
S.A. Piazza & Assoc. 1.1220
Clackamas, OR No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 62.84
S&F Foods 0.7900

Romulus, MI No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 83.08
Schwan's Food Service 0.7418 au 0.6942 au 0.6646 au
Marshall, MN No Bid No Bid 44.51 m 49.98 m 66.46 m
Super Bakery Inc.
Cleveland, OH No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tasty Brands 0.9270
Syosset, NY No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 89.00 au
Tyson - A 0.4980
Springdale, AR No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 53.78 au
Tyson - B 0.4781
Springdale, AR No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 68.85 au

Page 5



ITEM Cheesy Bread Mini Burgers Patties Meatloaf Taco Meat
Bite Size Ground Beef Ground Beef Slices Frozen

Quantity: 4,000 cs 1,000 cs 1,000 cs 500 cs 1,500 cs
0516646 0515090 0516115 New Item 0516170

ITEM NUMBER 22 23 24 25-DELETED 26
Arlington Valley Farms
Hudson, OH No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bake Crafters Food Co-A 0.2450 au
McDonald, TN 58.95 m No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bake Crafters Food Co-B 0.2510 au
McDonald, TN 60.36 m No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Butler Foods 0.3019 0.6449 0.7654 1.0238 2.7890
Cantonment, FL 72.46 70.71 au 130.12 77.81 nu 89.24
Churchfield Trading Co
Santa Ynez, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
ES Foods
Woodbury, NY No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Foster Poultry Farms LLC
Livingston, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Gold Creek Foods
Gainesville, GA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Goodman - Don Lee 0.6933 au
Inglewood, CA No Bid No Bid 152.53 m No Bid No Bid
Hormel Food Sales
Austin, MN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
House of Raeford Farms
Raeford, NC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Integrated Food Service
Gardena, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
JTM Provisions - A 0.8070 4.8000
Harrison, OH No Bid No Bid 157.36 my No Bid 143.87 m
JTM Provisions - B 3.2183
Harrison, OH No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 96.55 m
JTM Provisions - C 2.6830
Harrison, OH No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 80.51 my
Maid Rite Specialty Food 0.3258 0.6000 0.6484
Dunmore, PA No Bid 125.10 ly 144.00 ly 103.74 l,nu No Bid
Nardone Bros Baking Co
Hanover Township, PA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
National Food Group
Novi, MI No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Proview Foods
Syosset, NY No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Rich Chicks
Gardena, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
S.A. Piazza & Assoc. 0.2894
Clackamas, OR 69.46 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
S&F Foods 0.8700
Romulus, MI 41.52 au No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Schwan's Food Service
Marshall, MN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Super Bakery Inc.
Cleveland, OH No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tasty Brands 0.9641
Syosset, NY 75.20 au No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tyson - A 0.5801 0.7419 0.9712 a
Springdale, AR No Bid 66.71 au 126.12 73.81 nu No Bid
Tyson - B 1.4735
Springdale, AR No Bid 141.46 au No Bid No Bid No Bid
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ITEM Meatballs, Beef Sausage Patty Sausage Link Smoked Sausage Pepperoni, Turkey
Frozen Turkey Turkey Frozen Sliced

Quantity: 600 cs 2,000 cs 2,000 cs 300 cs 300 cs
0516190 0516210 0516200 0516120 0512140

ITEM NUMBER 27 28 29-DELETED 30-DELETED 31
Arlington Valley Farms
Hudson, OH No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bake Crafters Food Co.
McDonald, TN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Butler Foods 0.7069
Cantonment, FL 45.24 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Churchfield Trading Co
Santa Ynez, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
ES Foods
Woodbury, NY No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Foster Poultry Farms LLC
Livingston, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Gold Creek Foods
Gainesville, GA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Goodman - Don Lee 0.4875 au
Inglewood, CA 117.00 m No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Hormel Food Sales - A 0.2761 0.2813 0.5099
Austin, MN No Bid 44.18 my 45.00 my No Bid 118.80 my
Hormel Food Sales - B 0.3357
Austin, MN No Bid 45.99 my No Bid No Bid No Bid
House of Raeford Farms
Raeford, NC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Integrated Food Service
Gardena, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
JTM Provisions - A 0.6549 au
Harrison, OH 111.99 m No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
JTM Provisions - B 0.6197 au
Harrison, OH 114.03 m No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Maid Rite Specialty Food 0.5875 l 0.2969 l
Dunmore, PA 112.80 mu 38.00 mu No Bid No Bid No Bid
Nardone Bros Baking Co
Hanover Township, PA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
National Food Group
Novi, MI No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Proview Foods
Syosset, NY No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Rich Chicks
Gardena, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
S.A. Piazza & Assoc.
Clackamas, OR No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
S&F Foods
Romulus, MI No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Schwan's Food Service
Marshall, MN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Super Bakery Inc.
Cleveland, OH No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tasty Brands
Syosset, NY No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tyson 0.6444
Springdale, AR 41.24 au No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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ITEM Bacon, Turkey Turkey Ham Turkey Ham Turkey Breast Turkey Breast
Frozen Sliced Whole, Boneless Roast, Sliced Thick Sliced

Quantity: 150 cs 1,000 cs 800 cs 700 cs 400 cs
0517540 0516220 0516221 0516340 0516312

ITEM NUMBER 32 33 34-DELETED 35 36
Arlington Valley Farms
Hudson, OH No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bake Crafters Food Co.
McDonald, TN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Butler Foods 5.8883
Cantonment, FL No Bid No Bid No Bid 70.66 No Bid
Churchfield Trading Co
Santa Ynez, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
ES Foods
Woodbury, NY No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Foster Poultry Farms LLC
Livingston, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Gold Creek Foods
Gainesville, GA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Goodman - Don Lee
Inglewood, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Hormel Food Sales 0.1626 0.7742 4.0400 1.0090
Austin, MN 97.58 my 48.00 my No Bid 72.72 my 220.95 my
House of Raeford Farms
Raeford, NC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Integrated Food Service
Gardena, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
JTM Provisions
Harrison, OH No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Maid Rite Specialty Food
Dunmore, PA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Nardone Bros Baking Co
Hanover Township, PA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
National Food Group
Novi, MI No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Proview Foods
Syosset, NY No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Rich Chicks
Gardena, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
S.A. Piazza & Assoc.
Clackamas, OR No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
S&F Foods
Romulus, MI No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Schwan's Food Service
Marshall, MN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Super Bakery Inc.
Cleveland, OH No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tasty Brands
Syosset, NY No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tyson 5.555
Springdale, AR No Bid No Bid No Bid 66.66 No Bid
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ITEM Roast Chicken Patty Chicken Patty Chicken Breast Chicken Breast
Turkey Thigh Grilled, White Breakfast Breaded, Spicy Breaded

Quantity: 600 cs 1500 cs 500 cs 5000 cs 6000 cs
0516760 0516562 0516580 0516620 0516930

ITEM NUMBER 37-DELETED 38 39 40 41
Arlington Valley Farms
Hudson, OH No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bake Crafters Food Co.
McDonald, TN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Butler Foods 1.1376 0.2603 0.8574 0.8345
Cantonment, FL No Bid 62.57 52.06 ay 113.18 110.16 au
Churchfield Trading Co
Santa Ynez, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
ES Foods
Woodbury, NY No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Foster Poultry Farms LLC
Livingston, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Gold Creek Foods 0.8200 0.3800 0.7600 0.7700
Gainesville, GA No Bid 43.50 96.64 au 30.40 30.60
Goodman - Don Lee
Inglewood, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Hormel Food Sales
Austin, MN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
House of Raeford Farms
Raeford, NC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Integrated Food Service
Gardena, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
JTM Provisions
Harrison, OH No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Maid Rite Specialty Food
Dunmore, PA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Nardone Bros Baking Co
Hanover Township, PA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
National Food Group
Novi, MI No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Proview Foods 1.2200 0.2650 1.0500 1.0500
Syosset, NY No Bid 58.68 au 53.00 84.00 84.00 au
Rich Chicks 0.5470 1.1040 1.0940
Gardena, CA No Bid No Bid 85.34 my 86.14 my 85.34 my
S.A. Piazza & Assoc.
Clackamas, OR No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
S&F Foods
Romulus, MI No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Schwan's Food Service
Marshall, MN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Super Bakery Inc.
Cleveland, OH No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tasty Brands
Syosset, NY No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tyson - A 1.0846 0.4592 0.8347 0.8118
Springdale, AR No Bid 58.57 103.77 au 110.18 107.16 au
Tyson - B 0.2403 1.0637
Springdale, AR No Bid No Bid 48.06 ay No Bid 127.64 ay
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ITEM Chicken Breast Popcorn Chicken Popcorn Chicken Chicken Fajita Meat Chicken, 8 pc
Tenders Frozen Spicy Grilled, Dark Breaded

Quantity: 1,500 cs 3,500 cs 1,000 cs 1,000 cs 4,000 cs
0516650 0516870 0516880 0516690 0516550

ITEM NUMBER 42 43 44 45 46
Arlington Valley Farms
Hudson, OH No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bake Crafters Food Co.
McDonald, TN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Butler Foods 0.9977 0.4961 0.4894 0.7198 1.2244
Cantonment, FL 116.73 76.90 77.82 123.09 au 95.50
Churchfield Trading Co
Santa Ynez, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
ES Foods
Woodbury, NY No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Foster Poultry Farms LLC
Livingston, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Gold Creek Foods 1.0500 0.6800 0.7100
Gainesville, GA 95.10 23.90 No Bid 170.56 No Bid
Goodman - Don Lee
Inglewood, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Hormel Food Sales
Austin, MN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
House of Raeford Farms
Raeford, NC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Integrated Food Service
Gardena, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
JTM Provisions
Harrison, OH No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Maid Rite Specialty Food
Dunmore, PA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Nardone Bros Baking Co
Hanover Township, PA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
National Food Group
Novi, MI No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Proview Foods 1.4660 0.5000 0.6218
Syosset, NY 84.00 au 53.00 No Bid 39.80 au No Bid
Rich Chicks 1.0940 0.6800
Gardena, CA 85.34 my 72.79 my No Bid No Bid No Bid
S.A. Piazza & Assoc.
Clackamas, OR No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
S&F Foods
Romulus, MI No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Schwan's Food Service
Marshall, MN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Super Bakery Inc.
Cleveland, OH No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tasty Brands
Syosset, NY No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tyson 0.9394 0.4737 0.4643 0.6964 1.1280
Springdale, AR 112.73 73.90 73.82 119.09 au 92.50
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ITEM Chicken Chicken Taco Wrap Fish Sticks Fish Portion
8-piece roasted Rotisserie Meat-Filled Cornmeal Crust Cornmeal Crust

Quantity: 1,500 cs 500 cs 400 cs 1,500 cs 500 cs
0516540 New Item 0516730 0515051 0515030

ITEM NUMBER 47 48 49 50 51
Arlington Valley Farms
Hudson, OH No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bake Crafters Food Co.
McDonald, TN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Butler Foods 1.0074 4.9600 0.6574 0.7326 0.6818
Cantonment, FL 78.58 119.08 my 47.33 au 63.00 60.00 au
Churchfield Trading Co 0.858 l
Santa Ynez, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid 73.00 my No Bid
ES Foods
Woodbury, NY No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Foster Poultry Farms LLC
Livingston, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Gold Creek Foods
Gainesville, GA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Goodman - Don Lee - A 0.8385 ay
Inglewood, CA No Bid No Bid 88.89 m No Bid No Bid
Goodman - Don Lee - B 0.8096 au
Inglewood, CA No Bid No Bid 76.10 m No Bid No Bid
Goodman - Don Lee - C 0.8066 au
Inglewood, CA No Bid No Bid 71.80 m No Bid No Bid
Hormel Food Sales
Austin, MN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
House of Raeford Farms 4.6700
Raeford, NC No Bid 112.08 my No Bid No Bid No Bid
Integrated Food Service 0.7400 au
Gardena, CA No Bid No Bid 74.00 m No Bid No Bid
JTM Provisions
Harrison, OH No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Maid Rite Specialty Food
Dunmore, PA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Nardone Bros Baking Co
Hanover Township, PA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
National Food Group
Novi, MI No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Proview Foods
Syosset, NY No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Rich Chicks
Gardena, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
S.A. Piazza & Assoc.
Clackamas, OR No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
S&F Foods
Romulus, MI No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Schwan's Food Service
Marshall, MN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Super Bakery Inc.
Cleveland, OH No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tasty Brands
Syosset, NY No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tyson - A 0.9562 0.5201 0.5879
Springdale, AR 74.58 37.97 au 42.33 au No Bid No Bid
Tyson - B 0.5008
Springdale, AR No Bid No Bid 36.06 au No Bid No Bid
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ITEM BBQ Pork Chili w/ Beans Chili w/o Beans Chili Vegetarian Corn Dog
Shredded Canned Canned Canned Frozen

Quantity: 1,000 cs 1,000 cs 1,000 cs 1,000 cs 3,000 cs
0516940 0512060 New Item New Item 0516052

ITEM NUMBER 52 53-DELETED 54-DELETED 55-DELETED 56
Arlington Valley Farms
Hudson, OH No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bake Crafters Food Co.
McDonald, TN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Butler Foods 3.4010 16.7083 9.4367 0.8356
Cantonment, FL 68.02 No Bid 100.25 au 56.62 au 40.11
Churchfield Trading Co
Santa Ynez, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
ES Foods
Woodbury, NY No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Foster Poultry Farms LLC 0.5950 ly
Livingston, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 42.84 my
Gold Creek Foods
Gainesville, GA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Goodman - Don Lee 0.8325 au
Inglewood, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 59.94 m
Hormel Food Sales
Austin, MN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
House of Raeford Farms
Raeford, NC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Integrated Food Service
Gardena, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
JTM Provisions
Harrison, OH No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Maid Rite Specialty Food
Dunmore, PA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Nardone Bros Baking Co
Hanover Township, PA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
National Food Group
Novi, MI No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Proview Foods
Syosset, NY No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Rich Chicks
Gardena, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
S.A. Piazza & Assoc.
Clackamas, OR No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
S&F Foods
Romulus, MI No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Schwan's Food Service
Marshall, MN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Super Bakery Inc.
Cleveland, OH No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tasty Brands
Syosset, NY No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tyson 0.7731
Springdale, AR No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 37.11

Page 12



ITEM Frankfurters Frankfurters Toaster Pastries Toaster Pastries Crispy Biscuit
Beef Turkey Singe Count Two Count Shelf Stable

Quantity: 2,000 cs 2,000 cs 3,000 cs 2,200 cs 1,000 cs
0516070 0516070 0505970 0505980 New Item

ITEM NUMBER 57 58-DELETED 59 60 61
Arlington Valley Farms
Hudson, OH No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bake Crafters Food Co.
McDonald, TN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Butler Foods 0.5263 0.3383 0.5067 0.3731
Cantonment, FL 42.10 No Bid 40.60 36.48 44.77 ny
Churchfield Trading Co 0.1366 l 0.354 ly
Santa Ynez, CA No Bid 21.87 mu No Bid No Bid 42.55 my
ES Foods
Woodbury, NY No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Foster Poultry Farms LLC
Livingston, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Gold Creek Foods
Gainesville, GA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Goodman - Don Lee
Inglewood, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Hormel Food Sales 0.4488
Austin, MN No Bid 71.80 my No Bid No Bid No Bid
House of Raeford Farms
Raeford, NC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Integrated Food Service
Gardena, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
JTM Provisions
Harrison, OH No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Maid Rite Specialty Food
Dunmore, PA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Nardone Bros Baking Co
Hanover Township, PA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
National Food Group 0.5268 ly
Novi, MI 42.15 my No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Proview Foods
Syosset, NY No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Rich Chicks
Gardena, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
S.A. Piazza & Assoc.
Clackamas, OR No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
S&F Foods
Romulus, MI No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Schwan's Food Service
Marshall, MN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Super Bakery Inc.
Cleveland, OH No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tasty Brands
Syosset, NY No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tyson 0.5559
Springdale, AR 44.47 au No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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ITEM Oatmeal Bar Cereal Bar Cereal Bar w/ Cereal Cereal, Pre-K
Shelf Stable Shelf Stable Cereal Pieces Ready to Eat Ready to Eat

Quantity: 1,000 cs 2,000 cs 2,000 cs 6,000 cs 600 cs
0505990 0505990 0505130 0506010 0506030

ITEM NUMBER 62 63 64 65 66
Arlington Valley Farms
Hudson, OH No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bake Crafters Food Co.
McDonald, TN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Butler Foods 0.3706 0.2817 * 0.3602 * 0.2913 0.2913
Cantonment, FL 53.37 60.85 34.58 27.96 27.96
Churchfield Trading Co 0.357 ly 0.3320 ly 0.2920 l 0.3110 ly
Santa Ynez, CA 51.50 my No Bid 31.95 my 28.04 mu 29.90 mu
ES Foods 0.6225 l 0.3800 ly
Woodbury, NY 74.70 m 57.00 mu No Bid No Bid No Bid
Foster Poultry Farms LLC
Livingston, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Gold Creek Foods
Gainesville, GA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Goodman - Don Lee
Inglewood, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Hormel Food Sales
Austin, MN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
House of Raeford Farms
Raeford, NC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Integrated Food Service
Gardena, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
JTM Provisions
Harrison, OH No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Maid Rite Specialty Food
Dunmore, PA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Nardone Bros Baking Co
Hanover Township, PA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
National Food Group
Novi, MI No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Proview Foods
Syosset, NY No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Rich Chicks
Gardena, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
S.A. Piazza & Assoc.
Clackamas, OR No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
S&F Foods
Romulus, MI No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Schwan's Food Service
Marshall, MN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Super Bakery Inc.
Cleveland, OH No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tasty Brands
Syosset, NY No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tyson
Springdale, AR No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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ITEM Cereal Granola Chicken Chunk Tuna Taco Shell
Bulk Pack Bulk Pack Canned Light Bowls

Quantity: 100 cs 800 cs 50 cs 50 cs 1,800 cs
0506170 0506180 0504130 0504100 0511190

ITEM NUMBER 67 68 69-DELETED 70 71
Arlington Valley Farms
Hudson, OH No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bake Crafters Food Co. 0.266 au
McDonald, TN No Bid 106.56 m No Bid No Bid No Bid
Butler Foods 12.7100 11.9375 20.0650 1.1326
Cantonment, FL 50.83 47.75 No Bid 120.39 81.55
Churchfield Trading Co-A 15.1200 l
Santa Ynez, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid 90.72 mu No Bid
Churchfield Trading Co-B 10.8350 au
Santa Ynez, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid 65.01 m No Bid
ES Foods
Woodbury, NY No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Foster Poultry Farms LLC
Livingston, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Gold Creek Foods
Gainesville, GA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Goodman - Don Lee
Inglewood, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Hormel Food Sales
Austin, MN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
House of Raeford Farms
Raeford, NC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Integrated Food Service
Gardena, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
JTM Provisions
Harrison, OH No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Maid Rite Specialty Food
Dunmore, PA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Nardone Bros Baking Co
Hanover Township, PA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
National Food Group
Novi, MI No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Proview Foods
Syosset, NY No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Rich Chicks
Gardena, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
S.A. Piazza & Assoc.
Clackamas, OR No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
S&F Foods
Romulus, MI No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Schwan's Food Service
Marshall, MN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Super Bakery Inc.
Cleveland, OH No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tasty Brands
Syosset, NY No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tyson
Springdale, AR No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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ITEM Fruit Slush Raisins French Fries Breakfast Pastrie Mini Calzones
Fruit Juice Flavored Potato Stix Egg & Cheese Cheese

Quantity: 8,000 cs 2,000 cs 1,000 cs 300 cs 3,000 cs
0517470 0509161 0514321 0517240 0516780

ITEM NUMBER 72 73 74 75-DELETED 76
Arlington Valley Farms
Hudson, OH No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bake Crafters Food Co.
McDonald, TN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Butler Foods 0.3850 0.3110 2.6540 0.8140 au 1.0285
Cantonment, FL 23.10 77.75 ay 79.62 48.84 m 49.37
Churchfield Trading Co 0.3720 ly 1.0140 ly
Santa Ynez, CA No Bid 74.51 my No Bid No Bid 48.68 my
ES Foods
Woodbury, NY No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Foster Poultry Farms LLC
Livingston, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Gold Creek Foods
Gainesville, GA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Goodman - Don Lee
Inglewood, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Hormel Food Sales
Austin, MN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
House of Raeford Farms
Raeford, NC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Integrated Food Service
Gardena, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
JTM Provisions
Harrison, OH No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Maid Rite Specialty Food
Dunmore, PA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Nardone Bros Baking Co
Hanover Township, PA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
National Food Group
Novi, MI No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Proview Foods
Syosset, NY No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Rich Chicks
Gardena, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
S.A. Piazza & Assoc.
Clackamas, OR No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
S&F Foods 0.8700
Romulus, MI No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 41.52
Schwan's Food Service 0.6949 au
Marshall, MN No Bid No Bid No Bid 66.71 m No Bid
Super Bakery Inc.
Cleveland, OH No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tasty Brands 1.0630
Syosset, NY No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 82.91 au
Tyson
Springdale, AR No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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ITEM Meatballs Turkey Breast
Garlic Basil Sticks

Quantity: 700 cs 1,000 cs
0516180 0517710

ITEM NUMBER 77 78
Arlington Valley Farms
Hudson, OH No Bid No Bid
Bake Crafters Food Co.
McDonald, TN No Bid No Bid
Butler Foods
Cantonment, FL No Bid No Bid
Churchfield Trading Co
Santa Ynez, CA No Bid No Bid
ES Foods
Woodbury, NY No Bid No Bid
Foster Poultry Farms LLC
Livingston, CA No Bid No Bid
Gold Creek Foods
Gainesville, GA No Bid No Bid
Goodman - Don Lee
Inglewood, CA No Bid No Bid
Hormel Food Sales 0.6398
Austin, MN No Bid 127.95 my
House of Raeford Farms
Raeford, NC No Bid No Bid
Integrated Food Service
Gardena, CA No Bid No Bid
JTM Provisions
Harrison, OH No Bid No Bid
Maid Rite Specialty Food
Dunmore, PA No Bid No Bid
Nardone Bros Baking Co
Hanover Township, PA No Bid No Bid
National Food Group
Novi, MI No Bid No Bid
Proview Foods
Syosset, NY No Bid No Bid
Rich Chicks 0.9840
Gardena, CA 121.05 my No Bid
S.A. Piazza & Assoc.
Clackamas, OR No Bid No Bid
S&F Foods
Romulus, MI No Bid No Bid
Schwan's Food Service
Marshall, MN No Bid No Bid
Super Bakery Inc.
Cleveland, OH No Bid No Bid
Tasty Brands
Syosset, NY No Bid No Bid
Tyson
Springdale, AR No Bid No Bid

* = Item #1 approved for oatmeal raisin only (40400) 
* = Item #9 not approved for lemon (7507)
* = Item #10 not approved for Kelloggs Blueberry (3800092560)
* = Item #63 not approved for Chocolate Chip Oatmeal (70300)
* = Item #64 not approved Team Cheerios Strawberry (31914000)
a = Alternate product bid 
au = Alternate product bid.  Product not approved in taste test, or no sample was sent by bidder, or non-domestic product
ay = Product was approved in taste test
ft = Full truckload
ht = Half truckload
iy  = Imported product was approved in taste test
iu = Imported product was not approved in taste test, or no sample was sent, or non-domestic product

l  = Delivery lead time

lu = Delivery lead time is not acceptable

ly = Delivery lead time is acceptable

m = Minimum ship quantities
mu = Minimum ship quantity bid is not acceptable 
my = Yes - minimum ship quantity bid is acceptable
sa = Split Total Quantity/Award 50% For Each Item

BID TABULATION, RECOMMENDATIONS, AND PROTEST
Bid tabulations with award recommendations are posted for 72 hours in the Procurement Department Office and are also posted to the School 
District's website address at: https://www.escambiaschools.org/Page/1048. Notices will not be automatically mailed.

Failure to file a protest within the time prescribed in Section 120.57(3) Florida Statutes, or failure to post the bond or other security required by law 
within the time allowed for filing a bond shall constitute a waiver of proceedings under Chapter 120 Florida Statues.

I hereby certify that the prices and bidders reflected herein are valid, and have been received in compliance to Escambia County School Board Rules 
and Florida Law.

Allison Watson
Allison Watson, Director
Procurement Department
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