& THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

75 North Pace Blvd.

Pensacola, FL 32507

AWARD NOTICE

AU pie: ’

DATE: BID TITLE & REFERENCE:
June 7, 2023 Cafeteria Equipment, Bid #231602

DESCRIPTION OF PURCHASE:

An annual purchasing agreement, with two (2), one (1) year renewal option to provide cafeteria
equipment to schools throughout the District. Thirty-seven (37) items were bid and thirty-two (32) items
were awarded. Five (5) items were not awarded due to no bids and/or sample documentation was
received, or sample documentation was not approved. Items will be purchased as needed to meet

cafeteria usage requirements. The solicitation and tabulation of responses may be viewed at
https://www.escambiaschools.org/Page/1048

Effective Dates: July 1, 2023 through June 30, 2024

REQUESTED BY:

Food Services

SUPPLIER NAME:

Kesco Kitchen Equipment & Supply Company, Pensacola, FL

AMOUNT OF PURCHASE: FUNDING SOURCE:

$429,194.00 Est./ Yr. Food Services Fund (4110)
METHOD OF PROCUREMENT:

ECSD Bid Bids Received: 2 Bids Rejected: 0
DATE AND TIME POSTED:

June 7, 2023, 12:30 p.m. Central Time
9500 PUR 100 (01/14) — Retention 5 years




DATE: June7,2023

BID NBR: 231602
BID TITLE: Cafeteria Equipment

Top Price: Equipment - Delivery Only

THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
75 NORTH PACE BOULEVARD
PENSACOLA, FLORIDA 32505

BID TABULATION

Awarded Items are highlighted

Bottom Price: Equipment & Full Installation

ITEM Shelving Mobile Shelving Washer Machine, Dryer,
Units Units Laundry Laundry
Quantity: 1 ea. 1 ea. 1 ea. 1 ea.
ITEM NUMBER 1 2 3 - DELETED 4 - DELETED
Kesco Kit. Equip. & Supply Co. 500.00 760.00
Pensacola, FL 500.00 760.00 No Bid No Bid
Stafford-Smith, Inc.
Kalamazoo, Ml No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
ITEM Dunnage Rack Electric
48" Long Can Opener Slicer Slicer
Quantity: 1 ea. 1 ea. 1 ea. 1 ea.
ITEM NUMBER 5 6 7 7
Kesco Kit. Equip. & Supply Co. 198.00 1,550.00 10,300.00 8,500.00
Pensacola, FL 198.00 1,550.00 10,300.00 8,500.00
Stafford-Smith, Inc. 14,304.29
Kalamazoo, MI No Bid No Bid 15,229.30 No Bid
ITEM Slicer Combi-oven/ Convection Steamer, Convection Steamer,
Stand Mobile Steamer Gas Double Stack Gas Gas
Quantity: 1 ea. 1 ea. 3 ea. 2 ea.
ITEM NUMBER 8 9 10 1
Kesco Kit. Equip. & Supply Co. 1,850.00 27,296.00 28,200.00 33,600.00
Pensacola, FL 1,850.00 27,296.00 28,200.00 33,600.00
Stafford-Smith, Inc. 2,321.80 36,114.27 44,207.80 50,024.65
Kalamazoo, MI 3,367.30 39,214.30 47,528.00 53,479.05




ITEM Reach-In Reach-In Reach-In Reach-In
Refrigerator Refrigerator Refrigerator Refrigerator
Quantity: 1 ea. 1 ea. 1 ea. 7 ea.
ITEM NUMBER 12 12 13 13
Kesco Kit. Equip. & Supply Co. 6,500.00 13,600.00 7,360.00 18,750.00
Pensacola, FL 6,500.00 13,600.00 7,360.00 18,750.00
Stafford-Smith, Inc. 19,225.86 25,530.57
Kalamazoo, MI 22,055.86 No Bid 28,330.57 No Bid
ITEM Reach-In Reach-In Mobile Pan Mobile Hot/
Freezer Freezer Racks Proof Cabinet
Quantity: 1 ea. 1 ea. 2 ea. 7 ea.
ITEM NUMBER 14 14 15 16
Kesco Kit. Equip. & Supply Co. 9,000.00 10,900.00 1,250.00 6,800.00
Pensacola, FL 9,000.00 10,900.00 1,250.00 6,800.00
Stafford-Smith, Inc. 20,073.11 10,819.90
Kalamazoo, MI 22,873.11 No Bid No Bid 13,969.90
ITEM Mobile Hot/ Work Table w/ Mobile Platform Safety Ladder
Proof Cabinet Overhead Pot Rack Truck
Quantity: 7 ea. 1 ea. 1 ea. 1 ea.
ITEM NUMBER 16 17 - DELETED 18 19 - DELETED
Kesco Kit. Equip. & Supply Co. 7,500.00 625.00
Pensacola, FL 7,500.00 No Bid 625.00 No Bid
Stafford-Smith, Inc. 656.50
Kalamazoo, Ml No Bid No Bid 1,031.50 No Bid
ITEM Pass-thru Pass-thru Mobile Cold Mobile Hot
Refrigerator Warmer Food Counter Food Counter
Quantity: 1 ea. 1 ea. 1 ea. 1 ea.
ITEM NUMBER 20 21 22 23
Kesco Kit. Equip. & Supply Co. 23,650.00 21,275.00 12,280.00 12,290.00
Pensacola, FL 23,650.00 21,275.00 12,280.00 12,290.00
Stafford-Smith, Inc. 33,206.94 29,498.04
Kalamazoo, MI 36,006.90 32,298.04 No Bid No Bid




ITEM Mobile Hot Mobile Hot Mobile Dual Service Mobile Dual Service
Food Counter Top Counter Milk Cooler Milk Cooler
Quantity: 1 ea. 1 ea. 1 ea. 1 ea.
ITEM NUMBER 24 25 26 27
Kesco Kit. Equip. & Supply Co. 9,750.00 10,600.00 6,350.00 4,850.00
Pensacola, FL 9,750.00 10,600.00 6,350.00 4,850.00
Stafford-Smith, Inc. 7,095.43 4,384.70
Kalamazoo, Mi No Bid No Bid 9,385.40 6,614.70
ITEM Mobile Cash Mobile Hot/Cold Ice Maker, Ice Storage Bin,
Counter Food Counter Small Small
Quantity: 1 ea. 1 ea. 1 ea. 1 ea.
ITEM NUMBER 28 29 30 31
Kesco Kit. Equip. & Supply Co. 5,900.00 17,370.00 3,900.00 1,390.00
Pensacola, FL 5,900.00 17,370.00 3,900.00 1,390.00
Stafford-Smith, Inc. 5,012.47 1,632.46
Kalamazoo, MI No Bid No Bid 8,660.47 3,182.46
ITEM Ice Maker, Ice Storage Bin, Ice Machine (Nugget Ice) Moble Work
Large Large w/ Storage Bin Table
Quantity: 1 ea. 1 ea. 1 ea. 1 ea.
ITEM NUMBER 32 33 34 35
Kesco Kit. Equip. & Supply Co. 3,950.00 1,595.00 4,950.00 3,150.00
Pensacola, FL 3,950.00 1,595.00 4,950.00 3,150.00
Stafford-Smith, Inc. 4,829.30 1,792.96 7,960.10
Kalamazoo, MI 7,247.30 3,993.00 10,393.10 No Bid
ITEM Baker's Table Convection Oven
w/Spice Shelf (Double Deck)
Quantity: 6 ea. 6 ea.
ITEM NUMBER 36 - DELETED 37
Kesco Kit. Equip. & Supply Co. 19,900.00
Pensacola, FL No Bid 19,900.00
Stafford-Smith, Inc. 35,021.54
Kalamazoo, MI No Bid 37,821.54

BID TABULATION, RECOMMENDATIONS, AND PROTEST

Bid tabulations with award recommendations are posted for seventy-two (72) hours in the Purchasing Department Office and are also posted to
the School District's website address at: http://ecsd-fl.schoolloop.com/purchasing/bids.

Failure to file a protest within the time prescribed in Section 120.57(3) Florida Statutes, or failure to post the bond or other security required by
law within the time allowed for filing a bond shall constitute a waiver of proceedings under Chapter 120 Florida Statutes. Notices will not be

automatically mailed.

| hereby certify that the prices and bidders reflected herein are valid, and have been received in compliance to Escambia County School Board
Rules and Florida Law.

Alson Watzon

Allison Watson, Purchasing Director




