THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
75 North Pace Blvd.
Pensacola, FL 32505

RFP/BID AWARD NOTICE

DATE: RFP/BID TITLE & REFERENCE:
March 2, 2023 Food Processing: USDA Commodities,
RFP #230902

DESCRIPTION OF PURCHASE:

An annual agreement to provide processing of USDA commodity items into ready to use products for
use in the preparation of school meals as stocked and distributed by the Central Warehouse for school
cafeterias throughout the District. Responders meeting specifications with the aggregate low price for
the commodity/lot were awarded in each area. Forty-nine (49) items were offered and forty-four (44)
items are recommended for award. Five (5) items were not awarded due to no bids being received or
sample products were not approved in taste tests. Items will be purchased as needed to meet breakfast
and lunch menu requirements. Recommend RFP award(s) to the lowest responder(s) meeting
specifications.

Effective Dates: July 1, 2023 through June 30, 2024.

REQUESTED BY:

Food Services

SUPPLIER NAME: ITEMS AWARDED:  ESTIMATED ANNUAL EXPENDITURE:
Bongard Creameries, Chanhassen, MN 1 $ 80,444.00
Brookwood Farms, Siler City, NC 1 64,000.00
ES Foods, Woodbury, NC 1 159,530.00
Goodman Food Products, Inglewood, CA 4 276,845.00
Hormel Food Sales, Austin, MN 8 647,953.50
JTM Provisions, Harrison, OH 1 98,150.00
Land O’ Lakes, Arden Hills, MN 4 264,625.00
National Food Group, Novi, Mi 2 466,500.00
Red Gold, Elwood, IN 10 400,472.00
Rich’s Chick, Gardena, CA 2 111,797.00
Schwan’s Food Service, Marshall, MN 1 244 .880.00
Tyson, Springdale, AR 9 1,247,875.00

AMOUNT OF PURCHASE: FUNDING SOURCE:

$4,063,071.50 Est. / Yr. Food Services Fund (4110)

METHOD OF PROCUREMENT:

ECSD RFP Responses Received: 20 Responses Rejected: 1

DATE AND TIME POSTED:

March 2, 2023, 3:16 p.m. Central Time

9500 PUR 100 (11/10) — Retention 5 years




DATE: March 2, 2023
RFP NBR: 230902

RFP TITLE: Food Processing: USDA Commodities

THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY

PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
75 NORTH PACE BOULEVARD
PENSACOLA, FLORIDA 32505

RFP TABULATION

Awarded Items are highlighted

Vendor Goodman Food
Item Bongards Creameries, Brookwood Farms, Butterball, Del Monte Foods, Inc., ES Foods, Products, Gold Creek Foods, |Hormel Food Sales,| JTM Provisions, Land O' Lakes,
No. Chanhassen, MN Siler City, NC Garner, NC Walnut Creek, CA Woodbury, NY Inglewood, CA Gainesville, GA LLC, Austin, MN Harrison, OH Arden Hills, MN
1 Chicken, 8-Piece, Breaded (0516550) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid (AU) No Bid No Bid No Bid
Gold Creek Foods
Brand: 791880
Commodity Code#: 100103
Portion Size: 4.57 oz
Portions / Case: 112
Case Size: 8
Fee For Service/Case: $64.32
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): $50.11/1.022
2 Chicken, 8-Piece, Roasted (0516540) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid (AU) No Bid No Bid No Bid
Gold Creek Foods
Brand: 791890
Commodity Code#: 100103
Portion Size: 3.71 0z
Portions / Case: 138
Case Size: 8
Fee For Service/Case: $65.28
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): $61.59/0.919
Chicken Filet, Whl Muscle, Small, Breaded
3 (0516580) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid (AU) No Bid No Bid No Bid
Gold Creek Foods
Brand: 792426
Commodity Code#: 100103
Portion Size: 2.0 0z
Portions / Case: 256
Case Size: 8
Fee For Service/Case: $66.56
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): $42.68/0.427
Chicken Breast Filets, Whl Muscle, Breaded
4 (0516930) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Gold Creek Foods
Brand: 792421
Commodity Code#: 100103
Portion Size: 4.0 oz
Portions / Case: 128
Case Size: 8
Fee For Service/Case: $69.44
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): $41.01/0.863




Vendor

Goodman Food

Item Bongard Cremeries, Brookwood Farms, Butterball, Del Monte Foods, Inc., ES Foods, Products, Gold Creek Foods, |Hormel Food Sales,| JTM Provisions, Land O' Lakes,
No. Chanhassen, MN Siler City, NC Garner, NC Walnut Creek, CA Woodbury, NY Inglewood, CA Gainesville, GA LLC, Austin, MN Harrison, OH Arden Hills, MN
Chicken Breast Filet, Hot, Spicy, Whl Muscle,
5 Breaded (0516620) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Gold Creek Foods
Brand: 792431
Commodity Code#: 100103
Portion Size: 4.0 0z
Portions / Case: 128
Case Size: 8
Fee For Service/Case: $72.64
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): $41.01/0.888
Chicken Tenders, Whole Muscle, Breaded
6 (0516650) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid (AU) No Bid No Bid No Bid
Gold Creek Foods
Brand: 792441
Commodity Code#: 100103
Portion Size: 4.5 oz
Portions / Case: 113
Case Size: 8
Fee For Service/Case: $60.16
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): $41.01/0.895
7 Popcorn Chicken, Chunk, Breaded (0516870) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid (AU) No Bid No Bid No Bid
Gold Creek Foods
Brand: 791461
Commodity Code#: 100103
Portion Size: 0.25 oz
Portions / Case: 170
Case Size: 8
Fee For Service/Case: $49.60
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): $32.01/0.480
8 Popcorn Chicken, Spicy, Breaded (0516880) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand:
Commodity Code#:
Portion Size:
Portions / Case:
Case Size:
Fee For Service/Case:
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value):
Chicken Breast Filet, Whl Muscle, Grilled
9 (0516560) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand:
Commodity Code#:
Portion Size:
Portions / Case:
Case Size:

Fee For Service/Case:

Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value):




Item
No.

Vendor

Bongard Cremeries,
Chanhassen, MN

Brookwood Farms,
Siler City, NC

Butterball,
Garner, NC

Del Monte Foods, Inc.,

Walnut Creek, CA

ES Foods,
Woodbury, NY

Goodman Food
Products,
Inglewood, CA

Gold Creek Foods,
Gainesville, GA

Hormel Food Sales,
LLC, Austin, MN

JTM Provisions,
Harrison, OH

Land O' Lakes,
Arden Hills, MN

10

Garlic Basil, Chicken Meatballs w/
Mozzarella Cheese (0516180)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Brand:

Commodity Code#:

Portion Size:

Portions / Case:

Case Size:

Fee For Service/Case:

Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value):

11

Chicken Fajita Strips (0516890):

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

(AY)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Brand:

Gold Creek Foods
791896

Commodity Code#:

100103

Portion Size:

214 oz

Portions / Case:

239

Case Size:

8

Fee For Service/Case:

$93.44

Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value):

$75.57/0.707

12

Beef, Mini Burgers (0515190)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

(MY)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Brand:

CNQ211203

Commodity Code#:

100154

Portion Size:

1.20 oz.

Portions / Case:

49

Case Size:

400

Fee For Service/Case:

$57.60

Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value):

$84.79/.3560

13

Beef Crumbles (0516970)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

(MY)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Brand:

CNQ21104

Commodity Code#:

100154

Portion Size:

2.20 oz

Portions / Case:

36

Case Size:

291

Fee For Service/Case:

$78.00

Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value):

$82.80/.5526

14

Beef Taco Meat, Reduced Sodium (0516170)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

(M)

No Bid

Brand:

JTM

Commodity Code#:

CP5249

Portion Size:

3.17 oz

Portions / Case:

151

Case Size:

6 bags

Fee For Service/Case:

$44.33

Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value):

$53.36/0.6470

14

Beef Taco Meat, Reduced Sodium (0516170)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

(MY)

No Bid

Brand:

JTM

Commodity Code#:

CP5258

Portion Size:

3.03 oz

Portions / Case:

158

Case Size:

6 bags

Fee For Service/Case:

$39.26

Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value):

$40.39/0.5041




Goodman Food

Item Vendor Bongard Cremeries, Brookwood Farms, Butterball, Del Monte Foods, Inc., ES Foods, Products, Gold Creek Foods, [Hormel Food Sales,| JTM Provisions, Land O' Lakes,
No. Chanhassen, MN Siler City, NC Garner, NC Walinut Creek, CA Woodbury, NY Inglewood, CA Gainesville, GA LLC, Austin, MN Harrison, OH Arden Hills, MN
Beef Taco Meat, Reduced Sodium (0516170)
14 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid (M) No Bid
Brand: JTM
Commodity Code#: CP5249
Portion Size: 2.71 0z
Portions / Case: 177
Case Size: 6 bags
Fee For Service/Case: $47.34
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): $99.40/0.8290
15 Beef Meatballs (0516190) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid (MY) No Bid No Bid (MY) No Bid
Brand: CNQ28053VS JTM #5035
Commodity Code#: 100154 CP5035
Portion Size: 2.00 oz 2.60 oz
Portions / Case: 960 184
Case Size: 54 6 bags
Fee For Service/Case: $52.80 $54.31
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): $87.05/.5827 $73.06/0.6922
15 Beef Meatballs (0516190) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid (AU,M) No Bid
Brand: JTM #5049
Commodity Code#: CP5049
Portion Size: 2.50 oz
Portions / Case: 192
Case Size: 6 bags
Fee For Service/Case: $55.41
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): $116.59/0.8958
16 Ground Beef Patties (0516115) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid (MY) No Bid No Bid (M) No Bid
Brand: CNQ212503 JTM CP5670
Commodity Code#: 100154 CP5670
Portion Size: 2.50 oz 2.45 0z
Portions / Case: 200 195
Case Size: 200 6 bags
Fee For Service/Case: $55.63 $56.36
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): $69.12/.6238 $117.64/0.8923
16 Ground Beef Patties (0516115) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid (AY,M) No Bid
Brand: JTM CP5659
Commodity Code#: CP5659
Portion Size: 2.50 oz
Portions / Case: 196
Case Size: 6 bags
Fee For Service/Case: $55.69
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): $81.78/0.7014
17 Frankfurters, Turkey (0516070) No Bid No Bid (AU,M) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid (MY) No Bid No Bid
Butterball 22655-
Brand: 89212 Jennie-O
Commodity Code#: 100124 612620
Portion Size: 2 oz. 20z
Portions / Case: 160 160
Case Size: 1 4
Fee For Service/Case: $11.72 $38.40
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): $30.78/.2656 $32.73/.4446




Goodman Food

Item Vendor Bongard Cremeries, Brookwood Farms, Butterball, Del Monte Foods, Inc., ES Foods, Products, Gold Creek Foods, [Hormel Food Sales,| JTM Provisions, Land O' Lakes,
No. Chanhassen, MN Siler City, NC Garner, NC Walinut Creek, CA Woodbury, NY Inglewood, CA Gainesville, GA LLC, Austin, MN Harrison, OH Arden Hills, MN
18 Pepperoni, Turkey, Sliced (0512140) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid (MY) No Bid No Bid
Brand: Jennie-0O
Commodity Code#: 231008
Portion Size: 1.37 oz
Portions / Case: 233
Case Size: 8
Fee For Service/Case: $83.80
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): $32.26/.4981
19 |Turkey Sausage, Patty (0516210) No Bid No Bid (AY,M) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid (MY) No Bid No Bid
Butterball 22655-
Brand: 89208 Jennie-O
Commodity Code#: 100124 613203
Portion Size: 1410z 1.025 oz
Portions / Case: 226 160
Case Size: 1 2
Fee For Service/Case: $31.18 $28.29
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): $34.12/.2889 $15.56/.2741
20 |Sausage Link, Turkey (0516200) DELETED No Bid No Bid (AU,M) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid (MY) No Bid No Bid
Butterball 22655-
Brand: 89207 Jennie-O
Commodity Code#: 100124 614003
Portion Size: 1410z 1.025 oz
Portions / Case: 226 160
Case Size: 1 2
Fee For Service/Case: $31.18 $29.11
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): $34.12/.2889 $15.56/.2792
21 Turkey (0516312) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid (MY) No Bid No Bid
Brand: Jennie-O
Commodity Code#: 878403
Portion Size: 2.93 oz
Portions / Case: 245
Case Size: 9
Fee For Service/Case: $156.15
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): $63.52/.8966
22  |Turkey Ham, Deli Style, Pre-Sliced (0516220) No Bid No Bid (AY,M) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid (MY) No Bid No Bid
Butterball 22655-
Brand: 89202 Jennie-O
Commodity Code#: 100124 256503
Portion Size: 3.58 oz 3.06 oz
Portions / Case: 80 62
Case Size: 12 12
Fee For Service/Case: $34.53 $26.88
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): $42.92/.9681 $20.69/.7673
23  |Turkey Ham, Whole (0516221) - DELETED No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand:
Commodity Code#:
Portion Size:
Portions / Case:
Case Size:

Fee For Service/Case:

Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value):




Vendor

Goodman Food

Item Bongard Cremeries, Brookwood Farms, Butterball, Del Monte Foods, Inc., ES Foods, Products, Gold Creek Foods, [Hormel Food Sales,| JTM Provisions, Land O' Lakes,
No. _ _ _ - - Chanhassen, MN Siler City, NC Garner, NC Walnut Creek, CA Woodbury, NY Inglewood, CA Gainesville, GA LLC, Austin, MN Harrison, OH Arden Hills, MN
Roast Turkey Breast, Deli Style, Pre-Sliced
24 |(0516340) No Bid No Bid (AU,M) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid (MY) No Bid No Bid
Butterball 22655-
Brand: 89104 Jennie-O
Commodity Code#: 100124 209918
Portion Size: 3.150z 30z
Portions / Case: 144 96
Case Size: 44 12
Fee For Service/Case: $60.14 $47.16
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): $37.58/.6786 $25.06/.7523
25 |Turkey Breast Sticks (0517710) No Bid No Bid (AU,M) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid (MY) No Bid No Bid
Butterball 22655-
Brand: 89209 Jennie-O
Commodity Code#: 100124 207130
Portion Size: 3.60 oz 1.2 0z
Portions / Case: 133 400
Case Size: 1 400
Fee For Service/Case: $69.94 $205.20
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): $45.56/.8684 $49.57/.6369
26  |[Turkey Pot Roast (0516760) - DELETED No Bid No Bid (AU,M) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand:
Commodity Code#: 100124
Portion Size: 3.58 oz
Portions / Case: 80
Case Size: 3
Fee For Service/Case: $27.90
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): $37.30/.8150
27 Bacon, Turkey (0517540) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid (MY) No Bid No Bid
Brand: Jennie-O
Commodity Code#: 271106
Portion Size: 0.625 Ibs
Portions / Case: 12
Case Size: 12
Fee For Service/Case: $86.93
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): $10.36/.1622
28 Pork, BBQ, Shredded (0516940) No Bid (MY) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand: Brookwood Farms
Commodity Code#: 100193-12307
Portion Size: 4 oz.
Portions / Case: 80
Case Size: 4
Fee For Service/Case: $32.00
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): $67.35/.842
Macaroni and Cheese, Red. Fat, Red.
29  [Sodium, Whi Grain (0517600) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid (MY, D) No Bid No Bid No Bid (M)
Land O' Lakes
Brand: ES Foods 05915 JTM #5768 #43274
Commodity Code#: 110242 5768 110242
Portion Size: 6 oz 6.0 oz 6.0 oz
Portions / Case: 80 80 80
Case Size: 5 lbs 6 bags 6/5#
Fee For Service/Case: $45.58 $49.06 $53.73
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): $58.54/.7318 $14.02/0.7885 66.70/.8338




Goodman Food

Item Vendor Bongard Cremeries, Brookwood Farms, Butterball, Del Monte Foods, Inc., ES Foods, Products, Gold Creek Foods, |Hormel Food Sales,| JTM Provisions, Land O' Lakes,
No. Chanhassen, MN Siler City, NC Garner, NC Walnut Creek, CA Woodbury, NY Inglewood, CA Gainesville, GA LLC, Austin, MN Harrison, OH Arden Hills, MN
Macaroni and Cheese, Red. Fat, Red.
29  |Sodium, Whi Grain (0517600) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid (AY,M) No Bid
Brand: JTM #5756
Commodity Code#: 5756
Portion Size: 6.0 oz
Portions / Case: 80
Case Size: 6 bags
Fee For Service/Case: $49.96
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): $9.97/0.7491
Macaroni and Cheese, Red. Fat, Red.
29 |Sodium, Whi Grain (0517600) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid (AY,M) No Bid
Brand: JTM #5776
Commodity Code#: 5776
Portion Size: 6.0 oz
Portions / Case: 80
Case Size: 6 bags
Fee For Service/Case: $54.83
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): $14.14/0.8621
Cheese Sauce Frozen, Pouch, Cheddar, Red.
30 Fat, Red. Sodium (0517610) -DELETED No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid (M,D) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand: ES Foods 05812 JTM #5715
Commodity Code#: 110242 5715
Portion Size: 2 0z. 252 serv.
Portions / Case: 6 bags 30
Case Size: $44.53 6 bags
Fee For Service/Case: $20.63 $52.99
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF §$ Value): $65.16/.2715 $15.78/$0.2729
Cheese Sauce, Shelf Stable Pouch, Cheddar,
31 Reduced Sodium (0517610) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Land O' Lakes
Brand: 39945
Commodity Code#: 110242
Portion Size: 106 oz.
Portions / Case: 6
Case Size: 6
Fee For Service/Case: $42.25
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): $68.54/.3233
32 Cheese Sauce, White, Shelf Stable (0517650) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid (AU,M)
Land O' Lakes
Brand: JTM 39947
Commodity Code#: 5730 110242
Portion Size: 268 serv. 106 oz.
Portions / Case: 6 bags 6
Case Size: 6 bags 6
Fee For Service/Case: $51.36 $46.95
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): $29.21/0.3006 $75.35/.3555




Vendor

Goodman Food

Item Bongard Cremeries, Brookwood Farms, Butterball, Del Monte Foods, Inc., ES Foods, Products, Gold Creek Foods, |Hormel Food Sales,| JTM Provisions, Land O' Lakes,
No. Chanhassen, MN Siler City, NC Garner, NC Walnut Creek, CA Woodbury, NY Inglewood, CA Gainesville, GA LLC, Austin, MN Harrison, OH Arden Hills, MN
Cheese Portions, Refridgerated, Mozzarella
33 |String (0517030) (AU) No Bid No Bid No Bid (M,D) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Land O' Lakes
Brand: Bongards ES Foods 40244 59701
110242-
Commodity Code#: USDA/402991 110242 110242
Portion Size: 1o0z. 10z 1 oz.
Portions / Case: 168 160 168
Case Size: 168 160 168
Fee For Service/Case: $15.60 $43.14 $15.87
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): $20.45/.2146 $62.37/.3898 $36.32/.2162
Cheese Portions, Refridgerated, Mozzarella
33  |String (0517030) (AU) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand: Bongards
110242-
Commodity Code#: USDA/402951
Portion Size: 1 oz.
Portions / Case: 168
Case Size: 168
Fee For Service/Case: $14.81
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): $.2099
34 Cheese Portions, Ref., Red. Fat (0517670) (AU) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid (AU)
Land O' Lakes
Brand: #44875
110242-
Commodity Code#: USDA/402921 110242
Portion Size: 1 oz. 1 oz
Portions / Case: 168 168
Case Size: 168 168
Fee For Service/Case: $20.93 $23.05
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): $.2463095 $43.50/.2175
34 Cheese Portions, Ref., Red. Fat (0517670) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid (AU)
Land O' Lakes
Brand: #44882
110242-
Commodity Code#: USDA/402391 110242
Portion Size: 1 o0z. 10z
Portions / Case: 168 168
Case Size: 168 168
Fee For Service/Case: $20.111 $23.05
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): $.24142857 $43.50/.2175
35 |Cheese Cubes, Ref., Red. Fat (0517660) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Land O’ Lakes

Brand: #44113
Commodity Code#: 110242
Portion Size: 1 oz.
Portions / Case: 200
Case Size: 200
Fee For Service/Case: $35.85

Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value):

$60.20/.3010




Item
No.

Vendor

Bongard Cremeries,
Chanhassen, MN

Brookwood Farms,
Siler City, NC

Butterball,
Garner, NC

Del Monte Foods, Inc.,

Walnut Creek, CA

ES Foods,
Woodbury, NY

Goodman Food
Products,
Inglewood, CA

Gold Creek Foods,
Gainesville, GA

Hormel Food Sales,
LLC, Austin, MN

JTM Provisions,
Harrison, OH

Land O' Lakes,
Arden Hills, MN

35

Cheese Cubes, Ref., Red. Fat (0517660)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Brand:

Land O' Lakes
#44115

Commodity Code#:

110242

Portion Size:

1 oz.

Portions / Case:

200

Case Size:

200

Fee For Service/Case:

$35.85

Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value):

$60.20/.3010

36

Tomato Catsup, Shelf Stable, Low Sod.
(0507090)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Brand:

Commodity Code#:

Portion Size:

Portions / Case:

Case Size:

Fee For Service/Case:

Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value):

37

Tomato Catsup, Shelf Stable, Individual
(0507100)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Brand:

Commodity Code#:

Portion Size:

Portions / Case:

Case Size:

Fee For Service/Case:

Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value):

38

Tomato Catsup, Shelf Stable, Low Sodium,

Individual (0507090) - DELETED

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Brand:

Commodity Code#:

Portion Size:

Portions / Case:

Case Size:

Fee For Service/Case:

Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value):

39

Diced Tomatoes (New Item, No ID)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Brand:

Commodity Code#:

Portion Size:

Portions / Case:

Case Size:

Fee For Service/Case:

Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value):

40

Canned Salsa, Shelf Stable, Low Sodium
(0502393)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Brand:

Commodity Code#:

Portion Size:

Portions / Case:

Case Size:

Fee For Service/Case:

Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value):




Item
No.

Vendor

Bongard Cremeries,
Chanhassen, MN

Brookwood Farms,
Siler City, NC

Butterball,
Garner, NC

Del Monte Foods, Inc.,
Walnut Creek, CA

ES Foods,
Woodbury, NY

Goodman Food
Products,
Inglewood, CA

Gold Creek Foods,
Gainesville, GA

Hormel Food Sales,
LLC, Austin, MN

JTM Provisions,
Harrison, OH

Land O' Lakes,
Arden Hills, MN

41

Salsa, Shelf Stable, Dipping Cup, Low
Sodium (0507350)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Brand:

Commodity Code#:

Portion Size:

Portions / Case:

Case Size:

Fee For Service/Case:

Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value):

42

Marinara Sauce, Shelf Stable, Low Sodium
(0505200)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

(AU)

No Bid

Brand:

PFS

Commodity Code#:

5703

Portion Size:

3.50 oz

Portions / Case:

137

Case Size:

6 bags

Fee For Service/Case:

$54.64

Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value):

$6.16/0.4438

43

Marinara Sauce Dipping Cup, Shelf Stable,
Low Sodium (New Item/No ID #)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Brand:

Commodity Code#:

Portion Size:

Portions / Case:

Case Size:

Fee For Service/Case:

Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value):

44

Spaghetti Sauce, Shelf Stable, Low Sodium
(0508050)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Brand:

Commodity Code#:

Portion Size:

Portions / Case:

Case Size:

Fee For Service/Case:

Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value):

45

Tomato Sauce (0502380)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Brand:

Commodity Code#:

Portion Size:

Portions / Case:

Case Size:

Fee For Service/Case:

Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value):

46

BBQ Sauce, Individual, Shelf Stable, Low
Sodium (0507321)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Brand:

Commodity Code#:

Portion Size:

Portions / Case:

Case Size:

Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value):

Fee For Service/Case:




Goodman Food

Item Vendor Bongard Cremeries, Brookwood Farms, Butterball, Del Monte Foods, Inc., ES Foods, Products, Gold Creek Foods, |Hormel Food Sales,| JTM Provisions, Land O' Lakes,
No. Chanhassen, MN Siler City, NC Garner, NC Walnut Creek, CA Woodbury, NY Inglewood, CA Gainesville, GA LLC, Austin, MN Harrison, OH Arden Hills, MN
47 Fruit Cup, Mixed (0501101) No Bid No Bid No Bid (AU) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand: Del Monte
Commodity Code#: 100220
Portion Size: 4 oz.
Portions / Case: 72
Case Size: 72
Fee For Service/Case: $17.01
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): $0.34/.6390
48 Fruit Cup, Variety Flavors (0501120) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand:
Commodity Code#:
Portion Size:
Portions / Case:
Case Size:
Fee For Service/Case:
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value):
Pizza, Whole Grain, Cheese Round
49 Individual (0517440) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand:
Commodity Code#:
Portion Size:
Portions / Case:
Case Size:

Fee For Service/Case:

Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value):




Vendor Nardone Brothers Nicks Famous Bar- Pilgrim's Pride Schwan's Food
Item Baking Co. Inc, National Food Group, B-Q, Corporation, Red Gold, LLC Rich Chicks, Service, Tyson
No. Hanover, PA Novi, Mi Nashville, TN Greeley, CO Elwood, IN Gardena, CA Marshall, MN Springdale, AR
1 Chicken, 8-Piece, Breaded (0516550) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tyson
Brand: #16660000928
Commodity Code#: 100103
Portion Size: 4.7-8.4 oz
Portions / Case: 82
Case Size: 4
Fee For Service/Case: $59.67
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): $1.0954
2 Chicken, 8-Piece, Roasted (0516540) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tyson
Brand: #10218790928
Commodity Code#: 100103
Portion Size: 3.7-6.5 oz
Portions / Case: 85
Case Size: 4
Fee For Service/Case: $47.51
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): $0.8513
Chicken Filet, Whl Muscle, Small, Breaded
3 (0516580) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand: Rich Chicks 13441
Commodity Code#: 100103
Portion Size: 2.05 oz
Portions / Case: 156
Case Size: 4
Fee For Service/Case: $64.61
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): $91.15/0.58
Chicken Breast Filets, WhI Muscle, Breaded
4 (0516930) No Bid No Bid No Bid (AU,M) No Bid No Bid
Tyson
Brand: Pilgrim's/Goldkist 7516 Rich Chicks 13440 #10703000928
Commodity Code#: 100103 100103 100103
Portion Size: 400z 410 0z 4 oz.
Portions / Case: 120 78 115
Case Size: 6 4 6
Fee For Service/Case: $99.54 $64.61 $84.00
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): $1.150 $91.15/1.17 $1.0788
Chicken Breast Filet, Hot, Spicy, Whl Muscle,
5 Breaded (0516620) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tyson
Brand: Rich Chicks 13410 #10703120928
Commodity Code#: 100103 100103
Portion Size: 4100z 3.75 0z
Portions / Case: 78 132
Case Size: 4 4
Fee For Service/Case: $65.41 $63.85
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): $91.95/1.18 $0.8146




Vendor Nardc.)ne Brothers . Nicks Famous Bar- Pilgrim's F.’ride . . Schwan'.s Food
Item Baking Co. Inc, National Food Group, B-Q, Corporation, Red Gold, LLC Rich Chicks, Service, Tyson
No. Hanover, PA Novi, Mi Nashville, TN Greeley, CO Elwood, IN Gardena, CA Marshall, MN Springdale, AR
Chicken Tenders, Whole Muscle, Breaded
6 (0516650) No Bid No Bid No Bid (AU,M) No Bid (AU) No Bid
Tyson
Brand: Pilgrim's/Goldkist 7527 Rich Chicks 43424 #10703320928
Commodity Code#: 100103 10013 100103
Portion Size: 4.50z 410 0z 4.14 oz
Portions / Case: 107 78 119
Case Size: 6 4 4
Fee For Service/Case: $97.38 $64.61 $65.62
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): $1.277 $91.15/1.17 $0.9245
7 Popcorn Chicken, Chunk, Breaded (0516870) No Bid No Bid No Bid (AU,M) No Bid (AU) No Bid
Pilgrim's/Goldkist Tyson
Brand: 110452 Rich Chicks 54409 #10703680928
Commodity Code#: 100103 100103 100103
Portion Size: 4.3 0z 0.30z 3.36 oz
Portions / Case: 104 107 155
Case Size: 6 4 4
Fee For Service/Case: $50.40 $55.61 $54.20
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): $0.805 $72.97/0.68 $0.4781
8 Popcorn Chicken, Spicy, Breaded (0516880) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tyson
Brand: #10703780928
Commodity Code#: 100103
Portion Size: 3.30z
Portions / Case: 159
Case Size: 4
Fee For Service/Case: $54.11
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): $0.4654
Chicken Breast I?ilet, WhI Muscle, Grilled
9 (0516560) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tyson
Brand: #10703220928
Commodity Code#: 100103
Portion Size: 2.26 oz
Portions / Case: 215
Case Size: 4
Fee For Service/Case: $72.86
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): $0.5844
Chicken Breast Filet, Whl Muscle, Grilled
9 (0516560) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tyson
Brand: #10383500928
Commodity Code#: 100103
Portion Size: 30z
Portions / Case: 54
Case Size: 2
Fee For Service/Case: $29.44
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): $0.8196




Nardone Brothers Nicks Famous Bar- Pilgrim's Pride Schwan's Food
ltem Vendor Baking Co. Inc, National Food Group, B-Q, Corporation, Red Gold, LLC Rich Chicks, Service, Tyson
No. Hanover, PA Novi, Mi Nashville, TN Greeley, CO Elwood, IN Gardena, CA Marshall, MN Springdale, AR
Garlic Basil, Chicken Meatballs w/
10 Mozzarella Cheese (0516180) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand: Rich Chicks 91401
Commodity Code#: 100103
Portion Size: 2.60 oz
Portions / Case: 123
Case Size: 4
Fee For Service/Case: $67.41
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): $112.64/0.96
11 Chicken Fajita Strips (0516890): No Bid No Bid No Bid (AU,M) No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tyson
Brand: Pilgrim's/Goldkist 1250 #10035220928
Commodity Code#: 100103 100103
Portion Size: 2.47 oz 2.8 0z
Portions / Case: 194 171
Case Size: 6 6
Fee For Service/Case: $74.09 $53.38
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): $0.596 $0.6502
12 Beef, Mini Burgers (0515190) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid (AU)
Ball Park
Brand: #10000055325
Commodity Code#: 100154
Portion Size: 4.86 oz
Portions / Case: 80
Case Size: 80
Fee For Service/Case: $70.45
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): $1.3006
13 Beef Crumbles (0516970) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Hillshire
Brand: #10000008737
Commodity Code#: 100154
Portion Size: 226
Portions / Case: 1
Case Size: 1
Fee For Service/Case: $51.61
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): $0.5705
Beef Taco Meat, Reduced Sodium (0516170)
14 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid (AU)
AdvancePierre
Brand: #10000032432
Commodity Code#: 240z
Portion Size: 220
Portions / Case: 1
Case Size: 49
Fee For Service/Case: $62.99
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): $0.5703
Beef Taco Meat, Reduced Sodium (0516170)
14 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid See Above
Brand:
Commodity Code#:
Portion Size:
Portions / Case:
Case Size:

Fee For Service/Case:

Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value):




Nardone Brothers

Nicks Famous Bar-

Pilgrim’s Pride

Schwan's Food

ltem Vendor Baking Co. Inc, National Food Group, B-Q, Corporation, Red Gold, LLC Rich Chicks, Service, Tyson
No. Hanover, PA Novi, Mi Nashville, TN Greeley, CO Elwood, IN Gardena, CA Marshall, MN Springdale, AR
Beef Taco Meat, Reduced Sodium (0516170)
14 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid See Above
Brand:
Commodity Code#:
Portion Size:
Portions / Case:
Case Size:
Fee For Service/Case:
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value):
15 Beef Meatballs (0516190) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
AdvancePierre
Brand: #10000011750
Commodity Code#: 100154
Portion Size: 250z
Portions / Case: 192
Case Size: 5
Fee For Service/Case: $68.31
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): $0.7339
15 Beef Meatballs (0516190) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
AdvancePierre
Brand: #10000073050
Commodity Code#: 100154
Portion Size: 250z
Portions / Case: 192
Case Size: 5
Fee For Service/Case: $43.44
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): $0.7982
16 Ground Beef Patties (0516115) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
AdvancePierre
Brand: #10000037600
Commodity Code#: 100154
Portion Size: 230z
Portions / Case: 140
Case Size: 1
Fee For Service/Case: $35.37
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): $0.8253
16 Ground Beef Patties (0516115) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid See Above
Brand:
Commodity Code#:
Portion Size:
Portions / Case:
Case Size:
Fee For Service/Case:
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value):
17 Frankfurters, Turkey (0516070) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand:
Commodity Code#:
Portion Size:
Portions / Case:
Case Size:

Fee For Service/Case:

Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value):




Item
No.

Vendor

Nardone Brothers
Baking Co. Inc,
Hanover, PA

National Food Group,
Novi, Mi

Nicks Famous Bar-
B-Q,
Nashville, TN

Pilgrim’s Pride
Corporation,
Greeley, CO

Red Gold, LLC
Elwood, IN

Rich Chicks,
Gardena, CA

Schwan's Food
Service,
Marshall, MN

Tyson

Springdale, AR

18

Pepperoni, Turkey, Sliced (0512140)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Brand:

Commodity Code#:

Portion Size:

Portions / Case:

Case Size:

Fee For Service/Case:

Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value):

19

Turkey Sausage, Patty (0516210)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Brand:

Commodity Code#:

Portion Size:

Portions / Case:

Case Size:

Fee For Service/Case:

Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value):

20

Sausage Link, Turkey (0516200) - DELETED

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Brand:

Commodity Code#:

Portion Size:

Portions / Case:

Case Size:

Fee For Service/Case:

Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value):

21

Turkey (0516312)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Brand:

Commodity Code#:

Portion Size:

Portions / Case:

Case Size:

Fee For Service/Case:

Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value):

22

Turkey Ham, Deli Style, Pre-Sliced (0516220)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Brand:

Commodity Code#:

Portion Size:

Portions / Case:

Case Size:

Fee For Service/Case:

Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value):

23

Turkey Ham, Whole (0516221) - DELETED

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Brand:

Commodity Code#:

Portion Size:

Portions / Case:

Case Size:

Fee For Service/Case:

Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value):




Item
No.

Vendor

Nardone Brothers
Baking Co. Inc,
Hanover, PA

National Food Group,
Novi, Mi

Nicks Famous Bar-
B-Q,
Nashville, TN

Pilgrim’s Pride
Corporation,
Greeley, CO

Red Gold, LLC
Elwood, IN

Rich Chicks,
Gardena, CA

Schwan's Food
Service,
Marshall, MN

Tyson
Springdale, AR

24

Roast Turkey Breast, Deli Style, Pre-Sliced
(0516340)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Brand:

Commodity Code#:

Portion Size:

Portions / Case:

Case Size:

Fee For Service/Case:

Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value):

25

Turkey Breast Sticks (0517710)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Brand:

Commodity Code#:

Portion Size:

Portions / Case:

Case Size:

Fee For Service/Case:

Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value):

26

Turkey Pot Roast (0516760) - DELETED

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Brand:

Commodity Code#:

Portion Size:

Portions / Case:

Case Size:

Fee For Service/Case:

Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value):

27

Bacon, Turkey (0517540)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Brand:

Commodity Code#:

Portion Size:

Portions / Case:

Case Size:

Fee For Service/Case:

Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value):

28

Pork, BBQ, Shredded (0516940)

No Bid

No Bid

(AU)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Brand:

Nick's Famous
BBQ 23462

Commodity Code#:

100193

Portion Size:

5 Ibs

Portions / Case:

4

Case Size:

80 cs

Fee For Service/Case:

$36.75

Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value):

$81.047

29

Macaroni and Cheese, Red. Fat, Red.
Sodium, Whi Grain (0517600)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Brand:

Commodity Code#:

Portion Size:

Portions / Case:

Case Size:

Fee For Service/Case:

Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value):




Item
No.

Vendor

Nardone Brothers
Baking Co. Inc,
Hanover, PA

National Food Group,
Novi, Ml

Nicks Famous Bar-
B-Q,
Nashville, TN

Pilgrim's Pride
Corporation,
Greeley, CO

Red Gold, LLC
Elwood, IN

Rich Chicks,
Gardena, CA

Schwan's Food
Service,
Marshall, MN

Tyson

Springdale, AR

30

Cheese Sauce Frozen, Pouch, Cheddar, Red.

Fat, Red. Sodium (0517610) - DELETED

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Brand:

Commodity Code#:

Portion Size:

Portions / Case:

Case Size:

Fee For Service/Case:

Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value):

31

Cheese Sauce, Shelf Stable Pouch, Cheddar,
Reduced Sodium (0517610)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Brand:

Commodity Code#:

Portion Size:

Portions / Case:

Case Size:

Fee For Service/Case:

Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value):

32

Cheese Sauce, White, Shelf Stable (0517650)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Brand:

Commodity Code#:

Portion Size:

Portions / Case:

Case Size:

Fee For Service/Case:

Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value):

33

Cheese Portions, Refridgerated, Mozzarella
String (0517030)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Brand:

Commodity Code#:

Portion Size:

Portions / Case:

Case Size:

Fee For Service/Case:

Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value):

33

Cheese Portions, Refridgerated, Mozzarella
String (0517030)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Brand:

Commodity Code#:

Portion Size:

Portions / Case:

Case Size:

Fee For Service/Case:

Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value):




Item
No.

Vendor

Nardone Brothers
Baking Co. Inc,
Hanover, PA

National Food Group,
Novi, Ml

Nicks Famous Bar-
B-Q,
Nashville, TN

Pilgrim's Pride
Corporation,
Greeley, CO

Red Gold, LLC
Elwood, IN

Rich Chicks,
Gardena, CA

Schwan's Food
Service,
Marshall, MN

Tyson

Springdale, AR

34

Cheese Portions, Ref., Red. Fat (0517670)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Brand:

Commodity Code#:

Portion Size:

Portions / Case:

Case Size:

Fee For Service/Case:

Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value):

34

Cheese Portions, Ref., Red. Fat (0517670)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Brand:

Commodity Code#:

Portion Size:

Portions / Case:

Case Size:

Fee For Service/Case:

Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value):

35

Cheese Cubes, Ref., Red. Fat (0517660)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Brand:

Commodity Code#:

Portion Size:

Portions / Case:

Case Size:

Fee For Service/Case:

Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value):

35

Cheese Cubes, Ref., Red. Fat (0517660)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Brand:

Commodity Code#:

Portion Size:

Portions / Case:

Case Size:

Fee For Service/Case:

Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value):

36

Tomato Catsup, Shelf Stable, Low Sod.
(0507090)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Brand:

Red Gold / REDYL99

Commodity Code#:

100332

Portion Size:

0.6 oz

Portions / Case:

1140

Case Size:

6

Fee For Service/Case:

$30.18

Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value):

$37.29/0.03

37

Tomato Catsup, Shelf Stable, Individual
(0507100)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Brand: Red Gold / REDY59G
Commodity Code#: 100332

Portion Size: 9 gr. Packet
Portions / Case: 1000

Case Size: 1000

Fee For Service/Case: $19.84

Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): $22.72/0.02




Nardone Brothers

Nicks Famous Bar-

Pilgrim’s Pride

Schwan's Food

ltem Vendor Baking Co. Inc, National Food Group, B-Q, Corporation, Red Gold, LLC Rich Chicks, Service, Tyson
No. Hanover, PA Novi, Mi Nashville, TN Greeley, CO Elwood, IN Gardena, CA Marshall, MN Springdale, AR
Tomato Catsup, Shelf Stable, Low Sodium,
38 |Individual (0507090) - DELETED No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand: Red Gold/ REDYL9G
Commodity Code#: 100332
Portion Size: 9 gr. Packet
Portions / Case: 1000
Case Size: 1000
Fee For Service/Case: $21.60
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): $24.89/0.02
Diced Tomatoes (New Item, No ID)
39 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand: Red Gold /REDBQ9B
Commodity Code#: 100332
Portion Size: 210z
Portions / Case: 291
Case Size: 6
Fee For Service/Case: $28.50
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): $28.50/0.10
Canned Salsa, Shelf Stable, Low Sodium
40 |(0502393): No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand: Red Gold / REDSC99
Commodity Code#: 100332
Portion Size: 1.5 oz
Portions / Case: 412
Case Size: 6
Fee For Service/Case: $34.93
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): $38.97/0.10
Salsa, Shelf Stable, Dipping Cup, Low
41 Sodium (0507350) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Red Gold/
Brand: REDSC2ZC84
Commodity Code#: 100332
Portion Size: 30z
Portions / Case: 84
Case Size: 84
Fee For Service/Case: $33.40
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): $35.01/0.42
Marinara Sauce, Shelf Stable, Low Sodium
42  |(0505200) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand: RedPack / RPKNA9SE
Commodity Code#: 100332
Portion Size: 1.5 0z
Portions / Case: 420
Case Size: 6
Fee For Service/Case: $35.75
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): $40.76/0.10




Nardone Brothers

Nicks Famous Bar-

Pilgrim’s Pride

Schwan's Food

Item Vendor Baking Co. Inc, National Food Group, B-Q, Corporation, Red Gold, LLC Rich Chicks, Service, Tyson
No. Hanover, PA Novi, Ml Nashville, TN Greeley, CO Elwood, IN Gardena, CA Marshall, MN Springdale, AR
Marinara Sauce Dipping Cup, Shelf Stable,
43  |Low Sodium (New Item/No ID #) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Red Gold /
Brand: REDNA2ZC168
Commodity Code#: 100332
Portion Size: 250z
Portions / Case: 168
Case Size: 168
Fee For Service/Case: $52.49
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): $57.50/0.34
§paghetti §auce, Shelf §tab|e, Low Sodium
44  |(0508050) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand: Red Pack / RPKMASE
Commodity Code#: 100332
Portion Size: 1.2 0z
Portions / Case: 530
Case Size: 6
Fee For Service/Case: $31.73
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): $38.79/0.07
45 |Tomato Sauce (0502380) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand: Vine Ripe / VINHM99
Commodity Code#: 100332
Portion Size: 106 oz
Portions / Case: 6
Case Size: 56
Fee For Service/Case: $23.70
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): $29.88/0.09
BBQ Sauce, Individual, Shelf Stable, Low
46  |Sodium (0507321) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand: Red Gold / REDOAIZ
Commodity Code#: 100332
Portion Size: 1.0 oz
Portions / Case: 250
Case Size: 250
Fee For Service/Case: $33.66
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): $35.06/0.14
47  |Fruit Cup, Mixed (0501101) No Bid (D) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand: Zee Zee's Harvest #1765
Commodity Code#: 100212
Portion Size: 1 cup
Portions / Case: 72 servings
Case Size: 72 cups
Fee For Service/Case: $27.51
Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): $46.00/.6389




Nardone Brothers Nicks Famous Bar- Pilgrim's Pride Schwan's Food
Item Vendor Baking Co. Inc, National Food Group, B-Q, Corporation, Red Gold, LLC Rich Chicks, Service, Tyson
No. Hanover, PA Novi, Mi Nashville, TN Greeley, CO Elwood, IN Gardena, CA Marshall, MN Springdale, AR
48 Fruit Cup, Variety Flavors (0501120) No Bid (D,SA) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Diced Peach Cups,

Brand: #1740

Commodity Code#: 100220

Portion Size: 1 cup

Portions / Case: 72 servings

Case Size: 72 cups

Fee For Service/Case: $19.24

Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): $46.01/.6390
48 Fruit Cup, Variety Flavors (0501120) No Bid (D,SA) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Brand: Diced Pear Cups, #1780

Commodity Code#: 100225

Portion Size: 1 cup

Portions / Case: 72 servings

Case Size: 72 cups

Fee For Service/Case: $19.04

Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): $46.01/.6390

Pizza, Whole Grain, Cheese Round
49 Individual (0517440) (M) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid (M) No Bid

Nardone Bros.

Brand: 625WRM2 Schwan's 78368

Commodity Code#: 110244 110244

Portion Size: 5.40 oz 4.98 oz

Portions / Case: 60 60

Case Size: 60 6

Fee For Service/Case: $39.08 $30.61

Total Price / Portion (Includes DF $ Value): $53.50/.8916 0.6999

RFP tabulations with award recommendations are posted for 72 hours in the Purchasing Department Office and are also posted to the School District's website

NOTES:

A - Alternate Offer

AU- Alternate Unacceptable, No Sample
Sent, Or Sample Not Approved

AY- Alternate Sample Received and
Approved

D- Delivery lead time

M - Minimum Order Quantity For Delivery
MY - Minimum Order Quanity Acceptable for

Delivery

SA - Split Award Quanities (50% for each

flavor)

address at: http://ecsd-fl.schoolloop.com/purchasing/bids. Notices will not be automatically mailed.

Failure to file a protest within the time prescribed in Section 120.57(3) Florida Statutes, or failure to post the bond or other security required by law within the time
allowed for filing a bond shall constitute a waiver of proceedings under Chapter 120 Florida Statutes.

| hereby certify that the prices and responders reflected herein are valid, and have been received in compliance to Escambia County School Board Rules and

Florida Law.

Allison Watsov

Allison Watson
Purchasing Director
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