
 

 
 
 
DATE: BID TITLE & REFERENCE: 
September 3, 2020    Paper Products & Cleaning Supplies for  

School Cafeterias, Bid #210102 
 
DESCRIPTION OF PURCHASE: 

 

An annual purchasing agreement with a one (1) year renewal option to provide paper products and 
cleaning supplies to school cafeterias.  Items to be stocked and distributed by the Central 
Warehouse.  Eighty-nine (89) items were bid, seventy-five (75) items are awarded.  Items will be 
purchased as needed to meet cafeteria usage requirements.  Bid award(s) to the lowest bidder(s) 
meeting specifications.  Items awarded as a lot are awarded to the bidder with the aggregate low 
total cost for that lot.   
 

Effective Dates: October 1, 2020 through September 30, 2021. 
 
 
 
 

  
REQUESTED BY: 

 

Food Services  
 
    

SUPPLIER NAME:                         ITEMS AWARDED:        ESTIMATED ANNUAL EXPENDITURE:          
 

      Central Poly Bag Corp., Linden, NJ                      1              $       855.00 
      Daxwell, Houston, TX                                              12                                           85,004.50 
      Imperial Dade, Loxley, AL                                       10         109,750.50 
      Interboro Packaging Corp, Montgomery, AL            4                                            65,310.00 
      Merchants Paper Co., Pensacola, FL         16         241,314.30 

PR Chemical & Paper Supply, Pensacola, FL          1                     1,551.75 
      Sam Tell and Son, Farmington, NY                          1                   641.92    
      Supreme Paper Supplies, Pensacola, FL               30                                         651,097.27 
 
       
    
AMOUNT OF PURCHASE:  FUNDING SOURCE: 

 

$1,155,525.24 Est. / Yr. Food Services Fund (4110) 
     

  
METHOD OF PROCUREMENT: 

 

ECSD Bid     Bids Received: 13    Bids Rejected:  1  
                                                   

  
DATE AND TIME POSTED: 

 

September 3, 2020, 2:45pm Central Time 
 
 
9500PUR101 (11/10) Retention - 5 Years 

 
THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY 

PURCHASING DEPARTMENT 
75 North Pace Blvd.  

Pensacola, FL  32505 
 

BID AWARD NOTICE 



DATE:  August 19, 2020

BID NBR: 210102
BID TITLE:  Paper Products & Cleaning Supplies for School Cafeterias

ITEM
   12 x 17 1oz Container, 1oz Container, 2oz

Quantity: 1,000 cs 200 cs 25 cs 200 cs
0702090 0702110 0702231 0702130

ITEM NUMBER 1 2 3 4
All American Poly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Piscataway, NJ
Calico Packaging, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Jessup, MD
Central Poly Bag No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Linden, NJ
Daxwell No Bid 13.86 13.18 l 16.33 l
Houston, TX l
Imperial Dade Paper 34.69 30.55 14.46 16.66
Loxley, AL
Interboro No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Montgomery, AL
Merchants Paper Co. 39.90 17.55 16.05 au 20.95
Pensacola, FL
PR Chemical & Paper 79.58 24.52 22.23 au 612.50 au
Pensacola, FL
Pyramid School Products No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tampa, FL
Sam Tell and Son 33.57 au 27.33 26.10 au 31.31
Farmingdale, NY
Supreme Paper Supplies 34.93 17.63 au 16.49 au 17.42 au
Pensacola, FL
Unipak Corp No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brooklyn, NY

Awarded Items are highlighted

Napkins Cups, Cold Portion Container

THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

75 NORTH PACE BOULEVARD
PENSACOLA, FLORIDA 32505

BID TABULATION

Lids for Covering Cold Portion Cups, Cold Portion 
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ITEM
Container 2oz 4oz Container 4oz

Quantity: 100 cs 1,000 cs 100 cs 150 cs
0702190 0110036 0702140 0702120

ITEM NUMBER 5 6 7 8

All American Poly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Piscataway, NJ
Calico Packaging, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Jessup, MD
Central Poly Bag No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Linden, NJ
Daxwell 15.90 ay No Bid No Bid 30.11 ay
Houston, TX l l
Imperial Dade Paper 16.61 33.32 64.75 27.69 au
Loxley, AL
Interboro No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Montgomery, AL
Merchants Paper Co. 19.15 31.95 No Bid 36.05
Pensacola, FL
PR Chemical & Paper 57.13 au No Bid 76.49 48.02
Pensacola, FL
Pyramid School Products No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tampa, FL
Sam Tell and Son 22.98 au 52.93 82.87 au 50.97
Farmingdale, NY
Supreme Paper Supplies 17.00 34.43 No Bid 32.90 au
Pensacola, FL
Unipak Corp No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brooklyn, NY

Cups, Cold PortionLids for Covering Cold Portion Cups, Plastic, 3.5 oz. Cups, Paper Souffle
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ITEM
Container, 4 oz 4 oz 5 oz 5 oz

Quantity: 200 cs 300 cs 600 cs 150 cs
0702161 0145145 0110037 0145146

ITEM NUMBER 9 10 11 12

All American Poly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Piscataway, NJ
Calico Packaging, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Jessup, MD
Central Poly Bag No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Linden, NJ
Daxwell 19.68 ay No Bid No Bid No Bid
Houston, TX l
Imperial Dade Paper 20.05 au 49.80 31.24 117.61 au
Loxley, AL
Interboro No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Montgomery, AL
Merchants Paper Co. 26.35 41.00 30.55 121.50
Pensacola, FL
PR Chemical & Paper 35.53 53.93 37.37 au No Bid
Pensacola, FL
Pyramid School Products No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tampa, FL
Sam Tell and Son 29.07 71.34 au 43.47 171.77 au
Farmingdale, NY
Supreme Paper Supplies 29.73 47.72 32.23 121.53 au
Pensacola, FL
Unipak Corp No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brooklyn, NY

Cup, Cone Shaped Cup, Paper, Flat BottomLids for Covering Cold Portion Cup, Plastic, Cold

Page 3



ITEM
Container 5 oz Container 5 oz Container, 6 oz 6 oz

Quantity: 300 cs 150 cs 1,800 cs 150 cs
0702151 0702162 0145147 0145143

ITEM NUMBER 13 14 15 16

All American Poly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Piscataway, NJ
Calico Packaging, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Jessup, MD
Central Poly Bag No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Linden, NJ
Daxwell 29.65 au 19.68 au No Bid No Bid
Houston, TX l l
Imperial Dade Paper 34.41 24.28 15.73 au 13.08
Loxley, AL
Interboro No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Montgomery, AL
Merchants Paper Co. 45.70 26.35 au 16.35 12.85
Pensacola, FL
PR Chemical & Paper 77.53 42.95 21.47 16.53
Pensacola, FL
Pyramid School Products No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tampa, FL
Sam Tell and Son 77.95 29.07 au 25.96 20.23
Farmingdale, NY
Supreme Paper Supplies 39.86 au 26.45 au 15.80 12.40
Pensacola, FL
Unipak Corp No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brooklyn, NY

Cups, Cold Portion Lids, Hot/ColdLids for Covering Cold Cups, Hot/Cold Beverage
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ITEM
 9 oz Container, 10 oz Container, 10 oz Container, 12 oz

Quantity: 150 cs 2,300 cs 150 cs 250 cs
0110104 0145150 0700270 0702240

ITEM NUMBER 17 18 19 20

All American Poly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Piscataway, NJ
Calico Packaging, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Jessup, MD
Central Poly Bag No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Linden, NJ
Daxwell No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Houston, TX
Imperial Dade Paper 44.93 23.05 au 16.32 25.75 au
Loxley, AL
Interboro No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Montgomery, AL
Merchants Paper Co. 43.99 24.25 15.95 27.15
Pensacola, FL
PR Chemical & Paper 103.56 28.23 20.63 34.46
Pensacola, FL
Pyramid School Products No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tampa, FL
Sam Tell and Son 73.15 36.54 26.83 39.50
Farmingdale, NY
Supreme Paper Supplies 46.40 23.60 15.47 26.30
Pensacola, FL
Unipak Corp No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brooklyn, NY

Lids for Covering Hot/ColdCup, Plastic, Cold Cups, Hot/Cold Beverage Cups, Cold Beverage 
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ITEM
12 oz Beverage Container, 12 oz Container, 16 oz Heavy, 16 oz

Quantity: 250 cs 250 cs 150 cs 150 cs
0702245 0702410 0702370 0110104

ITEM NUMBER 21 22 23 24

All American Poly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Piscataway, NJ
Calico Packaging, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Jessup, MD
Central Poly Bag No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Linden, NJ
Daxwell No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Houston, TX
Imperial Dade Paper 20.93 20.40 18.75 au 50.69
Loxley, AL
Interboro No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Montgomery, AL
Merchants Paper Co. 40.35 21.05 39.25 49.60
Pensacola, FL
PR Chemical & Paper 57.53 56.83 49.60 76.00
Pensacola, FL
Pyramid School Products No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tampa, FL
Sam Tell and Son 63.64 au 27.68 58.80 78.24
Farmingdale, NY
Supreme Paper Supplies 24.35 23.72 38.05 48.10
Pensacola, FL
Unipak Corp No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brooklyn, NY

Cups, Cold Lids for Covering Cold Cups, Hot/Cold Beverage Cup, Cold, Plastic
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ITEM
Black, 12 oz Foam Bowl, 12 oz Plastic, 12 oz Plastic, 12 oz

Quantity: 1,200 cs 1,000 cs 150 cs 150 cs
0700060 0700070 0700062 0700072

ITEM NUMBER 25 26 27 28

All American Poly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Piscataway, NJ
Calico Packaging, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Jessup, MD
Central Poly Bag No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Linden, NJ
Daxwell No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Houston, TX
Imperial Dade Paper 23.43 99.59 36.80 45.16
Loxley, AL
Interboro No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Montgomery, AL
Merchants Paper Co. 22.90 94.50 35.95 44.20
Pensacola, FL
PR Chemical & Paper No Bid No Bid 50.80 No Bid
Pensacola, FL
Pyramid School Products No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tampa, FL
Sam Tell and Son 71.20 135.79 au 105.13 91.07
Farmingdale, NY
Supreme Paper Supplies 25.20 32.02 35.90 44.21
Pensacola, FL
Unipak Corp No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brooklyn, NY

             Bowl, Clear Lid, Dome, ClearBowl, Foam Lid, Dome
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ITEM
Foam White, 10 oz Foam Black, 10 oz Clear, Vented, 10 oz No Vent, 10 oz

Quantity: 1,200 cs 1,200 cs 1,000 cs 1,000 cs
0700065 NEW ITEM - DELETED 0700075 0700270

ITEM NUMBER 29 30 31 32

All American Poly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Piscataway, NJ
Calico Packaging, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Jessup, MD
Central Poly Bag No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Linden, NJ
Daxwell No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Houston, TX
Imperial Dade Paper 38.14 No Bid 22.55 16.32
Loxley, AL
Interboro No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Montgomery, AL
Merchants Paper Co. 37.30 No Bid 22.05 15.95
Pensacola, FL
PR Chemical & Paper 34.04 No Bid 26.39 20.63
Pensacola, FL
Pyramid School Products No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tampa, FL
Sam Tell and Son 65.54 au No Bid 38.02 29.73
Farmingdale, NY
Supreme Paper Supplies 36.19 24.21 su 21.39 15.48
Pensacola, FL
Unipak Corp No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brooklyn, NY

Bowl, Insulated Bowl, Insulated                  Lids, Clear              Lids, Plastic
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ITEM
Food Items, 1/4 lb. Food Items, 1/2 lb. Food Items, 1 lb. Hinged Flat Lid

Quantity: 400 cs 1,000 cs 1,000 cs 300 cs
0702450 0702460 0702470 0700080 - DELETED

ITEM NUMBER 33 34 35 36

All American Poly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Piscataway, NJ
Calico Packaging, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Jessup, MD
Central Poly Bag No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Linden, NJ
Daxwell No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Houston, TX
Imperial Dade Paper 10.72 12.66 15.08 No Bid
Loxley, AL
Interboro No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Montgomery, AL
Merchants Paper Co. 14.25 au 14.65 au 19.70 au No Bid
Pensacola, FL
PR Chemical & Paper No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pensacola, FL
Pyramid School Products No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tampa, FL
Sam Tell and Son 21.82 au 20.66 au 25.01 au No Bid
Farmingdale, NY
Supreme Paper Supplies 13.34 15.70 16.34 42.81 au
Pensacola, FL
Unipak Corp No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brooklyn, NY

Dipping Tray, 2-Comp. w/Trays for Serving Ind. Trays for Serving Ind. Trays for Serving Ind.
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ITEM
Hinged Lid 10 x 8 x 5/8

Quantity: 5,000 cs 1,200 cs 11,000 cs 1,100 cs
NEW ITEM - DELETED 0702591 0702620 0702570 - DELETED

ITEM NUMBER 37 38 39 40

All American Poly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Piscataway, NJ
Calico Packaging, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Jessup, MD
Central Poly Bag No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Linden, NJ
Daxwell No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Houston, TX
Imperial Dade Paper No Bid 14.87 au 33.70 au No Bid
Loxley, AL
Interboro No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Montgomery, AL
Merchants Paper Co. No Bid 10.85 No Bid No Bid
Pensacola, FL
PR Chemical & Paper No Bid 19.80 No Bid No Bid
Pensacola, FL
Pyramid School Products No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tampa, FL
Sam Tell and Son 25.68 nu 20.46 44.28 No Bid
Farmingdale, NY
Supreme Paper Supplies No Bid 11.25 22.44 29.00 pu
Pensacola, FL
Unipak Corp No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brooklyn, NY

Trays, Non-CompartmentedTray, 3-Comp, White Trays, 3-Comp, w/ Tray, 6-Comp, White
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ITEM
14 x 10 x 3/4 Hinged Lid Poly w/Hinged Lid

Quantity: 2,000 cs 200 cs 200 cs 2,500 cs
NEW ITEM - DELETED 0702380 0702815 0700150

ITEM NUMBER 41 42 43 44

All American Poly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Piscataway, NJ
Calico Packaging, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Jessup, MD
Central Poly Bag No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Linden, NJ
Daxwell No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Houston, TX
Imperial Dade Paper No Bid 25.45 No Bid 27.40
Loxley, AL
Interboro No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Montgomery, AL
Merchants Paper Co. No Bid 16.50 No Bid 30.75
Pensacola, FL
PR Chemical & Paper No Bid 43.39 No Bid No Bid
Pensacola, FL
Pyramid School Products No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tampa, FL
Sam Tell and Son 22.30 nu 43.50 No Bid 64.93
Farmingdale, NY
Supreme Paper Supplies No Bid 15.39 No Bid 25.99
Pensacola, FL
Unipak Corp No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brooklyn, NY

Sub Container, 8"Trays, Hot Dog, ClearTrays, Non-Compartmented Trays, Hot Dog w/
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ITEM
Single Serve       50/Pk, Brown Size w/ Zipper Top w/Open Top

Quantity: 200 cs 200 bale 50 cs 75 cs
NEW ITEM - DELETED 0145334 0702820 0702800

ITEM NUMBER 45 46 47 48

All American Poly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Piscataway, NJ
Calico Packaging, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Jessup, MD
Central Poly Bag No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Linden, NJ
Daxwell No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Houston, TX
Imperial Dade Paper 38.29 nu No Bid 12.29 22.19
Loxley, AL
Interboro No Bid No Bid 11.48 ay No Bid
Montgomery, AL
Merchants Paper Co. No Bid 10.85 12.80 36.65
Pensacola, FL
PR Chemical & Paper No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pensacola, FL
Pyramid School Products No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tampa, FL
Sam Tell and Son No Bid 11.31 52.85 au 47.21 au
Farmingdale, NY
Supreme Paper Supplies 35.26 nu No Bid 11.38 21.05
Pensacola, FL
Unipak Corp No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brooklyn, NY

Bag, Hot Dog Silver Foil            Bags, Paper SandwichBags, Lunch, Bags, Plastic, Sandwich
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ITEM
w/Zipper Top 9 x 12

Quantity: 1,000 cs 800 cs 2,500 cs 75 cs
0702825 0145669 - DELETED 0702835 0702840 - DELETED

ITEM NUMBER 49 50 51 52

All American Poly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Piscataway, NJ
Calico Packaging, LLC No Bid No Bid 10.54 au No Bid
Jessup, MD
Central Poly Bag No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Linden, NJ
Daxwell No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Houston, TX
Imperial Dade Paper 31.86 No Bid 13.16 No Bid
Loxley, AL
Interboro No Bid No Bid 11.98 ay No Bid
Montgomery, AL
Merchants Paper Co. 36.35 No Bid 17.15 No Bid
Pensacola, FL
PR Chemical & Paper No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pensacola, FL
Pyramid School Products No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tampa, FL
Sam Tell and Son 30.96 au 34.13 au No Bid 154.06 su
Farmingdale, NY
Supreme Paper Supplies 29.45 27.93 au 10.00 37.83 su
Pensacola, FL

Unipak Corp No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brooklyn, NY

         Bags, Plastic, Gallon Size Bag, Zip Lock, Freezer Gallon Bags, Plastic, Gallon Size Bag, Sandwich Size, Foil Lined
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ITEM

Quantity: 100 cs 1,500 cs 2,200 cs 125 cs
0702910 0702030 0702010 0702020

ITEM NUMBER 53 54 55 56

All American Poly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Piscataway, NJ
Calico Packaging, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Jessup, MD
Central Poly Bag No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Linden, NJ
Daxwell No Bid 5.12 l 5.12 l 5.12 l
Houston, TX
Imperial Dade Paper 15.44 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Loxley, AL
Interboro No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Montgomery, AL
Merchants Paper Co. No Bid 6.95 6.95 6.95 au
Pensacola, FL
PR Chemical & Paper No Bid 18.48 17.88 18.97
Pensacola, FL
Pyramid School Products No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tampa, FL
Sam Tell and Son 168.71 au 7.47 au 7.47 au 7.47 au
Farmingdale, NY
Supreme Paper Supplies 14.96 5.40 au 5.40 5.40 au
Pensacola, FL
Unipak Corp No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brooklyn, NY

               Bag, Cookie                    Spoons                   Forks                     Knives
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ITEM
Serving

Quantity: 3,200 cs 2,000 pk 200 cs 25 bx
0702040 0702060 0750495 0750555 - DELETED

ITEM NUMBER 57 58 59 60

All American Poly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Piscataway, NJ
Calico Packaging, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Jessup, MD
Central Poly Bag No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Linden, NJ
Daxwell 11.12 l 39.63 No Bid No Bid
Houston, TX l
Imperial Dade Paper No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Loxley, AL
Interboro No Bid 12.80 1.80 No Bid
Montgomery, AL
Merchants Paper Co. 12.30 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pensacola, FL
PR Chemical & Paper No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pensacola, FL
Pyramid School Products No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tampa, FL
Sam Tell and Son 17.97 au No Bid 13.92 49.53 au
Farmingdale, NY
Supreme Paper Supplies 11.50 au 1.43 au 11.32 m 3.98 au
Pensacola, FL
Unipak Corp No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brooklyn, NY

                 Beard NetsUtensil Set, Spork Gloves, Plastic                Hair Nets
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ITEM
Unwrapped, Jumbo Milk 12 x 20 x 6 16 x 24

Quantity: 300 bx 400 cs 100 cs 100 cs
0150159 - DELETED 0702360 0702940 0702940

ITEM NUMBER 61 62 63 64

All American Poly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Piscataway, NJ
Calico Packaging, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Jessup, MD
Central Poly Bag No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Linden, NJ
Daxwell No Bid 26.91 l No Bid No Bid
Houston, TX
Imperial Dade Paper No Bid No Bid 35.90 No Bid
Loxley, AL
Interboro No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Montgomery, AL
Merchants Paper Co. No Bid 35.95 31.40 31.70
Pensacola, FL
PR Chemical & Paper No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pensacola, FL
Pyramid School Products No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tampa, FL
Sam Tell and Son 71.69 au 48.94 au 45.20 au 43.94 au
Farmingdale, NY
Supreme Paper Supplies No Bid 25.39 au 31.80 au 28.42
Pensacola, FL
Unipak Corp No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brooklyn, NY

Straws, Clear, Plastic Straws, Wrapped               Pan Liners Pan Liner, Baking
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ITEM
18 x 26 Sandwich Wrap

Quantity: 400 cs 600 bx 625 cs 250 rl
0702500 0702790 0702760

ITEM NUMBER 65 66 67 68

All American Poly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Piscataway, NJ
Calico Packaging, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Jessup, MD
Central Poly Bag No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Linden, NJ
Daxwell No Bid No Bid No Bid 10.65 ay
Houston, TX l
Imperial Dade Paper 15.05 No Bid No Bid 12.94
Loxley, AL
Interboro No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Montgomery, AL
Merchants Paper Co. 21.70 5.02 No Bid 12.90
Pensacola, FL
PR Chemical & Paper No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pensacola, FL
Pyramid School Products No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tampa, FL
Sam Tell and Son No Bid 4.57 au No Bid 16.83 au
Farmingdale, NY
Supreme Paper Supplies 13.70 3.28 62.90 11.12
Pensacola, FL
Unipak Corp No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brooklyn, NY

Plastic, Vinyl Film (PVC)Paper, Delicatessen for Sandwich WrapPan Liners
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ITEM Scouring Pads
20 Gal. Can 56 Gal. Can 3.5 x 5 x 3/4 6 x 9 x 3/8

Quantity: 75 cs 2,000 cs 120 bx 125 bx
0702890 0702920 0701255 0701245

ITEM NUMBER 69 70 71 72

All American Poly No Bid 19.52 ay No Bid No Bid
Piscataway, NJ
Calico Packaging, LLC 13.78 23.94 No Bid No Bid
Jessup, MD
Central Poly Bag 11.40 17.80 No Bid No Bid
Linden, NJ
Daxwell No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Houston, TX
Imperial Dade Paper No Bid 25.40 No Bid No Bid
Loxley, AL
Interboro 13.32 22.48 ay No Bid No Bid
Montgomery, AL 19.48 ay

17.34 ay
14.34 au
12.82 au

Merchants Paper Co. No Bid No Bid 9.45 No Bid
Pensacola, FL
PR Chemical & Paper No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pensacola, FL
Pyramid School Products No Bid No Bid 6.89 my 2.17 au
Tampa, FL m
Sam Tell and Son 16.70 au 23.93 au 51.33 au 16.75 au
Farmingdale, NY
Supreme Paper Supplies No Bid 20.10 au 5.78 5.88
Pensacola, FL
Unipak Corp No Bid 21.50 No Bid No Bid
Brooklyn, NY

Garbage Can Liners -            Scouring PadsGarbage Can Liners - 
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ITEM Hood Detergent
Scouring Sponge Aluminum

Quantity: 1,600 bx 400 cs 24 gal 15 cs
0701270 0701060 0701160 0701070

ITEM NUMBER 73 74 75 76

All American Poly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Piscataway, NJ
Calico Packaging, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Jessup, MD
Central Poly Bag No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Linden, NJ
Daxwell No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Houston, TX
Imperial Dade Paper No Bid 30.65 No Bid No Bid
Loxley, AL
Interboro No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Montgomery, AL
Merchants Paper Co. 3.95 28.00 au 22.95 No Bid
Pensacola, FL
PR Chemical & Paper No Bid No Bid 23.03 103.45
Pensacola, FL
Pyramid School Products 3.45 au 76.25 m 32.99 m No Bid
Tampa, FL m
Sam Tell and Son 6.79 au No Bid No Bid No Bid
Farmingdale, NY
Supreme Paper Supplies 4.59 36.05 au 34.41 No Bid
Pensacola, FL
Unipak Corp No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brooklyn, NY

Soap Powder             Polish Liquid           Stainless Steel 
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ITEM Oven Cleaner, Acid
Type Degreaser Rational For Combi Oven Disposable

Quantity: 120 gal 8 pl 36 cs 500 rl
0701080 0700190 0702100 0703095

ITEM NUMBER 77 78 79 80

All American Poly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Piscataway, NJ
Calico Packaging, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Jessup, MD
Central Poly Bag No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Linden, NJ
Daxwell No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Houston, TX
Imperial Dade Paper No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Loxley, AL
Interboro No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Montgomery, AL
Merchants Paper Co. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pensacola, FL
PR Chemical & Paper No Bid 138.08 No Bid No Bid
Pensacola, FL
Pyramid School Products No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tampa, FL
Sam Tell and Son 6.785 au 80.24 No Bid No Bid
Farmingdale, NY
Supreme Paper Supplies 8.72 No Bid 19.32 38.75
Pensacola, FL
Unipak Corp No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brooklyn, NY

Food Service Wipe,Cleaner/Rinse Aid Tablets, Plexiglass Cleaner
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ITEM
 12 x 33 Liquid, 32 oz 18 x 25, Hvy Duty Plain, White

Quantity: 50 rl 150 btl 200 rl 500 pk
0110073 - DELETED 0145159 - DELETED 0145238 0145630

ITEM NUMBER 81 82 83 84

All American Poly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Piscataway, NJ
Calico Packaging, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Jessup, MD
Central Poly Bag No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Linden, NJ
Daxwell No Bid No Bid 20.21 ay No Bid
Houston, TX l
Imperial Dade Paper No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Loxley, AL
Interboro No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Montgomery, AL
Merchants Paper Co. No Bid 2.20 au 4.20 1.25
Pensacola, FL
PR Chemical & Paper No Bid No Bid No Bid 13.78
Pensacola, FL
Pyramid School Products No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tampa, FL
Sam Tell and Son No Bid 51.39 au 29.17 au 15.23 au
Farmingdale, NY
Supreme Paper Supplies No Bid 3.96 au 17.93 au 1.33 au
Pensacola, FL
Unipak Corp No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brooklyn, NY

Plastic Wrap, Clear Detergent, Dishwashing             Foil, Aluminum                Paper Plates, 6"
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ITEM
White 12 x 75 Ft. Disposable

Quantity: 500 pk 100 rl 500 cs 300 cs
0145650 0150007 - DELETED 0702510 NEW ITEM

ITEM NUMBER 85 86 87 88

All American Poly No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Piscataway, NJ
Calico Packaging, LLC No Bid No Bid 10.28 No Bid
Jessup, MD
Central Poly Bag No Bid No Bid 9.80 ay No Bid
Linden, NJ
Daxwell No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Houston, TX
Imperial Dade Paper No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Loxley, AL
Interboro No Bid No Bid 9.34 No Bid
Montgomery, AL
Merchants Paper Co. 1.95 No Bid No Bid 14.30 ny
Pensacola, FL
PR Chemical & Paper No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pensacola, FL
Pyramid School Products No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tampa, FL
Sam Tell and Son 19.02 au No Bid 20.23 au No Bid
Farmingdale, NY
Supreme Paper Supplies 2.41 au 26.99 au 11.75 au No Bid
Pensacola, FL
Unipak Corp No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brooklyn, NY

Paper Plates, 9" Plain,                 Paper, Wax          Baker's Rack Cover, Pizza Box, Individual
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ITEM
Plastic, 8 oz, w/ Hinged Lid

Quantity: 500 cs
NEW ITEM

ITEM NUMBER 89

All American Poly No Bid
Piscataway, NJ
Calico Packaging, LLC No Bid
Jessup, MD
Central Poly Bag No Bid
Linden, NJ
Daxwell No Bid
Houston, TX
Imperial Dade Paper No Bid
Loxley, AL
Interboro No Bid
Montgomery, AL
Merchants Paper Co. No Bid
Pensacola, FL
PR Chemical & Paper No Bid
Pensacola, FL
Pyramid School Products No Bid
Tampa, FL
Sam Tell and Son No Bid
Farmingdale, NY
Supreme Paper Supplies 39.78 ny
Pensacola, FL
Unipak Corp No Bid
Brooklyn, NY

NOTES:
a=Alternate product 
au=Alternate product unacceptable, no sample sent, or sample not approved
l = Lead Time
m = Vendor bid minimum shipment / my = Minimum shipment acceptable
u = Unacceptable, no sample sent or sample not approved
y = Sample received and approved
mu=Minimum shipment unacceptable
n=New item / nu = New item unacceptable / ny= New item acceptable
su= Sample unacceptable / sy= Sample acceptable

Clamshell, Small,Clear
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BID TABULATION, RECOMMENDATIONS, AND PROTEST
Bid tabulations with award recommendations are posted for 72 hours in the Purchasing Department Office and are also posted to the School District's website address at: http://ecsd-
fl.schoolloop.com/purchasing/bids. Notices will not be automatically mailed. Bid tabulations or recommendations will be distributed solely through the Purchasing website address.                     
Failure to file a protest within the time prescribed in Section 120.57(3) Florida Statutes will constitute a waiver of proceedings under Chapter 120 Florida Statutes, or failure to post the bond or 
other security required by law within the time allowed for filing a bond shall constitute a waiver of proceedings under Chapter 120 Florida Statutes. 

I hereby certify that the prices and bidders reflected herein are valid, and have been received in compliance to Escambia County School Board Rules and Florida Law.

John Dombroskie
John Dombroskie, Director
Purchasing Department
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