THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY
&3 PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

75 North Pace Blvd.

Pensacola, FL 32505

El)i (23

BID AWARD NOTICE

DATE: BID TITLE & REFERENCE:
October 9, 2019 Miscellaneous Condiments, Spices &
Staples, Bid #200502

DESCRIPTION OF PURCHASE:

An annual agreement with a one (1) year renewal option to provide miscellaneous condiments,
spices, and staples for school cafeterias as stocked and distributed by the Central Warehouse.
Eleven (11) items were bid, and ten (10) items are awarded. The item not awarded was due to
samples not being submitted. Items will be purchased as needed to meet cafeteria usage
requirements. Bid award(s) to the lowest bidder(s) meeting specifications.

Effective Dates: October 16, 2019 through September 30, 2020.

REQUESTED BY:

Food Services

SUPPLIER NAME: ITEMS AWARDED: ESTIMATED ANNUAL EXPENDITURE:

Butter Buds, Racine, WI, 1 $ 4,967.50
MJM Marketing, Kailua Kona, Hl 1 71,820.00
Red Gold, LLC, Elwood, IN 1 53,860.00
Robbins Sales Co., Inc., Syosset, NY 1 99,000.00
6

Sysco Gulf Coast, Geneva, AL 39,610.00
AMOUNT OF PURCHASE: FUNDING SOURCE:
$269,257.50 Est. / Yr. Food Services Fund (4110)

METHOD OF PROCUREMENT:

ECSD Bid Responses Received: 8

DATE AND TIME POSTED:

October 9, 2019, 11:15 am Central Time

9500PUR101 (11/10) Retention - 5 Years



THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
75 NORTH PACE BOULEVARD
PENSACOLA, FLORIDA 32505
BID TABULATION

DATE: September 24, 2019
Awarded Items Are Highlighted
BID NBR: 200502

BID TITLE: Miscellaneous Condiments, Spices, and Staples

Where two prices are shown, the bottom price is the bid case/pack size
Top price is unit price needed to determine low cost because of vendor differences in case count

ITEM Beans, Beans, Peaches, Salt | Garlic and Herb
Pinto Kidney Diced DELETED Season, No Salt
Quantity: 150 cs 150 cs 2,000 cs 48 cs 200 cs
0502041 0502050 0501150 0510780 0510210
ITEM NUMBER 1 2 3 4 5
Butler Foods of Pensacola
Cantonment, FL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Butter Buds
Racine, WI No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Churchfield Trading Co.* 6.4600 d
Santa Ynez, CA No Bid No Bid 38.78 ay No Bid No Bid
Churchfield Trading Co.* 6.6400 d
Santa Ynez, CA No Bid No Bid 39.84 ay No Bid No Bid
MJM Marketing
Kailua Kona, HI No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Red Gold
Elwood, IN No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Robbins Sales Co. 8.2500
Syosset, NY No Bid No Bid 49.50 No Bid No Bid
Safe & Fair Food
Chicago, IL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Sysco Gulf Coast 3.9166 ay 4.1500 ay 8.5000 au 0.7500 au 16.2500 m
Geneva, AL 23.50 24.90 51.00 18.00 97.50
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ITEM Graham Snacks, Oats, Marinara Soup, Cream Italian Dressing | Pan/Food Spray
Whole Grain Quick Sauce of Mushroom Low Calorie,Dry Butter
Quantity: 2,100 cs 150 cs 2,000 cs 50 cs 100 cs 250 cs
0505250 0506121 0505200 0512050 0507160 0502100
ITEM NUMBER 6 7 8 9 10 1

Butler Foods of Pensacola 0.2603

Cantonment, FL 52.05 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Butter Buds 3.3100

Racine, WI No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 19.87

Churchfield Trading Co.

Santa Ynez, CA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

MJM Marketing 0.1100 ay

Kailua Kona, HI 34.20 my No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Red Gold 4.4900

Elwood, IN No Bid No Bid 26.93 my No Bid No Bid No Bid

Red Gold 3.9700 co

Elwood, IN No Bid No Bid 23.83 m No Bid No Bid No Bid

Robbins Sales Co.

Syosset, NY No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Safe & Fair Food 0.1350 au

Chicago, IL 25.92 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Sysco Gulf Coast 0.1190 3.2500 5.7666 3.8300 2.6100 4.0400

Geneva, AL 17.85 39.00 34.60 46.00 47.00 24.25

NOTES:

*=Past performance
a=Alternate bid

au=Alternate bid sample was unacceptable or no sample sent

ay=Alternate bid sample was received and approved

co=Commodity pricing
d=Delivery lead time

m=Minimum bid order quantity
mu=Minimum bid order quantity not acceptable
my=Minimum bid order quantity is acceptable

BID TABULATION, RECOMMENDATIONS, AND PROTEST
Bid tabulations with award recommendations are posted for 72 hours in the Purchasing Department Office and are
also posted to the School District's website address at: http://ecsd-fl.schoolloop.com/purchasing/bids. Notices will

not be automatically mailed.

Failure to file a protest within the time prescribed in Section 120.57(3) Florida Statutes, or failure to post the bond
or other security required by law within the time allowed for filing a bond shall constitute a waiver of proceedings
under Chapter 120 Florida Statutes.

| hereby certify that the prices and bidders reflected herein are valid, and have been received in compliance to

Escambia County School Board Rules and Florida Law.

Jokn Dombroskic
John Dombroskie, Director
Purchasing Department
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