
 

 
 
 
DATE: BID TITLE & REFERENCE: 
November 29, 2018  Cafeteria Equipment, Bid#191002 
 
DESCRIPTION OF PURCHASE: 

 

An annual purchasing agreement with a one (1) year renewal option to provide cafeteria equipment 
to schools throughout the District. Forty-two (42) items were bid and thirty-nine (39) items are 
awarded.  Items #4, 5, and 42 were not awarded due to the following: the items requested were not 
bid upon and no documentation was received for any alternate products, or the equipment for which 
documentation was received was not deemed acceptable. Items will be purchased as needed to 
meet cafeteria usage requirements.  Bid award(s) to the lowest bidder(s) meeting specifications.  
 

Effective Dates: January 1, 2019 through December 31, 2019.  
 
 
 
 
 

  
REQUESTED BY: 
 
      Food Services Department 
 
    
SUPPLIER NAME:           ITEMS AWARDED:            ESTIMATED ANNUAL EXPENDITURE:  
 

 Big Bend Restaurant Supply, Inc.,                        6       $ 75,263.95 
 Tallahassee, FL           
 Chef’s Depot, Monsey, NY                                    2                                      16,294.67 
      Kesco-Florida, Pensacola, FL       24                      159,111.56 
 Pasco Brokerage, Inc., Plano, TX        1          32,040.00 
 Sam Tell & Son, Inc., Farmingdale, NY       6          14,274.33 
       
            
    
AMOUNT OF PURCHASE:  FUNDING SOURCE: 

 

$296,984.51 Est. / Yr. Food Services Fund (4110) 
 

  
METHOD OF PROCUREMENT: 

 

ECSD Bid      Bids Received:  5    
 

  
DATE AND TIME POSTED: 

 

November 29, 2018, 4:30 pm Central Time 
 
 
9500PUR101 (11/10) Retention - 5 Years 

 
THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY 

PURCHASING DEPARTMENT 
75 North Pace Blvd.  

Pensacola, FL  32505 
 

BID AWARD NOTICE 



DATE:  November 27, 2018

BID NBR:  191002
BID TITLE:  Cafeteria Equipment

Top Price: Equipment - Delivery  Only                                Bottom Price: Equipment & Full Installation
                                                           

ITEM
Units Units    Shelving Units Laundry

Quantity: 3 ea 3 ea 3 ea 4 ea
DELETED

ITEM NUMBER 1 2 3 4
Big Bend Restaurant Sup 399.64 494.75 519.02 NO BID
Tallahassee, FL 424.64 519.75 544.20
Chef's Depot
Morsey, NY NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Kesco Kit Equip. & Supply 356.80 411.24 434.28
Pensacola, FL 356.80 411.24 434.28 NO BID
Pasco Brokerage Inc. 506.80 sh 596.80 639.00 1,058.00
Plano, TX NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Sam Tell & Son Inc. 330.42 574.16 604.04 622.13
Farmingdale, NY 330.42 574.16 604.04 622.13

ITEM
       Laundry Table      Rack, 48"L Carts

Quantity: 2 ea 1 ea 15 ea 2 ea
DELETED

ITEM NUMBER 5 6 7 8
Big Bend Restaurant Sup NO BID 1,137.85 ny 159.68 1,891.21
Tallahassee, FL 1,162.85 NO BID NO BID
Chef's Depot 1,224.98
Morsey, NY NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Kesco Kit Equip. & Supply 149.00 1,200.00
Pensacola, FL NO BID NO BID 149.00 1,200.00
Pasco Brokerage Inc. 1,058.00 1,405.00 ny 245.00 1,465.00
Plano, TX NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Sam Tell & Son Inc. 1,165.81 ny 151.26 1,337.66
Farmingdale, NY NO BID 1,165.81 151.26 NO BID

Dryer, Receiving Dunnage

THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

75 NORTH PACE BOULEVARD
PENSACOLA, FLORIDA 32505

BID TABULATION

Awarded Items are highlighted

Shelving Mobile Shelving Mobile Utensil Washing Machine,

Mobile Utility
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ITEM
Opener Mobile Pan, Gas

Quantity: 1 ea 2 ea 2 ea 1 ea

ITEM NUMBER 9 10 11 12
Big Bend Restaurant Sup 1,472.97 7,845.21 1,433.08 13,537.47
Tallahassee, FL NO BID NO BID NO BID 13,687.47
Chef's Depot 1,445.37 6,699.88 1,409.26 18,215.13
Morsey, NY NO BID NO BID NO BID 19,565.13
Kesco Kit Equip. & Supply 1,350.00 5,495.00 au 1,110.00 14,175.00
Pensacola, FL 1,350.00 5,495.00 1,110.00 14,275.00
Pasco Brokerage Inc. 1,407.00 7,475.00 1,425.00 18,050.00
Plano, TX NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Sam Tell & Son Inc. 8,039.85 1,110.29 18,077.38
Farmingdale, NY NO BID 8,039.85 1,110.29 18,077.38

ITEM
Double Deck   Steamer Gas Dbl. Stack Gas

Quantity: 3 ea 1 ea 4 ea 1 ea

ITEM NUMBER 13 14 15 16
Big Bend Restaurant Sup 13,429.47 22,638.05 ay 13,755.85 4,085.69
Tallahassee, FL 13,629.47 22,838.05 13,955.85 4,185.69
Chef's Depot 14,107.02 21,496.08 ay 17,575.10 3,069.84
Morsey, NY 15,357.02 21,496.08 17,675.10 4,019.84
Kesco Kit Equip. & Supply 14,550.00 18,200.00 f 15,750.00 ng 3,900.00
Pensacola, FL 14,650.00 19,200.00 15,850.00 4,000.00
Kesco Kit Equip. & Supply 10,450.00 f 15,750.00 lpg 11,400.00
Pensacola, FL 10,550.00 15,850.00 11,440.00
Pasco Brokerage Inc. 14,925.00 22,900.00 17,100.00 3,415.00
Plano, TX NO BID 22,900.00 NO BID NO BID
Sam Tell & Son Inc. 15,231.71 23,326.38 19,140.76 3,441.38
Farmingdale, NY 15,231.71 23,326.38 19,140.76 3,441.38

Convection Oven Combi Oven / Conv. Steamer,

Electric Can Slicer Slicer Stand

Burners
Range, Two

Tilting Braising
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ITEM
Refrigerator Racks Cabinet     OH Pot Rack

Quantity: 2 ea 6 ea 6 ea 1 ea

ITEM NUMBER 17 18 19 20
Big Bend Restaurant Sup 9,833.20 855.44 5,608.74 1,271.45 ny
Tallahassee, FL 9,908.20 NO BID NO BID 1,321.45
Chef's Depot 8,653.50 5,476.55
Morsey, NY 9,153.50 NO BID 5,876.55 NO BID
Kesco Kit Equip. & Supply 7,628.00 520.00 5,750.00
Pensacola, FL 7,628.00 520.00 5,750.00 NO BID
Pasco Brokerage Inc. 9,040.00 920.00 5,340.00 1,845.00 nu
Plano, TX NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Sam Tell & Son Inc. 9,865.05 500.15 7,150.53 1,385.47 nu
Farmingdale, NY 9,865.05 500.15 7,150.53 1,385.47

ITEM
Truck Ladder       Refrigerator        Warmer

Quantity: 1 ea 1 ea 1 ea 1 ea

ITEM NUMBER 21 22 23 24
Big Bend Restaurant Sup 448.17 NO BID 16,885.44 15,151.46
Tallahassee, FL NO BID 16,935.44 15,301.46
Chef's Depot 592.96 15,054.75 13,479.30
Morsey, NY NO BID  NO BID 15,704.75 14,129.30
Kesco Kit Equip. & Supply 440.00 13,800.00 12,634.00
Pensacola, FL 440.00  NO BID 13,800.00 12,634.00
Pasco Brokerage Inc. 595.00 460.00 15,725.00 14,085.00
Plano, TX NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Sam Tell & Son Inc. 518.71 402.50 17,162.53 15,366.52
Farmingdale, NY 518.71 402.50 17,162.53 15,366.52

Mobile Platform Safety Pass-Thru

Mobile Hot/ProofReach-In Mobile Pan

Pass-Thru

Work Table w/

Page 3



ITEM
    Food Counter, 36" Food Counter, 50" Food Counter, 50" Food Counter, 36"

Quantity: 1 ea 1 ea 1 ea 10 ea

ITEM NUMBER 25 26 27 28
Big Bend Restaurant Sup 5,590.25 ny 6,627.60 ny 6,860.70 ny 5,482.05 ny
Tallahassee, FL 5,715.25 6,752.60 6,985.70 5,607.05
Chef's Depot 6,329.60 ny 7,429.44 ny 7,678.08 ny 6,207.52 ny
Morsey, NY 6,829.60 7,929.44 8,178.08 6,707.52
Kesco Kit Equip. & Supply 5,150.00 ny 6,150.00 ny 6,350.00 ny 5,050.00 ny
Pensacola, FL 5,150.00 6,150.00 6,350.00 5,050.00
Pasco Brokerage Inc. 5,725.00 ny 6,805.00 ny 7,050.00 ny 5,605.00 ny
Plano, TX NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Sam Tell & Son Inc. 6,366.66 nu 7,046.56 nu 8,523.97 nu 6,777.68 ny
Farmingdale, NY 6,366.66 7,046.56 8,523.97 6,777.68

ITEM
Top Counter Milk Cooler Milk Cooler Milk Cooler

Quantity: 1 ea 1 ea 1 ea 1 ea

ITEM NUMBER 29 30 31 32
Big Bend Restaurant Sup 6,576.15 ny 3,980.83 4,135.87 ay 2,606.14
Tallahassee, FL 6,701.15 4,030.83 4,185.87 2,656.14
Big Bend Restaurant Sup 2,528.33
Tallahassee, FL 2,578.33
Chef's Depot 7,374.56 ny 2,524.65 2,494.91 ay 2,225.57 ay
Morsey, NY 7,874.56 2,924.65 2,894.91 2,625.57
Kesco Kit Equip. & Supply 6,085.00 ny 2,950.00 4,000.00 2,500.00
Pensacola, FL 6,085.00 2,950.00 4,000.00 2,500.00
Pasco Brokerage Inc. 6,750.00 ny 3,425.00 4,700.00 2905.00/2995.00 cb
Plano, TX NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Sam Tell & Son Inc. 8,163.54 ny 3,276.68 4,652.03 2,875.01
Farmingdale, NY 8,163.54 3,276.68 NO BID 2,875.01

Mobile Hot Mobile Dual Serv. Mobile Dual Serv.

Mobile Cold Mobile Cold Mobile Hot

Mobile Dual Serv.

Mobile Hot
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ITEM
 Counter    Food Counter Small Bin, Small

Quantity: 2 ea 1 ea 1 ea 1 ea

ITEM NUMBER 33 34 35 36
Big Bend Restaurant Sup 2,892.75 ny 11,848.20 ny 2,607.87 f 897.47
Tallahassee, FL 2,942.75 11,973.32 2,657.87 NO BID c
Chef's Depot 3,445.60 ny 12,998.08 ny 2,963.47 ay 1,019.84
Morsey, NY 3,945.60 13,498.08 3,563.47 1,419.84
Kesco Kit Equip. & Supply 2,620.00 ny 11,100.00 ny 2,850.00 975.00
Pensacola, FL 2,620.00 11,100.00 2,950.00 975.00
Pasco Brokerage Inc. 3,140.00 ny 12,275.00 ny 3,125.00 ay 1,450.00 bt
Plano, TX NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Sam Tell & Son Inc. 3,205.60 nu 13,683.43 nu 4,514.42 b
Farmingdale, NY 3,205.60 13,683.43 4,514.42 NO BID

ITEM
Large Bin, Large     w/Storage Bin Table

Quantity: 1 ea 1 ea 1 ea 1 ea

ITEM NUMBER 37 38 39 40
Big Bend Restaurant Sup 2,593.64 f 817.67 4,638.26 ai 765.45 ny
Tallahassee, FL 2,643.64 NO BID c 4,688.26 815.45
Chef's Depot 2,947.32 929.17 4,171.81
Morsey, NY 3,547.32 1,329.17 5,171.81 NO BID
Kesco Kit Equip. & Supply 2,850.00 890.00 4,200.00 NO BID
Pensacola, FL 2,950.00 890.00 4,300.00
Pasco Brokerage Inc. 3,125.00 f 1,200.00 bt 4,990.00 b,f 1,300.00 ny
Plano, TX NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Sam Tell & Son Inc. 4,393.35 b 4,024.62 1,000.32 nu
Farmingdale, NY 4,393.35 NO BID 4,024.62 1,000.32

Ice Maker Ice Storage Ice Machine

Mobile Cashier Mobile Hot/Cold  Ice Maker

Mobile Work

Ice Storage
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ITEM
   w/Spice Shelf          Table

Quantity: 1 ea 1 ea
DELETED

ITEM NUMBER 41 42
Big Bend Restaurant Sup 2,487.50 nu 4,492.40 nu
Tallahassee, FL 2,537.50 4,542.40
Chef's Depot
Morsey, NY NO BID NO BID
Kesco Kit Equip. & Supply
Pensacola, FL NO BID NO BID
Pasco Brokerage Inc.
Plano, TX NO BID NO BID
Sam Tell & Son Inc. 2,413.67 ny 6,039.71 nu
Farmingdale, NY 2,413.67 6,039.71

a = Alternate bid 
ai=Accessories included
b=Bin included 
bt=Bin top included
c=No installation cost if purchased w/ Ice Head
cb=Corner bumper kit
ea= price per each
f= filter accessory included in pricing
fl=filter accessary labor/install included in pricing
lpg=Lp gas
m = Vendor bid minimum shipment
n - No prior approved brand
ng=Natural gas
sh=Four shelves per section
u = Unacceptable, no sample sent or sample not approved
y= Sample literature received and approved 

BID TABULATION, RECOMMENDATIONS, AND PROTEST
Bid tabulations with award recommendations are posted for 72 hours in the Purchasing Department Office and are also 
posted to the School District's website address at: http://ecsd-fl.schoolloop.com/purchasing/bids.  Notices will not be 
automatically mailed.

Failure to file a protest within the time prescribed in Section 120.57(3) Florida Statutes, or failure to post the bond or other 
security required by law within the time allowed for filing a bond shall constitute a waiver of proceedings under Chapter 
120 Florida Statutes.   

I hereby certify that the prices and bidders reflected herein are valid, and have been received in compliance to Escambia 
County School Board Rules and Florida Law.

John Dombroskie
John Dombroskie, Director
Purchasing Department

Baker's Table           Work
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