
 

 
 
 
DATE: BID TITLE & REFERENCE: 
August 21, 2018  Musical Instruments and Accessories, Bid 

#190505 
 
DESCRIPTION OF PURCHASE: 

 

 Musical instruments for various schools throughout the District.  One hundred forty-four (144) items 
bid, ninety-nine (99) items are awarded.  Thirty (30) items valued at ($6,528.61) will be purchased 
separately using a cooperative purchasing agreement.  Fifteen (15) items are not recommended for 
award due to no bids being received.  Bid award(s) to the lowest bidder(s) meeting specifications.   

 
  
REQUESTED BY: 

 

      Fine Arts Department 
 
    
SUPPLIER NAME:      ITEMS FOR PURCHASE:         ESTIMATED EXPENDITURE: 
 

Brook Mays Music, Dallas, TX                13     $    8,885.00 
Schmidt’s Music, Inc., Pensacola, FL                  80       259,659.75 
Taylor Music Inc., Aberdeen, SD                           6                                                     421.98 
 

    
AMOUNT OF PURCHASE:  FUNDING SOURCE: 

 

$$268,966.73 General Fund (1110) – MS Band Instrument Replacement 
(1307) $26,228.00 

 
Capital Improvement Tax Construction Fund FY 18 (3718) – 
Subsidy-High School Bands (1302) $15,945.00 
 
Half Cent Sales Tax 2008 (3948) – Kingsfield Elementary 
New Construction (3299) $44,490.75 
 
Half Cent Sales Tax 2008 (3948) – Beulah Middle New 
Construction (3311) $182,302.98 

 
  
METHOD OF PROCUREMENT: 

 

ECSD Bid     Responses Received:  7 Responses Rejected:  4       
   

  
DATE AND TIME POSTED: 

 

August 21, 2018, 3:45pm Central Time 
 
 
9500PUR101 (11/10) Retention - 5 Years 

 
THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY 

PURCHASING DEPARTMENT 
75 North Pace Boulevard  

Pensacola, FL  32505 
 

BID AWARD NOTICE 
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Musical Instruments and Accessories

** F=Florida Business; O=Out of State Business Deleted#-See Notes Below Deleted^-See Notes Below
Bid Item #/Description 

Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes
O Brook Mays Music 5% No Bid No Bid $7,356.00 $7,723.80 $3,879.00 $4,072.95 No Bid No Bid
F Schmidt's Music, Inc. $2,265.00 $2,265.00 $6,725.00 $6,725.00 $3,695.00 $3,695.00 No Bid No Bid
O Taylor Music Inc. 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3,616.00 $3,796.80 No Bid No Bid

Bid Item #/Description 
Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

O Brook Mays Music 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $900.00 $945.00 AU $600.00 $630.00 AU $446.00 $468.30
F Schmidt's Music, Inc. $1,645.00 $1,645.00 $1,825.00 $1,825.00 $825.00 $825.00 $610.00 $610.00 AY No Bid No Bid
O Taylor Music Inc. 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $828.00 $869.40 $611.00 $641.55 No Bid No Bid

Bid Item #/Description 
Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

O Brook Mays Music 5% $752.00 $789.60 $1,300.00 $1,365.00 AU $208.00 $218.40 $376.00 $394.80
F Schmidt's Music, Inc. $875.00 $875.00 AU $1,970.00 $1,970.00 $82.00 $82.00 AU No Bid No Bid
O Taylor Music Inc. 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bid Item #/Description 
Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

O Brook Mays Music 5% $15.00 $15.75 $54.00 $56.70 $45.00 $47.25 U $20.00 $21.00
F Schmidt's Music, Inc. $15.00 $15.00 $56.00 $56.00 $50.00 $50.00 $19.00 $19.00
O Taylor Music Inc. 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bid Item #/Description 
Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

O Brook Mays Music 5% $20.00 $21.00 U $20.00 $21.00 U $1,450.00 $1,522.50 AU No Bid No Bid $222.00 $233.10
F Schmidt's Music, Inc. $24.00 $24.00 $34.00 $34.00 $1,740.00 $1,740.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Taylor Music Inc. 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bid Item #/Description 
Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

O Brook Mays Music 5% No Bid No Bid $101.00 $106.05 $68.00 $71.40 $43.00 $45.15
F Schmidt's Music, Inc. $4,648.00 $4,648.00 No Bid No Bid $49.00 $49.00 $29.00 $29.00
O Taylor Music Inc. 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $44.00 $46.20 No Bid No Bid

Bid Item #/Description 
Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

O Brook Mays Music 5% $35.00 $36.75 $34.00 $35.70 $55.00 $57.75 $29.00 $30.45
F Schmidt's Music, Inc. $28.00 $28.00 $28.00 $28.00 $44.00 $44.00 $26.00 $26.00
O Taylor Music Inc. 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

**
FL. Pref. 

Adj.

16/ Orchestra Chime Mallet

12/ Timpani Heads-DELETED^

24/ Malletech

28/ General Timpani Mallets
**

FL. Pref. 
Adj.

25/ Xylo/Bell Mallets 26/ Xylo/Bell Mallets 27/ General Bass Mallet

**
FL. Pref. 

Adj.

21/ Tuba 22/ Cymbal-DELETED^

5 / Marching Baritone

19/ Electric Guitar-DELETED^ 20/ 110 Guitar Amp
**

FL. Pref. 
Adj.

17 / Yarn Mallets 17 / Yarn Mallets 18/ Bass Clarinet

**
FL. Pref. 

Adj.

9/ Flugelhorn 10/ Euphonium 11/ Bass Drum Heads-DELETED^

23/ Cymbal Stand

**

6/ Tenor Saxophone 7/ Alto Saxophone 8/ Microkorg XL5 / Marching Baritone

THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

1 / French Horn 3/ Marimba

Wednesday, August 21, 2018  
190505

Recommended Award

75 NORTH PACE BOULEVARD

PENSACOLA, FL 32505

2/ Sousaphone 4/ Drum Set DELETED^

BID TABULATION

FL. Pref. 
Adj.

Date: 
Bid Number:
Bid Title: 

**
FL. Pref. 

Adj.

13/ Concert Snare Drum Heads 14/ Bass Drum Mallets 15/ Timpani Mallets
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Bid Item #/Description 
Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

O Brook Mays Music 5% $2,429.00 $2,550.45 $1,750.00 $1,837.50 $3,000.00 $3,150.00 AU No Bid No Bid
F Schmidt's Music, Inc. $2,223.00 $2,223.00 $1,668.00 $1,668.00 $3,195.00 $3,195.00 No Bid No Bid
O Taylor Music Inc. 5% No Bid No Bid $1,195.00 $1,254.75 AU $3,111.00 $3,266.55 No Bid No Bid

Bid Item #/Description 
Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

O Brook Mays Music 5% $1,200.00 $1,260.00 AU $1,200.00 $1,260.00 AU $2,000.00 $2,100.00 AU $2,000.00 $2,100.00 AU

F Schmidt's Music, Inc. $550.00 $550.00 $550.00 $550.00 $1,145.00 $1,145.00 $1,145.00 $1,145.00
O Taylor Music Inc. 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bid Item #/Description 
Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

O Brook Mays Music 5% No Bid No Bid $532.00 $558.60 $532.00 $532.00 AU $715.00 $715.00 $715.00 $715.00 AU

F Schmidt's Music, Inc. $540.00 $540.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Taylor Music Inc. 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bid Item #/Description 
Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

O Brook Mays Music 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $500.00 $525.00 AU $2,565.00 $2,693.25
F Schmidt's Music, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $480.00 $480.00 $585.00 $585.00 $2,460.00 $2,460.00
O Taylor Music Inc. 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2,422.00 $2,543.10

Bid Item #/Description 
Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

O Brook Mays Music 5% $1,450.00 $1,522.50 AU $2,566.00 $2,694.30 $4,420.00 $4,641.00 $900.00 $945.00 AU

F Schmidt's Music, Inc. $1,740.00 $1,740.00 $2,350.00 $2,350.00 $4,245.00 $4,245.00 $1,960.00 $1,960.00
O Taylor Music Inc. 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $4,177.00 $4,385.85 No Bid No Bid

Bid Item #/Description 
Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

O Brook Mays Music 5% $3,400.00 $3,570.00 AU $2,643.00 $2,775.15 $1,765.00 $1,853.25 AU No Bid No Bid
F Schmidt's Music, Inc. $4,205.00 $4,205.00 $2,415.00 $2,415.00 $1,970.00 $1,970.00 $4,940.00 $4,940.00
O Taylor Music Inc. 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bid Item #/Description 
Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

O Brook Mays Music 5% $2,000.00 $2,100.00 AU No Bid No Bid $10,600.00 $11,130.00 $1,318.00 $1,383.90
F Schmidt's Music, Inc. $2,015.00 $2,015.00 No Bid No Bid $9,695.00 $9,695.00 $1,255.00 $1,255.00
O Taylor Music Inc. 5% $1,939.00 $2,035.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,233.00 $1,294.65 AU

Bid Item #/Description 
Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

O Brook Mays Music 5% $3,763.00 $3,951.15 $2,305.00 $2,420.25 $2,305.00 $2,420.25 No Bid No Bid $325.00 $341.25
F Schmidt's Music, Inc. $3,585.00 $3,585.00 $2,195.00 $2,195.00 $2,195.00 $2,195.00 $1,200.00 $1,200.00 $315.00 $315.00
O Taylor Music Inc. 5% $3,511.00 $3,686.55 $2,155.00 $2,262.75 $1,808.00 $1,898.40 AU No Bid No Bid $322.00 $338.10

Bid Item #/Description 
Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

O Brook Mays Music 5% $328.00 $344.40 $305.00 $320.25 $154.00 $161.70 $269.00 $282.45
F Schmidt's Music, Inc. $315.00 $315.00 $260.00 $260.00 $110.00 $110.00 $245.00 $245.00
O Taylor Music Inc. 5% $400.00 $420.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

39/ Jazz Guitar

36/ Bass
**

FL. Pref. 
Adj.

33/ Cello 34/ Cello 35/ Bass

32/ Keyboard-DELETED#
**

FL. Pref. 
Adj.

29/ French Horn 30/ Concert Bass Drum 31/ Tuba

39/ Jazz Guitar
**

FL. Pref. 
Adj.

37/ Digital Piano Keyboard 38/ Standard Jazz Bass 38/ Standard Jazz Bass

44/ Protégé Oboe
**

FL. Pref. 
Adj.

41/Bass Combo Amplifier-DELETED# 42/ Conga Set 43/ Piccolo40/Bass Combo Amp-DELETED^

52/ Tuba
**

FL. Pref. 
Adj.

49/ Baritone Saxophone 50/ French Horn 51/ Euphonium

48/ Tenor Saxophone
**

FL. Pref. 
Adj.

45/ Bass Clarinet 46/ Contra-Alto Clarinet 47/ Bassoon

60/ Drum Set
**

FL. Pref. 
Adj.

57/ Miramba 58/ Xylophone 59/ Concert Bells 58/ Xylophone

56/ Concert Bass Drum
**

FL. Pref. 
Adj.

53/ Tuba 54/ Tuba Tamer-DELETED# 55/ Timpani Set of 4 Drums

64/ Triangle Performance Pack
**

FL. Pref. 
Adj.

61/ Concert Snare Drum 62/ Symphonic Gong-DELETED^ 63/ Gong Stand
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Bid Item #/Description 
Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

O Brook Mays Music 5% $84.00 $88.20 $85.00 $89.25 $159.00 $166.95 $3,350.00 $3,517.50
F Schmidt's Music, Inc. $170.00 $170.00 $67.00 $67.00 $199.00 $199.00 $3,065.00 $3,065.00
O Taylor Music Inc. 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bid Item #/Description 
Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

O Brook Mays Music 5% $306.00 $321.30 $373.00 $391.65 $104.00 $109.20 $88.00 $92.40
F Schmidt's Music, Inc. $325.00 $325.00 $405.00 $405.00 $120.00 $120.00 $100.00 $100.00
O Taylor Music Inc. 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $98.00 $102.90 $82.00 $86.10

Bid Item #/Description 
Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

O Brook Mays Music 5% $275.00 $288.75 $275.00 $288.75 AU $47.00 $49.35 $38.00 $39.90 $47.00 $49.35
F Schmidt's Music, Inc. $180.00 $180.00 $180.00 $180.00 $42.00 $42.00 $39.00 $39.00 $35.00 $35.00
O Taylor Music Inc. 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bid Item #/Description 
Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

O Brook Mays Music 5% $73.00 $76.65 $348.00 $365.40 $50.00 $52.50 $259.00 $271.95
F Schmidt's Music, Inc. $77.00 $77.00 $335.00 $335.00 $40.00 $40.00 No Bid No Bid
O Taylor Music Inc. 5% No Bid No Bid $326.00 $342.30 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bid Item #/Description 
Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

O Brook Mays Music 5% $108.00 $113.40 $30.00 $31.50 $21.00 $22.05 AU $31.00 $32.55
F Schmidt's Music, Inc. $125.00 $125.00 $27.00 $27.00 $38.00 $38.00 $30.00 $30.00
O Taylor Music Inc. 5% $101.00 $106.05 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bid Item #/Description 
Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

O Brook Mays Music 5% $27.00 $28.35 $33.00 $34.65 $9.00 $9.45 $46.00 $48.30
F Schmidt's Music, Inc. $28.00 $28.00 $31.00 $31.00 $8.00 $8.00 $45.00 $45.00
O Taylor Music Inc. 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bid Item #/Description 
Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

O Brook Mays Music 5% $134.00 $140.70 $3,815.00 $4,005.75 $31.00 $32.55 $42.00 $44.10
F Schmidt's Music, Inc. $104.00 $104.00 $3,640.00 $3,640.00 $26.00 $26.00 $37.00 $37.00
O Taylor Music Inc. 5% No Bid No Bid $3,555.00 $3,732.75 $21.99 $23.09 No Bid No Bid

Bid Item #/Description 
Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

O Brook Mays Music 5% $5.00 $5.25 $79.00 $82.95 $31.00 $32.55 AU $30.00 $31.50
F Schmidt's Music, Inc. No Bid No Bid $91.00 $91.00 $35.00 $35.00 $34.00 $34.00
O Taylor Music Inc. 5% No Bid No Bid $74.99 $78.74 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bid Item #/Description 
Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

O Brook Mays Music 5% $36.00 $37.80 AU $75.00 $78.75 $40.00 $42.00 AU $81.00 $85.05
F Schmidt's Music, Inc. $46.00 $46.00 $72.00 $72.00 $50.00 $50.00 $78.00 $78.00
O Taylor Music Inc. 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

76/ Rachet-DELETED^

68/ Chimes
**

FL. Pref. 
Adj.

65/ Triangle-DELETED^ 66/ Artisan Triangle 67/ Tambourine

**
FL. Pref. 

Adj.

73/ Granite Blocks-DELETED^ 73/ Granite Blocks-DELETED^ 74/ Wood Blocks

80/ Conga Set

75/ Vibra Slap-DELETED^

72/ Goosneck Suspended Cymbal
Stand**

FL. Pref. 
Adj.

69/ Cymbal-DELETED^
70/ Classic Orchestral Cymbals-

DELETED^
71/ Cymbal Cradle Stand

**
FL. Pref. 

Adj.

77/ Snare Stand 78/ Concert Toms 79/ Agogo Bells-DELETED^

88/ Cabasa-DELETED^
**

FL. Pref. 
Adj.

85/ Castanet Machine-DELETED^ 86/ Maracas-DELETED^ 87/ Egg Shaker Set-DELETED^

84/ Claves-DELETED^
**

FL. Pref. 
Adj.

81/ Bongos Set 82/ Cowbell 83/ Guiro-DELETED^

 92/ Sleigh Bells-DELETED^
**

FL. Pref. 
Adj.

89/Class Wind Chimes-DELETED^ 90/ Vibraphone 91/ Slap Stick

96/ Trumpet Triple Play Mute
**

FL. Pref. 
Adj.

93/ Sleigh Bells-DELETED^
94/ Percussion Trap Table

Accessory Rack
95/ Straight Trumpet Mute-

DELETED^

100/Tromb.Cup Mute-DELETED^
**

FL. Pref. 
Adj.

97/ Trumpet and Cornet Cup Mute 98/ Straight French Horn Mute 99/ Straight Trombone Mute
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Bid Item #/Description 
Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

O Brook Mays Music 5% $43.00 $45.15 $36.00 $37.80 AU No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Schmidt's Music, Inc. $40.00 $40.00 $46.00 $46.00 $2,750.00 $2,750.00 $1,715.00 $1,715.00
O Taylor Music Inc. 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bid Item #/Description 
Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

O Brook Mays Music 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Schmidt's Music, Inc. $410.00 $410.00 AY $4.00 $4.00 AY $62.00 $62.00 $62.00 $62.00
O Taylor Music Inc. 5% No Bid No Bid $0.00 $0.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bid Item #/Description 
Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

O Brook Mays Music 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $49.00 $51.45 AU No Bid No Bid
F Schmidt's Music, Inc. $390.00 $390.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $27.00 $27.00
O Taylor Music Inc. 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bid Item #/Description 
Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

O Brook Mays Music 5% $2.80 $2.94 AU $68.00 $71.40 AU No Bid No Bid $2.82 $2.96 AU

F Schmidt's Music, Inc. $2.25 $2.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.50 $2.50
O Taylor Music Inc. 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bid Item #/Description 
Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

O Brook Mays Music 5% $62.35 $65.47 AU No Bid No Bid $189.00 $198.45 AU No Bid No Bid
F Schmidt's Music, Inc. $56.00 $56.00 $1.50 $1.50 $195.00 $195.00 No Bid No Bid
O Taylor Music Inc. 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bid Item #/Description 
Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

O Brook Mays Music 5% $124.00 $130.20 AU $25.00 $26.25 AU No Bid No Bid $8,500.00 $8,925.00
F Schmidt's Music, Inc. $120.00 $120.00 $75.00 $75.00 No Bid No Bid $8,685.00 $8,685.00 AY

O Taylor Music Inc. 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bid Item #/Description 
Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

O Brook Mays Music 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Schmidt's Music, Inc. No Bid No Bid $22.00 $22.00 AY $57.00 $57.00 AY No Bid No Bid
O Taylor Music Inc. 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bid Item #/Description 
Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

O Brook Mays Music 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3,732.00 $3,918.60 AY No Bid No Bid
F Schmidt's Music, Inc. No Bid No Bid $17.00 $17.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Taylor Music Inc. 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bid Item #/Description 
Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

O Brook Mays Music 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Schmidt's Music, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $199.00 $199.00 AY

O Taylor Music Inc. 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

108/ Bench
**

FL. Pref. 
Adj.

105/ Digital Piano 106/ USB 2.0 A to B Cable 107/ Stands 

104/ Lab Expansion
**

FL. Pref. 
Adj.

101/Mouthpiece Puller-DELETED^ 102/ Trumpet and Cornet Cup Mute 103/ Modular Music Lab System

116/ Economy Claves
**

FL. Pref. 
Adj.

113/ Jingle Bells-DELETED^ 114/ Bodhran Set-DELETED^ 115/ Univ Tablet Stand-DELETED#

 112/ Piano Light-DELETED^
**

FL. Pref. 
Adj.

109/ Portable Weighted Keyboard 110/ Piano-DELETED# 111/ Soprano Ukulele-DELETED^

124/ Orff Essential Set
**

FL. Pref. 
Adj.

121/ Handbell Set 122/ Octave Set 123/ Recorders-DELETED#

120/Har.Ser. Recorder-DELETED#
**

FL. Pref. 
Adj.

117/ Table Gong 118/ Conductor's Batons 119/ Deluxe Band Sets

132/ Orff Mallet Pack-DELETED#
**

FL. Pref. 
Adj.

129/Sopr Ukulele Rack-DELETED# 130/ Staff Lapboards 131/ Arthur Hull Drum Circle

128/ Lummi Sticks-DELETED#
**

FL. Pref. 
Adj.

125/ Univ Orff Stand-DELETED# 126/ Resonator Bells 127/ Resonator Chime Bars

136/ Temple Block
**

FL. Pref. 
Adj.

133/ Ukulele Tuner-DELETED# 134/ Rhythm In Motion-DELETED# 135/ Drumtastick-DELETED#
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Bid Item #/Description 
Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

O Brook Mays Music 5% $57.00 $59.85 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $413.00 $433.65 AY

F Schmidt's Music, Inc. No Bid No Bid $47.00 $47.00 AY No Bid No Bid $510.00 $510.00 AU

O Taylor Music Inc. 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bid Item #/Description 
Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

O Brook Mays Music 5% $2,872.00 $3,015.60 No Bid No Bid $8,754.00 $9,191.70 $199.00 $208.95 AY

F Schmidt's Music, Inc. $2,495.00 $2,495.00 AY $2.95 $2.95 AY $8,380.00 $8,380.00 AY No Bid No Bid
O Taylor Music Inc. 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

U= Bid Not Accepted Due To Either Quality,Higher Price, and/or Not Meeting Bid Specifications
AU=Alternate Bid Not Accepted Due To Either Quality,Higher Price, and/or Not Meeting Bid Specifications
AY=Alternate Bid Accepted
#=Item Deleted Due To "No Bids" Received

^=Item Deleted For Purchase Utilizing TCPN Contract #R140803 Per School Board Rule 6Gx17-5.02(7)(G)(3) - Other Contracts

NOTES:

140/ Conga and Bongo Drums
**

FL. Pref. 
Adj.

137/ Chime Tree 138/ Drum Sticks 139/ Tongue Drums-DELETED#

144/ Crash Pair of Cymbals
**

FL. Pref. 
Adj.

141/ Bass Bar 142/ Jingle Bell 143/ 2000 Series Orff West-11

BID TABULATION, RECOMMENDATIONS, AND PROTEST

Bid tabulations with award recommendations are posted for 72 hours in the Purchasing Department Office and are also posted to the School 
District's website address at: http://ecsd-fl.schoolloop.com/purchasing/bids. Notices will not be automatically mailed.

Failure to file a protest within the time prescribed in Section 120.57(3) Florida Statutes, or failure to post the bond or other security required by law 
within the time allowed for filing a bond shall constitute a waiver of proceedings under Chapter 120 Florida Statutes. 

I hereby certify that the prices and bidders reflected herein are valid, and have been received in compliance to Escambia County School Board 
Rules and Florida Law.

John Dombroskie,
Director Purchasing Department
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