
 

 
 
 
DATE:  BID TITLE & REFERENCE: 
September 28, 2018          Classroom and Office Supplies, Bid #190405 
 
DESCRIPTION OF PURCHASE: 
 

An annual purchasing agreement to provide classroom and office supplies to be stocked and 
distributed by the Central Warehouse.  One hundred sixty-seven (167) items were bid; one hundred 
thirty-eight (138) items are awarded.  Items will be purchased on an as needed basis to replenish the 
Central Warehouse inventory. Bid award to the bidder(s) meeting specifications.   
 
Effective Dates:  October 17, 2018 through September 20, 2019. 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
  
REQUESTED BY: 

 
 Central Warehouse 
 
    
SUPPLIER NAME:       ITEMS AWARDED:   ESTIMATED ANNUAL EXPENDITURE: 

 
National Art & School Supplies, Crestview, FL  1  L                       $      300.00 
Pyramid School Products, Tampa, FL             96                                                75,000.00 
Quill LLC, Lincolnshire, IL     5                                                25,000.00 
School Specialty, Greenville, WI               8          9,000.00 
Standard Stationery Supply, Wheeling, IL          19                                                  4,000.00 
Strickland Paper Co. Pensacola, FL   9        37,000.00 
 
   
 

AMOUNT OF PURCHASE: FUNDING SOURCE: 
  

$150,300.00 Est. / Yr. General Fund (1110) 
 

  
METHOD OF PROCUREMENT: 

 
ECSD Bid             Responses Received:  7 
 

 

  
DATE AND TIME POSTED: 

 
    September 28, 2018, 3:00pm Central Time 

 
9500PUR101 (11/10) Retention - 5 Years 

 
THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY 

PURCHASING DEPARTMENT 
75 North Pace Boulevard  

Pensacola, FL  32505 
 

BID AWARD NOTICE 



Classroom and Office Supplies

** F=Florida Business; O=Out of State Business

Bid Item #/Description 
Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

O Acco Brands USA LLC 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Ace Office Supplies No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Lakeshore Learning Materials 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F National Art & School Supplies No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Pyramid School Products $4.09 $4.09 A,NS $2.76 $2.76 $2.00 $2.00 $1.04 $1.04
O Quill LLC 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $13.43 $14.10 No Bid No Bid
O School Specialty, Inc. 5% No Bid No Bid $7.93 $8.33 E $8.68 $9.11 No Bid No Bid
O Standard Stationery Supply IL LLC 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Strickland Paper CO. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $8.68 $8.68 No Bid No Bid

Bid Item #/Description 
Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

O Acco Brands USA LLC 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Ace Office Supplies No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Lakeshore Learning Materials 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F National Art & School Supplies No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Pyramid School Products $3.96 $3.96 $2.76 $2.76 $1.09 $1.09 A,SA, L $1.69 $1.69 L

O Quill LLC 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.08 $2.18 $3.43 $3.60
O School Specialty, Inc. 5% $8.18 $8.59 No Bid No Bid $1.78 $1.87 No Bid No Bid
O Standard Stationery Supply IL LLC 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.52 $1.60
F Strickland Paper CO. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.13 $1.13 $2.05 $2.05

Bid Title: 

5 / Battery, Alkaline, Size "D"
**

FL. Pref. 
Adj.

**

6/ Battery, Alkaline, Size "AAA"
7/Binder, 3-Ring 8-1/2" x 11" 1/2" 

capacity
8/ Binder, 3-Ring, 8-1/2" x 11" 2" 

capacity

THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

1 / Bag, Zip Lock 3/ Battery, Alkaline, 9 V

Wednesday, August 29, 2018  1:00 PM CST
190405

Recommended Award

75 NORTH PACE BOULEVARD

PENSACOLA, FL 32505

2/ Battery, Alkaline, Size "C" 1.5 Volt 4/ Battery, Alkaline, Size "AA"

BID TABULATION

FL. Pref. 
Adj.

Date: 
Bid Number:

No Award
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Bid Item #/Description 
Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

O Acco Brands USA LLC 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Ace Office Supplies No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Lakeshore Learning Materials 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F National Art & School Supplies No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Pyramid School Products $1.49 $1.49 L $2.79 $2.79 L $0.69 $0.69 $0.65 $0.65
O Quill LLC 5% $2.94 $3.09 $2.73 $2.87 A, NS $1.29 $1.35 A, NS $1.08 $1.13 A, NS

O School Specialty, Inc. 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.99 $1.04 $0.80 $0.84
O Standard Stationery Supply IL LLC 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.62 $0.65 A, NS $0.52 $0.55 A, NS

F Strickland Paper CO. $1.81 $1.81 $3.36 $3.36 No Bid No Bid $1.25 $1.25

Bid Item #/Description 
Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

O Acco Brands USA LLC 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Ace Office Supplies No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Lakeshore Learning Materials 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F National Art & School Supplies No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Pyramid School Products $1.49 $1.49 L $2.59 $2.59 L $1.59 $3.96 L $1.05 $1.05 L

O Quill LLC 5% $3.03 $3.18 $5.55 $5.83 $3.01 $3.16 $2.48 $2.60
O School Specialty, Inc. 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.20 $3.36 $1.98 $2.08
O Standard Stationery Supply IL LLC 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Strickland Paper CO. $1.66 $1.66 $2.74 $2.74 $1.91 $1.91 $1.13 $1.13

Bid Item #/Description 
Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

O Acco Brands USA LLC 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Ace Office Supplies No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Lakeshore Learning Materials 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F National Art & School Supplies No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Pyramid School Products No Bid No Bid $2.09 $2.09 $5.95 $5.95 $1.29 $1.29
O Quill LLC 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O School Specialty, Inc. 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Standard Stationery Supply IL LLC 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Strickland Paper CO. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.67 $1.67

19/ Calendar, Desk Pad August-July 20/ Calendar, Refill
**

FL. Pref. 
Adj.

17 / Box, Moving & Storage
18/ Calendar, Desk Pad, January-

December

**
FL. Pref. 

Adj.

9/ Binder, 3-Ring, 8-1/2" x 11" 1-1/2" 
capacity

10/ Binder, 3-Ring, 8-1/2" x 11" 3" 
capacity

11/ Clip Board, Legal Size

16/ Binder, 3-Ring, 8-1/2" x 11", 1" 
capacity

12/ Clip Board, Letter Size

**
FL. Pref. 

Adj.

13/ Binder, 3 Ring, 8-1/2" x 11", 1-
1/2" capacity

14/ Binder, 3-Ring, 8-1/2" x 11", 3" 
capacity

15/ Binder, 3-Ring, 8-1/2" x 11", 2" 
capacity

No Award
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Bid Item #/Description 
Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

O Acco Brands USA LLC 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Ace Office Supplies No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Lakeshore Learning Materials 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F National Art & School Supplies No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Pyramid School Products $10.29 $10.29 $0.55 $0.55 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Quill LLC 5% No Bid No Bid $0.93 $0.98 $37.43 $39.30 A, NS $50.88 $53.42 A, NS

O School Specialty, Inc. 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Standard Stationery Supply IL LLC 5% $5.79 $6.08 $0.14 $0.15 A, NS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Strickland Paper CO. No Bid No Bid $9.07 $9.07 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bid Item #/Description 
Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

O Acco Brands USA LLC 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Ace Office Supplies $269.95 $269.95 A, NS $289.95 $289.95 A, NS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Lakeshore Learning Materials 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F National Art & School Supplies No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Pyramid School Products No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $15.95 $15.95
O Quill LLC 5% $275.74 $289.53 A, NS $279.93 $293.93 $85.94 $90.24 $34.77 $36.51 A, NS

O School Specialty, Inc. 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Standard Stationery Supply IL LLC 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Strickland Paper CO. $282.09 $282.09 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bid Item #/Description 
Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

O Acco Brands USA LLC 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Ace Office Supplies No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Lakeshore Learning Materials 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F National Art & School Supplies No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Pyramid School Products $0.32 $0.32 A, SA $1.39 $1.39 A, SA $0.57 $0.57 $8.49 $8.49 L

O Quill LLC 5% $0.45 $0.47 A, NS $1.75 $1.84 A, NS $1.30 $1.37 A, NS $9.84 $10.33 A, NS

O School Specialty, Inc. 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Standard Stationery Supply IL LLC 5% $0.18 $0.19 $1.37 $1.44 $0.41 $0.43 No Bid No Bid
F Strickland Paper CO. $0.28 $0.28 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $6.03 $6.03 A, SA 

24/ Toner, Black, Sharp Copier 
AR455

28/ Surge Suppression Stripe 
APC/Tripplite**

FL. Pref. 
Adj.

25/ Toner, Lexmark Printer for E460 
Series

26/ Toner, Lexmark Printer for MS-
510DN & MS-610 Series

27/ Toner, Black, Sharp Copier 
MX500

**
FL. Pref. 

Adj.

21/ Clock, Wall, Battery, 14" Face 22/ Compass, Metal Drawing, Pencil
23/ Flash Drive, 16Gb, Swivel Cap 

Style

32/ Folders, File, Manila, Legal Size
**

FL. Pref. 
Adj.

29/ Divider Sheets, 5 tabs/set for 3-
ring binder

30/ Divider Sheets, a-z Leatherette 
Tabs

31/ Fastener, Paper, round head

No Award No Award
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Bid Item #/Description 
Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

O Acco Brands USA LLC 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Ace Office Supplies No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Lakeshore Learning Materials 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F National Art & School Supplies No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Pyramid School Products $7.19 $7.19 L $5.89 $5.89 $4.45 $4.45 $3.29 $3.29
O Quill LLC 5% $8.09 $8.49 A, NS $12.11 $12.72 $10.36 $10.88 $21.19 $22.25 A, NS

O School Specialty, Inc. 5% No Bid No Bid $6.25 $6.56 $4.40 $4.62 No Bid No Bid
O Standard Stationery Supply IL LLC 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Strickland Paper CO. $8.80 $8.80 A, SA $8.45 $8.45 $5.29 $5.29 No Bid No Bid

Bid Item #/Description 
Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

O Acco Brands USA LLC 5% No Bid No Bid $26.58 $27.91 A, NS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Ace Office Supplies No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Lakeshore Learning Materials 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F National Art & School Supplies No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Pyramid School Products $2.99 $2.99 $14.95 $14.95 $3.79 $3.79 L $5.29 $5.29 L

O Quill LLC 5% $5.01 $5.26 A, NS $47.43 $49.80 A, NS $5.37 $5.64 A, NS $7.15 $7.51 A, NS

O School Specialty, Inc. 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.70 $2.84 A, NS No Bid No Bid
O Standard Stationery Supply IL LLC 5% $1.86 $1.95 A, NS No Bid No Bid $2.61 $2.74 A, NS No Bid No Bid
F Strickland Paper CO. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $6.92 $6.92 $8.40 $8.40

Bid Item #/Description 
Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

O Acco Brands USA LLC 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Ace Office Supplies No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Lakeshore Learning Materials 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F National Art & School Supplies No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Pyramid School Products $5.95 $5.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Quill LLC 5% $3.17 $3.33 $4.11 $4.32 A, NS $2.64 $2.77 A, NS $6.69 $7.02 A, NS

O School Specialty, Inc. 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Standard Stationery Supply IL LLC 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Strickland Paper CO. $2.91 $2.91 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

36/ Legal Size #960 File Frames
**

FL. Pref. 
Adj.

33/ Folders, File Manila, Letter Size 35/ Letter size, Folders Hanging File

39/ Folders, Twin Pocket, Portfolio 
Style W/O Prongs**

FL. Pref. 
Adj.

37/ Letter Size, File Frames
38/ Laminating Film, 25" Wide x 

500', 1" Core

34/ Legal Size Folders, Hanging File

40/ Folders, W/Pockets & Prongs, 
Assorted colors

44/ Teacher Planning Book, 8 
Column**

FL. Pref. 
Adj.

41/ Picture Frame, Black
42/ Roll/Grade Book, #30-X, 39 

Lines
43/ Roll/Grade Book, #18

No Award No Award No Award
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Bid Item #/Description 
Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

O Acco Brands USA LLC 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Ace Office Supplies No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Lakeshore Learning Materials 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F National Art & School Supplies No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Pyramid School Products $0.27 $0.27 $0.27 $0.27 $1.99 $1.99 $2.05 $2.05
O Quill LLC 5% $0.38 $0.40 $0.44 $0.46 $65.12 $68.38 A, NS $2.35 $2.47 A, NS, E

O School Specialty, Inc. 5% $0.34 $0.36 $0.34 $0.36 No Bid No Bid $40.00 $42.00
O Standard Stationery Supply IL LLC 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Strickland Paper CO. $0.51 $0.51 $0.49 $0.49 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bid Item #/Description 
Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

O Acco Brands USA LLC 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Ace Office Supplies No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Lakeshore Learning Materials 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F National Art & School Supplies No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Pyramid School Products $17.95 $17.95 A, NS $2.79 $2.79 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Quill LLC 5% $29.40 $30.87 A, NS $2.33 $2.45 A, NS, E $5.61 $5.89 A, NS No Bid No Bid
O School Specialty, Inc. 5% $15.00 $15.75 A, NS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Standard Stationery Supply IL LLC 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Strickland Paper CO. $18.14 $18.14 A, SA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bid Item #/Description 
Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

O Acco Brands USA LLC 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Ace Office Supplies No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Lakeshore Learning Materials 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F National Art & School Supplies No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Pyramid School Products No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Quill LLC 5% $2.15 $2.26 A, NS, E No Bid No Bid A, NS $4.17 $4.38 A, NS $1.84 $1.93 A, NS

O School Specialty, Inc. 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.99 $1.04 No Bid No Bid
O Standard Stationery Supply IL LLC 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.26 $1.32 A, NS No Bid No Bid
F Strickland Paper CO. No Bid No Bid $0.70 $0.70 A, SA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

56/ Paper Plates, 9" Plain, White
**

FL. Pref. 
Adj.

53/ Bags, Lunch 50/PK Brown
54/ Towels, Paper roll, 2-Ply, 

Kitchen Type
55/ Paper Plates, 6" Plain, White

52/ Foil, Aluminum 18" x 25' Heavy 
Duty**

FL. Pref. 
Adj.

49/ Facial tissue, 100 count 50/ Cup, Cone Shaped, 4oz
51/ Detergent, Dishwashing, Liquid, 

32oz

48/ Cup, Plastic, Cold, 5oz
**

FL. Pref. 
Adj.

45/ Index Card, 3" x 5" White 46/ Index Card, 3" x 5" White 47/ Cup, Plastic 3.5oz Cup

No AwardNo Award

No AwardNo Award
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Bid Item #/Description 
Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

O Acco Brands USA LLC 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Ace Office Supplies No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Lakeshore Learning Materials 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F National Art & School Supplies No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Pyramid School Products No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.49 $2.49 $18.99 $18.99
O Quill LLC 5% No Bid No Bid $6.35 $6.67 A, NS $2.65 $2.78 A, NS No Bid No Bid
O School Specialty, Inc. 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Standard Stationery Supply IL LLC 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Strickland Paper CO. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bid Item #/Description 

Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

O Acco Brands USA LLC 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Ace Office Supplies No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Lakeshore Learning Materials 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F National Art & School Supplies No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Pyramid School Products $1.39 $1.39 $1.89 $1.89 $18.95 $18.95 No Bid No Bid
O Quill LLC 5% $0.62 $0.65 $0.86 $0.90 $45.64 $47.92 No Bid No Bid A, NS, AU

O School Specialty, Inc. 5% $18.00 $18.90 No Bid No Bid $56.00 $58.80 No Bid No Bid
O Standard Stationery Supply IL LLC 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Strickland Paper CO. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $15.76 $15.76 $6.92 $6.92

Bid Item #/Description 
Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

O Acco Brands USA LLC 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Ace Office Supplies No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Lakeshore Learning Materials 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F National Art & School Supplies No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Pyramid School Products No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.89 $1.89 $3.69 $3.69 L

O Quill LLC 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.28 $1.34 A, NS, AU $7.55 $7.93 A, NS

O School Specialty, Inc. 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $7.30 $7.67
O Standard Stationery Supply IL LLC 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.68 $0.71 No Bid No Bid
F Strickland Paper CO. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.52 $2.52 $8.29 $8.29

**
FL. Pref. 

Adj.

61/ Cups, Hot/Cold Beverage 
Container, 6oz

62/ Cups, Hot/Cold Beverage 
Container, 10oz

63/ Labels, Address, 1" x 2-5/8", 
White, E-Z Peel, Self-Adhesive

60/ Lid, Hot/Cold, 6oz
**

FL. Pref. 
Adj.

57/ Bag, Zip Lock, Freezer Gallon 
Size 9" x 12"

58/ Straws, Clear, Plastic, 
Unwrapped, Jumbo

59/ Cup, Cold Plastic, 12oz

68/ Black Markers, Fine Point, 
Permanent, waterproof ink**

FL. Pref. 
Adj.

65/ Badge, Tardy Pass, White, 
Raptorware

66/ Badge, Visitor, Raptorware, 
Yellow Border

67/ Name Badge, Self-Adhesive, 
Red border & White middle

No Award

No Award No Award

64/ Name Badge, Plastic W/Clip or 
Clip/Pin Combo

No Award
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Bid Item #/Description 
Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

O Acco Brands USA LLC 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Ace Office Supplies No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Lakeshore Learning Materials 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.74 $4.98 A, NA

F National Art & School Supplies No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $6.54 $6.54 No Bid No Bid
F Pyramid School Products $2.39 $2.39 L $1.09 $1.09 L $4.49 $4.49 L $1.09 $1.09 L

O Quill LLC 5% $2.98 $3.13 $4.71 $4.95 A, NS $8.44 $8.86 $3.15 $3.31 A, NS

O School Specialty, Inc. 5% $1.63 $1.71 $4.60 $4.83 $5.90 $6.20 $3.50 $3.68
O Standard Stationery Supply IL LLC 5% $0.62 $0.65 A, NS $0.64 $0.67 A, NS $1.17 $1.23 A, NS $0.78 $0.82 A, NS

F Strickland Paper CO. $1.84 $1.84 No Bid No Bid $1.38 $1.38 $3.52 $3.52

Bid Item #/Description 
Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

O Acco Brands USA LLC 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Ace Office Supplies No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Lakeshore Learning Materials 5% No Bid No Bid $3.55 $3.73 A, NA, E No Bid No Bid $3.79 $3.98 A, NA

F National Art & School Supplies $1.80 $1.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Pyramid School Products $1.69 $1.69 L $2.93 $2.93 L $2.93 $2.93 L $1.25 $1.25 NA

O Quill LLC 5% $2.14 $2.25 $8.76 $9.20 A, NS $9.00 $9.45 A, NS $2.95 $3.10 A, NS

O School Specialty, Inc. 5% $1.90 $2.00 $11.00 $11.55 $8.59 $9.02 $2.88 $3.02
O Standard Stationery Supply IL LLC 5% No Bid No Bid $2.40 $2.52 A, NS $2.40 $2.52 A, NS No Bid No Bid
F Strickland Paper CO. $2.40 $2.40 $11.18 $11.18 $11.20 $11.20 $4.34 $4.34

Bid Item #/Description 
Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

O Acco Brands USA LLC 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Ace Office Supplies No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Lakeshore Learning Materials 5% $27.54 $28.92 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F National Art & School Supplies No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Pyramid School Products $7.90 $7.90 $1.79 $1.79 NA $4.32 $4.32 $1.29 $1.29 A, NS

O Quill LLC 5% $19.86 $20.85 A, NS, AU $5.63 $5.91 $7.11 $7.47 A, NS No Bid No Bid
O School Specialty, Inc. 5% $6.00 $6.30 A, NS $4.20 $4.41 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Standard Stationery Supply IL LLC 5% $4.74 $4.98 A, SA $1.07 $1.12 A, NS $2.54 $2.67 No Bid No Bid
F Strickland Paper CO. No Bid No Bid $4.56 $4.56 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

**
FL. Pref. 

Adj.

69/ Highlighter set, assorted colors 
70/ Marker set, felt-tip, chisel or 

bullet, style
71/ Markers, Black, Large, felt, 

chisel-tip, instant dry

76/ Markers, Dry Erasable, Fine 
Point

**
FL. Pref. 

Adj.

77/ White Board, 9" x 12" Dry Erase 78/ Highlighter, Yellow, Chisel Tip
79/ Eraser, Multipurpose, Dry Erase 

& Chalkboards

**
FL. Pref. 

Adj.

73/ Cleaner for Dry White Board, 8oz 
Bottle

74/ Black Markers, Dry Erasable for 
Dry White Board

75/ Blue Markers, Dry Erasable for 
Dry White Board

80/ Lens, Magnifier, 3X/6X Powers 
Plastic w/lanyard

72/ Markers, Dry Erasable, Chisel 
Point

No Award
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Bid Item #/Description 
Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

O Acco Brands USA LLC 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Ace Office Supplies No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Lakeshore Learning Materials 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F National Art & School Supplies No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Pyramid School Products $2.09 $2.09 $1.89 $1.89 A, NS No Bid No Bid $0.65 $0.65
O Quill LLC 5% $2.19 $2.30 $3.31 $3.48 A, NS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O School Specialty, Inc. 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Standard Stationery Supply IL LLC 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.50 $0.53
F Strickland Paper CO. No Bid No Bid $2.46 $2.46 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bid Item #/Description 
Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

O Acco Brands USA LLC 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Ace Office Supplies No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Lakeshore Learning Materials 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F National Art & School Supplies No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Pyramid School Products $1.15 $1.15 $2.95 $2.95 A, NS No Bid No Bid $3.99 $3.99 A, NS

O Quill LLC 5% $1.56 $1.64 $3.57 $3.57 A, NS No Bid No Bid $12.87 $13.51 A, NS

O School Specialty, Inc. 5% $1.30 $1.37 $10.50 $10.50 A, NS No Bid No Bid $16.80 $17.64 A, NS

O Standard Stationery Supply IL LLC 5% $1.05 $1.10 $2.28 $2.28 A, NS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Strickland Paper CO. $2.11 $2.11 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bid Item #/Description 
Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

O Acco Brands USA LLC 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Ace Office Supplies No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Lakeshore Learning Materials 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F National Art & School Supplies No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Pyramid School Products $2.95 $2.95 A, NS $3.69 $3.69 A, NS No Bid No Bid $2.09 $2.09 A, NS

O Quill LLC 5% $2.60 $2.73 A, NS No Bid No Bid $1.76 $1.85 No Bid No Bid
O School Specialty, Inc. 5% $6.20 $6.51 A, NS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.22 No Bid A, NS

O Standard Stationery Supply IL LLC 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Strickland Paper CO. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

84/ Rubber Bands, #18, 3" x 1/16" x 
1/32" thick, or rubber, 1/4lb. **

FL. Pref. 
Adj.

81/ Hook, White Plastic, Medium 
Duty, Holds up to 3lb.

82/ Project/Display Boards, 36" x 
48", Tri-Fold, White

83/ Pie Pan, Aluminum, 9" Diameter

**
FL. Pref. 

Adj.

89/ Canned Air, Duster, Computer 
Keyboard

90/ Insecticide, Wasp Freeze Spray 91/ Pad, Mouse, 8.5" x 9.75"

**
FL. Pref. 

Adj.

85/ Rubber Cement, 4oz. Bottle 
w/brush cap, acid free, photo safe 

86/ Tape, Duct, 2" x 60 yard, Silver
87/ Zip-Ties, Plastic Tie & Cable 

wrap 14 1/2" Long 

No Award

No Award

No Award

 92/ Paste, Art, Paper Mache, 2oz.

88/ Tape, CAUTION BARRIER, 3" x 
1000'

No Award No Award

No Award No Award
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Bid Item #/Description 
Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

O Acco Brands USA LLC 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Ace Office Supplies No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Lakeshore Learning Materials 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F National Art & School Supplies No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Pyramid School Products $2.04 $2.04 $0.40 $0.40 No Bid No Bid $2.59 $2.59 A, NS

O Quill LLC 5% $10.19 $10.70 A, NS $13.32 $13.99 No Bid No Bid $0.26 $0.27 A, NS

O School Specialty, Inc. 5% $2.40 $2.52 A, NS $0.40 $0.42 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Standard Stationery Supply IL LLC 5% $1.30 $1.37 A, NS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Strickland Paper CO. No Bid No Bid $1.28 $1.28 $0.31 $0.31 A, NS No Bid No Bid

Bid Item #/Description 
Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

O Acco Brands USA LLC 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Ace Office Supplies No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Lakeshore Learning Materials 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F National Art & School Supplies $3.78 $3.78 $1.24 $1.24 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Pyramid School Products $2.95 $2.95 $0.95 $0.95 $1.85 $1.85 $0.59 $0.59 A, NS

O Quill LLC 5% $13.09 $13.74 $4.83 $5.07 $10.05 $10.55 $0.71 $0.75 A, NS, E

O School Specialty, Inc. 5% $4.20 $4.41 $1.20 $1.26 $2.60 $2.73 No Bid No Bid
O Standard Stationery Supply IL LLC 5% $2.50 $2.63 A, NS $0.79 $0.83 A, NS $1.60 $1.68 A, NS No Bid No Bid
F Strickland Paper CO. $3.66 $3.66 $1.24 $1.24 $1.84 $1.84 $0.98 $0.98

Bid Item #/Description 
Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

O Acco Brands USA LLC 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Ace Office Supplies No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Lakeshore Learning Materials 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F National Art & School Supplies No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Pyramid School Products $5.95 $5.95 $7.79 $7.79 No Bid No Bid $1.49 $1.49
O Quill LLC 5% $7.90 $8.30 $9.33 $9.80 $13.41 $14.08 A, NS No Bid No Bid
O School Specialty, Inc. 5% $12.00 $12.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Standard Stationery Supply IL LLC 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Strickland Paper CO. $10.27 $10.27 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

**
FL. Pref. 

Adj.

97/ POST-IT-NOTE PAD, 3" x 5" Self-
adhesive note pads, Canary Yellow

98/ Post-It-Note Pad, 1-1/2" x 2" Self-
Adhesive note pads, Canary 

99/ Post-It-Note, 3" x 3" Self-
Adhesive note pads, Canary Yellow

96/ Pad, Memo, "WHILE YOU WERE 
OUT"**

FL. Pref. 
Adj.

93/ Glue Stick, Rub-on 94/ Crayon 95/ Pad, Memo, 4-1/2" x 5-1/2" 

104/ Paper, Graph, 20 sheets/pad, 
Letter, 8-1/2x11**

FL. Pref. 
Adj.

101/ Pads, Legal Ruled, w/ 
clipboard backing

102/ Pads, Legal Ruled, w/clipboard 
backing

103/ Paper, Bond, White, 8-1/2"x11, 
w/Watermark, 20LB 

No Award No Award

No Award

100/ Pad, Steno, Note pad, Spiral 
Top
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Bid Item #/Description 
Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

O Acco Brands USA LLC 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Ace Office Supplies No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Lakeshore Learning Materials 5% $8.54 $8.97 A, SA $5.69 $5.97 A, SA $5.69 $5.97 A, SA $5.69 5.97 A, SA

F National Art & School Supplies No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Pyramid School Products $4.95 $4.95 L $3.95 $3.95 L $3.95 $3.95 L $3.95 $3.95 L

O Quill LLC 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O School Specialty, Inc. 5% No Bid No Bid $2.20 $2.31 $2.20 $2.31 $2.20 $2.31
O Standard Stationery Supply IL LLC 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Strickland Paper CO. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bid Item #/Description 
Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

O Acco Brands USA LLC 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Ace Office Supplies No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Lakeshore Learning Materials 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F National Art & School Supplies No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Pyramid School Products $0.65 $0.65 $1.69 $1.69 $0.44 $0.44 $2.95 $2.95
O Quill LLC 5% $0.86 $0.90 $3.95 $4.15 $1.53 $1.61 A, NS $5.68 $5.96
O School Specialty, Inc. 5% $0.58 $0.61 $1.40 $1.47 $0.48 $0.50 No Bid No Bid
O Standard Stationery Supply IL LLC 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.30 $0.32 $2.22 $2.33
F Strickland Paper CO. $1.02 $1.02 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.29 $3.29

Bid Item #/Description 
Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

O Acco Brands USA LLC 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Ace Office Supplies No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Lakeshore Learning Materials 5% $3.79 $3.98 A, SA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F National Art & School Supplies No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Pyramid School Products $1.89 $1.89 $0.21 $0.21 L $0.42 $0.42 L $1.00 $1.00 L

O Quill LLC 5% $1.91 $2.01 $0.69 $0.72 $1.29 $1.35 $2.93 $3.08 A, NS

O School Specialty, Inc. 5% $1.90 $2.00 $0.20 $0.21 A,NS $0.39 $0.41 $0.94 $0.99
O Standard Stationery Supply IL LLC 5% No Bid No Bid $0.15 $0.16 $0.32 $0.34 A, NS $0.88 $0.92
F Strickland Paper CO. No Bid No Bid $0.18 $0.18 $0.44 $0.44 $1.14 $1.14

108/ Paper, Manuscript Writing, 
(Grade 3), 1/2" Writing space**

FL. Pref. 
Adj.

105/ Paper, Manuscript Writing, 
Story-Writing 18" x 12", 5/8 ruling

106/ Paper Manuscript Writing, 
(Grade 1), 5/8"

107/ Paper, Manuscript Writing, 
(Grade 2), early transition

116/ Paper Clips, Binder Clips, 
Large, Black/Silver, Size #10, 2" **

FL. Pref. 
Adj.

113/ Sentence Strips, size 3"x24", 
Ruled 1-1/2"

114/ Paper Clips, Binder Clips, 
Small, Black/Silver, Size #2, 3/4" 

115/ Paper Clips, Binder Clips, 
Black/Silver, Medium, Size #5

 112/ Punch, Heavy Duty, Two & 
Three-Hole, adjustable**

FL. Pref. 
Adj.

109/ Notebook, Spiral, Single 
Subject, Wire Bound & 3-Hole 

110/ Paper, Student Notebook Filler, 
Wide Ruled, 8" x 10-1/2"

111/ Punch, Paper, One Hole, 1/4"
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Bid Item #/Description 
Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

O Acco Brands USA LLC 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Ace Office Supplies No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Lakeshore Learning Materials 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F National Art & School Supplies No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Pyramid School Products $3.69 $3.69 $4.10 $4.10 L $1.90 $1.90 L $0.93 $0.93 L

O Quill LLC 5% No Bid No Bid $6.73 $7.07 A, NS $3.32 $3.49 A, NS $1.11 $1.17
O School Specialty, Inc. 5% $5.60 $5.88 No Bid No Bid $1.70 $1.79 $0.96 $1.01
O Standard Stationery Supply IL LLC 5% $1.04 $1.09 A, NS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Strickland Paper CO. No Bid No Bid $3.99 $3.99 NP $1.36 $1.36 NP $0.75 $0.75

Bid Item #/Description 
Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

O Acco Brands USA LLC 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Ace Office Supplies No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Lakeshore Learning Materials 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F National Art & School Supplies No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Pyramid School Products $0.93 $0.93 L $0.93 $0.93 L $0.93 $0.93 L $0.93 $0.93 L

O Quill LLC 5% $1.23 $1.29 $1.05 $1.10 $1.36 $1.43 $1.26 $1.32
O School Specialty, Inc. 5% $0.96 $1.01 $0.96 $1.01 $0.96 $1.01 $0.96 $1.01
O Standard Stationery Supply IL LLC 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Strickland Paper CO. $0.75 $0.75 $1.65 $1.65 $1.33 $1.33 $0.85 $0.85

Bid Item #/Description 
Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

O Acco Brands USA LLC 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Ace Office Supplies No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Lakeshore Learning Materials 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F National Art & School Supplies No Bid No Bid $8.40 $8.40 $8.40 $8.40 $8.40 $8.40
F Pyramid School Products $0.93 $0.93 L $8.19 $8.19 L $8.19 $8.19 L $8.19 $8.19 L

O Quill LLC 5% $1.29 $1.35 $10.78 $11.32 $10.78 $11.32 $13.71 $14.40
O School Specialty, Inc. 5% $0.96 $1.01 $1.99 $2.09 A, NS $1.99 $2.09 A, NS $1.99 $2.09 A, NS

O Standard Stationery Supply IL LLC 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Strickland Paper CO. $0.97 $0.97 $14.26 $14.26 $14.26 $14.26 $14.26 $14.26

124/ Pen, Blue, Medium Ball Point, 
stick w/ clip cap**

FL. Pref. 
Adj.

121/ Pen, Blue, Fine Ball Point, stick 
w/clip cap

122/ Pen, Red, Fine Ball Point, stick 
w/clip cap

123/ Pen, Black, Medium Ball Point, 
stick w/clip cap

120/ Pen, Black, Fine Ball Point, 
stick w/clip cap**

FL. Pref. 
Adj.

117/ Eraser, Kneaded Drafting, Art 
removes Chalk & Charcoal

118/ Paper Clips, Gem, Jumbo
119/ Paper Clips, Gem, Standard #1, 

non-rust

128/ Pen, Green Felt Tip, Fine Point
**

FL. Pref. 
Adj.

125/ Pen, Red, Medium Ball Point, 
stick w/clip cap

126/ Pen, Black Felt Tip, Fine Point 127/ Pen, Blue Felt Tip, Fine Point
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Bid Item #/Description 
Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

O Acco Brands USA LLC 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Ace Office Supplies No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Lakeshore Learning Materials 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F National Art & School Supplies No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $16.86 $16.86
F Pyramid School Products $3.79 $3.79 L $3.79 $3.79 L $0.47 $0.47 $13.92 $13.92
O Quill LLC 5% $4.38 $4.60 $4.43 $4.65 $1.23 $1.29 $17.81 $18.70
O School Specialty, Inc. 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Standard Stationery Supply IL LLC 5% $1.83 $1.92 $1.83 $1.92 $0.06 $0.06 A, NS No Bid No Bid
F Strickland Paper CO. $3.80 $3.80 $4.71 $4.71 $5.78 $5.78 $20.97 $20.97

Bid Item #/Description 
Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

O Acco Brands USA LLC 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Ace Office Supplies No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Lakeshore Learning Materials 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.69 $5.97 A, NA No Bid No Bid
F National Art & School Supplies No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Pyramid School Products $6.49 $6.49 $1.49 $1.49 L $1.79 $1.79 L $1.59 $1.59 L

O Quill LLC 5% $8.53 $8.96 $3.33 $3.50 $3.21 $3.37 $2.91 $3.06
O School Specialty, Inc. 5% $7.40 $7.77 $3.00 $3.15 $2.20 $2.31 No Bid No Bid
O Standard Stationery Supply IL LLC 5% No Bid No Bid $1.09 $1.14 $1.53 $1.61 No Bid No Bid
F Strickland Paper CO. No Bid No Bid $3.48 $3.48 $1.88 $1.88 A, SA $1.88 $1.88

Bid Item #/Description 
Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

O Acco Brands USA LLC 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Ace Office Supplies No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Lakeshore Learning Materials 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F National Art & School Supplies No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Pyramid School Products $0.99 $0.99 L $1.25 $1.25 L $3.42 $3.42 L $4.50 $4.50 L

O Quill LLC 5% $4.55 $4.78 A, NS $1.26 $1.32 No Bid No Bid $0.93 $0.98
O School Specialty, Inc. 5% No Bid No Bid $1.30 $1.37 $0.98 $1.03 $0.98 $1.03
O Standard Stationery Supply IL LLC 5% $0.78 $0.82 A, NS $1.07 $1.12 A, NS $3.53 $3.71 $3.88 $4.07
F Strickland Paper CO. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.77 $1.77 $1.22 $1.22

132/ Pencil, Sharpener, Electric, 
110V AC**

FL. Pref. 
Adj.

129/ Pen, Roller Ball, Black, Uni-Ball 
rolling ball, 0.7mm fine point

130/ Pen, Roller Ball, Blue, Uni-Ball 
rolling ball, 0.7mm fine point

131/ Erasers, caps, fits standard 
pencils, 

140/ Pencils, #2-1/2 
**

FL. Pref. 
Adj.

137/ Pencil, Red 138/ Pencil, #2-1/2 Lead 139/ Pencils #2, Tipped

136/ Pencil, #4 
**

FL. Pref. 
Adj.

133/ Sharpener, Pencil, Mechanical 134/ Pencils, Beginners, Untipped
135/ Pencils, #2 pencil w/erasers, 

2nd Grade
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Bid Item #/Description 
Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

O Acco Brands USA LLC 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Ace Office Supplies No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Lakeshore Learning Materials 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.95 $1.00 A, NA

F National Art & School Supplies No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Pyramid School Products $0.89 $0.89 No Bid No Bid $6.49 $6.49 $1.59 $1.59
O Quill LLC 5% $4.69 $4.92 A, NS No Bid No Bid $10.16 $10.67 $4.08 $4.28
O School Specialty, Inc. 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.50 $2.63 $1.44 $1.51 A, NS

O Standard Stationery Supply IL LLC 5% $0.50 $0.53 No Bid No Bid $2.08 $2.18 A, NS $1.00 $1.05
F Strickland Paper CO. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.45 $5.45 $1.66 $1.66

Bid Item #/Description 
Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

O Acco Brands USA LLC 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Ace Office Supplies No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Lakeshore Learning Materials 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F National Art & School Supplies No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Pyramid School Products $0.63 $0.63 $1.39 $1.39 $2.19 $2.19 $1.89 $1.89
O Quill LLC 5% $0.77 $0.81 A, NS $3.13 $3.29 A, NS $8.40 $8.82 $9.00 $9.45 A, NS

O School Specialty, Inc. 5% No Bid No Bid $1.20 $1.26 No Bid No Bid $0.19 $0.20
O Standard Stationery Supply IL LLC 5% $0.36 $0.38 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.18 $1.24
F Strickland Paper CO. $1.75 $1.75 $3.34 $3.34 $11.16 $11.16 E $8.85 $8.85

Bid Item #/Description 
Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

O Acco Brands USA LLC 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Ace Office Supplies No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Lakeshore Learning Materials 5% No Bid No Bid $16.14 $16.95 A, NA $16.14 $16.95 A, NA $3.79 $3.98 A, NA

F National Art & School Supplies No Bid No Bid $16.80 $16.80 $16.80 $16.80 No Bid No Bid
F Pyramid School Products $1.49 $1.49 $16.19 $16.19 $16.19 $16.19 $0.79 $0.79 L

O Quill LLC 5% $9.60 $10.08 $19.32 $20.29 No Bid No Bid $0.91 $0.96
O School Specialty, Inc. 5% $2.04 $2.14 E No Bid No Bid $15.72 $16.51 No Bid No Bid
O Standard Stationery Supply IL LLC 5% $1.03 $1.08 $2.15 $2.26 A, NS $2.15 $2.26 A, NS $0.37 $0.39 A, NS

F Strickland Paper CO. No Bid No Bid $26.28 $26.28 $26.28 $26.28 $1.48 $1.48

**
FL. Pref. 

Adj.

No Award

144/ Protractor, 6" Plastic, 
two(2)rows of calibrations**

FL. Pref. 
Adj.

141/ Erasers, Pencil, Pink Pearl, 
Large, 12/box

142/ Protectors, Label, Easy-on, 
Clear, Self-Adhesive 

143/ Sheet Protectors, Top-load, 
Non-Glare, 100/box

145/ Rulers, Wood 18" Metal Edge
146/ Rulers, Wood, Meter/Yard stick -

39" w/Metal Tip
147/ Rulers, 6" (15cm), Plastic

148/ Rulers, 12" Wood, w/metal 
edge

**
FL. Pref. 

Adj.

149/ Rulers, 12" (30cm), Plastic 150/ Scissors, Blunt Point, 4-1/2" 151/ Scissors, Clip Point, 5"
152/ Stamp Pad, Black, Foam 

Rubber, 2-3/4" x 4-1/4"
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Bid Item #/Description 
Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

O Acco Brands USA LLC 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Ace Office Supplies No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Lakeshore Learning Materials 5% $3.79 $3.98 A, NA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F National Art & School Supplies No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Pyramid School Products $0.79 $0.79 L $2.09 $2.09 $0.46 $0.46 $0.22 $0.22
O Quill LLC 5% $0.91 $0.96 $4.43 $4.65 $0.56 $0.59 $0.46 $0.48 A, NA

O School Specialty, Inc. 5% No Bid No Bid $5.00 $5.25 $0.60 $0.63 A, NS No Bid No Bid
O Standard Stationery Supply IL LLC 5% $0.37 $0.39 A, NS No Bid No Bid $0.36 $0.38 $0.15 $0.16 A, NS

F Strickland Paper CO. $1.48 $1.48 $6.55 $6.55 No Bid No Bid $0.23 $0.23

Bid Item #/Description 
Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

O Acco Brands USA LLC 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Ace Office Supplies No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Lakeshore Learning Materials 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F National Art & School Supplies No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Pyramid School Products $2.69 $2.69 $0.51 $0.51 $0.62 $0.62 $1.39 $1.39
O Quill LLC 5% $3.83 $4.02 $2.16 $2.27 $5.96 $6.26 $2.55 $2.68
O School Specialty, Inc. 5% $4.60 $4.83 $0.77 $0.81 $4.69 $4.92 $2.19 $2.30
O Standard Stationery Supply IL LLC 5% $0.40 $0.42 A, NS No Bid No Bid $0.47 $0.49 A, NS $0.71 $0.75
F Strickland Paper CO. No Bid No Bid $0.55 $0.55 $1.29 $1.29 A, NS $0.95 $0.95

Bid Item #/Description 
Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

O Acco Brands USA LLC 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Ace Office Supplies No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Lakeshore Learning Materials 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F National Art & School Supplies $5.96 $5.96 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Pyramid School Products $6.04 $6.04 $1.59 $1.59 $0.55 $0.55 $1.29 $1.29
O Quill LLC 5% $7.56 $7.94 No Bid No Bid $0.98 $1.03 A, NA $1.54 $1.62
O School Specialty, Inc. 5% $6.60 $6.93 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.30 $1.37
O Standard Stationery Supply IL LLC 5% $1.75 $1.84 A, NS $1.22 $1.28 $0.40 $0.42 $0.75 $0.79
F Strickland Paper CO. No Bid No Bid $2.22 $2.22 No Bid No Bid $1.82 $1.82

155/ Staples, standard, chisel point, 156/ Staple Remover, Black

**
FL. Pref. 

Adj.

157/ Tape, Box, Sealing, Clear, 2" x 
60 YDS

158/ Tape, Frosted, Mending, 3/4" 
wide x 1296"

159/ Tape, Masking, 3/4" x 60Yards, 
GENERAL PURPOSE

160/ Tape Dispensers, Heavy Duty, 
Black, 1" Core for 1/2" & 3/4" tape

**
FL. Pref. 

Adj.

161/ Tape, Book Mending, Clear, 
Trans-parent, 3" x 15 Yds.

162/ Tape, Masking, Tartan, 2" x 
60yds

163/ Correction Fluid, Photocopy, 
while, 3/4oz. Bottle

164/ Pen, Correction White Out

153/ Stamp Pad, Red, Foam Rubber, 
2-3/4" x 4-1/4"

154/ Stapler 4", Throat, Black 
length, 8-1/2"**

FL. Pref. 
Adj.
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Bid Item #/Description 
Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

O Acco Brands USA LLC 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Ace Office Supplies No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Lakeshore Learning Materials 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F National Art & School Supplies No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Pyramid School Products $0.91 $0.91 $0.72 $0.72 A, NS No Bid No Bid
O Quill LLC 5% $1.25 $1.32 $3.08 $3.23 A, NA $73.56 $77.24 A, NA

O School Specialty, Inc. 5% $1.30 $1.37 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Standard Stationery Supply IL LLC 5% $0.42 $0.44 A, NS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Strickland Paper CO. $4.53 $4.53 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

A =  Alternate Bid
E = Equivalent Pricing
L = Lot
NA = Not Approved
NP = Not approved Packaging
NS = No Sample
SA = Sample Approved

**
FL. Pref. 

Adj.

165/ Correction Tape, White Out, 
Dispenser W/Ready-Write Film

166/ Liquid Paper, White Out, .74oz 
Bottle

167/ Shrink Wrap, 18" x 1500' 
.90MIL

NOTES:

No Award No Award

BID TABULATION, RECOMMENDATIONS, AND PROTEST

Bid tabulations with award recommendations are posted for 72 hours in the Purchasing Department Office and are also posted to the School 
District's website address at: http://ecsd-fl.schoolloop.com/purchasing/bids.  Notices will not be automatically mailed.

Failure to file a protest within the time prescribed in Section 120.57(3) Florida Statutes, or failure to post the bond or other security required by law 
within the time allowed for filing a bond shall constitute a waiver of proceedings under Chapter 120 Florida Statutes.

I hereby certify that the prices and bidders reflected herein are valid, and have been received in compliance to Escambia County School Board 
Rules and Florida Law.

John Dombroskie,
Director Purchasing Department
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