THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY
n PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

75 North Pace Blvd.

Pensacola, FL 32505

El)i (23

BID AWARD NOTICE

DATE: BID TITLE & REFERENCE:
September 10, 2018 Miscellaneous Paper Products & Cleaning
Supplies for School Cafeterias, Bid #190102

DESCRIPTION OF PURCHASE:

An annual purchasing agreement, with a one (1) year renewal option, to provide paper products and
cleaning supplies for school cafeterias (seven (7) items were bid, three (3) items are awarded) to be
stocked and distributed by the Central Warehouse. Items will be purchased as needed to meet
cafeteria usage requirements. Four (4) items are not awarded due to no satisfactory bids being
received. Bid award(s) to the lowest bidder(s) meeting specifications.

Effective Dates: October 1, 2018 through June 30, 2019 (Initial Term)

REQUESTED BY:

Food Services

SUPPLIER NAME: ITEMS AWARDED: ESTIMATED ANNUAL EXPENDITURE:
Imperial Dade Paper, Loxley, AL 1 $ 50,800.00
PR Chemical & Paper Supply, Pensacola, FL 2 5,043.50

AMOUNT OF PURCHASE: FUNDING SOURCE:
$55,843.50 Est. / Yr. Food Services Fund (4110)

METHOD OF PROCUREMENT:

ECSD Bid Bids Received: 9 Bids Rejected: 1

DATE AND TIME POSTED:

September 10, 2018, 2:00pm Central Time

9500PUR101 (11/10) Retention - 5 Years



DATE: August 28, 2018

BID NBR: 190102

THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
75 NORTH PACE BOULEVARD
PENSACOLA, FLORIDA 32505

BID TABULATION

BID TITLE: MISC. PAPER PRODUCTS & CLEANING SUPPLIES FOR SCHOOL CAFETERIAS

Awarded Items are highlighted

ITEM Dipping Tray, Cups, 16 oz., Parfait Dome Lid, Dome Lid,
2-Compartment Cold Food 16 oz. 12 oz.
Quantity: 50 cs 125 cs 75 cs |75 cs
0700080 0702225 0702250 New Item
ITEM NUMBER 1 2-DELETED 3-DELETED 4-DELETED
All Florida Paper
Medley, FL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Calico Packaging
Tampa, FL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Central Poly
Linden, NJ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Imperial Dade Paper
Loxley, AL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Interboro Packaging
Montgomery, NY No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
PR Chemical & Paper
Pensacola, FL 83.51 68.80 a No Bid No Bid
Supreme Paper Supplies
Pensacola, FL No Bid 39.90 a No Bid No Bid
Unipak Corp
Brooklyn, NY No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
ITEM Sandwich Bag, |Cleaner/Rinse Aid Garbage Can
Foil Lined Tablets Liners, 56 gal
Quantity: 10 cs 8 pl 2,000 cs
0702840 0700190 0702920
ITEM NUMBER 5-DELETED 6 7
All Florida Paper
Medley, FL No Bid No Bid 27.02 nu
Calico Packaging
Tampa, FL No Bid No Bid 25.74 nu
Central Poly
Linden, NJ No Bid No Bid 20.95 nu
Imperial Dade Paper
Loxley, AL No Bid No Bid 25.40 ny
Interboro Packaging
Montgomery, NY No Bid No Bid 25.48 ny
Interboro Packaging
Montgomery, NY No Bid No Bid 23.01 nu
Interboro Packaging
Montgomery, NY No Bid No Bid 19.82 nu
PR Chemical & Paper
Pensacola, FL No Bid 108.50 24.94 nu
Supreme Paper Supplies
Pensacola, FL No Bid No Bid 23.76 nu
Unipak Corp
Brooklyn, NY No Bid No Bid 21.35 nu

a = Alternate bid

n= No prior approved brand

y =Product was tested and approved
u=Unacceptable, no sample sent, or sample not approved
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BID TABULATION, RECOMMENDATIONS, AND PROTEST

Bid tabulations with award recommendations are posted for 72 hours in the Purchasing Department Office and are also
posted to the School District's website address at: http://ecsd-fl.schoolloop.com/purchasing/bids. Notices will not be
automatically mailed.

Failure to file a protest within the time prescribed in Section 120.57(3) Florida Statutes, or failure to post the bond or other
security required by law within the time allowed for filing a bond shall constitute a waiver of proceedings under Chapter 120
Florida Statutes.

| hereby certify that the prices and bidders reflected herein are valid, and have been received in compliance to Escambia
County School Board Rules and Florida Law.

Vobn Dombroskic

John Dombroskie, Director
Purchasing Department
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