
 

 
 
 
DATE: BID TITLE & REFERENCE: 
October 4, 2017  Miscellaneous Condiments, Spices, and 

Staples, Bid #180302 
 
DESCRIPTION OF PURCHASE: 

 

An annual purchasing agreement to provide school cafeterias miscellaneous condiments, spices, and 
staples.  Items will be stocked and distributed by the Central Warehouse.  Forty-seven (47) items 
were bid, thirty-eight (38) items are awarded.  Items will be purchased as needed to meet cafeteria 
usage requirements.  Bid award(s) to the lowest bidder(s) meeting specifications.  
 

Effective Dates:  October 18, 2017 through September 30, 2018.  
 
 
 
 
 

  
REQUESTED BY: 

 

      Food Services 
 
    
SUPPLIER NAME:             ITEMS AWARDED:  ESTIMATED ANNUAL EXPENDITURE: 
 

 Ben E. Keith, Elba, AL                                    9          $   18,562.26 
 Butler Foods of Pensacola, Cantonment, FL         8       45,830.10 
 J&J Snack Foods Corp., Pennsauken, NJ       1        33,075.00 
 Jennie-O Turkey, Willmar, MN          1          6,960.00 
 Red Gold, Elwood, IN           1          1,162.00  
 Sysco Gulf Coast, Geneva, AL          5        48,710.50 
 US Foods-Montgomery, AL         13      130,034.50 
 
    
AMOUNT OF PURCHASE:  FUNDING SOURCE: 

 

$284,334.36 Est. / Yr. Food Services Fund (4110) 
 

  
METHOD OF PROCUREMENT: 

 

ECSD Bid      Bids Received: 12          
   

  
DATE AND TIME POSTED: 

 

October 4, 2017, 10:30am Central Time 
 
 
9500PUR101 (11/10) Retention - 5 Years 

 
THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY 

PURCHASING DEPARTMENT 
75 North Pace Boulevard  

Pensacola, FL  32505 
 

BID AWARD NOTICE 



DATE:  September 26, 2017

BID NBR:  180302
BID TITLE:  Miscellaneous Condiments, Spices, and Staples

Where two prices are shown, the bottom price is the bid case/pack size 
Top price is unit price needed to determine low cost because of vendor differences in case count

ITEM
Whole Wheat Granulated            Mix Frozen

Quantity: 50 bg 150 bg 50 bg 50 cs
0505191 0511171 0506200 0506200

ITEM NUMBER 1-DELETE 2 3 4-DELETE
Bake Crafters Food Co. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
McDonald, TN
Ben E Keith No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cantonment, FL
Butler Foods of Pensacola No Bid No Bid 6.05 No Bid
Cantonment, FL 36.30
Chef's Corner Foods No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Dallas, TX
ChurchField Trading Co. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Santa Ynez, CA
Cole's Quality Foods, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Grand Rapids, Michigan
J&J Snack Foods Corp. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pennsauken, NJ
Jennie-O Turkey No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Willmar, MN
Major Products Co., Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Little Ferry, NJ
Red Gold, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Elwood, IN
Sysco Gulf Coast No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Geneva, AL
US Foods No Bid 3.116 4.936 No Bid
Montgomery, AL 24.93 29.62

Awarded Items are highlighted

Flour, White         Sugar, Corn Bread Corn Bread Batter

THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

75 NORTH PACE BOULEVARD
PENSACOLA, FLORIDA 32505

BID TABULATION
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ITEM Bread Stick, Przt
Whole Grain Whole Grain Cheese Filled Cheese Filled

Quantity: 100 bg 1,600 cs 1,600 cs 100 cs 100 cs
0506131 0516642 0516642 0516640 0517250

ITEM NUMBER 5 6--DELETE 6-DELETE 7 8
Bake Crafters Food Co. No Bid 0.1082 m No Bid No Bid No Bid
McDonald, TN 25.96
Ben E Keith No Bid 0.098 No Bid 0.3983 0.3847
Cantonment, FL 21.67 57.36 27.70
Butler Foods of Pensacola No Bid 0.1032 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cantonment, FL 22.70
Chef's Corner Foods No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Dallas, TX
ChurchField Trading Co. No Bid 0.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Santa Ynez, CA 22.14
Cole's Quality Foods, Inc. No Bid 0.2407 0.1110 No Bid No Bid
Grand Rapids, Michigan 13.00 25.00
J&J Snack Foods Corp. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pennsauken, NJ
Jennie-O Turkey No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Willmar, MN
Major Products Co., Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Little Ferry, NJ
Red Gold, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Elwood, IN
Sysco Gulf Coast No Bid 3.4438 0.1052 0.35173 0.36111
Geneva, AL 27.55 23.15 50.65 26.00
US Foods 2.6425 No Bid No Bid 0.344 0.346
Montgomery, AL 21.14 m 49.58 24.96

ITEM
Fruit Filled Themed Canola       Turkey

Quantity: 100 cs 1,050 cs 200 cs 300 cs
0517270 0517370 050722 0517540

ITEM NUMBER 9 10 11 12
Bake Crafters Food Co. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
McDonald, TN
Ben E Keith 0.4133 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cantonment, FL 29.76
Butler Foods of Pensacola 0.4465 0.2674 l No Bid 2.5861 ay
Cantonment, FL 32.15 38.50 46.55
Chef's Corner Foods No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Dallas, TX
ChurchField Trading Co. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Santa Ynez, CA
Cole's Quality Foods, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Grand Rapids, Michigan
J&J Snack Foods Corp. No Bid 0.2188 m No Bid No Bid
Pennsauken, NJ 31.50
Jennie-O Turkey No Bid No Bid No Bid 2.3200 m
Willmar, MN 23.20 ay
Major Products Co., Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Little Ferry, NJ
Red Gold, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Elwood, IN
Sysco Gulf Coast 0.38541 No Bid 9.50 2.83 au
Geneva, AL 27.75 38.00 34.00
US Foods 0.3700 0.253 No Bid 0.084 au
Montgomery, AL 26.67 36.54 32.85

      Bacon,

       Grits Breadstick, Bread Stick,

Bread Stick, Cookie Dough       Oil, Veg.

Breadstick,

Page 2



ITEM
Whole Grain Quick

Quantity: 48 cs 200 cs 60 cs 50 cs
0510780 New Item 0506121 0502240

ITEM NUMBER 13 14 15-DELETE 16
Bake Crafters Food Co. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
McDonald, TN
Ben E Keith No Bid 6.36 No Bid No Bid
Cantonment, FL 76.35
Butler Foods of Pensacola No Bid
Cantonment, FL 71.21 37.65 32.10
Chef's Corner Foods No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Dallas, TX
ChurchField Trading Co. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Santa Ynez, CA
Cole's Quality Foods, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Grand Rapids, Michigan
J&J Snack Foods Corp. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pennsauken, NJ
Jennie-O Turkey No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Willmar, MN
Major Products Co., Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Little Ferry, NJ
Red Gold, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Elwood, IN
Sysco Gulf Coast 0.7916 5.5375 2.8791 7.375
Geneva, AL 19.00 66.45 34.55 29.50
US Foods No Bid 0.236   5.05
Montgomery, AL 65.34 20.20

ITEM
Seasoning      Sauce      Sour Sauce

Quantity: 100 cs 200 cs 200 cs 200 cs
0509020 0513230 0513200 0513210

ITEM NUMBER 17 18 19 20
Bake Crafters Food Co. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
McDonald, TN
Ben E Keith 0.3286 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cantonment, FL 43.36
Butler Foods of Pensacola 0.2806 pf
Cantonment, FL 80.80 s 32.25 pf 42.50 ps 46.15 pf
Chef's Corner Foods No Bid 0.0630 au 0.059 au 0.065 au
Dallas, TX 41.00 m 38.34 m 41.89 m
ChurchField Trading Co. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Santa Ynez, CA
Cole's Quality Foods, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Grand Rapids, Michigan
J&J Snack Foods Corp. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pennsauken, NJ
Jennie-O Turkey No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Willmar, MN
Major Products Co., Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Little Ferry, NJ
Red Gold, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Elwood, IN
Sysco Gulf Coast 0.3320 1.3866 1.3383 1.3383
Geneva, AL 43.75 41.60 40.15 40.15
US Foods 0.2420 0.101 0.103 0.103
Montgomery, AL 13.09 40.08 38.64 38.64

Sauce
Teriyaki 

Sweet
Pickle Relish,         Salt Stuffing Mix,

        Taco         Orange Sweet and 

        Oats, 
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ITEM
Sauce Mix Mix      Sauce

Quantity: 200 cs 75 cs. 75 cs. 50 cs.
0513240 New Item New Item 0502380

ITEM NUMBER 21 22-DELETE 23-DELETE 24
Bake Crafters Food Co. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
McDonald, TN
Ben E Keith No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cantonment, FL
Butler Foods of Pensacola No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cantonment, FL 43.98
Chef's Corner Foods 0.065 au No Bid No Bid No Bid
Dallas, TX 41.91 m
ChurchField Trading Co. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Santa Ynez, CA
Cole's Quality Foods, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Grand Rapids, Michigan
J&J Snack Foods Corp. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pennsauken, NJ
Jennie-O Turkey No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Willmar, MN
Major Products Co., Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Little Ferry, NJ
Red Gold, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.088 m
Elwood, IN 23.24
Sysco Gulf Coast 1.3866 No Bid 3.40 au 4.2166
Geneva, AL 41.60 20.40 25.30
US Foods 0.101 No Bid No Bid 0.084
Montgomery, AL 40.08 24.23

ITEM Syrup, Bkt.
       Canned   Dressing, Sweet Bags   Indiv. Cups

Quantity: 50 cs 200 cs 100 cs 2,500 cs
New Item New Item 0503040 New Item

ITEM NUMBER 25-DELETE 26-DELETE 27 28
Bake Crafters Food Co. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
McDonald, TN
Ben E Keith No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cantonment, FL
Butler Foods of Pensacola No Bid No Bid ay
Cantonment, FL 19.55 au 14.74
Chef's Corner Foods No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Dallas, TX
ChurchField Trading Co. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Santa Ynez, CA
Cole's Quality Foods, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Grand Rapids, Michigan
J&J Snack Foods Corp. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pennsauken, NJ
Jennie-O Turkey No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Willmar, MN
Major Products Co., Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Little Ferry, NJ
Red Gold, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Elwood, IN
Sysco Gulf Coast 8.00 au No Bid No Bid 0.1475 ay
Geneva, AL 48.00 14.75
US Foods No Bid No Bid 0.134 0.09 ay
Montgomery, AL 12.91 9.03

    Tomato

Pumpkin, Vinaigrette         Tea

Brown GravyKung Pao Poultry Gravy
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ITEM
       Prepared          White         Sauce  Salad Dress Mix

Quantity: 50 cs 200 gl 60 gl 200 cs
0507060 0507110 0507120 0507150

ITEM NUMBER 29 30 31 32
Bake Crafters Food Co. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
McDonald, TN
Ben E Keith 3.40 1.942 4.30 0.8226
Cantonment, FL 13.59 7.77 17.19 31.26
Butler Foods of Pensacola No Bid No Bid 8.24 1.0140
Cantonment, FL 32.96 38.55
Chef's Corner Foods No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Dallas, TX
ChurchField Trading Co. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Santa Ynez, CA
Cole's Quality Foods, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Grand Rapids, Michigan
J&J Snack Foods Corp. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pennsauken, NJ
Jennie-O Turkey No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Willmar, MN
Major Products Co., Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Little Ferry, NJ
Red Gold, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Elwood, IN
Sysco Gulf Coast 4.9375 2.83 9.50 1.8277
Geneva, AL 19.75 17.00 38.00 32.90
US Foods 4.6725 2.82 m 4.83 m 1.240
Montgomery, AL 18.69 16.97 19.32 22.35

ITEM
    Low Fat, Ind.     Ind. Pouch        Ind. Cup     Beef, Low Sod.

Quantity: 150 cs 1,000 cs 2,000 cs 150 cn
0507190 0507320 0507321 0504010

ITEM NUMBER 33 34 35-DELETE 36
Bake Crafters Food Co. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
McDonald, TN
Ben E Keith 0.054 0.0411 No Bid 7.115
Cantonment, FL 10.93 8.22 42.69
Butler Foods of Pensacola 0.0613 0.0513 0.1392 2.0780
Cantonment, FL 12.27 10.25 13.92 41.55
Chef's Corner Foods No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Dallas, TX
ChurchField Trading Co. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Santa Ynez, CA
Cole's Quality Foods, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Grand Rapids, Michigan
J&J Snack Foods Corp. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pennsauken, NJ
Jennie-O Turkey No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Willmar, MN
Major Products Co., Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid 4.7800
Little Ferry, NJ 23.90
Red Gold, LLC No Bid 0.063 0.09 No Bid
Elwood, IN 23.37 au 22.52 a
Sysco Gulf Coast 0.07375 No Bid 0.1050 No Bid
Geneva, AL 14.75 10.50
US Foods 0.069 0.04 ay No Bid 6.405 m
Montgomery, AL 13.99 8.07 38.43

Meat Base, 

  Ranch Style, Dry

Dressing, Ital. BBQ Sauce, BBQ Sauce, 

Mustard, Vinegar, Worcestershire
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ITEM
Chicken, Low Sod.         Ground Dark Ground

Quantity: 150 cn 84 cn 48 cn 48 cn
0504020 0510071 0510220 0510250

ITEM NUMBER 37 38 39 40
Bake Crafters Food Co. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
McDonald, TN
Ben E Keith No Bid 7.04 au 4.78 au 0.2650
Cantonment, FL 42.24 28.70 28.63
Butler Foods of Pensacola 1.9300 0.5917 0.3062 0.3188
Cantonment, FL 38.60 7.10 4.90 5.10
Chef's Corner Foods No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Dallas, TX
ChurchField Trading Co. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Santa Ynez, CA
Cole's Quality Foods, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Grand Rapids, Michigan
J&J Snack Foods Corp. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pennsauken, NJ
Jennie-O Turkey No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Willmar, MN
Major Products Co., Inc. 4.0400 ap No Bid No Bid No Bid
Little Ferry, NJ 20.20
Red Gold, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Elwood, IN
Sysco Gulf Coast No Bid 0.959 No Bid 0.2500
Geneva, AL 69.00 27.00
US Foods 6.586 No Bid 0.455 0.523
Montgomery, AL 39.52 8.20 9.42

ITEM    Hot Sauce,
Ground      Granulated Flakes Flakes     Individual

Quantity: 48 cn 200 cn 96 cn 96 cn 400 cs
0510310 0510340 0510660 0510660 0507200

ITEM NUMBER 41 42 43 43 44
Bake Crafters Food Co. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
McDonald, TN
Ben E Keith 0.3350 0.3320 0.8780 No Bid 0.035
Cantonment, FL 28.12 49.81 26.35 7.17
Butler Foods of Pensacola 0.4906 0.4400 0.9500 1.020 0.0634 e
Cantonment, FL 7.85 11.00 9.50 2.05 12.67
Butler Foods of Pensacola No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.0366
Cantonment, FL 7.32
Chef's Corner Foods No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Dallas, TX
ChurchField Trading Co. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Santa Ynez, CA
Cole's Quality Foods, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Grand Rapids, Michigan
J&J Snack Foods Corp. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pennsauken, NJ
Jennie-O Turkey No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Willmar, MN
Major Products Co., Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Little Ferry, NJ
Red Gold, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Elwood, IN
Sysco Gulf Coast 3.25 au 0.300 No Bid No Bid 0.0355
Geneva, AL 26.00 45.00 35.50
US Foods 0.753 0.592 No Bid No Bid 0.04
Montgomery, AL 10.55 15.40 8.03

      Cumin, 

Meat Base,           Basil, Chili Powder, 

     Parsley,

    Cinnamon,

Garlic,      Parsley,
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ITEM Cookie Dough,Rd. Biscuits, Whl 
Juice    Fat, Whl Gr,Frz.    Fat, Whl Gr,Frz.    Fat, Whl Gr,Frz. Grain, Lg

Quantity: 150 gal 1,350 cs 1,350 cs 1,350 cs 2,400 cs
0503020 0517081 0517081 0517081 0517290

ITEM NUMBER 45 46 46 46 47
Bake Crafters Food Co. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.1123 au
McDonald, TN 24.25 m
Ben E Keith 4.39 0.1177 No Bid No Bid 0.1366
Cantonment, FL 17.57 23.07 29.51
Butler Foods of Pensacola 9.60 0.1298 No Bid No Bid 0.1338
Cantonment, FL 38.40 25.45 28.90
Chef's Corner Foods No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Dallas, TX
ChurchField Trading Co. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Santa Ynez, CA
Cole's Quality Foods, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Grand Rapids, Michigan
J&J Snack Foods Corp. No Bid 0.1208 0.1438 0.2188 au No Bid
Pennsauken, NJ 21.75 27.60 31.50
Jennie-O Turkey No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Willmar, MN
Major Products Co., Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Little Ferry, NJ
Red Gold, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Elwood, IN
Sysco Gulf Coast 8.40 0.1130 No Bid No Bid 0.1386
Geneva, AL 33.60 22.15 29.95
US Foods 8.14 No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.125
Montgomery, AL 32.56 27.19

N - No prior approved brand
a = Alternate bid 
ap= Alternate pack size
e=Extended shelf life
l= Lead time required. Each variety only available for a season. 
m = Vendor bid minimum shipment
p = Pack size not acceptable
pf=preference for shelf stable
ps=30 lb. case
s=Sodium= 380 mg/serving
u = Unacceptable, no sample sent or sample not approved
y = Sample received and approved
mu=Minimum not acceptable

BID TABULATION, RECOMMENDATIONS, AND PROTEST
Bid tabulations with award recommendations are posted for 72 hours in the Purchasing Department Office and are also

posted to the School District's website address at: http://ecsd-fl.schoolloop.com/purchasing/bids. Notices will not be

automatically mailed. 

Failure to file a protest within the time prescribed in Section 120.57(3) Florida Statutes, or failure to post the bond or other

security required by law within the time allowed for filing a bond shall constitute a waiver of proceedings under Chapter 120

Florida Statutes.

I hereby certify that the prices and bidders reflected herein are valid, and have been received in compliance to Escambia

County School Board Rules and Florida Law.

John Dombroskie
John Dombroskie, Director

Purchasing Department

       Lemon Cookie Dough,Rd. Cookie Dough,Rd.
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