THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY
n PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

75 North Pace Blvd.

Pensacola, FL 32505

El)i (23

BID AWARD NOTICE

DATE: BID TITLE & REFERENCE:
May 3, 2017 Cafeteria Equipment, Bid#172202

DESCRIPTION OF PURCHASE:

An annual purchasing agreement with a one (1) year renewal option to provide cafeteria equipment
to schools throughout the District. Forty-one (41) items were bid and thirty-six (36) items are
awarded. Items #2, 22, 38, 39, 40 were not awarded due to the following: the items requested were
not bid upon and no documentation was received for any alternate products, or the equipment for
which documentation was received was not deemed acceptable. Items will be purchased as needed
to meet cafeteria usage requirements. Bid award(s) to the lowest bidder(s) meeting specifications.

Effective Dates: May 17, 2017 through April 30, 2018.

REQUESTED BY:

Food Services Department

SUPPLIER NAME: ITEMS AWARDED: ESTIMATED ANNUAL EXPENDITURE:
Chef’'s Depot, Monsey, NY 3 $ 61,675.20
Hotel and Restaurant Supply, Gulfport, MS 9 47,911.00
Kesco-Florida, Pensacola, FL 24 346,260.00

AMOUNT OF PURCHASE: FUNDING SOURCE:
$455,846.20 Est. / Yr. Food Services Fund (4110)

METHOD OF PROCUREMENT:
ECSD Bid Bids Received: 6 Bids Rejected: 1

“No Bid” Response: 1

DATE AND TIME POSTED:

May 3, 2017, 10:45am Central Time

9500PUR101 (11/10) Retention - 5 Years



DATE: April 25, 2017

BID NBR: 172202

THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
75 NORTH PACE BOULEVARD
PENSACOLA, FLORIDA 32505

BID TABULATION

BID TITLE: Cafeteria Equipment

Top Price: Equipment - Delivery Only

Awarded Items are highlighted

Bottom Price: Equipment and Full Installation

ITEM Refrigerator/ Refrigerator/ | Refrig Salad Bar/ | Refrig. Salad Bar/
2 Door Reach 1 Section Cold (5-Well) Cold (4-Well)
Quantity: 2 ea 1 ea 2 ea 2 ea
ITEM NUMBER 1 2-DELETE 3 4

Chef's Depot 3,224.98 6,304.69 au| 12,115.06 |au| 11,132.12 | au
Monsey, NY No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Hotel & Restaurant Supply
Gulfport, MS 3,078.00 No Bid 10,783.00 9,932.00
Kesco Kit Equip. & Supply
Pensacola, FL 3,250.00 No Bid 10,650.00 9,790.00
Wascomat of America
Inwood, NY No Bid No Bid 13,958.75 |au| 1291750 | au

ITEM Milk Cooler, Dou. | Milk Cooler, Dou. | Milk Cooler, Dou. Ice Storage

8 Crate Cap. 12 Crate Cap. 16 Crate Cap. Bin, Small
Quantity: 6 ea 4 ea 2 ea 2 ea
ITEM NUMBER 5 6 7 8

Chef's Depot 2,296.17 2,5685.42 3,615.44 au 877.67
Monsey, NY No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Hotel & Restaurant Supply
Gulfport, MS 2,397.00 2,697.00 No Bid No Bid
Kesco Kit Equip. & Supply 850.00
Pensacola, FL 2,400.00 2,700.00 3,650.00 900.00
Wascomat of America
Inwood, NY No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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ITEM Ice Storage Ice Maker, Ice Maker | Comm. Dou. Sta.
Bin, Large Large Small Conv. Oven, Gas
Quantity: 2 ea 2 ea 2 ea 10 ea
ITEM NUMBER 9 10 11 12
Chef's Depot 799.41 2,449.04 2,456.82 10,616.01
Monsey, NY No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Hotel & Restaurant Supply No Bid No Bid No Bid
Gulfport, MS 10,328.00
Kesco Kit Equip. & Supply 770.00 2,230.00 2,225.00 9,650.00
Pensacola, FL 820.00 2,300.00 2,295.00 9,750.00
Wascomat of America
Inwood, NY No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
ITEM | Power Tilt Combi Oven, 10 | Conv Steamer Range
Skill, Gas, 30 Gal Pan Cap, Gas Double Stack 2- Burners
Quantity: 1 ea 1 ea 4 ea 1 ea
ITEM NUMBER 13 14 15 16

Chef's Depot 13,102.10 15,758.06 13,837.70 2,143.90
Monsey, NY No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Hotel & Restaurant Supply
Gulfport, MS 14,138.00 22,329.00 13,294.00 No Bid
Kesco Kit Equip. & Supply 11,950.00 14,900.00 13,200.00 2,050.00
Pensacola, FL 12,050.00 15,250.00 13,400.00 2,150.00
Kesco Kit Equip. & Supply 12,200.00 11,800.00
Pensacola, FL 12,300.00 18,950.00 12,000.00
Wascomat of America
Inwood, NY No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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ITEM Hot Food Hot Cabinet Hot Cabinet | Hot Cabinet
Table for Hold & Trans. [for Hold & Trans.  for Holding Food
Quantity: 2 ea 2 ea 10 ea 5 ea
ITEM NUMBER 17 18 19 20

Chef's Depot 7,691.83 au 2,670.73 3,755.65 4,257.54

Monsey, NY No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Hotel & Restaurant Supply

Gulfport, MS 6,954.00 2,799.00 3,797.00 4,195.00

Kesco Kit Equip. & Supply

Pensacola, FL 6,450.00 2,425.00 4,200.00 4,700.00 au

Wascomat of America

Inwood, NY 9,273.13 au No Bid No Bid No Bid

ITEM Hot Cabinet Portable Solid Food Slicer, Can Opener,
Pass Through Top Counter Electric, Auto Electric
Quantity: 2 ea 2 ea 2 ea 3 ea
ITEM NUMBER 21 22-DELETE 23 24

Chef's Depot 4,485.95 6,923.65 nu 5,594.96 au 1,512.38 au

Monsey, NY No Bid No Bid No Bid

Hotel & Restaurant Supply

Gulfport, MS 4,398.00 6,288.00 nu 5,678.00 au 1,358.00 au

Kesco Kit Equip. & Supply

Pensacola, FL 4,890.00 5,795.00 nu 5,250.00 1,250.00

Wascomat of America

Inwood, NY No Bid 8,459.38 nu No Bid No Bid
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ITEM Food Mixer Prep Table Prep Table Shelving Hvy Duty
30-Quart 72"W 60"W Kit, 72"W
Quantity: 1 ea 3 ea 5 ea 10 ea
ITEM NUMBER 25 26 27 28
Chef's Depot 6,690.90 2,542.11 ny 2,162.23 ny 818.55 au
Monsey, NY No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Hotel & Restaurant Supply
Gulfport, MS No Bid No Bid No Bid 882.00 au
Kesco Kit Equip. & Supply 550.00
Pensacola, FL 6,850.00 2,200.00 ny 1,990.00 ny 590.00
Wascomat of America
Inwood, NY No Bid 3,817.92 ny 3,415.50 ny No Bid
ITEM Shelving Hvy Duty| Shelving Hvy Duty Can Rack Utility Cart
Kit, 60"W 48" W Hvy Duty Large
Quantity: 10 ea 10 ea 1 ea 5 ea
ITEM NUMBER 29 30 31 32
Chef's Depot 709.41 au 616.19 au 654.27 1,135.12
Monsey, NY No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Hotel & Restaurant Supply
Gulfport, MS 762.00 au 662.00 au 598.00 819.00 ay
Kesco Kit Equip. & Supply 475.00 410.00
Pensacola, FL 515.00 450.00 620.00 1,100.00
Wascomat of America
Inwood, NY No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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ITEM Utility Cart, Utility Kit Cart Utility Kit Cart Mobile Tilt
Small 2-shelf,Blk 3-shelf Truck
Quantity: 5 ea 5 ea 5 ea 2 ea
ITEM NUMBER 33 34 35 36
Chef's Depot 219.42 216.34 464.37
Monsey, NY No Bid No Bid No Bid au No Bid
Hotel & Restaurant Supply
Gulfport, MS 787.00 ay 182.00 147.00 449.00
Kesco Kit Equip. & Supply
Pensacola, FL No Bid 205.00 140.00 465.00
Wascomat of America
Inwood, NY No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
ITEM Mobile Tilt | Portable Washer, | Dryer,
Truck Cashier Counter |Electric, White Electric, White
Quantity: 2 ea 2 ea 3 ea 3 ea
ITEM NUMBER 37 38-DELETE 39-DELETE 40-DELETE
Chef's Depot 781.25 3,339.40
Monsey, NY No Bid No Bid nu No Bid No Bid
Hotel & Restaurant Supply
Gulfport, MS 774.00 3,188.00 nu No Bid No Bid
Kesco Kit Equip. & Supply
Pensacola, FL 810.00 2,790.00 nu No Bid No Bid
Wascomat of America
Inwood, NY No Bid 4,662.50 nu No Bid No Bid

Page 5




ITEM Dishwashing
Machine
Quantity: 2 ea
ITEM NUMBER 41
Chef's Depot
Monsey, NY No Bid
Hotel & Restaurant Supply
Gulfport, MS No Bid
Kesco Kit Equip. & Supply
Pensacola, FL 19,300.00 | ay
Wascomat of America
Inwood, NY No Bid

n - No prior approved brand
a = Alternate bid

u = Unacceptable, no sample sent or sample not approved

y = Sample received and approved

BID TABULATION, RECOMMENDATIONS, AND PROTEST

Bid tabulations with award recommendations are posted for 72 hours in the Purchasing Department Office and are
also posted to the School District's website address at: http://ecsd-fl.schoolloop.com/purchasing/bids. Notices will

not be automatically mailed.

Failure to file a protest within the time prescribed in Section 120.57(3), Florida Statutes , or failure to post the bond
or other security required by law within the time allowed for filing a bond shall constitute a waiver of proceedings

under Chapter 120 Florida Statutes.

| hereby certify that the prices and bidders reflected herein are valid, and have been received in compliance to
Escambia County School Board Rules and Florida Law.

Vobn Dombroskie
John Dombroskie, Director
Purchasing Department
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