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THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
75 North Pace Blvd.
Pensacola, FL 32505

BID AWARD NOTICE

DATE:
January 4, 2017

BID TITLE & REFERENCE:
Ala Carte Snack Items and Beverages for Direct
Delivery to School Cafeterias, Bid #171002

DESCRIPTION OF PURCHASE:

An annual pricing agreement with a one (1) year renewal option to provide direct delivery of ala carte
snack items and beverages to school cafeterias throughout the District to be served as breakfast and
lunch options and for ala carte sales. Thirty-five (35) items bid, nineteen (19) items are awarded.
Sixteen (16) items were not awarded due to no bids being received, products were not approved in

taste tests, or no samples were received for alternative products bid.

Effective Dates: February 1, 2017 through January 31, 2018.

REQUESTED BY:

Food Services

SUPPLIER NAME:

Butler Foods of Pensacola, Inc., Cantonment, FL

AMOUNT OF PURCHASE: FUNDING SOURCE:

$586,947.80 Est. / Yr. Food Services Fund (4110)

METHOD OF PROCUREMENT:

ECSD Bid Responses Received: 2

DATE AND TIME POSTED:

January 4, 2017, 11:15am Central Time

9500PUR101 (11/10) Retention - 5 Years



DATE: December 2, 2016

RFP NBR: 171002

THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
75 NORTH PACE BOULEVARD
PENSACOLA, FLORIDA 32505

RFP TABULATION

Awarded Items are highlighted

RFP TITLE: Ala Carte Snack Items and Beverages for Direct Delivery to School Cafeterias

Where two prices are shown, the bottom price is the bid case/pack size
Top price is a portion or unit price needed to determine low cost because of vendor differences in case count

ITEM Chips, Popcorn, Chips, Chips,
Assorted Assorted Tortilla, 2 oz. Tortilla, Bulk
Quantity: 150,000 ea 40,000 ea 12,000 ea 600 cS
0520500 New Item New Item 0502310
ITEM NUMBER 1 2 3 4
Butler Foods - Pensacola
Cantonment, FL 0.39 0.42 No Bid 19.25
Trident Beverage
Elmore, AL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
ITEM Chips, Brown Rice Chickpeas, Crackers,
Fritos, Bulk Chips Roasted Saltine
Quantity: 600 cs 300 cs 300 cs 20 cs
0520510 New Item New Item 0512030
ITEM NUMBER 5 6 7 8
Butler Foods - Pensacola 0.3167 0.2140 0.0305
Cantonment, FL 21.50 19.00 53.50 15.25
Trident Beverage
Elmore, AL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
ITEM Crackers, Cereal, Snack Baked Snack Baked Snack
Captain Wafers Mix, Assorted Crackers, Fish Cracker, Square
Quantity: 340 cs 300 Ccs 800 cs 100 cs
0512020 0504090 0504090 0520180
ITEM NUMBER 9 10 11 12
Butler Foods - Pensacola 0.0631 0.3900 0.2050 0.2166
Cantonment, FL 18.92 23.40 61.50 37.90
Trident Beverage
Elmore, AL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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ITEM Marshmallow, Marshmallow Oat Cookie,
Square, Crispy Square, Mini Squares Animal Shaped
Quantity: 750 cs 100 cs 300 cs 350 cs
0520230 New Item 0506190 0520190
ITEM NUMBER 13 14 15 16
Butler Foods - Pensacola 0.4588 0.3217 0.1933
Cantonment, FL 36.70 No Bid 38.60 29.00
Trident Beverage
Elmore, AL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
ITEM Fruit Fruit Fruit Cup, Water,
Shacks Pearls Frozen Smooth Unflavored
Quantity: 300 cs 3,000 cs 3,000 cs 50,000 ea
New Item New Item New Item 0580020
ITEM NUMBER 17 18 19 20
Butler Foods - Pensacola 0.3545 a,y 0.3625
Cantonment, FL 51.05 17.40 No Bid No Bid
Trident Beverage 0.32 a,u
Elmore, AL No Bid No Bid 31.20 No Bid
ITEM Water, Water, 8 oz. Water, 20 oz., Water, Carb
Flavored Unflavored Flavored Flavored
Quantity: 5,000 ea 500 ea 2,000 ea 5,000 ea
0570550 New Item 0570580 New Item
ITEM NUMBER 21 22 23 24
Butler Foods - Pensacola
Cantonment, FL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Trident Beverage
Elmore, AL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
ITEM Water, Carb Water, Juice, Fresh Other, 100%
Flavored Vitamin Ref., 4 oz. Juice, 6 oz.
Quantity: 5,000 ea 5,000 ea 980,000 ea 3,000 ea
New Item 0580020 0530900 0570590
ITEM NUMBER 25 26 27 28
Butler Foods - Pensacola
Cantonment, FL No Bid No Bid 0.19 0.29 au
Trident Beverage 0.03 au
Elmore, AL No Bid No Bid No Bid 19.20
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ITEM Other, 100% Sports Drink, Other, 100% Sports Drink,
Juice, 10 oz. Iso, Zero Cal Juice, Bulk Iso, Zero, 20 oz
Quantity: 150,000 ea 30,000 ea 3,000 ea 20,000 ea
0570590 0570540 0570590 0570540
ITEM NUMBER 29 30 31 32
Butler Foods - Pensacola
Cantonment, FL 0.53 au No Bid 0.43 au No Bid
Butler Foods - Pensacola
Cantonment, FL 0.23 au
Trident Beverage 0.04 au
Elmore, AL No Bid No Bid 96.00 No Bid
ITEM Tea Tea, Tea,
Art. Sweetened Unsweetened
Quantity: 19,000 ea 17,000 ea 15,000 ea
0580030 0580040 New Item
ITEM NUMBER 33 34 35

Butler Foods - Pensacola
Cantonment, FL 0.58 0.58 No Bid
Trident Beverage 0.03 au 0.02 au
Elmore, AL 41.75 No Bid 39.00

a=Alternate product bid

au = Alternate product bid. Product was not approved in taste test or no sample was sent by bidder.
y = Product was approved in Taste Test
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BID TABULATION, RECOMMENDATIONS, AND PROTEST

Bid tabulations with award recommendations are posted for 72 hours in the Purchasing Department Office and
are also posted to the School District's website address at: http://ecsd-fl.schoolloop.com/purchasing/bids.
Notices will not be automatically mailed.

Failure to file a protest within the time prescribed in Section 120.57(3), Florida Statutes, or failure to post the
bond or other security required by law within the time allowed for filing a bond shall constitute a waiver of
proceedings under Chapter 120 Florida Statutes.

I hereby certify that the prices and bidders reflected herein are valid, and have been received in compliance to
Escambia County School Board Rules and Florida Law.

Vol Donbroshic

John Dombroskie, Director
Purchasing Department
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