THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY
n PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

75 North Pace Blvd.

Pensacola, FL 32505

El)i (23

BID AWARD NOTICE

DATE: BID TITLE & REFERENCE:
September 6, 2016 Miscellaneous Foods, Bid #170102

DESCRIPTION OF PURCHASE:

An annual purchasing agreement to provide miscellaneous food products as stocked and distributed
by the Central Warehouse for school cafeterias throughout the District. Sixteen (16) items were bid
and fourteen (14) items are awarded. Items will be purchased as needed to meet breakfast and
lunch menu requirements. Bid award(s) to the lowest bidder(s) meeting specifications.

Effective Dates: October 1, 2016 through September 30, 2017.

REQUESTED BY:

Food Services

SUPPLIER NAME: ITEMS AWARDED: ESTIMATED ANNUAL EXPENDITURE:
Churchfield Trading, Santa Ynez, CA 1 $ 38,880.00
Global Foods, Las Vegas, NV 1 12,285.00
Harvest Hill Beverage Co., Stamford, CT 1 5,715.00
J&J Snack Foods Corp., Pennsauken, NJ 1 33,075.00
Jennie-O Turkey, Willmar, MN 1 6,300.00
Sysco Gulf Coast, Geneva, AL 5 17,871.00
US Foods-Montgomery, Montgomery, AL 4 18,485.50

AMOUNT OF PURCHASE: FUNDING SOURCE:
$132,611.50 Est. / Yr. Food Services Fund (4110)

METHOD OF PROCUREMENT:

ECSD Bid Bids Received: 9

DATE AND TIME POSTED:

September 6, 2016, 5:00 pm Central Time

9500PUR101 (11/10) Retention - 5 Years



DATE: August 11, 2016

BID NBR: 170102

THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
75 NORTH PACE BOULEVARD
PENSACOLA, FLORIDA 32505
BID TABULATION

Awarded Items are highlighted

BID TITLE: Miscellaneous Foods

Where two prices are shown: the bottom price is the bid case/pack size and the

top price is unit/portion price needed to determine low cost because of vendor differences in case count.

ITEM Flour, White Sugar, Corn Bread Grits
Whole Wheat Granulated Mix
Quantity: 50 bg 50 bg 50 bg 100 bg
0505191 0511171 0506200 0506131
ITEM NUMBER 1-DELETE 2 3 4

Butler Foods NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Cantonment, FL
Churchfield Trading NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Santa Ynez, CA
Global Foods NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Las Vegas, NV
Harvest Hill Beverage NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Stamford, CT
J&J Snack Foods NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Pennsauken, NJ
Jennie-O Turkey Store NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Willmar, MN
Roses Delight
West Park, FL 19.69 au 29.98 au 36.08 au 33.79 au
Sysco Gulf Coast NO BID 0.8775 NO BID 0.7238 m
Geneva, AL 35.10 au 28.95 au
US Foods NO BID 3.055 5.145 2.61
Montgomery, AL 24.44 ay 30.87 ay 20.82 ay
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ITEM Breadstick, Breadstick, Breadstick, Breadstick
Whole Grain Cheese Filled Pretzel, Cheese Fruit Filled
Quantity: 1,600 cs 100 cs 100 cs 100 cs
0516642 0516640 0517250 0517270
ITEM NUMBER 5 6 7 8
Butler Foods NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Cantonment, FL
Churchfield Trading 0.11 m NO BID NO BID NO BID
Santa Ynez, CA 24.30 ay
Global Foods NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Las Vegas, NV
Harvest Hill Beverage NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Stamford, CT
J&J Snack Foods NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Pennsauken, NJ
Jennie-O Turkey Store NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Willmar, MN
Roses Delight 0.2338 0.4354 0.4707
West Park, FL 33.67 64.54 31.35 33.89
Sysco Gulf Coast 0.1327 0.3400 0.3466 0.3730
Geneva, AL 19.10 48.95 24.95 26.85
US Foods 0.134 m 0.343 NO BID 0.377
Montgomery, AL 19.37 49.47 27.14
ITEM Cookie Dough Oil, Veg. Eggs, Liquid Bacon,
Themed Canola Boil-In-Bag Turkey
Quantity: 1,050 cs 200 cs 200 cs 300 cs
0517370 050722 0530190 0517540
ITEM NUMBER 9 10 11 -DELETE 12
Butler Foods NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Cantonment, FL
Churchfield Trading NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Santa Ynez, CA
Global Foods NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Las Vegas, NV
Harvest Hill Beverage NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Stamford, CT
J&J Snack Foods 0.2188 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Pennsauken, NJ 31.50
Jennie-O Turkey Store NO BID NO BID NO BID 0.070 m
Willmar, MN 21.000
Roses Delight 0.2653 NO BID
West Park, FL 38.20 39.68 au 48.63 au
Sysco Gulf Coast NO BID 8.95 ay 1.6917 NO BID
Geneva, AL 35.80 ap 50.75 au
US Foods 0.25 11.68 au 7.53 NO BID
Montgomery, AL 36.54 46.74 ap 45.19 au
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ITEM Salt [100% Fruit Juice Fruit Strips Stuffing Mix
Shelf Stable, 40z 100% Fruit Whl Grain
Quantity: 48 cs 900 cs 300 cs 200 cs
0510780 New Item New Item New Item
ITEM NUMBER 13 14 15 16
Butler Foods NO BID 0.1966 ay NO BID NO BID
Cantonment, FL 8.65
Churchfield Trading NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Santa Ynez, CA
Global Foods NO BID NO BID 0.225 ay NO BID
Las Vegas, NV 40.950
Harvest Hill Beverage NO BID 0.15875 m NO BID NO BID
Stamford, CT 6.35 ay
J&J Snack Foods NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Pennsauken, NJ
Jennie-O Turkey Store NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Willmar, MN
Roses Delight 0.13 0.3810 ay 0.5684 ay 6.46
West Park, FL 27.38 15.24 56.84 77.47
Sysco Gulf Coast 0.5521 0.2100 ay NO BID NO BID
Geneva, AL 13.25 8.40
US Foods NO BID 0.20 ay NO BID 5.68 m
Montgomery, AL 8.97 68.19
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m = Minimum order

au = Alternate product bid. Product not approved in taste test or no sample was sent by bidder.
ay = Sample product was approved

mu = Minimum ship quantity bid is not acceptable for that item

ap= Alternate packaging container

BID TABULATION, RECOMMENDATIONS, AND PROTEST

Bid tabulations with award recommendations are posted for 72 hours in the Purchasing
Department Office and are also posted to the School District's website address at: http://ecsd-
fl.schoolloop.com/purchasing/bids.

Failure to file a protest within the time prescribed in Section 120.57(3) Florida Statutes will
constitute a waiver of proceedings under Chapter 120 Florida Statues and School Board
Rules. Bid tabulations or recommendations will be distributed solely through the Purchasing
website address. Notices will not be automatically mailed.

| hereby certify that the prices and bidders reflected herein are valid, and have been received
in compliance to Escambia County School Board Rules and Florida Law.

Vol Dombroskie

John Dombroskie, Director
Purchasing Department
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