THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY
n PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
75 North Pace Boulevard

Pensacola, FL 32505

El)i (23

BID AWARD NOTICE

DATE: BID TITLE & REFERENCE:
June 7, 2016 Copier/Printer/Computer/Electrical Supplies, Bid
#162304

DESCRIPTION OF PURCHASE:

An annual purchasing agreement to provide copier/printer/electrical parts and supplies (twenty-nine
(29) items bid; fifteen (15) items are awarded) to be stocked and distributed by the Central
Warehouse. Items not awarded are due to lack of bidder response or a failure to provide a sample to
be tested for acceptance. Items will be purchased on an as needed basis to replenish the Central
Warehouse inventory. Bid award to the lowest bidder(s) meeting specifications and delivery needs.

Effective Dates: June 22, 2016 through June 21, 2017.

REQUESTED BY:

Central Warehouse/Information Technology

SUPPLIER NAME: ITEMS AWARDED: ESTIMATED EXPENDITURE:

Ace Office, Orlando, FL 1 $ 31,600.00
Automated Technical Service (ATS), Pride, LA 6 17,894.60
CDW Government, LLC, Vernon Hills, IL 1 212,500.00
MTS Partners, Inc., Larkspur, CA 1 9,360.00
5
1

Pyramid School Products, Tampa, FL 18,713.60

Troxell Communications, Metairie, LA 400.50
AMOUNT OF PURCHASE: FUNDING SOURCE:

$290,468.70 Est. / Yr. General Fund (1110)
METHOD OF PROCUREMENT:

ECSD Bid Responses Received: 12 Responses Rejected: 2

DATE AND TIME POSTED:

June 7, 2016, 1:35pm Central Time

9500PUR101 (11/10) Retention - 5 Years



*%

Date:
Bid Number:
Bid Title:

F=Florida Business; O=0ut of State Business

THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
75 NORTH PACE BOULEVARD

PENSACOLA, FL 32505

BID TABULATION

18-May-16
162304

Copier/Printer/Computer/Electrical Supplies

Recommended Award

1/Toner Cleaning Cloth, Stretch/Dust

2/Wipe, Anti-Static and All Purpose

3/Electrical Extension Cord, 12

4/Canned Air, Precision Duster

+ |_Bid Item #/Description FL. Pref. Adj. Cleaning

Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price |Notes Bid Price Eval. Price |Notes Bid Price Eval. Price |Notes Bid Price Eval. Price |Notes
F |A Group LLC $12.00 $12.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
F [Ace Office Supplies NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
O |Automated Techical Sys 5% NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
O [B&H 5% NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
O [CDWG 5% NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
O |Devicewear 5% NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
O |iPrint Technologies 5% NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
O |Logista 5% NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
F [Pyramid $7.98 $7.98 1 $4.98 $4.98] A/NS NO BID NO BID $2.98 $2.98| A NS
O |Troxell Communications 5% NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Not Awarded Not Awarded Not Awarded Not Awarded
5/Flash Drive, 16GB, USB 2.0, for PC & 6/Drum Only, (Not a Kit), Shar . .

o Bid Item #/Descripton L. Pref. Ad) Mac ARM3;’51(455 Copigrs P 7/Developer, Sharp ARM 355/455 Copiers |8/Toner, Sharp, ARM 355/455 Copiers

Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price |Notes Bid Price Eval. Price |Notes Bid Price Eval. Price |Notes Bid Price Eval. Price |Notes
F |A Group LLC NO BID NO BID $49.00 $49.00 $35.00 $35.00 $59.00 $59.00
F [Ace Office Supplies NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
O |Automated Techical Sys 5% NO BID NO BID $18.07 $18.97 $25.20 $26.46 $34.64 $36.37
O [B&H 5% $4.99 $5.24] A NS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
O [CDWG 5% $4.03 $4.23| A NS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
O |Devicewear 5% NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
O |iPrint Technologies 5% NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
O |Logista 5% $7.50 $7.88] A NS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
F [Pyramid NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
O |Troxell Communications 5% NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Not Awarded
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9/Developer, Sharp, MX-M363, M453,

10/Drum only, (Not a kit), Sharp, MX-

11/Toner, Sharp, MX-M363, M453, M503

12/Toner, Lexmark Printer for E460

Bid Item #/Description ) M503 Copiers M363, M453, M503 Copiers Copiers Series Printers
EE3 FL. Pref. Adj.
. Bid Price Eval. Price [Notes Bid Price Eval. Price |Notes Bid Price Eval. Price |Notes Bid Price Eval. Price |Notes
Bidder Name
F |A Group LLC $60.00 $60.00 $39.00 $39.00 $61.00 $61.00 $259.00 $259.00
F |Ace Office Supplies NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $197.50 $197.50
O [Automated Techical Sys 5% $50.80 $53.34 $23.27 $24.43 $39.40 $41.37 NO BID NO BID
O |B&H 5% NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
O |CDWG 5% NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $261.72 $274.81
O |Devicewear 5% NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
O |iPrint Technologies 5% NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $233.00 $244.65
O |Logista 5% NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
F |Pyramid NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
O |Troxell Communications 5% NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
13/Toner Lexmark Printer for MS- 14/Mouse pad, computer approx. 8.5" x e s e 16/Cord, Extension 50ft. 14/3 SJ,
- Bid ltem #/Descripton FL. Pref. Adj. 510DN & MS-610 Series Printers 9.75" Round, Outdoor cord with 3 prong
. Bid Price Eval. Price [Notes Bid Price Eval. Price  |Notes Bid Price Eval. Price |Notes Bid Price Eval. Price |Notes
Bidder Name
F |A Group LLC $289.00 $289.00 $3.50 $3.50 $22.00 $22.00 NO BID NO BID
F [Ace Office Supplies $247.50 $247.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
O |Automated Techical Sys 5% NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
O [B&H 5% NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
O [CDWG 5% $283.88 $298.07 NO BID NO BID $14.15 $14.86 NO BID NO BID
O |Devicewear 5% NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
O |iPrint Technologies 5% $234.00 $245.70 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
O |Logista 5% NO BID NO BID $1.25 $1.31 $13.85 $14.54 NO BID NO BID
F [Pyramid NO BID NO BID $2.98 $2.98 1 $14.29 $14.29 M60 $21.89 $21.89| Mm24
O |Troxell Communications 5% NO BID NO BID $0.89 $0.93| M$500 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
rizﬁiz;ﬂi%ﬁxi;zx:;iPél:)?('j 18/Tape, Electical, Vinyl, 3/4" wide x 66' 19/Cap, Cord Male, replacement for 20/Receptacle, Duplex Ivory,
w | Bid Item #/Description FL. Pref. Adj. 15A/125v Roll extension cord 20A/125v 20A/125v Spec.
. Bid Price Eval. Price |Notes Bid Price Eval. Price |Notes Bid Price Eval. Price |Notes Bid Price Eval. Price |Notes
Bidder Name
F |A Group LLC NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
F [Ace Office Supplies NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
O |Automated Techical Sys 5% NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
O [B&H 5% NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
O [CDWG 5% NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
O |Devicewear 5% NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
O |iPrint Technologies 5% NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
O |Logista 5% NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
F [Pyramid NO BID NO BID $0.89 $0.89] A/ NS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
O |Troxell Communications 5% NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Not Awarded Not Awarded Not Awarded Not Awarded
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21/Receptacle, Ground Fault,

22/Speaker, 8" Paging w/Baffle.

23/Laminating Film, 25" wide x 500, 1"

24/Battery, Alkaline, Size "AA", 1.5

- Bid Item #/Descripton FL. Pref. Adj. 110/125v, Ivory, 20A/125V core, Clear volt

el Nemie Bid Price Eval. Price [Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price |Notes Bid Price Eval. Price |Notes
F |A Group LLC NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $43.00 $43.00] A/ NS NO BID NO BID
F [Ace Office Supplies NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $44.95 $44.95 NO BID NO BID
O |Automated Techical Sys 5% NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
O [B&H 5% NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
O [CDWG 5% NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
O |Devicewear 5% NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
O |iPrint Technologies 5% NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
O |Logista 5% NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
F [Pyramid NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $26.58 $26.58| M200 $1.00 $1.00 1
O |Troxell Communications 5% NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Not Awarded Not Awarded
. .. 25/Battery, Alkaline, Size "D" 1.5 Volt | 26/Battery, Alkaline, Size "C" 1.5 Volt 27/Battery, Alkaline, 9 Volt AslEeiiany, A, Hae et 1S

«« | Bid Item #/Description FL. Pref. Ad]. Volt

Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price [Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price |Notes Bid Price Eval. Price |Notes
F |A Group LLC NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
F [Ace Office Supplies NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
O |Automated Techical Sys 5% NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
O [B&H 5% NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
O [CDWG 5% NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
O |Devicewear 5% NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
O |iPrint Technologies 5% NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
O |Logista 5% NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
F [Pyramid $2.68 $2.68 2 $1.88 $1.88 2 $1.58 $1.58 2 $1.00 $1.00 3
O |Troxell Communications 5% NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Not Awarded Not Awarded Not Awarded
29/Chromebook sleeve, fits up to 14"

«x | Bid ltem #/Descripton FL. Pref. Adj. devices

Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price |Notes
F |A Group LLC $13.00 $13.00
F |Ace Office Supplies $10.59 $10.59
O |Automated Techical Sys 5% NO BID NO BID
O |B&H 5% NO BID NO BID
O |CDWG 5% $8.50 $8.93 4
O [Devicewear 5% $7.94 $8.34| pallet est.
O |iPrint Technologies 5% NO BID NO BID
O [Logista 5% $9.15 $9.61
F |Pyramid NO BID NO BID
O |Troxell Communications 5% $8.85 $9.29
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NOTES:

A Alternate Item Bid

DNBAS Did not bid as specified

M(#) Minimum quantity that must be ordered

M($) Minimum amount that must be ordered

NS No Sample provided

NP Not provided

1 Full cases only

2 Alternate pack size, would be supplied in packs of 12 and 6 packs to a case
3 Case=36 packs of 4qty each

4  Award determined by multiple evaluation factors including price and lead time.

BID TABULATION, RECOMMENDATIONS, AND PROTEST

Bid tabulations with award recommendations are posted for 72 hours in the Purchasing Department Office and are also posted to the School District's website address at: http://ecsd-
fl.schoolloop.com/purchasing/bids. Failure to file a protest within the time prescribed in Section 120.57(3) Florida Statutes will constitute a waiver of proceedings under Chapter 120 Florida
Statues and School Board Rules. Bid tabulations or recommendations will be distributed solely through the Purchasing website address. Notices will not be automatically mailed.

I hereby certify that the prices and bidders reflected herein are valid, and have been received in compliance to Escambia County School Board Rules and Florida Law.

Vol Dombroskie

John Dombroskie, Director
Purchasing Department
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