
 

 
 
 
DATE: BID TITLE & REFERENCE: 
May 8, 2015  Cafeteria Equipment, Bid #153102 
 
DESCRIPTION OF PURCHASE: 

 

An annual pricing agreement to provide equipment to school cafeterias throughout the District. Forty-
two (42) items bid and thirty-eight (38) items are awarded.  Items #31, 32 and 38 were not awarded 
because: the items requested were not bid upon and no documentation was received for any 
alternate products, or the equipment for which documentation was received was not deemed 
acceptable.  Upon the recommendation of the Maintenance Department, Item #42 was not awarded 
because no acceptable alternate product was offered.  Items will be purchased as needed to meet 
cafeteria needs.  Bid award(s) to the lowest bidder(s) meeting specifications.  
 
Effective Dates: May 21, 2015 through May 20, 2016. 
 
 
 
 
 

  
REQUESTED BY: 

 

      Food Services 
 
    
SUPPLIER NAME:                  ITEMS AWARDED:         ESTIMATED ANNUAL EXPENDITURE:
  
      Birmingham Restaurant Supply, Birmingham, AL           5                               $  66,300.00 
      Hotel & Restaurant Supply, Gulfport, MS                        4                                 155,600.00  
      KESCO, Pensacola, FL                                                 20                                 308,200.00 
      Mobile Fixture, Mobile, AL                                               9                                 117,100.00 
  
    
AMOUNT OF PURCHASE:  FUNDING SOURCE: 

 

$647,200.00 Est. / Yr. Food Services Fund (4110) 
 

  
METHOD OF PROCUREMENT: 

 

ECSD Bid      Responses Received: 7      Responses Rejected: 2 
   

  
DATE AND TIME POSTED: 

 

May 8, 2015, 4:00 pm Central Time 
 
 
9500PUR101 (11/10) Retention - 5 Years 

 
THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY 

PURCHASING DEPARTMENT 
75 North Pace Blvd.  

Pensacola, FL  32505 
 

BID AWARD NOTICE 



DATE:  April 16, 2015

BID NBR:  153102
BID TITLE:  Cafeteria Equipment

Top Price: Equipment - Delivery  Only                                Bottom Price: Full Installation
                                                           

ITEM
2 Door Reach 1 Section

Quantity: 2 ea 5 ea 1 ea 1 ea

ITEM NUMBER 1 2 3 4
Brimingham Rest. Sup. 2,548.00 4,411.00 6,967.00 NO BID
Birmingham, AL 2,598.00 4,461.00 7,042.00 a,u
General Hotel & Rest. Sup. 3,370.63 4,982.11 NO BID NO BID
Miami Lakes, FL NO BID NO BID
Hotel & Restaurant Supply 3,438.00 4,698.00 NO BID NO BID
Gulfport, MS 3,438.00 4,698.00
Kesco Kit Equip. & Supply 3,200.00 3,645.00 4,925.00 3,250.00
Pensacola, FL 3,200.00 3,645.00 4,925.00 a,y 3,250.00 a,y
Kesco Kit Equip. & Supply 3,000.00 2,520.00 NO BID NO BID
Pensacola, FL 3,000.00 2,520.00 a,y
Kesco Kit Equip. & Supply 2,950.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Pensacola, FL 2,950.00 a,y
Mobile Fixture 2,839.59 3,970.56 7,027.92 3,971.25
Mobile, AL 2,839.59 3,970.56 7,027.92 a,u 3,971.25 a,u

ITEM
  Cold Food -79" Cold Food -64" Drop, 8 cap. Drop, 12 cap.

Quantity: 2 ea 2 ea 6 ea 4 ea

ITEM NUMBER 5 6 7 8
Brimingham Rest. Sup. NO BID NO BID 1,912.00 2,153.00
Birmingham, AL 1,962.00 2,203.00
General Hotel & Rest. Sup. NO BID NO BID 2,442.90 2,732.07
Miami Lakes, FL NO BID NO BID
Hotel & Restaurant Supply NO BID NO BID 2,295.00 2,576.00
Gulfport, MS 2,295.00 2,576.00
Kesco Kit Equip. & Supply 9,850.00 8,800.00 2,100.00 2,430.00
Pensacola, FL 9,850.00 a,y 8,800.00 a,y 2,100.00 2,430.00
Kesco Kit Equip. & Supply NO BID NO BID 3,300.00 3,650.00
Pensacola, FL 3,300.00 a,y 3,650.00 a,y
Mobile Fixture 11,095.30 9,923.35 2,090.72  NO BID
Mobile, AL 11,095.30 a,y 9,923.35 a,y 2,090.72

Refrig. Display half, pass thru

Refrig. Salad Bar Refrig. Salad Bar Milk Cooler, Dou.

THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

75 NORTH PACE BOULEVARD
PENSACOLA, FLORIDA 32505

BID TABULATION

Awarded Items are highlighted

Refrigerator/ Refrigerator/ Refrig./1 Sect, 2 Pass thru table top

Milk Cooler, Dou.
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ITEM
Access, 24.5 Cu Wall, 23.5 Cu. Small Large

Quantity: 2 ea 1 ea 5 ea 5 ea

ITEM NUMBER 9 10 11 12
Brimingham Rest. Sup. 2,843.00 2,390.00 802.00 839.00
Birmingham, AL 2,893.00 2,440.00 852.00 889.00
Bresco, Inc, 3,036.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Birmingham, AL 3,086.00
General Hotel & Rest. Sup. 2,999.32  NO BID 869.12 908.83
Miami Lakes, FL NO BID a,u  NO BID  NO BID
Hotel & Restaurant Supply NO BID  NO BID NO BID  NO BID
Gulfport, MS
Kesco Kit Equip. & Supply 3,300.00 1,885.00 675.00 710.00
Pensacola, FL 3,300.00 1,885.00 725.00 760.00
Mobile Fixture 2,354.31 2,383.02 675.62 2,061.04
Mobile, AL 2,354.31 2,383.02 675.62 2,061.04

ITEM
 Conv. Oven, Gas

Quantity: 5 ea 5 ea 10 ea 1 ea

ITEM NUMBER 13 14 15 16
Brimingham Rest. Sup. 2,520.00 2,520.00 9,575.00 11,715.00
Birmingham, AL 2,720.00 2,720.00 9,675.00 11,815.00
General Hotel & Rest. Sup. 2,576.02 2,572.34 9,194.53 12,170.74
Miami Lakes, FL 2,861.02 2,857.34 NO BID NO BID
Hotel & Restaurant Supply NO BID NO BID 9,964.00 11,689.00
Gulfport, MS 9,964.00 11,689.00
Kesco Kit Equip. & Supply 2,180.00 2,230.00 f 8,695.00 11,550.00
Pensacola, FL 2,250.00 f 2,300.00 f 8,695.00 11,590.00
Kesco Kit Equip. & Supply NO BID NO BID NO BID 11,400.00
Pensacola, FL 11,440.00
Mobile Fixture 2,220.88 2,118.00 9,313.62 11,448.32
Mobile, AL 2,520.88 2,418.00 9,713.62 11,848.32

Ice Maker, Large Ice Maker, Small Comm. Dou. Stack

Milk Cooler/Dual Milk Cooler/Cold Ice Stoorage Bin

Skillet, Gas, 30Ga.
Power Tilting

Ice Storage Bin
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ITEM
Pan Cap., Gas Dou. Stack, Gas 2 Burner    Table

Quantity: 5 ea 10 ea 1 ea 2 ea

ITEM NUMBER 17 18 19 20
Brimingham Rest. Sup. 15,538.00 12,267.00 2,180.00 NO BID
Birmingham, AL 16,138.00 a,u 12,542.00 2,250.00
General Hotel & Rest. Sup. 15,419.51 12,960.63 NO BID NO BID
Miami Lakes, FL NO BID a,y NO BID
Hotel & Restaurant Supply 16,760.00 12,166.00 NO BID NO BID
Gulfport, MS 16,760.00 a,u 12,166.00
Kesco Kit Equip. & Supply 18,500.00 12,420.00 f 2,150.00 6,900.00
Pensacola, FL 18,500.00 a,y 12,530.00 fl 2,230.00 6,950.00 a,y
Kesco Kit Equip. & Supply 14,500.00 12,160.00 f NO BID NO BID
Pensacola, FL 14,500.00 a,y 12,270.00 fl
Mobile Fixture 19,301.17 13,111.72 2,108.05 7,668.91
Mobile, AL 19,701.17 a,u 13,511.72 2,508.05 7,668.91

ITEM
Case, 30"W (Insulated) Low (Insulated) High

Quantity: 1 ea 2 ea 10 ea 12 ea

ITEM NUMBER 21 22 23 24
Brimingham Rest. Sup. 2,379.30 5,248.00 3,569.00 3,990.00
Birmingham, AL 2,379.30 5,248.00 3,569.00 3,990.00
General Hotel & Rest. Sup. 2,624.66 3,163.93 4,177.37 4,732.76
Miami Lakes, FL NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID
Hotel & Restaurant Supply 2,226.53 2,623.00 3,653.00 3,997.00
Gulfport, MS 2,226.53 2,623.00 3,653.00 3,997.00
Kesco Kit Equip. & Supply 2,332.55 2,750.00
Pensacola, FL 2,332.55 2,750.00 NO BID NO BID
Kesco Kit Equip. & Supply 2,550.00 3,900.00 4,250.00
Pensacola, FL NO BID 2,550.00 a,y 3,900.00 4,250.00
Mobile Fixture 2,332.55 2,589.16 3,523.72 3,955.48
Mobile, AL 2,332.55 2,589.16 3,523.72 3,955.48

Hot Food Display Hot Cabinet Hot Cabinet

Range,  Combi Oven, 10 Conv.Steamer

Hot Cabinet

Hot Food
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ITEM
Door, Pass Thru   Electric, Auto Electric, Gravity Electric

Quantity: 2 ea 5 ea 5 ea 10 ea

ITEM NUMBER 25 26 27 28
Brimingham Rest. Sup. 4,370.00 4,663.00 3,551.00 1,340.00
Birmingham, AL 4,370.00 a,u 4,693.00 3,581.00 1,340.00 a,u
General Hotel & Rest. Sup. 4,905.09 5,591.64 3,985.75 1,498.00
Miami Lakes, FL NO BID a,u NO BID NO BID NO BID
Hotel & Restaurant Supply 4,699.00 5,095.00 3,725.00 1,184.00
Gulfport, MS 4,699.00 a,u 5,095.00 3,725.00 1,184.00
Kesco Kit Equip. & Supply 4,380.00 5,100.00 3,795.00 1,200.00
Pensacola, FL 4,380.00 a,y 5,100.00 3,795.00 1,200.00
Mobile Fixture 4,589.58 5,276.00 3,725.00 1,301.05
Mobile, AL 4,589.58 a,u 5,276.00 3,725.00 1,301.05

ITEM
Chopper 30 Qt. w/Backsplash -72" w/Backsplash -60"

Quantity: 5 ea 3 ea 3 ea 10 ea
DELETE DELETE

ITEM NUMBER 29 30 31 32
Brimingham Rest. Sup. 4,225.00 6,905.00 625.00 625.00
Birmingham, AL 4,225.00 6,955.00 655.00 a,u 655.00 a,u
General Hotel & Rest. Sup. 4,451.29 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Miami Lakes, FL NO BID
Hotel & Restaurant Supply 3,974.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Gulfport, MS 3,974.00
Kesco Kit Equip. & Supply 3,990.00 6,450.00 250.00 230.00
Pensacola, FL 3,990.00 6,450.00 270.00 a,u 250.00 a,u
Mobile Fixture 4,206.01 8,541.44 411.51 312.46
Mobile, AL 4,206.01 8,541.44 411.51 a,u 312.46 a,u

Food Food Mixer Prep Table

Hot Cabinet,2-1/2 Food Slicer Food Slicer,

Prep Table

Can Opener
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ITEM
Kit/ 5 Shelves-72" Kit/ 5 Shelves-60" Kit/ 5 Shelves-48"

Quantity: 10 ea 10 ea 10 ea 1 ea

ITEM NUMBER 33 34 35 36
Brimingham Rest. Sup. 345.10 302.00 263.00 550.00
Birmingham, AL 369.10 a,u 326.00 a,u 287.00 a,u 575.00
General Hotel & Rest. Sup. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Miami Lakes, FL
Hotel & Restaurant Supply NO BID NO BID NO BID 558.00
Gulfport, MS 558.00
Kesco Kit Equip. & Supply 360.00 350.00 280.00 555.00
Pensacola, FL 380.00 a,y 370.00 a,y 300.00 a,y 555.00
Mobile Fixture 338.12 295.27 255.87 570.13
Mobile, AL 338.12 a,u 295.27 a,y 255.87 a,y 570.13

ITEM
Large Small 2 Shelf 3 Shelf

Quantity: 5 ea 5 ea 5 ea 5 ea
DELETE

ITEM NUMBER 37 38 39 40
Brimingham Rest. Sup. NO BID NO BID NO BID 149.80
Birmingham, AL 149.80
General Hotel & Rest. Sup. 742.00 625.19 319.00 238.00
Miami Lakes, FL NO BID a,u NO BID a,u NO BID NO BID
Hotel & Restaurant Supply NO BID NO BID 189.06 144.00
Gulfport, MS 189.06 144.00
Kesco Kit Equip. & Supply 1,175.00 510.00 185.00 145.00
Pensacola, FL 1,175.00 a,y 510.00 a,u 185.00 155.00
Mobile Fixture 1,049.99 966.56 140.59 131.40
Mobile, AL 1,049.99 a,u 966.56 a,u 140.59 131.40

Utility Cart Utility Cart Utility Kit. Cart

Shelving Hvy Duty Shelving Hvy Duty Shelving Hvy Duty

Utility Kit. Cart

Can Rack/Hvy Duty
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ITEM
Cartridge Machine

Quantity: 250 ea 3 ea
DELETE

ITEM NUMBER 41 42
Brimingham Rest. Sup. NO BID NO BID
Birmingham, AL
General Hotel & Rest. Sup. NO BID NO BID
Miami Lakes, FL
Hotel & Restaurant Supply 59.40 NO BID
Gulfport, MS 59.40
Kesco Kit Equip. & Supply 62.00 NO BID
Pensacola, FL 82.00
Kesco Kit Equip. & Supply NO BID 23,800.00
Pensacola, FL -Bellview 25,800.00 a,u
Kesco Kit Equip. & Supply NO BID 23,800.00
Pensacola, FL -Ensley 26,300.00 a,u
Kesco Kit Equip. & Supply NO BID 24,440.00
Pensacola, FL -Longleaf 26,440.00 a,u
Kesco Kit Equip. & Supply NO BID 16,150.00
Pensacola, FL-Myrtle Grov 20,150.00 a,u
Mobile Fixture 48.92
Mobile, AL 48.92 NO BID
Mobile Fixture NO BID 29,731.04
Mobile, AL-Bellview 30,731.04 a,u
Mobile Fixture NO BID 29,731.04
Mobile, AL-Ensley 30,731.04 a,u
Mobile Fixture 29,731.04
Mobile, AL-Longleaf NO BID 30,731.04 a,u
Mobile Fixture 23,247.00
Mobile, AL-Myrtle Grove NO BID 24,447.00 a,u

N - No prior approved brand
a = Alternate bid 
m = Vendor bid minimum shipment
p = Pack size not acceptable
u = Unacceptable, no sample sent or sample not approved
y = Sample received and approved
mu=minimum not acceptable
ea= price per each
f= filter accessory included in pricing
fl=filter accessary labor/install included in pricing

Steamer Filter Dishwashing
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BID TABULATION, RECOMMENDATIONS, AND PROTEST
Bid tabulations with award recommendations are posted for 72 hours in the Purchasing Department Office and are 
also posted to the School District's website address at: http://ecsd-fl.schoolloop.com/purchasing/bids.

Failure to file a protest within the time prescribed in Section 120.57(3) Florida Statutes will constitute a waiver of 
proceedings under Chapter 120 Florida Statues and School Board Rules.  Bid tabulations or recommendations will 
be distributed solely through the Purchasing website address.  Notices will not be automatically mailed.

I hereby certify that the prices and bidders reflected herein are valid, and have been received in compliance to 
Escambia County School Board Rules and Florida Law.

John Dombroskie
John Dombroskie, Director
Purchasing Department
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