THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY
n PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

75 North Pace Blvd.

Pensacola, FL 32505

El)i (23

BID AWARD NOTICE

DATE: BID TITLE & REFERENCE:
February 3, 2015 Food Processing: USDA Commodities, RFP #151803

DESCRIPTION OF PURCHASE:

An annual agreement to provide food processing of USDA commodity items into ready to use
products for use in the preparation of school lunches as stocked and distributed by the Central
Warehouse for school cafeterias throughout the District. This bid is awarded by commodity/lot and
not by line item. Bidders meeting specifications with the aggregate low price for the commaodity/lot
are awarded each area. Fifty-five (55) items bid; forty-six (46) items are awarded.

Effective Dates: August 1, 2015 through July 31, 2016.

REQUESTED BY:

Food Services

SUPPLIER NAME: ITEMS AWARDED: ESTIMATED EXPENDITURE:
Asian Food Solutions, Oviedo, FL 5 $ 296,100.00
Bongards, Bongards, MN 8 80,800.00
Brookwood Farms, Siler City, NC 1 12,400.00
ConAgra, Troy, OH 2 76,200.00
Don Lee Farms, Inglewood, CA 4 61,100.00
High Liner Foods, Portsmouth, NH 1 2,300.00
Jennie-O, Willmar, MN 5 185,600.00
JTM, Harrison, OH 6 139,500.00
McCain Foods, Lisle, IL 2 47,300.00
Pilgrim’s Pride, Tucker, GA 4 385,100.00
Red Gold, Elwood, IN 6 160,100.00
Tasty Brands, Syosset, NY 2 96,300.00

AMOUNT OF PURCHASE: FUNDING SOURCE:
$1,542,800.00 Est. / Yr. Food Services Fund (4110)

METHOD OF PROCUREMENT:

ECSD RFP Responses Received: 23

DATE AND TIME POSTED:

February 3, 2015, 2:00 pm Central Time

9500PUR101 (11/10) Retention - 5 Years



THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY

DATE: January 22, 2015
BID NBR: 151803
BID TITLE: Food Processing: USDA Commaodities

PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
75 NORTH PACE BOULEVARD
PENSACOLA, FLORIDA 32505

BID TABULATION

Awarded Items are highlighted

Cargill ConAgra
Item Advance American Asian Food Brookwood Cargill Meat |Kitchen Chef's Corner Foods Sales, Giorgio Don Lee
No. Vendor Pierre Foods |[Foods Group |Solutions Bongard Farms Inc. Solutions Solutions Foods LLC E S Foods Foods, Inc. Farms
Sweet and Sour Chicken
1 (0516820) No Bid No Bid (m) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand: Green Dragon Chef's Corner
Commodity Code #: 72005 CMDTYWG-0116
Commercial Code #: COMWG-0116
Portion Size: 3.900 3.920
Portions/Case: 176 171
Case Size: 42.90 42.00
Fee for Service/ Case: 83.07 27.09
Total Price/ Portion (Includes DF $ Value) .5950 .6626
Smoked BBQ Teriyaki Chicken
2 (0516830) No Bid No Bid (m) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid @ () No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand: Green Dragon Chef's Corner
Commodity Code #: 73001 CMDTY-0117B
Commercial Code #: COM-0117B
Portion Size: 2.850 2.800
Portions/Case: 240 240
Case Size: 42.90 42.00
Fee for Service/ Case: 78.24 27.88
Total Price/ Portion (Includes DF $ Value) .4460 .4000
Mandarin Orange Chicken
3 (0516840) No Bid No Bid (m) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand: Green Dragon Chef's Corner
Commodity Code #: 72001 CMDTYWG-0111
Commercial Code #: COMWG-0111
Portion Size: 3.900 3.920
Portions/Case: 176 171
Case Size: 42.90 42.00
Fee for Service/ Case: 80.96 27.88
Total Price/ Portion (Includes DF $ Value) .5830 .6400
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Cargill ConAgra
Item Advance American Asian Food Brookwood Cargill Meat |Kitchen Chef's Corner Foods Sales, Giorgio Don Lee
No. Vendor Pierre Foods |[Foods Group |Solutions Bongard Farms Inc. Solutions Solutions Foods LLC E S Foods Foods, Inc. Farms
Kung Pao Chicken w/o Vegs
4 (0516851) No Bid No Bid (m) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid @ () No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand: Green Dragon Chef's Corner
Commodity Code #: 73003 CMDTY-0113B
Commercial Code #: COM-0113B
Portion Size: 2.850 2.800
Portions/Case: 240 240
Case Size: 42.90 42.00
Fee for Service/ Case: 78.24 27.88
Total Price/ Portion (Includes DF $ Value) 4460 .4000
Chicken, 8 Piece Breaded
5 (0516550) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand:
Commodity Code #:
Commercial Code #:
N/A |Portion Size:
Portions/Case:
Case Size:
Fee for Service/ Case:
Total Price/ Portion (Includes DF $ Value)
Chicken, 8 Piece, Roasted
6 (0516540) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand:
Commodity Code #:
Commercial Code #:
N/A |Portion Size:
Portions/Case:
Case Size:

Fee for Service/ Case:

Total Price/ Portion (Includes DF $ Value)
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Item
No.

Vendor

Advance
Pierre Foods

American
Foods Group

Asian Food
Solutions

Bongard

Brookwood
Farms Inc.

Cargill Meat
Solutions

Cargill
Kitchen
Solutions

Chef's Corner
Foods

ConAgra
Foods Sales,
LLC

E S Foods

Giorgio

Foods, Inc.

Don Lee
Farms

Chicken Patty, Small, Breaded
(0516581)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Brand:

Commodity Code #:

N/A

Commercial Code #:

Portion Size:

Portions/Case:

Case Size:

Fee for Service/ Case:

Total Price/ Portion (Includes DF $ Value)

Chicken Patty, Home-style Brd.
(0516901)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Brand:

Commodity Code #:

N/A

Commercial Code #:

Portion Size:

Portions/Case:

Case Size:

Fee for Service/ Case:

Total Price/ Portion (Includes DF $ Value)

Chick Patty, Hot & Spicy, Brd.
(0516910)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Brand:

Commodity Code #:

N/A

Commercial Code #:

Portion Size:

Portions/Case:

Case Size:

Fee for Service/ Case:

Total Price/ Portion (Includes DF $ Value)
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Item
No.

Vendor

Advance
Pierre Foods

American
Foods Group

Asian Food
Solutions

Bongard

Brookwood
Farms Inc.

Cargill Meat
Solutions

Cargill
Kitchen
Solutions

Chef's Corner
Foods

ConAgra
Foods Sales,
LLC

E S Foods

Giorgio

Foods, Inc.

Don Lee
Farms

10

Chick Tend-Shaped Strips, Brd.
(0516860)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Brand:

Commodity Code #:

Commercial Code #:

Portion Size:

Portions/Case:

Case Size:

Fee for Service/ Case:

Total Price/ Portion (Includes DF $ Value)

11

Chick Tend, Whole Muscle, Brd.
(0516650)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Brand:

Commodity Code #:

N/A

Commercial Code #:

Portion Size:

Portions/Case:

Case Size:

Fee for Service/ Case:

Total Price/ Portion (Includes DF $ Value)

12

Popcorn Chicken, Breaded
(0516871)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Brand:

Commodity Code #:

Commercial Code #:

Portion Size:

Portions/Case:

Case Size:

Fee for Service/ Case:

Total Price/ Portion (Includes DF $ Value)

4 of 38




Item
No.

Vendor

Advance
Pierre Foods

American
Foods Group

Asian Food
Solutions

Bongard

Brookwood
Farms Inc.

Cargill Meat
Solutions

Cargill
Kitchen
Solutions

Chef's Corner
Foods

ConAgra
Foods Sales,
LLC

E S Foods

Giorgio

Foods, Inc.

Don Lee
Farms

13

Popcorn Chicken , Spicy, Brd.
(0516880)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Brand:

Commodity Code #:

N/A

Commercial Code #:

Portion Size:

Portions/Case:

Case Size:

Fee for Service/ Case:

Total Price/ Portion (Includes DF $ Value)

14

Chicken Breast Filets, Whole Muscle,
Bread.
(0516930)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Brand:

Commodity Code #:

Commercial Code #:

Portion Size:

Portions/Case:

Case Size:

Fee for Service/ Case:

Total Price/ Portion (Includes DF $ Value)

15

Chicken Fajita Strips
(0516890)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Brand:

Green Dragon

Commodity Code #:

78800

Commercial Code #:

Portion Size:

2.000

Portions/Case:

320

Case Size:

42.90

Fee for Service/ Case:

88.00

Total Price/ Portion (Includes DF $ Value)

.3950
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Cargill ConAgra

Item Advance American Asian Food Brookwood Cargill Meat |Kitchen Chef's Corner Foods Sales, Giorgio Don Lee

No. Vendor Pierre Foods |[Foods Group |Solutions Bongard Farms Inc. Solutions Solutions Foods LLC E S Foods Foods, Inc. Farms
Grilled Chicken Patty

16 (0516560) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand:
Commodity Code #:
Commercial Code #:
Portion Size:
Portions/Case:
Case Size:
Fee for Service/ Case:
Total Price/ Portion (Includes DF $ Value)
Beef Crumbles

17 (0516970) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid (a) (Y)
Brand: APF American Fds Don Lee
Commodity Code #: 1-320610-20  [290863 CNQ21104
Commercial Code #: 3-320610-20 |290862 CN21104
Portion Size: 2.000 2.000 2.50
Portions/Case: 267 240 256
Case Size: 30.00 30.00 40.0
Fee for Service/ Case: 23.66 26.00 28.96
Total Price/ Portion (Includes DF $ Value) .4069 .2750/.2700 4397
Beef Taco Meat, Reduced Sod.

18 (0516170) (@) (u) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand: APF Don Lee
Commodity Code #: 32432-328 CNQK12500
Commercial Code #: 32432-330 CNK12500
Portion Size: 2.400 3.030
Portions/Case: 220 158
Case Size: 33.00 30.00
Fee for Service/ Case: 31.90 23.31
Total Price/ Portion (Includes DF $ Value) |.4067 4456
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Item
No.

Vendor

Advance
Pierre Foods

American
Foods Group

Asian Food
Solutions

Bongard

Brookwood
Farms Inc.

Cargill Meat
Solutions

Cargill
Kitchen
Solutions

Chef's Corner
Foods

ConAgra
Foods Sales,
LLC

E S Foods

Giorgio

Foods, Inc.

Don Lee
Farms

19

Beef Meatballs
(0516191)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Brand:

APF

American Fds

Don Lee

Commodity Code #:

1-17-505-0

290855

CNQ28053VS

Commercial Code #:

3-17-505-0

290854

CN28053VS

Portion Size:

2.500

0.500

2.000

Portions/Case:

192

960

240

Case Size:

30.00

30.00

30.00

Fee for Service/ Case:

24.96

26.61

24.78

Total Price/ Portion (Includes DF $ Value)

4784

.1072/.1050

4443

20

Turkey Sausage Patty
(0516210)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Brand:

Commodity Code #:

Commercial Code #:

Portion Size:

Portions/Case:

Case Size:

Fee for Service/ Case:

Total Price/ Portion (Includes DF $ Value)

21

Turkey Ham
(0516221)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Brand:

Commodity Code #:

Commercial Code #:

Portion Size:

Portions/Case:

Case Size:

Fee for Service/ Case:

Total Price/ Portion (Includes DF $ Value)
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Cargill ConAgra
Item Advance American Asian Food Brookwood Cargill Meat |Kitchen Chef's Corner Foods Sales, Giorgio Don Lee
No. Vendor Pierre Foods |[Foods Group |Solutions Bongard Farms Inc. Solutions Solutions Foods LLC E S Foods Foods, Inc. Farms
Turkey Ham , Deli Style,
Pre-sliced
22 (0516220) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand: Harvest Prov.
Commodity Code #: 700275
Commercial Code #: 700275
Portion Size: 3.430
Portions/Case: 140
Case Size: 30.00
Fee for Service/ Case: 67.66
Total Price/ Portion (Includes DF $ Value) .7260
Roast Turkey Breast, Deli Style,
Pre-sliced
23 (0516340) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand: Harvest Prov.
Commodity Code #: 700168
Commercial Code #: 700168
Portion Size: 3.930
Portions/Case: 122
Case Size: 30.00
Fee for Service/ Case: 62.62
Total Price/ Portion (Includes DF $ Value) .7800
Turkey Roast
24 (0516311) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand: Harvest Prov.
Commodity Code #: 8700131
Commercial Code #: 8700131
Portion Size: 3.130
Portions/Case: 97
Case Size: 19.00
Fee for Service/ Case: 1.510
Total Price/ Portion (Includes DF $ Value) .5390

8 of 38




Cargill ConAgra

Item Advance American Asian Food Brookwood Cargill Meat |Kitchen Chef's Corner Foods Sales, Giorgio Don Lee

No. Vendor Pierre Foods |[Foods Group |Solutions Bongard Farms Inc. Solutions Solutions Foods LLC E S Foods Foods, Inc. Farms
Beef, Flame Broiled Patty

25 (0516113) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid (a) (Y)
Brand: APF American Fds Don Lee
Commodity Code #: 1-155-525-20 [290807 CNQ212503
Commercial Code #: 155-525-20 290806 CN212503
Portion Size: 2.500 2.5 2.500
Portions/Case: 200 200 200
Case Size: 31.25 31.25 31.25
Fee for Service/ Case: 18.00 22.34 19.38
Total Price/ Portion (Includes DF $ Value)  |.4537 4744 1 .4640 4235
Country Fried Steak

26 (0516150) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand: APF Don Lee
Commodity Code #: 69035 CNQ633803
Commercial Code #: 68035 CN633503
Portion Size: 3.800 3.800
Portions/Case: 85 130
Case Size: 20.19 30.88
Fee for Service/ Case: 19.98 23.41
Total Price/ Portion (Includes DF $ Value)  |.7635 .6655
Beef Steak, Cooked, Breaded

27 (0516132) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand: Don Lee
Commodity Code #: CNQ621603
Commercial Code #: CN621603
Portion Size: 1.600
Portions/Case: 300
Case Size: 30.00
Fee for Service/ Case: 23.79
Total Price/ Portion (Includes DF $ Value) .3636
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Item
No.

Vendor

Advance
Pierre Foods

American
Foods Group

Asian Food
Solutions

Bongard

Brookwood
Farms Inc.

Cargill Meat
Solutions

Cargill
Kitchen
Solutions

Chef's Corner
Foods

ConAgra
Foods Sales,
LLC

E S Foods

Giorgio

Foods, Inc.

Don Lee
Farms

28

Beef, Mini Burgers
(0515120)

@ ™

@ ()

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

(a) (¥)

Brand:

APF

American Fds

Don Lee

Commodity Code #:

1-15-312-09

290813

CNQ211203

Commercial Code #:

15-312-09

290812

CN211203

Portion Size:

1.010

1.200

1.200

Portions/Case:

475

400

400

Case Size:

30.00

30.00

30.00

Fee for Service/ Case:

45.47

23.03

23.91

Total Price/ Portion (Includes DF $ Value)

2776

.2552 /.2495

.2136

29

Pork, Bib, Shredded
(0516940)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Brand:

Brookwood FM

Commodity Code #:

12307

Commercial Code #:

12013

Portion Size:

4.000

Portions/Case:

80

Case Size:

20.00

Fee for Service/ Case:

31.00

Total Price/ Portion (Includes DF $ Value)

.8260

30

Mozzarella Cheese, Shredded
(0516411)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Brand:

Bongards

Commodity Code #:

75507

Commercial Code #:

75507

Portion Size:

1.000

Portions/Case:

320

Case Size:

20.00

Fee for Service/ Case:

9.500

Total Price/ Portion (Includes DF $ Value)

.1610

10 of 38




Cargill ConAgra
Item Advance American Asian Food Brookwood Cargill Meat |Kitchen Chef's Corner Foods Sales, Giorgio Don Lee
No. Vendor Pierre Foods |[Foods Group |Solutions Bongard Farms Inc. Solutions Solutions Foods LLC E S Foods Foods, Inc. Farms
Cheese Portions, Mozzarella String,
Refrigerated
31 (0517030) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand: Bongards
Commodity Code #: 40295
Commercial Code #: 40295
Portion Size: 1.000
Portions/Case: 168
Case Size: 10.50
Fee for Service/ Case: 11.45
Total Price/ Portion (Includes DF $ Value) .1750
Cheese Sauce, Pouch, Cheddar, Reduced
Fat, Reduced Sodium, Refrigerated
32 (0517650) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand:
Commodity Code #:
Commercial Code #:
Portion Size:
Portions/Case:
Case Size:
Fee for Service/ Case:
Total Price/ Portion (Includes DF $ Value)
Jalapeno Cheese Sauce,
Reduced Fat
33 (0507172) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand:
Commodity Code #:
Commercial Code #:
Portion Size:
Portions/Case:
Case Size:

Fee for Service/ Case:

Total Price/ Portion (Includes DF $ Value)
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Cargill ConAgra
Item Advance American Asian Food Brookwood Cargill Meat |Kitchen Chef's Corner Foods Sales, Giorgio Don Lee
No. Vendor Pierre Foods |[Foods Group |Solutions Bongard Farms Inc. Solutions Solutions Foods LLC E S Foods Foods, Inc. Farms
American Cheese, Yellow, Sliced,
Reduced Fat and Reduced Sodium,
Refrigerated
34 (0516350) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid (@) (Y) No Bid No Bid
Brand: Bongards E S Foods
Commodity Code #: 10054 10129
Commercial Code #: 10054 10129
Portion Size: 0.500 0.500
Portions/Case: 640 960
Case Size: 20.00 30.00
Fee for Service/ Case: 12.40 26.70
Total Price/ Portion (Includes DF $ Value) .0660 .0777
American Cheese, White, Sliced,
Reduced Fat, Refrigerated
35 (0516352) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand: Bongards
Commodity Code #: 10050
Commercial Code #: 10050
Portion Size: 0.500
Portions/Case: 640
Case Size: 20.00
Fee for Service/ Case: 23.03
Total Price/ Portion (Includes DF $ Value) .0770
American Cheese,
5 Pound Loaves
36 (0516341) No Bid No Bid No Bid (a) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand: Bongards
Commodity Code #: 20263
Commercial Code #: 20263
Portion Size: 1.000
Portions/Case: 480
Case Size: 30.00
Fee for Service/ Case: 26.70
Total Price/ Portion (Includes DF $ Value) .1490
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Cargill ConAgra
Item Advance American Asian Food Brookwood Cargill Meat |Kitchen Chef's Corner Foods Sales, Giorgio Don Lee
No. Vendor Pierre Foods |[Foods Group |Solutions Bongard Farms Inc. Solutions Solutions Foods LLC E S Foods Foods, Inc. Farms
Cheese Portions, Cheddar Cheese,
37 Reduced Fat, Mld. Refrigerated 0517640) |No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand: Bongards
Commodity Code #: 40210
Commercial Code #: 40210
Portion Size: 1.000
Portions/Case: 96
Case Size: 6.000
Fee for Service/ Case: 7.680
Total Price/ Portion (Includes DF $ Value) .1870
Cheese, Swiss, Sliced, Reduced Fat,
Refrigerator
38 (0517500) No Bid No Bid No Bid (a) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand: Bongards
Commodity Code #: 75248
Commercial Code #: 75248
Portion Size: 0.750
Portions/Case: 256
Case Size: 12.00
Fee for Service/ Case: 14.79
Total Price/ Portion (Includes DF $ Value) .1560
Cheddar Cheese, Shredded, Reduced
Sodium, Refrigerated
39 (0516360) No Bid No Bid No Bid (a) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand: Bongards
Commodity Code #: 75571
Commercial Code #: 75571
Portion Size: 1.000
Portions/Case: 320
Case Size: 20.00
Fee for Service/ Case: 12.60
Total Price/ Portion (Includes DF $ Value) .1700
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Cargill ConAgra
Item Advance American Asian Food Brookwood Cargill Meat |Kitchen Chef's Corner Foods Sales, Giorgio Don Lee
No. Vendor Pierre Foods |[Foods Group |Solutions Bongard Farms Inc. Solutions Solutions Foods LLC E S Foods Foods, Inc. Farms
Macaroni and Cheese, Reduced Fat,
Reduced Sodium, Whole Grain
40 (0517600) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand: E S Foods
Commodity Code #: 5915
Commercial Code #: 5915
Portion Size: 6.000
Portions/Case: 80
Case Size: 30.00
Fee for Service/ Case: 34.89
Total Price/ Portion (Includes DF $ Value) .6109
Bread Sticks, Cheese Filled,
Reduced Fat
41 (0516640) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand: The Max
Commodity Code #: 77387-12722
Commercial Code #: 77387-12722
Portion Size: 1.950
Portions/Case: 192
Case Size: 23.40
Fee for Service/ Case: 24.83
Total Price/ Portion (Includes DF $ Value) .1293
Bread Sticks, Cheese Filled,
Reduced Fat
41 (0516640) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand: Gilardi
Commodity Code #: 16272-20117
Commercial Code #: 16272-20117
Portion Size: 2.210
Portions/Case: 144
Case Size: 19.89
Fee for Service/ Case: 29.94
Total Price/ Portion (Includes DF $ Value) .2079
Cheese Sticks, Mozzarella, Brd.
42 (0517660) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand:

Commodity Code #:

Commercial Code #:

Portion Size:

Portions/Case:

Case Size:

Fee for Service/ Case:

Total Price/ Portion (Includes DF $ Value)
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Cargill ConAgra
Item Advance American Asian Food Brookwood Cargill Meat |Kitchen Chef's Corner Foods Sales, Giorgio Don Lee
No. Vendor Pierre Foods |[Foods Group |Solutions Bongard Farms Inc. Solutions Solutions Foods LLC E S Foods Foods, Inc. Farms
Tomato Catsup, Shelf Stable
43 (0507090) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand:
Commodity Code #:
Commercial Code #:
Portion Size:
Portions/Case:
Case Size:
Fee for Service/ Case:
Total Price/ Portion (Includes DF $ Value)
Tomato Catsup, Individual,
Shelf Stable
44 (0507102) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand:
Commodity Code #:
Commercial Code #:
Portion Size:
Portions/Case:
Case Size:
Fee for Service/ Case:
Total Price/ Portion (Includes DF $ Value)
Canned Salsa, Shelf stable
45 (0502393) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand:

Commodity Code #:

Commercial Code #:

Portion Size:

Portions/Case:

Case Size:

Fee for Service/ Case:

Total Price/ Portion (Includes DF $ Value)
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Cargill ConAgra
Item Advance American Asian Food Brookwood Cargill Meat |Kitchen Chef's Corner Foods Sales, Giorgio Don Lee
No. Vendor Pierre Foods |[Foods Group |Solutions Bongard Farms Inc. Solutions Solutions Foods LLC E S Foods Foods, Inc. Farms
Salsa, Dipping Cup, Low Sodium, Shelf
Stable
46 (0507350) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand:
Commodity Code #:
Commercial Code #:
Portion Size:
Portions/Case:
Case Size:
Fee for Service/ Case:
Total Price/ Portion (Includes DF $ Value)
Marinara Sauce, Shelf Stable
47 (0505200) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand:
Commodity Code #:
Commercial Code #:
Portion Size:
Portions/Case:
Case Size:
Fee for Service/ Case:
Total Price/ Portion (Includes DF $ Value)
Spaghetti Sauce, Shelf Stable
48 (0508050) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand:

Commodity Code #:

Commercial Code #:

Portion Size:

Portions/Case:

Case Size:

Fee for Service/ Case:

Total Price/ Portion (Includes DF $ Value)
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Item
No.

Vendor

Advance
Pierre Foods

American
Foods Group

Asian Food
Solutions

Bongard

Brookwood
Farms Inc.

Cargill Meat
Solutions

Cargill
Kitchen
Solutions

Chef's Corner
Foods

ConAgra
Foods Sales,
LLC

E S Foods

Giorgio

Foods, Inc.

Don Lee
Farms

49

Whole Grain Cheese Lasagna
Roll Up
(0514500)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Brand:

Commodity Code #:

Commercial Code #:

Portion Size:

Portions/Case:

Case Size:

Fee for Service/ Case:

Total Price/ Portion (Includes DF $ Value)

50

Chicken Taco, Mini
(0514530)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Brand:

Commodity Code #:

Commercial Code #:

Portion Size:

Portions/Case:

Case Size:

Fee for Service/ Case:

Total Price/ Portion (Includes DF $ Value)

51

Quesadilla, Bib Chicken
(0517640)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Brand:

The Max

Commodity Code #:

77387-12723

Commercial Code #:

77387-12726

Portion Size: 4.090
Portions/Case: 96

Case Size: 29.40
Fee for Service/ Case: 45.80
Total Price/ Portion (Includes DF $ Value) ATT1
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Cargill ConAgra
Item Advance American Asian Food Brookwood Cargill Meat |Kitchen Chef's Corner Foods Sales, Giorgio Don Lee
No. Vendor Pierre Foods |[Foods Group |Solutions Bongard Farms Inc. Solutions Solutions Foods LLC E S Foods Foods, Inc. Farms
Stromboli, Pepperoni and
Cheese
52 (0514510) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand: Giorgio
Commodity Code #: 5193
Commercial Code #: 5193
N/A |Portion Size: 4.200
Portions/Case: 72
Case Size: 22.50
Fee for Service/ Case: 45.51
Total Price/ Portion (Includes DF $ Value) .7000
Omelet, Colby Cheese
53 (0516080) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand: Sunny Fresh
Commodity Code #: 40176
Commercial Code #: 40176
N/A |Portion Size: 2.100
Portions/Case: 225
Case Size: 29.53
Fee for Service/ Case: 45.00
Total Price/ Portion (Includes DF $ Value) .2830
Potatoes, Roasted Chunks
54 (0514430) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand:

Commodity Code #:

Commercial Code #:

Portion Size:

Portions/Case:

Case Size:

Fee for Service/ Case:

Total Price/ Portion (Includes DF $ Value)
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Cargill ConAgra
Item Advance American Asian Food Brookwood Cargill Meat |Kitchen Chef's Corner Foods Sales, Giorgio Don Lee
No. Vendor Pierre Foods |[Foods Group |Solutions Bongard Farms Inc. Solutions Solutions Foods LLC E S Foods Foods, Inc. Farms
Potato Wedges
55 (0514311) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand:

Commodity Code #:

Commercial Code #:

Portion Size:

Portions/Case:

Case Size:

Fee for Service/ Case:

Total Price/ Portion (Includes DF $ Value)
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Vendor

Jennie-O JT™M Nardone Bros Schwan's
Item High Liner Turkey Stove |Provisions McCain Foods [Michael Baking Co, Pilgrim's Pride Food Service,
No. Foods Inc. Sales, Lilac Co, Inc. Ling's USA Foods, Inc. Inc. Corporation Red Gold, LLC |Inc. Tasty Brands
Sweet and Sour Chicken
1 (0516820) No Bid No Bid No Bid (a) (m) (Y) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand: Lings
Commodity Code #: 8-52724-1551-7
Commercial Code #: 8-52724-1551-7
Portion Size: 3.600
Portions/Case: 192
Case Size: 43.51
Fee for Service/ Case: 92.16
Total Price/ Portion (Includes DF $ Value) .6042
Smoked BBQ Teriyaki Chicken
2 (0516830) No Bid No Bid No Bid (m) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand: Lings
Commodity Code #: 8-52724-15554-8
Commercial Code #: 8-52724-15554-8
Portion Size: 2.800
Portions/Case: 240
Case Size: 42.00
Fee for Service/ Case: 78.24
Total Price/ Portion (Includes DF $ Value) .4459
Mandarin Orange Chicken
3 (0516840) No Bid No Bid No Bid (m) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand: Lings
Commodity Code #: 8-52774-15555-5
Commercial Code #: 8-52774-15555-5
Portion Size: 3.600
Portions/Case: 192
Case Size: 43.50
Fee for Service/ Case: 92.16
Total Price/ Portion (Includes DF $ Value) .6042
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Item
No.

Vendor

High Liner
Foods Inc.

Jennie-O
Turkey Stove
Sales, Lilac

JT™M
Provisions
Co, Inc.

Ling's

McCain Foods
USA

Michael

Foods, Inc.

Nardone Bros
Baking Co,
Inc.

Pilgrim's Pride
Corporation

Red Gold, LLC

Schwan's
Food Service,
Inc.

Tasty Brands

Kung Pao Chicken w/o Vegs
(0516851)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

(2) (m)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Brand:

Lings

Commodity Code #:

8-52724-15557-9

Commercial Code #:

8-52724-15557-9

Portion Size:

3.800

Portions/Case:

182

Case Size:

43.50

Fee for Service/ Case:

117.06

Total Price/ Portion (Includes DF $ Value)

.8386

Chicken, 8 Piece, Breaded
(0516550)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Brand:

Commodity Code #:

N/A

Commercial Code #:

Portion Size:

Portions/Case:

Case Size:

Fee for Service/ Case:

Total Price/ Portion (Includes DF $ Value)

Chicken, 8 Piece, Roasted
(0516540)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Brand:

Commodity Code #:

N/A

Commercial Code #:

Portion Size:

Portions/Case:

Case Size:

Fee for Service/ Case:

Total Price/ Portion (Includes DF $ Value)

21 of 38




Vendor

Jennie-O JT™M Nardone Bros Schwan's
Item High Liner Turkey Stove |Provisions McCain Foods [Michael Baking Co, Pilgrim's Pride Food Service,
No. Foods Inc. Sales, Lilac Co, Inc. Ling's USA Foods, Inc. Inc. Corporation Red Gold, LLC |Inc. Tasty Brands
Chicken Patty, Small, Breaded
7 (0516581) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand: Gold Kist
Commodity Code #: 6353
Commercial Code #: 6353
N/A [Portion Size: 1.630
Portions/Case: 294
Case Size: 30.00
Fee for Service/ Case: 38.10
Total Price/ Portion (Includes DF $ Value) 57.34
Chicken Patty, Home-style Brd.
8 (0516901) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand: Gold Kist
Commodity Code #: 6654
Commercial Code #: 6654
N/A [Portion Size: 3.050
Portions/Case: 156
Case Size: 38.10
Fee for Service/ Case: 57.34
Total Price/ Portion (Includes DF $ Value)
Chick Patty, Hot & Spicy, Brd.
9 (0516910) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand: Gold Kist
Commodity Code #: 66660
Commercial Code #: 66660
N/A [Portion Size: 3.050
Portions/Case: 156
Case Size: 30.00
Fee for Service/ Case: 42.00
Total Price/ Portion (Includes DF $ Value) 61.24
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Vendor

Jennie-O JT™M Nardone Bros Schwan's
Item High Liner Turkey Stove |Provisions McCain Foods [Michael Baking Co, Pilgrim's Pride Food Service,
No. Foods Inc. Sales, Lilac Co, Inc. Ling's USA Foods, Inc. Inc. Corporation Red Gold, LLC |Inc. Tasty Brands
Chick Tend-Shaped Strips, Brd.
10 (0516860) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand: Gold Kist
Commodity Code #: 6253
Commercial Code #: 6253
Portion Size: 3.060
Portions/Case: 156
Case Size: 30.00
Fee for Service/ Case: 38.10
Total Price/ Portion (Includes DF $ Value) .3680
Chick Tend, Whole Muscle, Brd.
11 (0516650) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand:
Commodity Code #:
Commercial Code #:
N/A [Portion Size:
Portions/Case:
Case Size:
Fee for Service/ Case:
Total Price/ Portion (Includes DF $ Value)
Popcorn Chicken, Breaded
12 (0516871) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand: Gold Kist
Commodity Code #: 69160
Commercial Code #: 69160
Portion Size: 3.080
Portions/Case: 103
Case Size: 20.00
Fee for Service/ Case: 28.40
Total Price/ Portion (Includes DF $ Value) .3890
Popcorn Chicken, Breaded
12 (0516871) N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A (a) (u) N/A N/A N/A
Brand: Gold Kist
Commodity Code #: 110458
Commercial Code #: 110458
Portion Size: 4.300
Portions/Case: 108
Case Size: 30.00
Fee for Service/ Case: 44.10
Total Price/ Portion (Includes DF $ Value) 82.57
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Vendor

Jennie-O JT™M Nardone Bros Schwan's
Item High Liner Turkey Stove |Provisions McCain Foods [Michael Baking Co, Pilgrim's Pride Food Service,
No. Foods Inc. Sales, Lilac Co, Inc. Ling's USA Foods, Inc. Inc. Corporation Red Gold, LLC |Inc. Tasty Brands
Popcorn Chicken , Spicy, Brd.
13 (0516880) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand:
Commodity Code #:
Commercial Code #:
N/A [Portion Size:
Portions/Case:
Case Size:
Fee for Service/ Case:
Total Price/ Portion (Includes DF $ Value)
Chicken Breast Filets, Whole Muscle,
14 Bread. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand: Gold Kist
Commodity Code #: 7516
Commercial Code #: 7516
Portion Size: 4.000
Portions/Case: 120
Case Size: 30.00
Fee for Service/ Case: 67.50
Total Price/ Portion (Includes DF $ Value) .7600
Chicken Fajita Strips
15 (0516890) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand: Gold Kist
Commodity Code #: 1325
Commercial Code #: 1325
Portion Size: 2.451
Portions/Case: 195
Case Size: 30.00
Fee for Service/ Case: 50.10
Total Price/ Portion (Includes DF $ Value) 0.4320
Chicken Fajita Strips
15 (0516890) N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A (a)(u) N/A N/A N/A
Brand: Gold Kist
Commodity Code #: 1330
Commercial Code #: 1330
Portion Size: 2.460
Portions/Case: 195
Case Size: 30.00
Fee for Service/ Case: 50.40
Total Price/ Portion (Includes DF $ Value) 98.93
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Vendor

Jennie-O JT™M Nardone Bros Schwan's
Item High Liner Turkey Stove |Provisions McCain Foods [Michael Baking Co, Pilgrim's Pride Food Service,
No. Foods Inc. Sales, Lilac Co, Inc. Ling's USA Foods, Inc. Inc. Corporation Red Gold, LLC |Inc. Tasty Brands
Grilled Chicken Patty
16 (0516560) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand: Gold Kist
Commodity Code #: 7520
Commercial Code #: 7520
Portion Size: 3.000
Portions/Case: 106
Case Size: 20.00
Fee for Service/ Case: 62.60
Total Price/ Portion (Includes DF $ Value) .7900
Beef Crumbles
17 (0516970) No Bid No Bid (m) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand: JTM
Commodity Code #: CP5876
Commercial Code #: 5876CE
Portion Size: 2.000
Portions/Case: 240
Case Size: 30.00
Fee for Service/ Case: 25.30
Total Price/ Portion (Includes DF $ Value) .3831
Beef Taco Meat, Reduced Sod.
18 (0516170) No Bid No Bid (m) (@) (Y) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand: JTM
Commodity Code #: CP5232
Commercial Code #: 5232CE
Portion Size: 2.890
Portions/Case: 166
Case Size: 30.00
Fee for Service/ Case: 30.30
Total Price/ Portion (Includes DF $ Value) .3339
Beef Taco Meat, Reduced Sod.
18 (0516170) N/A N/A (m) (Y) N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
Brand: JTM
Commodity Code #: CP5250
Commercial Code #: 5250CE
Portion Size: 3.170
Portions/Case: 151
Case Size: 30.00
Fee for Service/ Case: 24.00
Total Price/ Portion (Includes DF $ Value) 4769
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Vendor

Jennie-O JT™M Nardone Bros Schwan's
Item High Liner Turkey Stove |Provisions McCain Foods [Michael Baking Co, Pilgrim's Pride Food Service,
No. Foods Inc. Sales, Lilac Co, Inc. Ling's USA Foods, Inc. Inc. Corporation Red Gold, LLC |Inc. Tasty Brands
Beef Meatballs
19 (0516191) No Bid No Bid (m) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand: JTM
Commodity Code #: CP5030
Commercial Code #: 5030CE
Portion Size: 2.800
Portions/Case: 171
Case Size: 30.00
Fee for Service/ Case: 23.30
Total Price/ Portion (Includes DF $ Value) .5339
Turkey Sausage Patty
20 (0516210) No Bid (m) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand: Jennie-O
Commodity Code #: 6132
Commercial Code #: 6132
Portion Size: 1.025
Portions/Case: 160
Case Size: 10.25
Fee for Service/ Case: 22.55
Total Price/ Portion (Includes DF $ Value) .2140
Turkey Ham
21 (0516221) No Bid (m) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand: Jennie-O
Commodity Code #: 8028
Commercial Code #: 8028
Portion Size: 3.580
Portions/Case: 71
Case Size: 16.00

Fee for Service/ Case:

24.96 /1.560 Ib

Total Price/ Portion (Includes DF $ Value)

.5840/2.610 Ib
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Vendor

Jennie-O JT™M Nardone Bros Schwan's
Item High Liner Turkey Stove |Provisions McCain Foods [Michael Baking Co, Pilgrim's Pride Food Service,
No. Foods Inc. Sales, Lilac Co, Inc. Ling's USA Foods, Inc. Inc. Corporation Red Gold, LLC |Inc. Tasty Brands
Turkey Ham , Deli Style,
22 Pre-sliced No Bid (m) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand: Jennie-O
Commodity Code #: 256521
Commercial Code #: 256521
Portion Size: 3.060
Portions/Case: 109
Case Size: 21.00
Fee for Service/ Case: 36.33
Total Price/ Portion (Includes DF $ Value) .5795
Roast Turkey Breast, Deli Style,
23 Pre-sliced No Bid (m) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand: Jennie-O
Commodity Code #: 209921
Commercial Code #: 209921
Portion Size: 3.000
Portions/Case: 112
Case Size: 21.00
Fee for Service/ Case: 35.70
Total Price/ Portion (Includes DF $ Value) .6094
Turkey Roast
24 (0516311) No Bid (m) (@) (Y) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand: Jennie-O
Commodity Code #: 217804
Commercial Code #: 217804
Portion Size: 2.290
Portions/Case: 234
Case Size: 44.80

Fee for Service/ Case:

87.81/1.960 Ib

Total Price/ Portion (Includes DF $ Value)

.4222/2.950 Ib
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Vendor

Jennie-O JT™M Nardone Bros Schwan's
Item High Liner Turkey Stove |Provisions McCain Foods [Michael Baking Co, Pilgrim's Pride Food Service,
No. Foods Inc. Sales, Lilac Co, Inc. Ling's USA Foods, Inc. Inc. Corporation Red Gold, LLC |Inc. Tasty Brands
Beef, Flame Broiled Patty
25 (0516113) No Bid No Bid (m) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand: JTM
Commodity Code #: CP5661
Commercial Code #: 566ICE
Portion Size: 2.200
Portions/Case: 228
Case Size: 31.43
Fee for Service/ Case: 24.36
Total Price/ Portion (Includes DF $ Value) 4316
Country Fried Steak
26 (0516150) No Bid No Bid (m) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand: JTM
Commodity Code #: CP5695
Commercial Code #: 5695CE
Portion Size: 3.350
Portions/Case: 137
Case Size: 28.89
Fee for Service/ Case: 32.80
Total Price/ Portion (Includes DF $ Value) .6691
Beef Steak, Cooked, Breaded
27 (0516132) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand:
Commodity Code #:
Commercial Code #:
Portion Size:
Portions/Case:
Case Size:

Fee for Service/ Case:

Total Price/ Portion (Includes DF $ Value)
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Vendor

Jennie-O JT™M Nardone Bros Schwan's
Item High Liner Turkey Stove |Provisions McCain Foods [Michael Baking Co, Pilgrim's Pride Food Service,
No. Foods Inc. Sales, Lilac Co, Inc. Ling's USA Foods, Inc. Inc. Corporation Red Gold, LLC |Inc. Tasty Brands
Beef, Mini Burgers
28 (0515120) No Bid No Bid (m) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand: JTM
Commodity Code #: CP5669
Commercial Code #: 5669CE
Portion Size: 1.150
Portions/Case: 417
Case Size: 30.00
Fee for Service/ Case: 24.30
Total Price/ Portion (Includes DF $ Value) 2217
Pork, Bib, Shredded
29 (0516940) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand:
Commodity Code #:
Commercial Code #:
Portion Size:
Portions/Case:
Case Size:
Fee for Service/ Case:
Total Price/ Portion (Includes DF $ Value)
Mozzarella Cheese, Shredded
30 (0516411) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand:
Commodity Code #:
Commercial Code #:
Portion Size:
Portions/Case:
Case Size:

Fee for Service/ Case:

Total Price/ Portion (Includes DF $ Value)
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Vendor

Jennie-O JT™M Nardone Bros Schwan's
Item High Liner Turkey Stove |Provisions McCain Foods [Michael Baking Co, Pilgrim's Pride Food Service,
No. Foods Inc. Sales, Lilac Co, Inc. Ling's USA Foods, Inc. Inc. Corporation Red Gold, LLC |Inc. Tasty Brands
Cheese Portions, Mozzarella String,
Refrigerated
31 (0517030) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand:
Commodity Code #:
Commercial Code #:
Portion Size:
Portions/Case:
Case Size:
Fee for Service/ Case:
Total Price/ Portion (Includes DF $ Value)
Cheese Sauce, Pouch, Cheddar, Reduced
Fat, Reduced Sodium, Refrigerated
32 (0517650) No Bid No Bid (m) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand: JTM
Commodity Code #: 5715
Commercial Code #: 5715
Portion Size: 1.900
Portions/Case: 252
Case Size: 30.00
Fee for Service/ Case: 32.00
Total Price/ Portion (Includes DF $ Value) .1945
Jalapeno Cheese Sauce,
Reduced Fat
33 (0507172) No Bid No Bid (m) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand: JTM
Commodity Code #: 5725
Commercial Code #: 5725
Portion Size: 2.000
Portions/Case: 240
Case Size: 30.00
Fee for Service/ Case: 32.00
Total Price/ Portion (Includes DF $ Value) .2305
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Item
No.

Vendor

High Liner
Foods Inc.

Jennie-O
Turkey Stove
Sales, Lilac

JT™M
Provisions
Co, Inc.

Ling's

McCain Foods
USA

Michael

Foods, Inc.

Nardone Bros
Baking Co,
Inc.

Pilgrim's Pride
Corporation

Red Gold, LLC

Schwan's
Food Service,
Inc.

Tasty Brands

34

American Cheese, Yellow, Sliced,
Reduced Fat and Reduced Sodium,
Refrigerated (0516350)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Brand:

Commodity Code #:

Commercial Code #:

Portion Size:

Portions/Case:

Case Size:

Fee for Service/ Case:

Total Price/ Portion (Includes DF $ Value)

35

American Cheese, White, Sliced,
Reduced Fat, Refrigerated
(0516352)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Brand:

Commodity Code #:

Commercial Code #:

Portion Size:

Portions/Case:

Case Size:

Fee for Service/ Case:

Total Price/ Portion (Includes DF $ Value)

36

American Cheese,
5 Pound Loaves
(0516341)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Brand:

Commodity Code #:

Commercial Code #:

Portion Size:

Portions/Case:

Case Size:

Fee for Service/ Case:

Total Price/ Portion (Includes DF $ Value)
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Item
No.

Vendor

High Liner
Foods Inc.

Jennie-O
Turkey Stove
Sales, Lilac

JT™M
Provisions
Co, Inc.

Ling's

McCain Foods
USA

Michael

Foods, Inc.

Nardone Bros
Baking Co,
Inc.

Pilgrim's Pride
Corporation

Red Gold, LLC

Schwan's
Food Service,
Inc.

Tasty Brands

37

Cheese Portions, Cheddar Cheese,
Reduced Fat, Refrigerated (0517640)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Brand:

Commodity Code #:

Commercial Code #:

Portion Size:

Portions/Case:

Case Size:

Fee for Service/ Case:

Total Price/ Portion (Includes DF $ Value)

38

Cheese, Swiss, Sliced, Reduced Fat,
Refrigerator
(0517500)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Brand:

Commodity Code #:

Commercial Code #:

Portion Size:

Portions/Case:

Case Size:

Fee for Service/ Case:

Total Price/ Portion (Includes DF $ Value)

39

Cheddar Cheese, Shredded, Reduced
Sodium, Refrigerated
(0516360)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Brand:

Commodity Code #:

Commercial Code #:

Portion Size:

Portions/Case:

Case Size:

Fee for Service/ Case:

Total Price/ Portion (Includes DF $ Value)
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Item
No.

Vendor

High Liner
Foods Inc.

Jennie-O
Turkey Stove
Sales, Lilac

JT™M
Provisions
Co, Inc.

Ling's

McCain Foods
USA

Michael

Foods, Inc.

Nardone Bros
Baking Co,
Inc.

Pilgrim's Pride
Corporation

Red Gold, LLC

Schwan's
Food Service,
Inc.

Tasty Brands

40

Macaroni and Cheese, Reduced Fat,
Reduced Sodium, Whole Grain
(0517600)

No Bid

No Bid

(m)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Brand:

JTM

Commodity Code #:

5767

Commercial Code #:

5767

Portion Size:

6.000

Portions/Case:

80

Case Size:

30.00

Fee for Service/ Case:

33.00

Total Price/ Portion (Includes DF $ Value)

.5470

41

Bread Sticks, Cheese Filled,
Reduced Fat
(0516640)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Brand:

Nardone

Commodity Code #:

96WBSM

Commercial Code #:

96WBSM

Portion Size:

2.000

Portions/Case:

96

Case Size:

12.00

Fee for Service/ Case:

23.00

Total Price/ Portion (Includes DF $ Value)

.3644

42

Cheese Sticks, Mozzarella, Brd.
(0517660)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Brand:

High Liner

Commodity Code #:

G1042DF

Commercial Code #:

G1042DF

Portion Size:

4.200

Portions/Case:

83

Case Size:

21.78

Fee for Service/ Case:

23.08

Total Price/ Portion (Includes DF $ Value)

.4036
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Vendor

Jennie-O JT™M Nardone Bros Schwan's
Item High Liner Turkey Stove |Provisions McCain Foods [Michael Baking Co, Pilgrim's Pride Food Service,
No. Foods Inc. Sales, Lilac Co, Inc. Ling's USA Foods, Inc. Inc. Corporation Red Gold, LLC |Inc. Tasty Brands
Tomato Catsup, Shelf Stable
43 (0507090) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid (m) No Bid No Bid
Brand: Red Gold
Commodity Code #: REDY599
Commercial Code #: REDY599
Portion Size: 0.600
Portions/Case: 1151
Case Size: 6/#10 cans
Fee for Service/ Case: 14.27
Total Price/ Portion (Includes DF $ Value) .0120
Tomato Catsup, Individual,
Shelf Stable
44 (0507102) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid (m) No Bid No Bid
Brand: Red Gold
Commodity Code #: REDY59G
Commercial Code #: REDY59G
Portion Size: 0.300
Portions/Case: 1,000
Case Size: 19.84
Fee for Service/ Case: 9.590
Total Price/ Portion (Includes DF $ Value) .0096
Tomato Catsup, Individual,
Shelf Stable
44 (0507102) N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A (a) (m) (u) No Bid No Bid
Brand: Red Gold
Commodity Code #: REDYL9G
Commercial Code #: REDYL96
Portion Size: 0.300
Portions/Case: 1,000
Case Size: 19.84
Fee for Service/ Case: 10.32
Total Price/ Portion (Includes DF $ Value) .0103
Canned Salsa, Shelf Stable,
45 (0502393) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid (m) No Bid No Bid
Brand: Red Gold
Commodity Code #: REDSC99
Commercial Code #: REDSC99
Portion Size: 1.500
Portions/Case: 412
Case Size: 6/#10 cans
Fee for Service/ Case: 23.10
Total Price/ Portion (Includes DF $ Value) .0560
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Vendor

Jennie-O JT™M Nardone Bros Schwan's
Item High Liner Turkey Stove |Provisions McCain Foods [Michael Baking Co, Pilgrim's Pride Food Service,
No. Foods Inc. Sales, Lilac Co, Inc. Ling's USA Foods, Inc. Inc. Corporation Red Gold, LLC |Inc. Tasty Brands
Salsa, Dipping Cup, Low Sodium, Shelf
Stable
46 (0507350) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid (m) No Bid No Bid
Brand: Red Gold
Commodity Code #: REDSC27C84
Commercial Code #: REDSC22C84
Portion Size: 3.000
Portions/Case: 84
Case Size: 15.75
Fee for Service/ Case: 25.36
Total Price/ Portion (Includes DF $ Value) .3000
Salsa, Dipping Cup, Low Sodium Shelf
Stable
46 (0507350) N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A (m) N/A N/A
Brand: Red Gold
Commodity Code #: REDSC27C168
Commercial Code #: REDSC27C168
Portion Size: 3.000
Portions/Case: 168
Case Size: 31.50
Fee for Service/ Case: 48.98
Total Price/ Portion (Includes DF $ Value) .2900
Marinara Sauce, Shelf Stable
47 (0505200) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid (m) No Bid No Bid
Brand: Red Gold
Commodity Code #: RPKNASE
Commercial Code #: RPKNASE
Portion Size: 1.500
Portions/Case: 420
Case Size: 6/#10 cans
Fee for Service/ Case: 18.64
Total Price/ Portion (Includes DF $ Value) .0550
Spaghetti Sauce, Shelf Stable
48 (0508050) N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A (m) No Bid No Bid
Brand: Red Pack
Commodity Code #: RPKMASE
Commercial Code #: RPKMA9E
Portion Size: 12.00
Portions/Case: 530
Case Size: 6#10 cans
Fee for Service/ Case: 18.64
Total Price/ Portion (Includes DF $ Value) .0350
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Vendor

Jennie-O JT™M Nardone Bros Schwan's

Item High Liner Turkey Stove |Provisions McCain Foods [Michael Baking Co, Pilgrim's Pride Food Service,

No. Foods Inc. Sales, Lilac Co, Inc. Ling's USA Foods, Inc. Inc. Corporation Red Gold, LLC |Inc. Tasty Brands
Whole Grain Cheese Lasagna
Roll Up

49 (0514500) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid (m)
Brand: Tasty Brands
Commodity Code #: 00801WG
Commercial Code #: 00801WG
Portion Size: 4.300
Portions/Case: 110
Case Size: 29.53
Fee for Service/ Case: 43.84
Total Price/ Portion (Includes DF $ Value) .6140
Chicken Taco, Mini

50 (0514530) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid (m)
Brand: Tasty Brands
Commodity Code #: 25701
Commercial Code #: 25701
Portion Size: 4.500
Portions/Case: 99
Case Size: 27.84
Fee for Service/ Case: 52.49
Total Price/ Portion (Includes DF $ Value) .5950
Quesadilla, Bib Chicken

51 (0517640) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand:
Commodity Code #:
Commercial Code #:
Portion Size:
Portions/Case:
Case Size:

Fee for Service/ Case:

Total Price/ Portion (Includes DF $ Value)
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Iltem
No.

Vendor

High Liner
Foods Inc.

Jennie-O
Turkey Stove
Sales, Lilac

JT™M
Provisions
Co, Inc.

Ling's

McCain Foods
USA

Michael
Foods, Inc.

Nardone Bros
Baking Co,
Inc.

Pilgrim's Pride
Corporation

Red Gold, LLC

Schwan's
Food Service,
Inc.

Tasty Brands

52

Stromboli, Pepperoni and
Cheese
(0514510)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Brand:

Commodity Code #:

Commercial Code #:

Portion Size:

Portions/Case:

Case Size:

Fee for Service/ Case:

Total Price/ Portion (Includes DF $ Value)

53

Omelet, Colby Cheese
(0516080)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

(m)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Brand:

Papetti's

Commodity Code #:

46025-85137

N/A

Commercial Code #:

46025-85137

Portion Size:

2.100

Portions/Case:

144

Case Size:

18.90

Fee for Service/ Case:

28.31

Total Price/ Portion (Includes DF $ Value)

.2697

54

Potatoes, Roasted Chunks
(0514430)

(m)

Brand:

McCain

Commodity Code #:

MCF03927

Commercial Code #:

MCF03927

Portion Size:

3.140

Portions/Case:

152

Case Size:

30.00

Fee for Service/ Case:

19.70

Total Price/ Portion (Includes DF $ Value)

.1290
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Vendor

Jennie-O JT™M Nardone Bros Schwan's
Item High Liner Turkey Stove |Provisions McCain Foods [Michael Baking Co, Pilgrim's Pride Food Service,
No. Foods Inc. Sales, Lilac Co, Inc. Ling's USA Foods, Inc. Inc. Corporation Red Gold, LLC |Inc. Tasty Brands
Potato Wedges
55 (0514311) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid (m) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Brand: McCain
Commodity Code #: 1000000496
Commercial Code #: 1000000496
Portion Size: 2.880
Portions/Case: 166
Case Size: 30.00
Fee for Service/ Case: 19.70
Total Price/ Portion (Includes DF $ Value) .1180

a = Alternate product bid.

u = Bid for this item is not acceptable: Alternate product bid - product not approved in taste test; no sample was sent by bidder, or alternate terms of bidder was not accepted.

Y = Product was approved in Taste Test
m = Vendor bid minimum delivery quantity.

BID TABULATION, RECOMMENDATIONS, AND PROTEST

Bid tabulations with award recommendations are posted for 72 hours in the Purchasing Department Office and are also posted to the School District's website address at: http://ecsd-

fl.schoolloop.com/purchasing/bids.

Failure to file a protest within the time prescribed in Section 120.57(3) Florida Statutes, and School Board Rules shall constitute a waiver of proceedings. Bid tabulations or recommendations will be
distributed solely through the Purchasing website address. Notices will not be automatically mailed.

I hereby certify that the prices and bidders reflected herein are valid, and have been received in compliance to Escambia County School Board Rules and Florida Law.

John Dombroskie,
Director Purchasing Department
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