
 

 
 
 
DATE:  BID TITLE & REFERENCE: 
August 29, 2014     Miscellaneous Food Items, RFP #150103 
 
 
DESCRIPTION OF PURCHASE: 

 

An annual pricing agreement to provide miscellaneous food items (seventeen (17) items bid, eleven 
(11) awarded) for use in the preparation of school breakfast and lunches as stocked and distributed 
by the Central Warehouse for school cafeterias throughout the District.   
 
Effective Dates:  September 17, 2014 through July 31, 2015. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

  
REQUESTED BY: 

 

Food Services 
 

    
SUPPLIER NAME:      ITEMS AWARDED:           ESTIMATED ANNUAL EXPENDITURE: 
 

Integrated Food Service, Gardena, CA    2            $ 138,000.00 
Kelley Foods of Alabama, Elba, AL    1        6,000.00 
Proview Foods, Gainesville, GA     1      16,800.00 
Sysco Food Serv., Geneva, AL     4      85,800.00 
Tasty Brands, Hicksville, NY     2      57,900.00 
Tools for Schools, Emmett, ID     1                 80,100.00 

 
    
AMOUNT OF PURCHASE: FUNDING SOURCE: 
 

        $384,600.00 Est. / Yr.   Food Services Fund (4110)  
    

   
METHOD OF PROCUREMENT: 

 

ECSD Bid                            Responses Received:  9                  “No” Bid Responses:  1 
 

  
DATE AND TIME POSTED: 

 

August 29, 2014, 8:00 AM Central Time 
 

 
9500PUR101 (11/10) Retention - 5 Years 

 
THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY 

PURCHASING DEPARTMENT 
75 North Pace Boulevard  

Pensacola, FL  32505 
 

BID AWARD NOTICE 



DATE:   August 22, 2014

BID NBR: 150103
BID TITLE:  Miscellaneous Food Items

Where two prices are shown, the bottom price is the bid case/pack size 
Top price is unit price needed to determine low cost because of vendor differences in case count

ITEM Chicken Breast
Grilled Cheese Tens, Wh Mus tnd Filets, Breaded

Quantity: 900 cs 1,200 cs 300 cs 1,500 cs
0516780 0517560 0516650

ITEM NUMBER 1 2 3 4

Integrated Food Serv. 0.6020 a 0.7190 No Bid No Bid

Gardena, CA 84.30 Y 51.78

Kelley Foods of AL No Bid No Bid 0.2581 0.8066

Elba, AL 96.80 96.80

M.C.I. Foods No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Santa Fe Springs, CA

Pilgrim's Pride No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.7060

Tucker, GA 84.75

Proview Foods, LLC No Bid No Bid 0.2489 a 0.6975 a

Gainesville, GA 56.00 Y 55.80 Y

Sysco - Gulf Coast No Bid No Bid 0.2537 No Bid

Geneva, AL 95.15

Tasty Brands No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Hicksville, NY

Tools for Schools No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Emmett, ID

Not Awarded

Awarded Items are highlighted

Turk Ham/Egg/Ch
Breakfast Sand Chicken Breast 

THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

75 NORTH PACE BOULEVARD
PENSACOLA, FLORIDA 32505

BID TABULATION
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ITEM Corn Dog Frankfurters Taco Pizza Bagels
Beef Breakfast Mini

Quantity: 2,000 cs 1,200 cs 400 cs 750 cs
0516052 0516070 0514510 0517072

ITEM NUMBER 5 6 7 8

Integrated Food Serv. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Gardena, CA
Kelley Foods of AL 0.4161 No Bid 0.5351 No Bid
Elba, AL 38.53
M.C.I. Foods No Bid No Bid 0.405 a No Bid
Santa Fe Springs, CA 29.17 u
Pilgrim's Pride No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tucker, GA
Proview Foods, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Gainesville, GA
Sysco - Gulf Coast 0.3451 No Bid 0.4520 a No Bid
Geneva, AL 24.85 22.60 u
Tasty Brands No Bid No Bid 0.3660 a 0.5600
Hicksville, NY 43.90 Y 53.76
Tools for Schools No Bid 0.6950 a No Bid No Bid
Emmett, ID 66.72 Y
Tools for Schools n/a 1.3200 a n/a n/a
Emmett, ID u

ITEM Sunflower Seed Tea Bags Sugar
Nut Butter cn Granulated lb Low Fat, Ind.

Quantity: 300 cs 300 bx 300 bg 100 cs
0503040 0511170 0507230

ITEM NUMBER 9 10 11 12

Integrated Food Serv. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Gardena, CA
Kelley Foods of AL 12.386 No Bid 0.5270 No Bid
Elba, AL 74.32 26.35
M.C.I. Foods No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Santa Fe Springs, CA
Pilgrim's Pride No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tucker, GA
Proview Foods, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Gainesville, GA
Sysco - Gulf Coast 11.6250 0.2656 0.4990 No Bid
Geneva, AL 69.75 25.50 24.95
Tasty Brands No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Hicksville, NY
Tools for Schools 14.1017 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Emmett, ID 84.61

Not Awarded

Ranch Dressing
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ITEM Oregano Paprika
Ground Ground

Quantity: 100 cs 150 cs 75 cn 50 cn
0502090 0502160 0510602 0510630

ITEM NUMBER 13 14 15 16

Integrated Food Serv.  No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Gardena, CA
Kelley Foods of AL No Bid 6.7100 No Bid No Bid
Elba, AL 40.27
M.C.I. Foods No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Santa Fe Springs, CA
Pilgrim's Pride No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tucker, GA
Proview Foods, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Gainesville, GA
Sysco - Gulf Coast No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Geneva, AL
Tasty Brands No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Hicksville, NY
Tools for Schools No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Emmett, ID

Not Awarded Not Awarded Not Awarded

ITEM
Seasoning

Quantity: 300
0504200

ITEM NUMBER 17

Integrated Food Serv. No Bid
Gardena, CA
Kelley Foods of AL No Bid
Elba, AL
M.C.I. Foods No Bid
Santa Fe Springs, CA
Pilgrim's Pride No Bid
Tucker, GA
Proview Foods, LLC No Bid
Gainesville, GA
Sysco - Gulf Coast No Bid
Geneva, AL
Tasty Brands No Bid
Hicksville, NY
Tools for Schools No Bid
Emmett, ID

No Awarded

Items 13-16 to be awarded as a lot.

White Pepper Onions

Mexican
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m = Minimum Bid by Vendor
au = Alternate product bid.  Product not approved in taste test or no sample was sent by bidder.
Y = Product was approved in Taste Test
m = Bidder bid minimum ship quantities
mu = Minimum ship quantity bid is not acceptable for that item

BID TABULATION, RECOMMENDATIONS, AND PROTEST
Bid tabulations with award recommendations are posted for 72 hours in the Purchasing 
Department Office and are also posted to the School District's website address at: 
http://ecsd-fl.schoolloop.com/purchasing/bids

Failure to file a protest within the time prescribed in
Section 120.57(3) Florida Statutes, and School Board Rules shall constitute a waiver of proceedings.
Bid tabulations or recommendations will be distributed solely through the Purchasing 
website address.  Notices will not be automatically mailed.

I hereby certify that the prices and bidders reflected herein are valid, and have been received
in compliance to Escambia County School Board Rules and Florida Law.

John Dombroskie, Director
Purchasing Department
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