
 

 
 
 
DATE: BID TITLE & REFERENCE: 
August 6, 2014                      Computer Peripherals, Bid #142704 
 
DESCRIPTION OF PURCHASE: 

 

A twelve (12) month pricing agreement to provide computer peripherals for classroom and 
administrative use throughout the District.  Forty-four (44) items bid and thirty (30) awarded.  Items 
will be purchased on an as needed basis.  The Bid, written in conjunction with the IT Department to 
address their needs, increases standardization within the District and offers all schools and 
departments the ability to take advantage of lower prices on IT approved products over the effective 
period of the bid. Bid award(s) to the lowest bidder(s) meeting specifications.  Items not awarded due 
to discontinuation of product by manufacturer, and decision to exercise District right to utilize State of 
Florida contract #880-000-09-01 for available Epson products.   
 
Effective Dates:  September 1, 2014 through August 31, 2015.  
 
 
 
 

  
REQUESTED BY: 

 

Information Technology   
 

    
SUPPLIER NAME:       ITEMS AWARDED:  ESTIMATED  ANNUAL EXPENDITURE: 
  
      Office Depot, Inc., Boca Raton, FL    5          $25,200.00 
      Staples Technology Solutions, Deerfield Bch, FL 1       4,000.00 
      Beyond Technology, Centennial, CO   4     15,800.00   
      iPrint Technologies, Larkspur, CA         17     99,800.00 
      Tree House, Wellington, FL     1       1,000.00 

Virtucom, Inc., Norcross, GA        2             25,700.00 
    
AMOUNT OF PURCHASE: FUNDING SOURCE: 

 

$171,500.00 Est. / Yr.  Various  
     

  
METHOD OF PROCUREMENT: 

 

ECSD Bid      Responses Received:  16     Responses Rejected:  5 
   

  
DATE AND TIME POSTED: 

 

August 6, 2014, 2:15 PM Central Time 
 
 
9500PUR101 (11/10) Retention - 5 Years 

 
THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY 

PURCHASING DEPARTMENT 
75 North Pace Blvd  

Pensacola, FL  32505 
 

BID AWARD NOTICE 



** F=Florida Business; O=Out of State Business

Bid Item #/Description 

Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

F A Group LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Office Depot, Inc. $376.08 $376.08 $40.88 $40.88 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Staples Tech Solutions No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Adorama Inc. 5% $349.00 $366.45 No Bid No Bid $724.00 $760.20 No Bid No Bid
O Beyond Technology 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O CNI Office Supplies 5% $367.38 $385.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Monster Technology 5% $385.00 $404.25 $247.00 $259.35 $789.00 $828.45 $1,564.00 $1,642.20
O MTS Partners 5% $339.00 $355.95 No Bid No Bid $659.00 $691.95 $1,299.00 $1,363.95
O Southern Computer Warehouse 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O The Tree House, Inc. 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $701.00 $736.05 No Bid No Bid
O Virtucom, Inc. 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bid Item #/Descripton

Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

F A Group LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Office Depot, Inc. No Bid No Bid $126.46 $126.46 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Staples Tech Solutions No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Adorama Inc. 5% $2,199.00 $2,308.95 $139.99 $146.99 $119.99 $125.99 $116.99 $122.84
O Beyond Technology 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O CNI Office Supplies 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $121.59 $127.67
O Monster Technology 5% $2,451.00 $2,573.55 $140.00 $147.00 $140.00 $147.00 $140.00 $147.00
O MTS Partners 5% $2,109.00 $2,214.45 $118.90 $124.85 $119.90 $125.90 $119.90 $125.90
O Southern Computer Warehouse 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O The Tree House, Inc. 5% No Bid No Bid $117.70 $123.59 $117.70 $123.59 $117.70 $123.59
O Virtucom, Inc. 5% No Bid No Bid $118.00 $123.90 $118.00 $123.90 $118.00 $123.90

Not Awarded Not Awarded

BID TABULATION

THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY

**
7/Epson 595wi interactive projector

FL. Pref. 
Adj.

8/83+ bulb 9/84+ bulb 10/95 bulb

**

Date: 
Bid Number:

Bid Title: 

PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

1/DC-06 document camera 5/Epson 99W Multimedia Projector

7/25/2013
142704
Computer Peripherals

Recommended Award

75 NORTH PACE BOULEVARD

PENSACOLA, FL 32505

2/ BrightLink Solo Module 6/Epson 585W Multimedia Projector
FL. Pref. 

Adj.

Not Awarded*3&4 were misnumberedNot Awarded Not Awarded

Not Awarded Not Awarded
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Bid Item #/Description 

Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

F A Group LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Office Depot, Inc. $126.26 $126.26 $126.26 $126.26 $51.81 $51.81 $51.81 $51.81
F Staples Tech Solutions No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Adorama Inc. 5% $116.99 $122.84 $149.00 $156.45 $65.24 $68.50 $94.99 $99.74
O Beyond Technology 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O CNI Office Supplies 5% $123.00 $129.15 $140.23 $147.24 $65.52 $68.80 $65.50 $68.78
O Monster Technology 5% $140.00 $147.00 $155.00 $162.75 $79.00 $82.95 $79.00 $82.95
O MTS Partners 5% $119.90 $125.90 $134.90 $141.65 $63.90 $67.10 $63.90 $67.10
O Southern Computer Warehouse 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O The Tree House, Inc. 5% $117.70 $123.59 $133.60 $140.28 $63.60 $66.78 No Bid No Bid
O Virtucom, Inc. 5% $118.00 $123.90 $134.00 $140.70 $65.00 $68.25 $65.00 $68.25

Bid Item #/Descripton

Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

F A Group LLC $1,499.00 $1,499.00 $590.00 $590.00 $1,100.00 $1,100.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00
F Office Depot, Inc. $1,426.49 $1,426.49 $426.20 $426.20 $1,058.86 $1,058.86 $1,058.26 $1,058.26
F Staples Tech Solutions $1,280.44 $1,280.44 $490.36 $490.36 $857.19 $857.19 $1,665.63 $1,665.63
O Adorama Inc. 5% $1,532.99 $1,609.64 $604.49 $634.71 $988.99 $1,038.44 No Bid No Bid
O Beyond Technology 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O CNI Office Supplies 5% $1,440.80 $1,512.84 $548.38 $575.80 $941.15 $988.21 No Bid No Bid
O Monster Technology 5% $1,664.00 $1,747.20 $659.00 $691.95 $1,090.00 $1,144.50 $1,069.00 $1,122.45
O MTS Partners 5% $1,129.00 $1,185.45 $439.00 $460.95 $709.00 $744.45 $1,471.00 $1,544.55
O Southern Computer Warehouse 5% $1,260.67 $1,323.70 $529.54 $556.02 $825.93 $867.23 $1,889.96 $1,984.46
O The Tree House, Inc. 5% No Bid No Bid $570.40 $598.92 $957.80 $1,005.69 No Bid No Bid
O Virtucom, Inc. 5% $1,270.00 $1,333.50 $283.00 $297.15 $798.00 $837.90 $2,247.80 $2,360.19

Not Awarded Not Awarded Not Awarded Not Awarded

16/Lexmark MS510DN printer 17/Lemark MS811N printer
18/Lexmark MS811N w/2drawers + 

output

11/96W bulb 12/450W bulb 13/475W bulb 14/595wi bulb

**
FL. Pref. 

Adj.

**
FL. Pref. 

Adj.

15/Lexmark C792E printer
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Bid Item #/Description 

Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

F A Group LLC $1,400.00 $1,400.00 $950.00 $950.00 $650.00 $650.00 $380.00 $380.00
F Office Depot, Inc. $1,058.86 $1,058.86 $781.47 $781.47 $583.27 $583.27 $372.53 $372.53
F Staples Tech Solutions $1,016.26 $1,016.26 $532.60 $532.60 $522.10 $522.10 $268.11 $268.11
O Adorama Inc. 5% $1,248.98 $1,311.43 No Bid No Bid $574.00 $602.70 $409.99 $430.49
O Beyond Technology 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $347.03 $364.38
O CNI Office Supplies 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $348.33 $365.75
O Monster Technology 5% $1,383.00 $1,452.15 No Bid No Bid $642.00 $674.10 $423.60 $444.78
O MTS Partners 5% $899.00 $943.95 No Bid No Bid $534.90 $561.65 $169.90 $178.40
O Southern Computer Warehouse 5% $1,057.69 $1,110.57 $594.58 $624.31 $486.00 $510.30 $369.14 $387.60
O The Tree House, Inc. 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $545.60 $572.88 $347.00 $364.35
O Virtucom, Inc. 5% $1,036.00 $1,087.80 No Bid No Bid $458.00 $480.90 $358.00 $375.90

DNA

Bid Item #/Descripton

Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

F A Group LLC $435.00 $435.00 $189.00 $189.00 $196.00 $196.00 $439.00 $439.00
F Office Depot, Inc. $373.12 $373.12 $176.58 $176.58 $183.36 $183.36 $413.03 $413.06
F Staples Tech Solutions $258.38 $258.38 $139.04 $139.04 $145.09 $145.09 $326.36 $326.36
O Adorama Inc. 5% $394.99 $414.74 $206.00 $216.30 $199.99 $209.99 $409.00 $429.45
O Beyond Technology 5% $347.58 $364.96 $164.49 $172.71 $139.58 $146.56 $312.35 $327.97
O CNI Office Supplies 5% $348.88 $366.32 $165.11 $173.37 $138.17 $145.08 $310.79 $326.33
O Monster Technology 5% $423.60 $444.78 $200.40 $210.42 $210.00 $220.50 $469.00 $492.45
O MTS Partners 5% $344.00 $361.20 $121.90 $128.00 $137.90 $144.80 $309.90 $325.40
O Southern Computer Warehouse 5% $370.45 $388.97 $175.31 $184.08 $182.05 $191.15 $410.07 $430.57
O The Tree House, Inc. 5% $353.05 $370.70 $164.40 $172.62 $172.00 $180.60 $385.50 $404.78
O Virtucom, Inc. 5% $358.50 $376.43 $171.00 $179.55 $178.00 $186.90 $395.00 $414.75

**

**
FL. Pref. 

Adj.

23/Lexmark toner (T632) 24/Lexmark toner (E450)
25/Lexmark toner 

(C782-Black)
26/Lexmark toner 

(C782-Cyan)

FL. Pref. 
Adj.

19/Lexmark MS811Nw/add. drawer 20/Lexmark E460DN 21/HP M551n 22/Lexmark toner (T644)
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Bid Item #/Description 

Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

F A Group LLC $439.00 $439.00 $439.00 $439.00 $273.00 $273.00 $445.00 $445.00
F Office Depot, Inc. $413.03 $413.03 $413.03 $413.03 $256.98 $256.98 $445.16 $445.16
F Staples Tech Solutions $326.36 $326.36 $326.36 $326.36 $214.48 $214.48 $371.52 $371.52
O Adorama Inc. 5% $416.00 $436.80 $423.00 $444.15 $279.99 $293.99 $489.99 $514.49
O Beyond Technology 5% $312.35 $327.97 $312.35 $327.97 $206.11 $216.42 $355.20 $372.96
O CNI Office Supplies 5% $310.79 $326.33 $310.79 $326.33 $204.24 $214.45 $353.80 $371.49
O Monster Technology 5% $469.00 $492.45 $469.00 $492.45 $293.00 $307.65 $505.00 $530.25
O MTS Partners 5% $309.90 $325.40 $309.90 $325.40 $202.90 $213.05 $351.90 $369.50
O Southern Computer Warehouse 5% $410.07 $430.57 $410.07 $430.57 $254.25 $266.96 $440.42 $462.44
O The Tree House, Inc. 5% $385.50 $404.78 $385.50 $404.78 $238.20 $250.11 $412.80 $433.44
O Virtucom, Inc. 5% $395.00 $414.75 $395.00 $414.75 $245.80 $258.09 $425.00 $446.25

Bid Item #/Descripton

Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

F A Group LLC $445.00 $445.00 $445.00 $445.00 $440.00 $440.00 $255.00 $255.00
F Office Depot, Inc. $445.16 $445.16 $445.16 $445.16 $415.72 $415.72 $150.01 $150.01
F Staples Tech Solutions $371.52 $371.52 $371.52 $371.52 $322.97 $322.97 $199.56 $199.56
O Adorama Inc. 5% $464.99 $488.24 $464.99 $488.24 $425.49 $446.76 $259.99 $272.99
O Beyond Technology 5% $355.20 $372.96 $355.20 $372.96 $309.20 $324.66 $190.81 $200.35
O CNI Office Supplies 5% $353.80 $371.49 $353.80 $371.49 $307.56 $322.94 $190.04 $199.54
O Monster Technology 5% $505.00 $530.25 $505.00 $530.25 $473.00 $496.65 $273.00 $286.65
O MTS Partners 5% $351.90 $369.50 $351.90 $369.50 $249.90 $262.40 $191.90 $201.50
O Southern Computer Warehouse 5% $440.42 $462.44 $440.42 $462.44 $411.92 $432.52 $236.83 $248.67
O The Tree House, Inc. 5% $412.80 $433.44 $412.80 $433.44 $385.35 $404.62 $221.90 $233.00
O Virtucom, Inc. 5% $425.00 $446.25 $425.00 $446.25 $396.00 $415.80 $229.00 $240.45

**

**
FL. Pref. 

Adj.

27/Lexmark toner 
(C782-Magenta)

28/Lexmark toner
(C782-Yellow)

29/Lexmark toner 
(C792-Black)

30/Lexmark toner 
(C792-Cyan)

FL. Pref. 
Adj.

31/Lexmark toner 
(C792-Magenta)

32/Lexmark toner 
(C792-Yellow)

33/Lexmark toner (T654) 34/Lexmark toner (E460)
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Bid Item #/Description 

Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

F A Group LLC $299.00 $299.00 $468.00 $468.00 $180.00 $180.00 $199.00 $199.00
F Office Depot, Inc. $279.83 $279.83 $355.39 $355.39 $181.51 $181.51 $200.98 $200.98
F Staples Tech Solutions $247.29 $247.29 $365.41 $365.41 $166.48 $166.48 $184.34 $184.34
O Adorama Inc. 5% $302.99 $318.14 $524.77 $551.01 $180.49 $189.51 $199.99 $209.99
O Beyond Technology 5% $236.20 $248.01 $349.41 $366.88 $144.93 $152.18 $160.15 $168.16
O CNI Office Supplies 5% $235.49 $247.26 No Bid No Bid $156.99 $164.84 $173.83 $182.52
O Monster Technology 5% $317.00 $332.85 $570.00 $598.50 $191.00 $200.55 $212.00 $222.60
O MTS Partners 5% $233.90 $245.60 $345.90 $363.20 $155.00 $162.75 $171.50 $180.08
O Southern Computer Warehouse 5% $276.86 $299.01 $429.12 $450.58 $162.04 $170.14 $179.43 $188.40
O The Tree House, Inc. 5% $259.35 $272.32 $407.85 $428.24 $154.00 $161.70 $170.50 $179.03
O Virtucom, Inc. 5% $267.00 $280.35 No Bid No Bid $163.00 $171.15 $178.80 $187.74

Bid Item #/Descripton

Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

F A Group LLC $199.00 $199.00 $199.00 $199.00 $396.00 $396.00 $87.00 $87.00
F Office Depot, Inc. $200.98 $200.98 $200.98 $200.98 $98.91 $98.91 $51.81 $51.81
F Staples Tech Solutions $184.34 $184.34 $184.34 $184.34 $171.89 $171.89 $119.18 $119.18
O Adorama Inc. 5% $198.30 $208.22 $205.03 $215.28 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Beyond Technology 5% $160.15 $168.16 $160.15 $168.16 $166.71 $175.05 $114.43 $120.15
O CNI Office Supplies 5% $173.83 $182.52 $173.83 $182.52 $180.82 $189.86 $123.35 $129.52
O Monster Technology 5% $212.00 $222.60 $212.00 $222.60 $110.00 $115.50 $68.00 $71.40
O MTS Partners 5% $171.50 $180.08 $171.50 $180.08 $67.00 $70.35 $52.00 $54.60
O Southern Computer Warehouse 5% $179.43 $188.40 $179.43 $188.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O The Tree House, Inc. 5% $170.50 $179.03 $170.50 $179.03 $127.85 $134.24 $49.00 $51.45
O Virtucom, Inc. 5% $178.80 $187.74 $178.80 $187.74 $354.00 $371.70 $172.00 $180.60

Bid Item #/Description 

Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

F A Group LLC $230.00 $230.00 $249.00 $249.00
F Office Depot, Inc. $415.72 $415.72 $51.81 $51.81
F Staples Tech Solutions $255.01 $255.01 $175.62 $175.62
O Adorama Inc. 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Beyond Technology 5% $245.37 $257.64 $168.33 $176.75
O CNI Office Supplies 5% $131.83 $138.42 $181.26 $190.32
O Monster Technology 5% $205.00 $215.25 $133.00 $139.65
O MTS Partners 5% $112.00 $117.60 $89.00 $93.45
O Southern Computer Warehouse 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O The Tree House, Inc. 5% $159.00 $166.95 $144.90 $152.15
O Virtucom, Inc. 5% $396.00 $415.80 No Bid No Bid

**

38/HP toner (Cyan)
**

FL. Pref. 
Adj.

35/Lexmark toner (MS510) 36/Lexmark toner (MS811) 37/HP toner (Black)

/

FL. Pref. 
Adj.

39/HP toner (Yellow)

**
FL. Pref. 

Adj.

43/Lexmark reman toner (T654) 44/Lexmark reman toner (E460) /

40/HP toner (Magenta) 41/Lexmark reman toner (T644) 42/Lexmark reman toner (E450)
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NOTES:

BID TABULATION, RECOMMENDATIONS, AND PROTEST
Bid tabulations with award recommendations are posted for 72 hours in the Purchasing Department Office and are also posted to the School District's website address at: http://ecsd-
fl.schoolloop.com/purchasing/bids

Failure to file a protest within the time prescribed in Section 120.57(3) Florida Statutes will constitute a waiver of proceedings under Chapter 120 Florida Statues and School Board 
Rules.  Bid tabulations or recommendations will be distributed solely through the Purchasing website address.  Notices will not be automatically mailed.

I hereby certify that the prices and bidders reflected herein are valid, and have been received in compliance to Escambia County School Board Rules and Florida Law.

John Dombroskie
John Dombroskie, Director
Purchasing Department
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