
 

 
 
 
DATE: BID TITLE & REFERENCE: 
July 9, 2014   Ala Carte Snack Items and Beverages for Direct Delivery to School 
    Cafeterias, RFP #142203 
 
DESCRIPTION OF PURCHASE: 

 

An annual agreement to provide direct delivery of ala carte snack items and beverages to school 
cafeterias throughout the District to be served as breakfast and lunch options and for ala carte sales.  
Thirty (30) items bid, twenty-two (22) items are awarded.   
 
Effective Dates:  August 1, 2014 through July 31, 2015. 
 
 
 
 
 
 

  
REQUESTED BY: 

 

Food Services 
 

    
SUPPLIER NAME:       ITEMS AWARDED:  ESTIMATED ANNUAL EXPENDITURE: 

 

Blue Bell Creameries, Mobile, Al     4            $     5,500.00 
Butler Foods of Pensacola, Cantonment, FL 11    101,200.00 

      Coca-Cola Refreshment, Pensacola, FL        7                       125,300.00  
               

                
    

AMOUNT OF PURCHASE: FUNDING SOURCE: 
 

$232,000.00 Est. / Yr.   Food Services Fund (4110) 
 

  
METHOD OF PROCUREMENT: 

 

ECSD Bid      Responses Received: 4  
 
  

DATE AND TIME POSTED: 
 

July 9, 2014, 2:40 pm Central Time 
 

 
9500 PUR100 (11/10) Retention – 5 Years 
 

 
THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY 

PURCHASING DEPARTMENT 
75 North Pace Blvd.  

Pensacola, FL  32505 
 

BID AWARD NOTICE 



DATE: June 24, 2014
BID NBR:142203

Where two prices are shown, the bottom price is the bid case/pack size
Top price is unit price needed to determine low cost because of vender differences in case count

ITEM Chips Crackers Crackers

Assorted Saltine
Quantity: 150,000 ea 30,000 pks 21,000 pks 50,000 ea

0520500 0512030 0512020 0520230
ITEM NUMBER 1 2 3 4

Blue Bell Creameries No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Mobile, AL
Buffalo Rock No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pensacola, FL
Butler Foods of Pensa. 0.3800 No Bid No Bid 0.4400
Cantonment, FL
Coca Cola Refreshment No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pensacola, FL
Damian's No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pensacola, FL

Not Awarded Not Awarded

ITEM Fruit Slush Chips,

Baked, .75 Mix Assorted Tortilla
Quantity: 45,900 ea 90,000 cs 30,000 ea 240,000 ea

0517470 0504090 0504090 0502310
ITEM NUMBER 5 6 7 8

Blue Bell Creameries No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Mobile, AL
Buffalo Rock No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pensacola, FL

Butler Foods of Pensa. 0.5900 No Bid 0.3900 0.3800 0.875 oz
Cantonment, FL 2.72 16 oz
Coca Cola Refreshment No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pensacola, FL
Damian's No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pensacola, FL

Not Awarded

Capt'n Wafers
Marshmallow
Square, Crisp

THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

75 NORTH PACE BOULEVARD
PENSACOLA, FLORIDA 32505

BID TABULATION

Awarded Items are highlighted

BID TITLE:  Ala Carte Snack Items and Beverages for Direct Delivery to School Cafeterias

Snack Crackers Cereal Snack
100% Fr. Juice
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ITEM Fudge Ice Cream

Bar Low Fat Cup Low Fat Low Fat
Quantity: 60,000 ea 15,000 ea 15,000 ea 15,000 ea

0530320 0530210 0530200 0530200
ITEM NUMBER 9 10 11 12

Blue Bell Creameries 0.3225 0.3608 0.2975 0.4025
Mobile, AL
Buffalo Rock No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pensacola, FL
Butler Foods of Pensa. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cantonment, FL
Coca Cola Refreshment No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pensacola, FL
Damian's 0.2900 a,u 0.3900 a,u No Bid 0.4900 a,u
Pensacola, FL

ITEM Crunch Bar Pudding Cup Water Water, 12 oz
Low Fat Frozen Unflavored Unflavored

Quantity: 15,000 ea 15,000 ea 35,000 ea 5,000 ea
0530320 0513080 0580020 0570550

ITEM NUMBER 13 14 15 16

Blue Bell Creameries No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Mobile, AL
Buffalo Rock No Bid No Bid 0.3500 20 oz 0.2800
Pensacola, FL
Butler Foods of Pensa. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cantonment, FL

Coca Cola Refreshment No Bid No Bid 0.2300 16.9 oz 0.2700
Pensacola, FL 0.36 20 oz
Damian's 0.3900 a,u No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pensacola, FL

Not Awarded Not Awarded

ITEM Water, 8 oz

Unflavored Flavored Vitamin Enr.
Quantity: 500 ea 10,000 ea 5,000 ea 5,000 ea

0570580
ITEM NUMBER 17 18 19 20

Blue Bell Creameries No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Mobile, AL
Buffalo Rock No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pensacola, FL
Butler Foods of Pensa. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cantonment, FL
Coca Cola Refreshment No Bid 0.3600 No Bid 0.9000
Pensacola, FL
Damian's No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pensacola, FL

Not Awarded Not Awarded

Water, 20 oz.

Ice Cream S'wich Ice Cream Cone

Water, FlavoredWater, 20 oz
Aerated, 12 oz

Items 9  - 12 Awarded as a Lot

Items 15 - 18 Awarded as a Lot
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ITEM Other Juice
100%, 4 oz 100%, 4 oz 100% 4 oz 100% 6 oz

Quantity: 360,000 ea 500 ea 15,000 ea 15,000 ea
0570590

ITEM NUMBER 21 22 23 24

Blue Bell Creameries No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Mobile, AL
Buffalo Rock No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pensacola, FL
Butler Foods of Pensa. 0.1900 0.1900 0.1900 0.2700
Cantonment, FL
Coca Cola Refreshment No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.2400
Pensacola, FL
Damian's No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pensacola, FL

ITEM Other Juice Tea,
100% 10 oz Sweet

Quantity: 150,000 ea 30,000 ea 20,000 ea 1,500 ea
0570590 0570540 05707650 0580030

ITEM NUMBER 25 26 27 28

Blue Bell Creameries No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Mobile, AL
Buffalo Rock No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pensacola, FL
Butler Foods of Pensa. No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.4800
Cantonment, FL
Coca Cola Refreshment 0.5400 0.6400 0.3800 No Bid
Pensacola, FL
Damian's No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pensacola, FL

ITEM Tea Tea
Artif. Sweet Unsweet

Quantity: 2,000 ea 2,000 ea
0580040

ITEM NUMBER 29 30

Blue Bell Creameries No Bid No Bid
Mobile, AL
Buffalo Rock No Bid No Bid
Pensacola, FL
Butler Foods of Pensa. 0.4800 No Bid
Cantonment, FL
Coca Cola Refreshment No Bid No Bid
Pensacola, FL
Damian's No Bid No Bid
Pensacola, FL

Not Awarded

Orange Juice Other JuiceApple Juice

Sports Drink 12 ozSports Drink 0 cal
Isotonic 20 oz Isotonic Low Cal

Items 21 - 24 Awarded as a Lot

Items 26 and 27 Awarded as a Lot

Items 28 -  29 Awarded as a Lot
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Vendor Approved
Blue Bell Creameries Yes

Yes
Yes

Yes
Yes
Yes

Damian's No - no sample received
No - no sample received
No - no sample received
No - no sample received
No - no sample received

Strawb'ry Fruit Bar 0.2925
Dream Bar 0.31

Item: Price

Lofat Choc. Cup 0.2975
Lofat Strawb'ry Cup 0.2975

BID TABULATION, RECOMMENDATIONS, AND PROTEST
Bid tabulations with award recommendations are posted for 72 hours in the Purchasing 
Department Office and are also posted to the School District's website address at: 
http://ecsd-fl.schoolloop.com/purchasing/bids

Failure to file a protest within the time prescribed in
Section 120.57(3) Florida Statutes, and School Board Rules shall constitute a waiver of proceedings.
Bid tabulations or recommendations will be distributed solely through the Purchasing 
website address.  Notices will not be automatically mailed.

I hereby certify that the prices and bidders reflected herein are valid, and have been received
in compliance to Escambia County School Board Rules and Florida Law.

John Dombroskie, Director
Purchasing Department

Rainbow Freeze 

Creamy Cott. 0.29

Van./Choc. Cone 0.49
Strawb. Shortcake 0.39
Orang. Cream Bar 0.29
Sour Swell Cherry 0.29

0.31

CookiesnCream 0.31
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