THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY
&n PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
75 North Pace Boulevard

Pensacola, FL 32505

432 1?

BID AWARD NOTICE

DATE: BID TITLE & REFERENCE:
April 1, 2014 Sports Equipment, Bid #141504

DESCRIPTION OF PURCHASE:

An annual purchasing agreement to provide sports equipment (fifty (50) items bid; forty-eight (48)
items awarded) to be stocked and distributed by the Central Warehouse. Items not awarded are due
to lack of bidder response and/or bidders not meeting minimum specifications. Items will be
purchased on an as needed basis to replenish the Central Warehouse inventory. Bid award(s) to the
lowest bidder(s) meeting specifications.

Effective Dates: May 1, 2014 through April 30, 2015.

REQUESTED BY:

Central Warehouse

SUPPLIER NAME: ITEMS AWARDED:  ESTIMATED ANNUAL EXPENDITURE:
A&B Management Group, Melbourne, FL 2 $ 1,050.00
All American, Elyria, OH 1 200.00
BSN Sports, Jenkintown, PA 32 7,100.00
Pyramid, Tampa, FL 9 5,400.00
Recreation Sports, Delray Beach, FL 1 25.00
S&S Worldwide, Colchester, CT 3 450.00
AMOUNT OF PURCHASE: FUNDING SOURCE:
$14,225.00 Est./Yr. General Fund (1110) — Regular Operations
METHOD OF PROCUREMENT:
ECSD Bid Responses Received: 10 Responses Rejected: 2

DATE AND TIME POSTED:

April 1, 2014, 12:00PM CST

9500PUR101 (11/10) Retention - 5 Years
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Date:
Bid Number:
Bid Title:

F=Florida Business; O=0ut of State Business

THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
75 NORTH PACE BOULEVARD
PENSACOLA, FL 32505

BID TABULATION

Tuesday, March 18, 2014

141504
Sports Equipment

Recommended Award

Bid Item #/Description 1/ Pinnies, High School 2/ Boundary Cones 3/ Marble Dust 4/ Field Paint
*k FL. Pref. Adj.
Bidder Name ] Bid Price Eval. Price [Notes Bid Price Eval. Price |Notes Bid Price Eval. Price |Notes Bid Price Eval. Price |Notes

F |A&B Mgmt (Southern Park) A, NS A, NS A, NS A, NS A, NS A, NS A, NS A, NS

F [Pyramid $2.20 $2.20 1 $3.29 $3.29 2 No Bid No Bid $33.99 $33.99 3
F |Recreation Sports No Bid No Bid $4.00 $4.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

O |All Am (Riddell) 5% No Bid No Bid A, NS A, NS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

O |BSN 5% A, NS A, NS A, NS A, NS A, NS A, NS A, NS A, NS

O |Evans & Company 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $32.52 $34.15| 7
O |MFAC (M-F Athletic) 5% No Bid No Bid A, NS A, NS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

O |S&S Worldwide 5% No Bid No Bid A, NS A, NS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bid Item #/Description 5/ Bases 6/ Badminton Shuttlecock 7/ Badminton Racket 8/ 7" Ball
X FL. Pref. Adj.
Bidder Name re J Bid Price Eval. Price [Notes Bid Price Eval. Price |Notes Bid Price Eval. Price |Notes Bid Price Eval. Price |Notes

F |A&B Mgmt (Southern Park) $10.99 $10.99 $2.24 $2.24 $12.49 $12.49 $3.99 $3.99

F [Pyramid $5.99 $5.99 4 $1.69 $1.69 5 A, NS A, NS $3.29 $3.29 6
F |Recreation Sports $8.00 $8.00 $2.40 $2.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

O |All Am (Riddell) 5% A, NS A, NS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

O |BSN 5% A, NS A, NS $1.32 $1.39 $3.95 $4.15 $2.23 $2.34

O |Evans & Company 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

O |MFAC (M-F Athletic) 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

O |S&S Worldwide 5% A, NS A, NS $3.77 $3.96 A, NS A, NS $4.55 $4.78
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Bid ltem #/Descripton 9/ 8 1/2" Ball 10/ 10" Ball 11/ 13" Ball 12/ Foam Ball, 7"
L FL. Pref. Adj.
Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price [Notes Bid Price Eval. Price |Notes Bid Price Eval. Price |Notes Bid Price Eval. Price |Notes
F |A&B Mgmt (Southern Park) $4.49 $4.49 $5.49 $5.49 $9.49 $9.49 $8.49 $9.49
F [Pyramid $2.98 $2.98 7 $3.89 $3.89 2 $8.69 $8.69 8 A, NS A, NS
F |Recreation Sports No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O |All Am (Riddell) 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O |BSN 5% $2.51 $2.64 $3.07 $3.22 $6.69 $7.02 $5.14 $5.40
O |Evans & Company 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O |MFAC (M-F Athletic) 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O |S&S Worldwide 5% $4.95 $5.20 $6.08 $6.38 $10.40 $10.92 $3.64 $3.82
Bid Item #/Description 13/ Foam Ball, Hi Bounce 14/ Foam Ball, Regular 15/ Football, foam, Jr. 16/ Football, foam, Official
*% i
Bidder Name FL. Pref. Adj. Bid Price Eval. Price [Notes Bid Price Eval. Price |Notes Bid Price Eval. Price |Notes Bid Price Eval. Price |Notes
F |A&B Mgmt (Southern Park) $4.49 $4.49 $2.99 $2.99 $9.99 $9.99 $10.49 $10.49
F |Pyramid A, NS A, NS $0.79 $0.79 9 A, NS A, NS A, NS A, NS
F |Recreation Sports No Bid No Bid $1.00 $1.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O |[All Am (Riddell) 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O |BSN 5% No Bid No Bid $0.95 $1.00 A, NS A, NS $6.26 $6.57
O |[Evans & Company 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O [MFAC (M-F Athletic) 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O |S&S Worldwide 5% $1.35 $1.42 A, NS A, NS $6.44 $6.76 $7.02 $7.37
Bid Item #/Descripton 17/ Ball Carrier 18/ Basketball, Mens, Official 19/ Basketball, Womens, Inter. 20/ Basketball, Mens, Reg.
** i
Bidder Name FL. Pref. Ad. Bid Price Eval. Price [Notes Bid Price Eval. Price |Notes Bid Price Eval. Price |Notes Bid Price Eval. Price |Notes
F |A&B Mgmt (Southern Park) $6.99 $6.99 $8.99 $8.99 $8.99 $8.99 $11.99 $11.99
F |Pyramid $2.39 $2.39 8 $5.99 $5.99 10 $5.98 $5.98 10 $5.98 $5.98| 10
F |Recreation Sports $3.00 $3.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O |[All Am (Riddell) 5% A, NS A, NS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid A, NS A, NS
O |BSN 5% $2.14 $2.25 $3.73 $3.92 $3.77 $3.96 $4.95 $5.20
O |[Evans & Company 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O [MFAC (M-F Athletic) 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O |S&S Worldwide 5% A, NS A, NS $6.54 $6.87 $6.41 $6.73 $6.54 $6.87
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Bid Item #/Description

21/ Basketball, Mens, Indoor

22/ Football, Intermediate

23/ Football, Senior size

24/ Football, Official

* FL. Pref. Adj. o ) o ) o i L .

Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price [Notes Bid Price Eval. Price |Notes Bid Price Eval. Price |Notes Bid Price Eval. Price |Notes
F |A&B Mgmt (Southern Park) $39.95 $39.95 $9.99 $9.99 $10.99 $10.99 $12.49 $12.49
F |Pyramid No Bid No Bid $6.99 $6.99 10 $6.29 $6.29 10 $7.69 $7.69| 10
F |Recreation Sports No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O |[All Am (Riddell) 5% No Bid No Bid A, NS A, NS A, NS A, NS No Bid No Bid
O |BSN 5% A, NS A, NS $3.36 $3.53 $3.40 $3.57 $6.88 $7.22
O |[Evans & Company 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O [MFAC (M-F Athletic) 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O |S&S Worldwide 5% No Bid No Bid $10.51 $11.04 $7.07 $7.42 $10.90 $11.45

Bid Item #/Descripton 25/ Frisbee 26/ Bean Bags 27/ Table Tennis Balls 28/ Table Tennis Paddles

*% i

Bidder Name FL. Pref. Adj. Bid Price Eval. Price [Notes Bid Price Eval. Price |Notes Bid Price Eval. Price |Notes Bid Price Eval. Price |Notes
F |A&B Mgmt (Southern Park) $5.09 $5.09 $0.99 $0.99 $4.00 $4.00 $3.49 $3.49
F |Pyramid $1.69 $1.69 10 $1.04 $1.04| 5E $2.28 $2.28 5 $1.79 $1.79] 2
F |Recreation Sports $1.75 $1.75 $1.49 $1.49 No Bid No Bid $1.90 $1.90
O |[All Am (Riddell) 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O |BSN 5% $1.50 $1.58 $5.67 $5.95 $1.68 $1.76 $1.32 $1.39
O |[Evans & Company 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O [MFAC (M-F Athletic) 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O [S&S Worldwide 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid A, NS A, NS A, NS A, NS

Bid Item #/Description 29/ Deck Ring 30/ Flags, Football 31/ Flag Football Set 32/ Jump Rope, #12

** i

Bidder Name FL. Pref. Ad. Bid Price Eval. Price [Notes Bid Price Eval. Price |Notes Bid Price Eval. Price |Notes Bid Price Eval. Price |Notes
F |A&B Mgmt (Southern Park) $28.99 $28.99 $4.19 $4.19 $2.15 $2.15 No Bid No Bid
F [Pyramid A, NS A, NS A, NS A, NS A, NS A, NS No Bid No Bid
F |Recreation Sports No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O |All Am (Riddell) 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O |BSN 5% $17.83 $18.72 $1.70 $1.79 $0.87 $0.91 No Bid No Bid
O |Evans & Company 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O |MFAC (M-F Athletic) 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O |S&S Worldwide 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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Bid Item #/Descripton

33/ Jump Rope, 9'

34/ Jump Rope, 16'

35/ Basketball Goal Nets

36/ Volleyball Net

* FL. Pref. Adj. . ) o ; . ) o )

Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price [Notes Bid Price Eval. Price [Notes Bid Price Eval. Price |Notes Bid Price Eval. Price [Notes
F |A&B Mgmt (Southern Park) $2.09 $2.09 $3.99 $3.99 $4.50 $4.50 $30.99 $30.99
F |Pyramid $1.59 $1.59 6 $2.24 $2.24 6 $1.79 $1.79 2 No Bid No Bid
F |Recreation Sports $1.72 $1.72 $2.88 $2.88 $2.50 $2.50 No Bid No Bid
O |[All Am (Riddell) 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O |BSN 5% $0.97 $1.02 $1.64 $1.72 $1.68 $1.76 $16.46 $17.28
O |[Evans & Company 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O [MFAC (M-F Athletic) 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O [S&S Worldwide 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid A, NS A, NS No Bid No Bid

Bid Item #/Description 37/ Soccer Ball, Regulation 38/ Soccer Ball, Highgrade 39/ Tennis Rackets 40/ Tennis Balls

** i

Bidder Name FL. Pref. Adj. Bid Price Eval. Price [Notes Bid Price Eval. Price [Notes Bid Price Eval. Price |Notes Bid Price Eval. Price [Notes
F |A&B Mgmt (Southern Park) $8.75 $8.75 $12.99 $12.99 $19.49 $19.49 $4.99 $4.99
F [Pyramid $5.94 $5.94 10 A, NS A, NS A, NS A, NS $2.45 $2.45 6
F |Recreation Sports No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O |All Am (Riddell) 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O [BSN 5% $3.28 $3.44 $5.00 $5.25 $6.98 $7.33 $2.63 $2.76
O |Evans & Company 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O |MFAC (M-F Athletic) 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O |S&S Worldwide 5% $6.94 $7.29 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bid Item #/Descripton 41/ Baton 42/ Spike, Track 43/ Whistles 44/ Whistle Covers

** i

Bidder Name FL. Pref. Adj. Bid Price Eval. Price [Notes Bid Price Eval. Price [Notes Bid Price Eval. Price |Notes Bid Price Eval. Price [Notes
F |A&B Mgmt (Southern Park) $3.19 $3.19 $13.75 $13.75 $1.35 $1.35 $0.64 $0.64
F |Pyramid $2.26 $2.26 5 No Bid No Bid A, NS A, NS $0.37 $0.37| 5
F |Recreation Sports $0.80 $0.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.49 $0.49
O |All Am (Riddell) 5% No Bid No Bid $7.98 $8.38 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O |BSN 5% $1.45 $1.52 $8.32 $8.74 $0.68 $0.71 5 $0.25 $0.26 5
O |[Evans & Company 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O [MFAC (M-F Athletic) 5% A, NS A, NS A, NS A, NS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O [S&S Worldwide 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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Bid Item #/Description 45/ Lanyard, Whistle 46/ Timer/Stop Watches 47/ Volleyballs, Regulation 48/ Volleyballs, Official
*% H
Bidder Name FL. Pref. Ad) Bid Price Eval. Price [Notes Bid Price Eval. Price [Notes Bid Price Eval. Price |Notes Bid Price Eval. Price [Notes
F |A&B Mgmt (Southern Park) $0.69 $0.69 $24.99 $24.99 $6.19 $6.19 $36.49 $36.49
F |Pyramid $0.31 $0.31 11 $15.05 $15.05 12 $5.69 $5.69 10 $23.29 $23.29| 5
F |Recreation Sports $0.40 $0.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O |All Am (Riddell) 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $32.79 $34.43
O |BSN 5% $0.22 $0.23 5 $15.41 $16.18 $3.16 $3.32 $27.59 $28.97
O |[Evans & Company 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O |MFAC (M-F Athletic) 5% No Bid No Bid $19.95 $20.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O [S&S Worldwide 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $7.27 $7.63 $27.91 $29.31
Bid Item #/Descripton 49/ Volleyball, Starter 50/ Hand Pump / /
* FL. Pref. Adj. L : o . o : o .
Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price [Notes Bid Price Eval. Price [Notes Bid Price Eval. Price |Notes Bid Price Eval. Price [Notes

F |A&B Mgmt (Southern Park) $16.99 $16.99 $5.29 $5.29
F |Pyramid $12.39 $12.39 5 A, NS A, NS
F |Recreation Sports No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O |All Am (Riddell) 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O |BSN 5% No Bid No Bid $2.59 $2.72
O |Evans & Company 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O |MFAC (M-F Athletic) 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O |S&S Worldwide 5% $13.55 $14.23 No Bid No Bid

NOTES:

A Alternate

S Sample sent

E equivalent pricing

1 Min. order 12/pk, full packs only

2 Min. order 24 qty

3 Min. order 35 gty

4 Min. order 6 sets

5 Min. order 12 gty

6 Min. order 48 qty

7 Min. order 60 gty

8 Min. order 20 gty

9 Min. order 50 gty

10 Min. order 36 gty

11 Min. order 144 qty

12 Min. order 15 gty
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BID TABULATION, RECOMMENDATIONS, AND PROTEST
Bid tabulations with award recommendations are posted for 72 hours in the Purchasing Department Office and are also posted to the School District's website address at:
http://old.escambia.k12.fl.us/adminoff/finance/purchasing/current_bid_activity.html

Failure to file a protest within the time prescribed in Section 120.57(3) Florida Statutes will constitute a waiver of proceedings under Chapter 120 Florida Statues and School Board Rules.
Bid tabulations or recommendations will be distributed solely through the Purchasing website address. Notices will not be automatically mailed.

| hereby certify that the prices and bidders reflected herein are valid, and have been received in compliance to Escambia County School Board Rules and Florida Law.

Vol Donbroskie

John Dombroskie, Director
Purchasing Department
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