THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY
&n PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

75 North Pace Blvd

Pensacola, FL 32505

432 1?

BID AWARD NOTICE

DATE: BID TITLE & REFERENCE:
August 9, 2013 Computer Peripherals, Bid #140304

DESCRIPTION OF PURCHASE:

A nine (9) month pricing agreement to provide computer peripherals for classroom and administrative
use throughout the District. Fifty-four (54) items were bid and fifty-four (54) items are awarded.
ltems will be purchased on an as needed basis. The Bid, written in conjunction with the IT
Department to address their needs, increases standardization within the District and offers all schools
and departments the ability to take advantage of lower prices on IT approved products over the
effective period of the bid.

Effective Dates: September 1, 2013 through May 31, 2014.

REQUESTED BY:

Information Technology

SUPPLIER NAME: ITEMS AWARDED: ESTIMATED EXPENDITURE:
Camcor, Burlington, NC 2 $ 16,400.00
CCS Presentation, Jacksonville, FL 4 7,200.00
CF Motion, Largo, FL 26 316,700.00
City Toner, Miami, FL 4 34,600.00
CNI Office Supplies, East Brunswick, NJ 1 3,500.00
Collaboration Solutions, Jacksonville, FL 2 6,400.00
Evolvtec, Ft. Lauderdale, FL 2 14,400.00
GMx Technologies, Tampa, FL 3 7,000.00
Interlight, Hammond, IN 1 2,000.00
Staples, Deerfield Beach, FL 3 57,500.00
Tree House, Wellington, FL 5 15,500.00
Y and S Technologies, Brooklyn, NY 1 14,500.00

AMOUNT OF PURCHASE:

$495,700.00 Est. / 9 Mos.

FUNDING SOURCE:

Various

METHOD OF PROCUREMENT:

ECSD Bid

Responses Received: 27

DATE AND TIME POSTED:

August 9, 2013, 2:00PM CST

9500PUR101 (11/10) Retention - 5 Years

Responses Rejected: 1



*%

Date:
Bid Number:
Bid Title:

THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY

PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

75 NORTH PACE BOULEVARD
PENSACOLA, FL 32505

BID TABULATION

F=Florida Business; O=0ut of State Business

7/25/2013
140304

Computer Peripherals

Recommended Award

Bid Item #/Description

1/Keyspan remote

2/ F15 document camera

3/Floor stand

4/87" whiteboard

o FL. Pref.
Bidder Name Adj. Bid Price Eval. Price [Notes Bid Price | Eval. Price [Notes Bid Price Eval. Price [Notes Bid Price Eval. Price |Notes

F |Audio Visual Innovation No Bid No Bid $333.32 $333.32 $344.11 $344.11 $2,142.66 $2,142.66
O |Aves Audio 5% $45.80 $48.09 $318.00 $333.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O |B&H 5% $42.94 $45.09 $313.00 $328.65 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F |BES Industries No Bid No Bid $249.99 $249.99| A NS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F |Business Services $56.98 $56.98 $353.98 $353.98 $1,229.98[ $1,229.98 $3,949.98 $3,949.98
O [Camcor 5% $49.44 $51.91 $281.69 $295.77 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F |CCS Presentation No Bid No Bid $325.78 $325.78 $329.32 $329.32 $2,097.89 $2,097.89
O [CDW Government 5% $45.34 $47.61 $328.65 $345.08 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F |CF Motion $42.00 $42.00 $390.00 $390.00 $287.00 $287.00 $1,899.00 $1,899.00
F |City Toner No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O |CNI Office 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F |Collaboration Solutions $41.75 $41.75 No Bid No Bid $285.00 $285.00 $2,030.00 $2,030.00
F |Diskovery Educational $61.13 $61.13 $363.30 $363.30 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F |Evolvtec $43.97 $43.97 $397.44 $397.44 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F |GMx Technologies $45.00 $45.00 $350.00 $350.00 $450.00 $450.00 $4,500.00 $4,500.00
O [Interlight 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F |Kynetic $48.00 $48.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O |Southern Computer 5% $45.51 $47.79 $312.55 $328.18 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F |Staples $45.98 $45.98 $343.48 $343.48 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F |Tree House No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F |Troxell $46.22 $46.22 $311.21 $311.21 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F |United Data Technologies DNBAS DNBAS 2 DNBAS DNBAS 2 DNBAS DNBAS 2 DNBAS DNBAS 2
O [|Virtucom 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O |Y and S Technologies 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O |Zalmen Reiss 5% $46.90 $49.25 $339.95 $356.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O [Zones 5% $47.90 $50.30 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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Bid Item #/Descripton — 5/96W projector 6/485W projector 7/83+ bulb 8/84+ bulb
*% : :
Bidder Name Adj. Bid Price Eval. Price [Notes Bid Price | Eval. Price [Notes Bid Price Eval. Price |Notes Bid Price Eval. Price |Notes

F |Audio Visual Innovation $545.65 $545.65 $1,073.91 $1,073.91 $143.00 $143.00 $218.00 $218.00
O |Aves Audio 5% $661.00 $694.05 $1,241.00f $1,303.05 $163.00 $171.15 $240.00 $252.00
O |B&H 5% $716.99 $752.84 $1,366.00] $1,434.30 $149.00 $156.45 $244.95 $257.20
F |BES Industries $468.00 $468.00] A/ NS | $1,104.00] $1,104.00f A,NS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F |Business Services $739.98 $739.98 $1,379.98[ $1,379.98 $179.98 $179.98 $259.98 $259.98
O [Camcor 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $160.60 $168.63 $243.63 $255.81
F |CCS Presentation $544.00 $544.00 $1,049.00( $1,049.00 $141.94 $141.94 $216.13 $216.13
O |CDW Government 5% $550.00 $577.50 $1,055.00f $1,107.75 $139.00 $145.95 $214.00 $224.70
F |CF Motion $539.00 $539.00 $934.00 $934.00 $140.00 $140.00 $217.00 $217.00
F |City Toner No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O |CNI Office 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $165.44 $173.71 $252.21 $264.82
F |Collaboration Solutions No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F |Diskovery Educational No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $180.79 $180.79 $269.88 $269.88
F |Evolvtec $825.00 $825.00 $1,500.00f $1,500.00 $153.91 $153.91 $234.11 $234.11
F |GMx Technologies $700.00 $700.00 $1,350.00f $1,350.00 $155.00 $155.00 $235.00 $235.00
O |Interlight 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $134.99 $141.74 $129.99 $136.49
F |Kynetic $698.00 $698.00 $1,326.00f $1,326.00 $161.00 $161.00 $244.00 $244.00
O |Southern Computer 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F |Staples $682.37 $682.37 $1,295.98| $1,295.98 $154.86 $154.86 $236.13 $236.13
F |Tree House $699.90 $699.90 $1,332.25[ $1,332.25 $153.85 $153.85 $233.40 $233.40
F |Troxell $701.08 $701.08 $1,319.31] $1,319.31 $155.27 $155.27 $234.56 $234.56
F |United Data Technologies DNBAS DNBAS 2 DNBAS DNBAS 2 DNBAS DNBAS 2 DNBAS DNBAS 2
O |Virtucom 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O |Y and S Technologies 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O |Zalmen Reiss 5% DNBAS DNBAS 3 DNBAS DNBAS 3 $159.90 $167.90 $239.90 $251.90
O [Zones 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $165.32 $173.59 $258.18 $271.09
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Bid Item #/TDescription FL Pref 9/95 bulb 10/96W bulb 11/450W bulb 12/475W bulb

- Bidder Name Adj. Bid Price Eval. Price [Notes Bid Price | Eval. Price [Notes Bid Price Eval. Price [Notes Bid Price Eval. Price |Notes
F |Audio Visual Innovation $97.00 $97.00 $97.00 $97.00 $122.00 $122.00 $61.80 $61.80
O |Aves Audio 5% $240.00 $252.00 $240.00 $252.00 $144.00 $151.20 $70.00 $73.50
O |B&H 5% $249.95 $262.45 $249.95 $262.45 $133.00 $139.65 $76.95 $80.80
F |BES Industries No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F |Business Services $259.98 $259.98 $259.98 $259.98 $159.98 $159.98 $89.98 $89.98
O [|Camcor 5% $243.63 $255.81 $243.63 $255.81 $137.31 $144.18 $68.40 $71.82
F |CCS Presentation $95.70 $95.70 $95.70 $95.70 $120.43 $120.43 $61.29 $61.29
O |CDW Government 5% $97.00 $101.85 $97.00 $101.85 $122.00 $128.10 $61.80 $64.89
F |CF Motion $220.00 $220.00 $220.00 $220.00 $122.00 $122.00 $77.00 $77.00
F |City Toner No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O |CNI Office 5% $252.21 $264.82 $252.21 $264.82 $141.37 $148.44 $71.00 $74.55
F |Collaboration Solutions No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F |Diskovery Educational $272.14 $272.14 $269.83 $269.83 $159.13 $159.13 No Bid No Bid
F |Evolvtec $234.11 $234.11 $234.11 $234.11 $131.45 $131.45 $61.79 $61.79
F |GMx Technologies $235.00 $235.00 $235.00 $235.00 $135.00 $135.00 $65.00 $65.00
O [Interlight 5% $144.99 $152.24 $129.99 $136.49 $129.99 $136.49 $119.99 $125.99
F |Kynetic $244.00 $244.00 $244.00 $244.00 $138.00 $138.00 $71.00 $71.00
O |Southern Computer 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F |Staples $236.13 $236.13 $236.13 $236.13 $132.25 $132.25 $61.79 $61.79
F |Tree House $233.40 $233.40 $233.40 $233.40 $131.60 $131.60 $62.55 $62.55
F |Troxell $234.56 $234.56 $234.56 $234.56 $133.06 $133.06 $64.18 $64.18
F |United Data Technologies DNBAS DNBAS 2 DNBAS DNBAS 2 DNBAS DNBAS 2 DNBAS DNBAS 2
O [Virtucom 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O |Y and S Technologies 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O |Zalmen Reiss 5% $239.90 $251.90 $239.90 $251.90 $134.90 $141.65 $63.90 $67.10
O |Zones 5% $258.18 $271.09 $258.18 $271.09 $145.00 $152.25 $68.42 $71.84
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Bid Item #/Descripton

13/C792DE printer

14/MS510DN printer

15/MS811N printer

16/MS811N w/2 add'l drawer

o FL. Pref.
Bidder Name Adj. Bid Price Eval. Price |Notes Bid Price | Eval. Price |Notes Bid Price Eval. Price [Notes Bid Price Eval. Price |Notes

F |Audio Visual Innovation No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O |Aves Audio 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O |B&H 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F |BES Industries No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F [Business Services $1,599.98( $1,599.98 $599.98 $599.98 $1,039.98| $1,039.98 $2,169.98 $2,169.98
O |Camcor 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F |CCS Presentation No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O |CDW Government 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F |CF Motion $1,165.00f $1,165.00 $495.00 $495.00 $941.00 $941.00 $1,882.00 $1,882.00
F |City Toner No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O |CNI Office 5% $1,269.00( $1,332.45 $486.19 $510.50 $843.50 $885.68 $2,021.44 $2,122.51
F |Collaboration Solutions No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F |Diskovery Educational $1,818.30f $1,818.30 $628.88 $628.88 $1,088.19| $1,088.19 No Bid No Bid
F |Evolvtec $1,214.27( $1,214.27 $465.62 $465.62 $806.00 $806.00 $1,712.06 $1,712.06
F |GMx Technologies $1,500.00] $1,500.00 $560.00 $560.00 $1,000.00f $1,000.00 $4,100.00 $4,100.00
O [Interlight 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F |Kynetic $1,528.00f $1,528.00 $590.00 $590.00 $995.00 $995.00 $2,190.00 $2,190.00
O |Southern Computer 5% $1,247.33( $1,309.70 $480.26 $504.27 $801.23 $841.29 $1,834.86 $1,926.60
F |Staples $1,265.01| $1,265.01 $445.28 $445.28 $772.79 $772.79 $1,472.73 $1,472.73
F |[Tree House $1,491.10( $1,491.10 $570.40 $570.40 $957.80 $957.80 No Bid No Bid
F [Troxell No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F |United Data Technologies DNBAS DNBAS 2 DNBAS DNBAS 2 DNBAS DNBAS 2 DNBAS DNBAS 2
O |Virtucom 5% $1,180.00] $1,239.00 $468.00 $491.40 $798.00 $837.90 $1,721.80 $1,807.89
O |Y and S Technologies 5% $1,198.00f $1,257.90 $456.00 $478.80 $727.00 $763.35 $1,658.00 $1,740.90
O |Zalmen Reiss 5% No Bid No Bid $618.50 $649.43 $1,048.52| $1,100.95 No Bid No Bid
O |Zones 5% $1,563.46) $1,641.63 $584.88 $614.12 $986.40] $1,035.72 $2,094.69 $2,199.42
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Bid Item #/Description

17/MS811N w/1 add'l drawer

18/T644N Lexmark

19/T632N Lexmark

20/E450DN Lexmark

o FL. Pref.
Bidder Name Adj. Bid Price Eval. Price |Notes Bid Price | Eval. Price [Notes Bid Price Eval. Price |Notes Bid Price Eval. Price |Notes

F |Audio Visual Innovation No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O |Aves Audio 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O |B&H 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F |BES Industries No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F |Business Services $1,299.98( $1,299.98 $359.98 $359.98 $359.98 $359.98 $179.98 $179.98
O |Camcor 5% No Bid No Bid $358.43 $376.35 $358.98 $376.93 $170.99 $179.54
F |CCS Presentation No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O |CDW Government 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F |CF Motion $1,176.00] $1,176.00 $248.00 $248.00 $243.00 $243.00 $131.00 $131.00
F |City Toner No Bid No Bid $332.37 $332.37 $329.58 $329.58 $158.42 $158.42
O |CNI Office 5% $1,063.17| $1,116.33 $255.32 $268.09 $246.05 $258.35 $132.40 $139.02
F |Collaboration Solutions No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F |Diskovery Educational No Bid No Bid $387.79 $387.79 $384.48 $384.48 $188.93 $188.93
F |Evolvtec $979.35 $979.35 $271.12 $271.12 $262.15 $262.15 $140.09 $140.09
F |GMx Technologies $1,250.00] $1,250.00 $335.00 $335.00 $335.00 $335.00 $160.00 $160.00
O [Interlight 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F [Kynetic $1,205.00] $1,205.00 $366.00 $366.00 $367.00 $367.00 $180.50 $180.50
O |Southern Computer 5% $1,040.43] $1,092.45 $340.85 $357.89 $341.16 $358.22 $161.45 $169.52
F |Staples $935.20 $935.20 $268.11 $268.11 $258.38 $258.38 $139.04 $139.04
F |Tree House No Bid No Bid $332.75 $332.75 $333.25 $333.25 $157.65 $157.65
F [Troxell No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F |United Data Technologies DNBAS DNBAS 2 DNBAS DNBAS 2 DNBAS DNBAS 2 DNBAS DNBAS 2
O |Virtucom 5% $1,001.00f $1,051.05 $258.00 $270.90 $248.00 $260.40 $135.00 $141.75
O |Y and S Technologies 5% $895.00 $939.75 $261.00 $274.05 $258.00 $270.90 $135.98 $142.78
O |Zalmen Reiss 5% $1,075.00] $1,128.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O |Zones 5% $1,232.72| $1,294.36 $353.68 $371.36 $314.13 $329.84 $175.47 $184.24
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Bid Item #/Descripton

21/C782 (Black) Lexmark

22/C782 (Cyan) Lexmark

23/C782 (Magenta) Lexmark

24/C782 (Yellow) Lexmark

o FL. Pref.
Bidder Name Adj. Bid Price Eval. Price |Notes Bid Price | Eval. Price [Notes Bid Price Eval. Price |Notes Bid Price Eval. Price |Notes

F |Audio Visual Innovation No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O |Aves Audio 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O |B&H 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F |BES Industries No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F |Business Services $189.98 $189.98 $399.98 $399.98 $399.98 $399.98 $399.98 $399.98
O [Camcor 5% $177.46 $186.33 $397.16 $417.02 $397.16 $417.02 $397.16 $417.02
F |CCS Presentation No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O |CDW Government 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F |CF Motion $134.00 $134.00 $302.00 $302.00 $302.00 $302.00 $302.00 $302.00
F |City Toner $161.12 $161.12 $362.96 $362.96 $362.96 $362.96 $362.96 $362.96
O |CNI Office 5% $138.17 $145.08 $310.79 $326.33 $310.79 $326.33 $310.79 $326.33
F [Collaboration Solutions No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F |Diskovery Educational $191.93 $191.93 $428.19 $428.19 $427.93 $427.93 $428.30 $428.30
F |Evolvtec $146.09 $146.09 $327.41 $327.41 $327.41 $327.41 $327.41 $327.41
F |GMx Technologies $163.00 $163.00 $369.00 $369.00 $369.00 $369.00 $369.00 $369.00
O [Interlight 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F |Kynetic $188.50 $188.50 $404.50 $404.50 $404.50 $404.50 $404.50 $404.50
O |Southern Computer 5% $164.24 $172.45 $362.57 $380.70 $362.57 $380.70 $362.57 $380.70
F |Staples $145.09 $145.09 $326.36 $326.36 $326.36 $326.36 $326.36 $326.36
F |Tree House $164.90 $164.90 $368.30 $368.30 $368.30 $368.30 $368.30 $368.30
F |Troxell No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F |United Data Technologies DNBAS DNBAS 2 DNBAS DNBAS 2 DNBAS DNBAS 2 DNBAS DNBAS 2
O |Virtucom 5% $140.00 $147.00 $315.00 $330.75 $315.00 $330.75 $315.00 $330.75
O |Y and S Technologies 5% $208.98 $219.43 $317.98 $333.88 $318.88 $334.82 $318.88 $334.82
O |Zalmen Reiss 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O |Zones 5% $179.87 $188.86 $405.20 $425.46 $405.20 $425.46 $405.20 $425.46
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Bid Item #/Description

25/C792 (Black) Lexmark

26/C792 (Cyan) Lexmark

27/C792 (Magenta) Lexmark

28/C792 (Yellow) Lexmark

o FL. Pref.
Bidder Name Adj. Bid Price Eval. Price |Notes Bid Price | Eval. Price |Notes Bid Price Eval. Price [Notes Bid Price Eval. Price |Notes

F |Audio Visual Innovation No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O |Aves Audio 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O |B&H 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F |BES Industries No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F [Business Services $269.98 $269.98 $449.98 $449.98 $449.98 $449.98 $449.98 $449.98
O |Camcor 5% $262.64 $275.77 $453.42 $476.09 $453.42 $476.09 $453.42 $476.09
F |CCS Presentation No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O |CDW Government 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F |CF Motion $198.00 $198.00 $343.00 $343.00 $343.00 $343.00 $343.00 $343.00
F |City Toner $155.67 $155.67 $236.20 $236.20 $236.30 $236.30 $236.20 $236.20
O |CNI Office 5% $204.24 $214.45 $353.80 $371.49 $353.80 $371.49 $353.80 $371.49
F |Collaboration Solutions No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F |Diskovery Educational $288.97 $288.97 $491.19 $491.19 $489.79 $489.79 $490.80 $490.80
F |Evolvtec $227.69 $227.69 $372.68 $372.68 $372.68 $372.68 $372.68 $372.68
F |GMx Technologies No Bid No Bid $420.38 $420.38 $420.38 $420.38 $420.38 $420.38
O [Interlight 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F |Kynetic $275.00 $275.00 $460.00 $460.00 $460.00 $460.00 $460.00 $460.00
O |Southern Computer 5% $243.99 $256.19 $422.66 $443.79 $422.66 $443.79 $422.66 $443.79
F |Staples $214.48 $214.48 $371.52 $371.52 $371.52 $371.52 $371.52 $371.52
F |[Tree House $244.00 $244.00 $420.70 $420.70 $420.70 $420.70 $420.70 $420.70
F [Troxell No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F |United Data Technologies DNBAS DNBAS 2 DNBAS DNBAS 2 DNBAS DNBAS 2 DNBAS DNBAS 2
O |Virtucom 5% $208.00 $218.40 $358.00 $375.90 $358.00 $375.90 $358.00 $375.90
O |Y and S Technologies 5% $206.00 $216.30 $309.98 $325.48 $362.89 $381.03 $362.88 $381.02
O |Zalmen Reiss 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O |Zones 5% $269.28 $282.74 $466.47 $489.79 $466.47 $489.79 $466.47 $489.79
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Bid Item #/Descripton

29/T654 Lexmark

30/E460DN Lexmark

31/MS510DN Lexmark

32/MS811N Lexmark

. FL. Pref.
Bidder Name Adj. Bid Price Eval. Price |Notes Bid Price | Eval. Price [Notes Bid Price Eval. Price |Notes Bid Price Eval. Price |Notes

F |Audio Visual Innovation No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O |Aves Audio 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O |B&H 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F |BES Industries No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F |Business Services $399.98 $399.98 $229.98 $229.98 $289.98 $289.98 $449.98 $449.98
O [|Camcor 5% $399.72 $419.71 $231.05 $242.60 $285.80 $300.09 $429.31 $450.78
F |CCS Presentation No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O |CDW Government 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F |CF Motion $304.00 $304.00 $188.00 $188.00 $283.00 $283.00 $458.00 $458.00
F |City Toner $370.88 $370.88 $213.56 $213.56 $274.75 $274.75 $489.59 $489.59
O |CNI Office 5% $307.56 $322.94 $190.04 $199.54 $235.49 $247.26 $370.28 $388.79
F |Collaboration Solutions No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F |Diskovery Educational $457.30 $457.30 $263.19 $263.19 $319.17 $319.17 $466.30 $466.30
F |Evolvtec $324.43 $324.43 $199.81 $199.81 $247.35 $247.35 $388.36 $388.36
F |GMx Technologies $375.00 $375.00 $215.43 $215.43 $267.00 $267.00 $415.00 $415.00
O [Interlight 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F [Kynetic $407.00 $407.00 $245.00 $245.00 $301.00 $301.00 $460.00 $460.00
O |Southern Computer 5% $380.03 $399.03 $216.85 $227.69 $270.47 $283.99 $420.35 $441.37
F |Staples $322.97 $322.97 $195.23 $195.23 $247.29 $247.29 $388.83 $388.83
F |Tree House $371.00 $371.00 $213.60 $213.60 $264.05 $264.05 $415.15 $415.15
F [Troxell No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F |United Data Technologies DNBAS DNBAS 2 DNBAS DNBAS 2 DNBAS DNBAS 2 DNBAS DNBAS 2
O |Virtucom 5% $310.00 $325.50 $195.00 $204.75 DNBAS DNBAS $388.00 $407.40
O |Y and S Technologies 5% $317.88 $333.77 $195.88 $205.67 $241.98 $254.08 $380.98 $400.03
O |Zalmen Reiss 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O |Zones 5% $412.08 $432.68 $236.04 $247.84 $294.72 $309.46 $463.42 $486.59
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Bid Item #/Description

33/T644 Rhinotek

34/T632N Rhinotek

35/E450DN Rhinotek

36/C782N (Black) Rhinotek

o FL. Pref.
Bidder Name Adj. Bid Price Eval. Price |Notes Bid Price | Eval. Price |Notes Bid Price Eval. Price |Notes Bid Price Eval. Price |Notes

F |Audio Visual Innovation No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O |Aves Audio 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O |B&H 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F |BES Industries No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F [Business Services No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O |Camcor 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F |CCS Presentation No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O |CDW Government 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F |CF Motion $237.00 $237.00 $152.00 $152.00 $132.00 $132.00 $134.00 $134.00
F |City Toner No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O |CNI Office 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F |Collaboration Solutions No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F |Diskovery Educational No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F |Evolvtec $271.12 $271.12 $317.44 $317.44 $140.09 $140.09 $146.09 $146.09
F |GMx Technologies $335.00 $335.00 $336.00 $336.00 $158.00 $158.00 $163.00 $163.00
O [Interlight 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F |Kynetic $370.00 $370.00 $372.00 $372.00 $187.00 $187.00 $195.00 $195.00
O |Southern Computer 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F |Staples No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F |Tree House No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F [Troxell No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F |United Data Technologies DNBAS DNBAS 2 DNBAS DNBAS 2 DNBAS DNBAS 2 DNBAS DNBAS 2
O |Virtucom 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O |Y and S Technologies 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O |Zalmen Reiss 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O |Zones 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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Bid Item #/Descripton

37/C782 (Cyan) Rhinotek

38/C782 (Magenta) Rhinotek

39/C782 (Yellow) Rhinotek

40/C792 (Black) Rhinotek

o FL. Pref.
Bidder Name Adj. Bid Price Eval. Price |Notes Bid Price | Eval. Price [Notes Bid Price Eval. Price |Notes Bid Price Eval. Price |Notes

F |Audio Visual Innovation No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O |Aves Audio 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O |B&H 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F |BES Industries No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F |Business Services No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O |Camcor 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F |CCS Presentation No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O |CDW Government 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F |CF Motion $302.00 $302.00 $302.00 $302.00 $302.00 $302.00 $198.00 $198.00
F |City Toner No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O |CNI Office 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F [Collaboration Solutions No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F |Diskovery Educational No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F |Evolvtec $327.41 $327.41 $327.41 $327.41 $327.41 $327.41 $215.57 $215.57
F |GMx Technologies $369.00 $369.00 $369.00 $369.00 $369.00 $369.00 $245.00 $245.00
O [|Interlight 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F |Kynetic $410.00 $410.00 $410.00 $410.00 $410.00 $410.00 $275.00 $275.00
O |Southern Computer 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F |Staples No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F [Tree House No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F |Troxell No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F |United Data Technologies DNBAS DNBAS 2 DNBAS DNBAS 2 DNBAS DNBAS 2 DNBAS DNBAS 2
O |Virtucom 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O |Y and S Technologies 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O |Zalmen Reiss 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O |Zones 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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Bid Item #/Description

41/C792 (Cyan) Rhinotek

42/C792 (Magenta) Rhinotek

43/C792 (Yellow) Rhinotek

44/E460 Rhinotek

o FL. Pref.
Bidder Name Adj. Bid Price Eval. Price |Notes Bid Price | Eval. Price |Notes Bid Price Eval. Price |Notes Bid Price Eval. Price |Notes

F |Audio Visual Innovation No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O |Aves Audio 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O |B&H 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F |BES Industries No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F [Business Services No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O |Camcor 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F |CCS Presentation No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O |CDW Government 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F |CF Motion $343.00 $343.00 $343.00 $343.00 $343.00 $343.00 $205.00 $205.00
F |City Toner No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O |CNI Office 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F |Collaboration Solutions No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F |Diskovery Educational No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F |Evolvtec $372.68 $372.68 $372.68 $372.68 $372.68 $372.68 $199.81 $199.81
F |GMx Technologies $422.00 $422.00 $422.00 $422.00 $422.00 $422.00 $159.00 $159.00
O [Interlight 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F |Kynetic $460.00 $460.00 $460.00 $460.00 $460.00 $460.00 $245.00 $245.00
O |Southern Computer 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F |Staples No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F |Tree House No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F [Troxell No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F |United Data Technologies DNBAS DNBAS 2 DNBAS DNBAS 2 DNBAS DNBAS 2 DNBAS DNBAS 2
O |Virtucom 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O |Y and S Technologies 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O |Zalmen Reiss 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O |Zones 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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Bid Item #/Descripton

45/MS811 Rhinotek

46/T644 West Point

47/T632 West Point

48/E450 West Point

o FL. Pref.
Bidder Name Adj. Bid Price Eval. Price |Notes Bid Price | Eval. Price [Notes Bid Price Eval. Price |Notes Bid Price Eval. Price |Notes

F |Audio Visual Innovation No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

O |Aves Audio 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

O |B&H 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

F |BES Industries No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

F |Business Services No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

O |Camcor 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

F |CCS Presentation No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

O |CDW Government 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

F |CF Motion $458.00 $458.00 $177.00 $177.00 $137.00 $137.00 $69.00 $69.00

F |City Toner No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

O |CNI Office 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

F [Collaboration Solutions No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

F |Diskovery Educational No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

F |Evolvtec $188.36 $188.36 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

F |GMx Technologies $415.00 $415.00 $100.00 $100.00 1 $150.00 $150.00 1 $100.00 $100.00 1
O |Interlight 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

F |Kynetic $460.00 $460.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

O |Southern Computer 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

F |Staples No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

F |Tree House No Bid No Bid $90.00 $90.00 $86.00 $86.00 $52.90 $52.90

F |Troxell No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

F |United Data Technologies DNBAS DNBAS 2 DNBAS DNBAS 2 DNBAS DNBAS 2 DNBAS DNBAS 2
O |Virtucom 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

O |Y and S Technologies 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

O |Zalmen Reiss 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

O |Zones 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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Bid Item #/Description

49/T654 West Point

50/E460 West Point

51/T644 Reman

52/E450 Reman

o FL. Pref.
Bidder Name Adj. Bid Price Eval. Price |Notes Bid Price | Eval. Price [Notes Bid Price Eval. Price |Notes Bid Price Eval. Price |Notes
F |Audio Visual Innovation No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O |Aves Audio 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O |B&H 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F |BES Industries No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F |Business Services No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $179.98 $179.98
O |Camcor 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $170.99 $179.54
F |CCS Presentation No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O |CDW Government 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F |CF Motion $185.00 $185.00 $123.00 $123.00 $170.00 $170.00 $66.00 $66.00
F |City Toner No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O |CNI Office 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F |Collaboration Solutions No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F |Diskovery Educational No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F |Evolvtec No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $178.37 $178.37 $140.09 $140.09
F |GMx Technologies $200.00 $200.00 1 $135.00 $135.00 1 $75.00 $75.00 $158.00 $158.00
O |Interlight 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F |Kynetic No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $105.45 $105.45 $72.65 $72.65
O |Southern Computer 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F |Staples No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $286.49 $286.49 $163.57 $163.57
F |[Tree House $160.00 $160.00 $110.00 $110.00 $128.90 $128.90 $47.00 $47.00] A NS
F [Troxell No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F |United Data Technologies DNBAS DNBAS 2 DNBAS DNBAS 2 DNBAS DNBAS 2 DNBAS DNBAS 2
O |Virtucom 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $138.00 $144.90 $138.00 $144.90
O |Y and S Technologies 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O |Zalmen Reiss 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O |Zones 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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Bid Item #/Descripton

53/T654 Reman

54/E460 Reman

/

/

o FL. Pref.
Bidder Name Adj. Bid Price Eval. Price |Notes Bid Price | Eval. Price [Notes Bid Price Eval. Price |Notes Bid Price Eval. Price |Notes

F |Audio Visual Innovation No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.00 $0.00
O [Aves Audio 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.00 $0.00
O |[B&H 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.00 $0.00
F |BES Industries No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.00 $0.00
F |Business Services No Bid No Bid $209.98 $209.98 $0.00 $0.00
O [Camcor 5% No Bid No Bid $93.40 $98.07 $0.00 $0.00
F |CCS Presentation No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.00 $0.00
O [CDW Government 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.00 $0.00
F |CF Motion $248.00 $248.00 $174.00 $174.00 $0.00 $0.00
F |City Toner No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.00 $0.00
O |CNI Office 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.00 $0.00
F [Collaboration Solutions No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.00 $0.00
F |Diskovery Educational No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.00 $0.00
F |Evolvtec $324.43 $324.43 $175.96 $175.96 $0.00 $0.00
F |GMx Technologies $75.00 $75.00 $200.00 $200.00 $0.00 $0.00
O |Interlight 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.00 $0.00
F |Kynetic $179.05 $179.05 $124.60 $124.60 $0.00 $0.00
O |Southern Computer 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.00 $0.00
F |Staples $340.00 $340.00 $221.73 $221.73 $0.00 $0.00
F |Tree House No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.00 $0.00
F |Troxell No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.00 $0.00
F |United Data Technologies DNBAS DNBAS 2 DNBAS DNBAS 2 $0.00 $0.00
O |Virtucom 5% $306.00 $321.30 No Bid No Bid $0.00 $0.00
O |Y and S Technologies 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.00 $0.00
O [zalmen Reiss 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.00 $0.00
O [Zones 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.00 $0.00
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NOTES:

A Alternate

NS No Sample

DNBAS Did not bid as specified

1 Stated supplies are limited
2 Bid pricing enclosure stated prices valid for 15 days
3 2 year Warranty instead of 3 year

BID TABULATION, RECOMMENDATIONS, AND PROTEST
Bid tabulations with award recommendations are posted for 72 hours in the Purchasing Department Office and are also posted to the School District's website address at:
http://old.escambia.k12.fl.us/adminoff/finance/purchasing/current_bid_activity.html

Failure to file a protest within the time prescribed in Section 120.57(3) Florida Statutes will constitute a waiver of proceedings under Chapter 120 Florida Statues and School Board
Rules. Bid tabulations or recommendations will be distributed solely through the Purchasing website address. Notices will not be automatically mailed.

| hereby certify that the prices and bidders reflected herein are valid, and have been received in compliance to Escambia County School Board Rules and Florida Law.

Vol Dombroskie

John Dombroskie, Director
Purchasing Department
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