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THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY

PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
75 North Pace Blvd.
Pensacola, FL 32505

BID AWARD NOTICE

DATE:
July 3, 2013

BID TITLE & REFERENCE:
Frozen Pizza, Pizza Dough, Cheese Sauces &
Cheese Products, RFP #132603

DESCRIPTION OF PURCHASE:

An annual pricing agreement to provide frozen pizza, pizza dough, cheese sauces and cheese
products to school cafeterias for use in the preparation of meals as stocked and distributed by the
Central Warehouse. Fifteen (15) items bid and awarded. Items will be purchased as needed to meet
breakfast and lunch menu requirements. Bid award(s) to lowest bidder(s) meeting specifications.

Effective Dates: August 1, 2013 through July 31, 2014.

REQUESTED BY:

Food Services

SUPPLIER NAME:

ConAgra, Troy, OH

JTM Provisions, Harrison, OH
Schwan’s Food Service, Marshall, MN
Sysco Gulf Coast, Geneva, AL

ITEMS AWARDED ESTIMATED ANNUAL EXPENDITURE
5 $ 72,100.00
4 56,600.00
5 115,400.00
1 3,800.00

AMOUNT OF PURCHASE:

$247,900.00 Est. / Yr.

FUNDING SOURCE:

Food Services Fund (4110)

METHOD OF PROCUREMENT:

ECSD Bid

Responses Received: 8 Responses Rejected: 2

DATE AND TIME POSTED:

July 3, 2013, 2:40 pm CST

9500 PUR100 (11/10) Retention — 5 Years



THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
75 NORTH PACE BOULEVARD
PENSACOLA, FLORIDA 32505

BID TABULATION: FROZEN PIZZA, PIZZA DOUGH, CHEESE SAUCES & CHEESE PRODUCTS, RFP #132603

DATE: June 13, 2013 Awarded Items are highlighted
Breakfast Pizza, Whole
Breakfast Turkey Sausage| Pizza, Cheese | Grain Cheese
Item Sausage Pizza Pizza Rounded Edge | Rounded Edge
0516380 0516400
300 cs 300 cs 400 cs 400 cs
Item Number la 1b 2a 2b
ConAgra Foods Portion Size/oz 2.44 2.66 4.67 4.68
Troy, OH Portions/Case 192 192 96 96
Portion Price 0.2260 0.2068 0.3592 0.3750
Case Price 43.40 m 39.70 m 34.48 m 36.00 m
Giorgio Foods Portion Size/oz
Temple, PA Portions/Case No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Portion Price
Case Price
JTM Provisions Portion Size/oz
Harrison, OH Portions/Case No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Portion Price
Case Price
Nardone Bros. Portion Size/oz 3.200 3.48 5.00 4.75
Wilkes-Barre, PA  |Portions/Case 80 80 72 96
Portion Price 0.2750 0.2875 0.5556 a 0.4167 a
Case Price 22.00 23.00 40.00 40.00
Schwan's Fd Svc  |Portion Size/oz 3.2 3.2 4.61 4.6
Marshall, MN Portions/Case 128 128 80 96
Portion Price 0.2185 0.2143 0.3480 0.3476 [a,u
Case Price 27.97 m 27.43 m 27.84 m 33.37 m
Sysco Gulf Coast [Portion Size/oz
Geneva, AL Portions/Case No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Portion Price
Case Price
Tubito's Pizza Portion Size/oz
Davie, FL Portions/Case No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Portion Price
Case Price
US Foods Portion Size/oz
Montgomery, AL |Portions/Case No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Portion Price
Case Price
Not Awarded Not Awarded
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Stuffed Crust

Pizza, Pepperoni

Grain Turkey

Wedge Cheese Filled | Rounded Edge Pepperoni
Item Pepperoni Pizza Sticks Wedge Rounded Edge
0516440 0516640 0516670
200 cs 600 cs 1800 cs 1800 cs
Item Number 3 4 ba 5b
ConAgra Foods Portion Size/oz 4.87 1.93 4.67 4.68
Troy, OH Portions/Case 72 192 96 96
Portion Price 0.4600 0.1895 0.3848 0.4000
Case Price 33.12 m 36.39 m 36.94 m 38.40 m
Giorgio Foods Portion Size/oz
Temple, PA Portions/Case No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Portion Price
Case Price
JTM Provisions Portion Size/oz
Harrison, OH Portions/Case No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Portion Price
Case Price
Nardone Bros. Portion Size/oz 4.95 3 5 5.25
Wilkes-Barre, PA  |Portions/Case 70 72 72 96
Portion Price 0.6000 0.3472 0.5556 0.4583 a
Case Price 42.00 25.00 40.00 44.00
Schwan's Fd Svc  |Portion Size/oz 4.94 2.10 4.70 4.48
Marshall, MN Portions/Case 72 200 80 96
Portion Price 0.4590 0.1896 [a,y| 0.3733 0.3576 |a\y
Case Price 33.05 m 37.92 m 29.86 m 34.33 m
Sysco Gulf Coast [Portion Size/oz
Geneva, AL Portions/Case No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Portion Price
Case Price
Tubito's Pizza Portion Size/oz
Davie, FL Portions/Case No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Portion Price
Case Price
US Foods Portion Size/oz
Montgomery, AL |Portions/Case No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Portion Price
Case Price
Not Awarded
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Whole Grain Pizza, Whole
Whole Grain Turkey Grain Turkey
Cheese Pizza |Pepperoni Pizza| Pizza Puff, Sausage
Item Round Round Pepperoni Rounded Edge
0517440 0517441 0516680 0516790
300 cs 300 cs 100 cs 400 cs
Item Number 6 7 8 9
ConAgra Foods Portion Size/oz 5.05 4.74
Troy, OH Portions/Case 60 No Bid No Bid 96
Portion Price 0.5247 ay 0.3785
Case Price 31.48 m 36.34 m
Giorgio Foods Portion Size/oz 5.00 5.00
Temple, PA Portions/Case 72 72 No Bid No Bid
Portion Price 0.5885 ay| 0.6735 [ay
Case Price 42.37 48.49
JTM Provisions Portion Size/oz
Harrison, OH Portions/Case No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Portion Price
Case Price
Nardone Bros. Portion Size/oz 5.35 5.89
Wilkes-Barre, PA |Portions/Case 60 60 No Bid No Bid
Portion Price 0.7000 0.7167 [a,u
Case Price 42.00 43.00
Schwan's Fd Svc  |Portion Size/oz 4.98 4.98 4.69
Marshall, MN Portions/Case 60 60 No Bid 96
Portion Price 0.5280 ay| 0.5467 |ay 0.3680 [a,u
Case Price 31.68 m 32.80 m 35.33 m
Sysco Gulf Coast [Portion Size/oz 6.00
Geneva, AL Portions/Case No Bid No Bid 48 No Bid
Portion Price 0.7917
Case Price 38.00
Tubito's Pizza Portion Size/oz
Davie, FL Portions/Case No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Portion Price
Case Price
US Foods Portion Size/oz
Montgomery, AL  |Portions/Case No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Portion Price
Case Price
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Macaroni And

Cheese Sauce,

Cheese Sauce,

Cheese Sauce,

Item Cheese Cheddar Jalapeno Queso Blanco
0517600 0517610 0517620 0517630
400 cs 300 cs 150 cs 150 cs
Item Number 10 11 12 13
ConAgra Foods Portion Size/oz
Troy, OH Portions/Case No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Portion Price
Case Price
Giorgio Foods Portion Size/oz
Temple, PA Portions/Case No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Portion Price
Case Price
JTM Provisions Portion Size/oz 6.00 480 0z 480 0z 480 0z
Harrison, OH Portions/Case 80 480 0z 480 0z 480 0z
Portion Price 0.6026 0.1286 0.1286 0.1321
Case Price 48.21 m 61.75 m 61.75 m 63.41 m
Nardone Bros. Portion Size/oz
Wilkes-Barre, PA  |Portions/Case No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Portion Price
Case Price
Schwan's Fd Svc  |Portion Size/oz
Marshall, MN Portions/Case No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Portion Price
Case Price
Sysco Gulf Coast [Portion Size/oz 106 106 420 0z
Geneva, AL Portions/Case No Bid 106 0z 106 0z 420 0z
Portion Price 0.6717 0z 0.6717 oz| 0.1725
Case Price 71.20 71.20 72.45
Tubito's Pizza Portion Size/oz
Davie, FL Portions/Case No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Portion Price
Case Price
US Foods Portion Size/oz 636 0z 636 0z 420 0z
Montgomery, AL |Portions/Case No Bid 636 0z 636 0z 420 0z
Portion Price 0.1068 0.1068 0.1682
Case Price 67.92 67.92 70.63

Items 10 - 13 Awarded as a Lot
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Pizza Dough, 7
Inches, Whole

Pizza Dough, 7

Item Grain Inches Pizza Dough Pizza Dough
0517430 0517510 0517510
500 cs 500 cs 600 cs 600 cs
Item Number 1l4a 14b 15a 15b
ConAgra Foods Portion Size/oz
Troy, OH Portions/Case No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Portion Price
Case Price
Giorgio Foods Portion Size/oz
Temple, PA Portions/Case No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Portion Price
Case Price
JTM Provisions Portion Size/oz
Harrison, OH Portions/Case No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Portion Price
Case Price
Nardone Bros. Portion Size/oz 6.25 6.25 16.00 30.00
Wilkes-Barre, PA  |Portions/Case 48 48 20 20
Portion Price 0.8125 [a,u| 0.8125 Jau 2.1500 Ja,u] 2.3000 Ja,u
Case Price 39.00 39.00 43.00 46.00
Schwan's Fd Svc  |Portion Size/oz 5.00 5.00 17.84 24.80
Marshall, MN Portions/Case 72 72 24 18
Portion Price 0.3878 0.3600 1.6133 1.8461
Case Price 27.92 m 25.92 m 38.72 m 33.23 m
Sysco Gulf Coast [Portion Size/oz 6.60 6.60 26.00
Geneva, AL Portions/Case 72 72 No Bid 20
Portion Price 0.7799 0.5958 1.7250
Case Price 56.15 42.90 34.50
Tubito's Pizza Portion Size/oz 21.05
Davie, FL Portions/Case No Bid No Bid No Bid 14
Portion Price 1.3929 |ay
Case Price 19.50 m
US Foods Portion Size/oz
Montgomery, AL |Portions/Case No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Portion Price
Case Price
Not Awarded Not Awarded

a=Alternate Product Bid
u=Alternate Product Tested and was Not Approved or no sample was sent
Y=Alternate Product Bid, Tested and was Approved
m=Bidder has minimum ship requirement
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BID TABULATION, RECOMMENDATIONS, AND PROTEST

Bid tabulations with award recommendations are posted for 72 hours in
the Purchasing Department Office and are also posted to the School
District's website address at:
http://old.escambia.k12.fl.us/adminoff/finance/purchasing/

Failure to file a protest within the time prescribed in Section 120.57(3)
Florida Statutes, and School Board Rules shall constitute a waiver of
proceedings.

Bid tabulations or recommendations will be distributed solely thorugh the
Purchasing website address. Notices will not be automatically mailed.

| hereby certify that the prices and bidders reflected herin are valid, and
have been received in compliance to Escambia County School Board
Rules and Florida Law.

John Dombroskie, Director
Purchasing Department
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