
 

 
 
 
DATE: BID TITLE & REFERENCE: 
February 7, 2013     Vehicle & Vehicle Freezer Units - Purchase & Mounting, ITB #131603
    
 
DESCRIPTION OF PURCHASE: 

 
Bid award to lowest bidder meeting specifications for one (1) International 4300 diesel delivery truck 
chassis and two (2) Thermo King T-100-SO refrigeration units for use by the Central Warehouse for 
food deliveries to school cafeterias.  Trade in of a 1988 Ford Waltco F-2 chassis, District vehicle 
C500771800 has been authorized - $2,500.00 trade-in value.  Freezer body and lift from this vehicle 
(C500771800) will be installed on the new International 4300 diesel truck. 
 
The trade-in of two (2) Thermo King RD-11 freezer units, currently installed on District Vehicle 
C500786800 (2003 Ford) and District Vehicle C500786900 (2004 International) is also authorized.  
These units will be replaced by the new refrigeration units.  
 
Total purchase price of International 4300 diesel truck:  $73,305.00, less trade-in credit ($2,500.00) = 
net purchase price - $70,805.00.  Cost to transfer existing lift to new chassis = $3,950.00. 
 
Total purchase price of two (2) Thermo King T-100-SO refrigeration units including installation:  
$42,777.70, less trade-in credit ($1,000.00) = net purchase price - $41,777.70. 
 
 

  
REQUESTED BY: 

 
Food Services 
 

    
SUPPLIER NAME:       ITEMS AWARDED:       ESTIMATED EXPENDITURE: 
  

Ward International Pensacola, FL   2 (vehicle and movement  $74,755.00  
       of freezer unit and lift) 
 
Midstate Thermo King, Montgomery, AL    2 (freezer units and     41,777.70     
           Installation)    
 

    
AMOUNT OF PURCHASE: FUNDING SOURCE: 

 
$116,532.70    Food Services Fund (4110) – School Level  
      Equipment (0215) 

  
METHOD OF PROCUREMENT: 

 
ECSD Bid      Responses Received: 3     
 
   

DATE AND TIME POSTED: 
 
February 7, 2013, 2:00 pm CST 

 
9500PUR101 (11/10) Retention - 5 Years 

 
THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY 

PURCHASING DEPARTMENT 
75 North Pace Blvd.  

Pensacola, FL  32505 
 

BID AWARD NOTICE 



DATE:  January 16, 2013
BID NBR:   131603 Awarded Items are highlighted
BID TITLE:  Vehicle & Vehicle Freezer Units-Purchase & Mounting

ITEM Chasis
Chassis Body & Lift Value Price after

Quantity: 1 ea 1 ea 1 ea Trade-in
Ward International 73,305.00 3,950.0000 90 days 2,500.00 70,805.00
Pensacola, FL
Kenworth of Mobile, Inc. 66,397.00 a 2,450.00 60 days 2,000.00 64,397.00
Irvington, AL  36544 u
Midstate Thermo King, Inc. No Bid No Bid 69 days No Bid No Bid
Montgomery, AL
Awarded as a Lot

ITEM Freezer Unit
W/Installation for fridge units Price after

Quantity: 2 ea 2 ea Trade-in
Ward International No Bid No Bid
Pensacola, FL
Kenworth of Mobile, Inc. 20,937.50 No Bid 20,937.50
Irvington, AL  36544 41,875.00 41,875.00
Midstate Thermo King, Inc. 21,388.85 500.00 20,888.85
Montgomery, AL 42,777.70 1,000.00 41,777.70
Awarded as a Lot

a = Alternate Product Bid u = Unacceptable

Vendor Item Number Quantity Unit Price Extended Price
Ward International Truck, Less Trade-in 70,805.00$     

Move Freezer Body & Lift 3,950.00$       
74,755.00$     

Midstate Thermo King 2 Freezer Units, less 2 trade-in allowance,
Includes installation to District vehicles. 41,777.70$     

TOTAL AWARD 116,532.70$  

THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

75 NORTH PACE BOULEVARD
PENSACOLA, FLORIDA 32505

BID TABULATION

Fridge Unit Trade-in value

BID TABULATION, RECOMMENDATIONS, AND PROTEST
Bid tabulations with award recommendations are posted for 72 hours in the Purchasing 
Department Office and are also posted to the School District's website address at: 
http://old.escambia.k12.fl.us/adminoff/finance/purchasing/current_bid_activity.html

Failure to file a protest within the time prescribed in
Section 120.57(3) Florida Statutes, and School Board Rules shall constitute a waiver of proceedings.
Bid tabulations or recommendations will be distributed solely through the Purchasing 
website address.  Notices will not be automatically mailed.

I hereby certify that the prices and bidders reflected herein are valid, and have been received
in compliance to Escambia County School Board Rules and Florida Law.

John Dombroskie, Director
Purchasing Department

Truck Move Freezer Lead time for Trade-in
Truck Delivery
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