
 

 
 
 
DATE: BID TITLE & REFERENCE: 
November 13, 2012                                Cafeteria Equipment, RFP #131003 
 
DESCRIPTION OF PURCHASE: 

 
An annual pricing agreement to provide equipment to school cafeterias throughout the District.  
Thirty-nine (39) items bid and thirty-nine (39) items awarded.  Items will be purchased as needed to 
meet cafeteria needs.  Bid award(s) to the lowest bidder(s) meeting specifications.  Like items are 
awarded as a lot to the vendor with the aggregate low total price for the lot.  
 
Effective Dates:  December 1, 2012 through November 30, 2013. 
 
 

 
REQUESTED BY: 

 
Food Services 
 

 
SUPPLIER NAME:                                              ITEMS AWARDED:    ESTIMATED ANNUAL EXPENDITURE: 

 
Culinary Depot, Monsey, NY      1   $     38,450.00 
East Bay Restaurant, Oakland, CA     2        126,900.00 
Hotel & Restaurant Supply, Gulfport, MS      6        720,900.00 
KESCO, Pensacola, FL     26     5,457,650.00 
Mobile Fixture, Mobile, AL      4              145,800.00 
 
 

     
AMOUNT OF PURCHASE: FUNDING SOURCE: 

 
$6,489,700.00 Est. / Yr.   Food Services Fund (4110) 
 

  
METHOD OF PROCUREMENT: 

 
ECSD Bid                            Responses Received:  16              Bids Rejected:  1 
    
  

DATE AND TIME POSTED: 
 
November 13, 2012, 5:35pm CST 
 

 
9500PUR101 (11/10) Retention - 5 Years 

 
THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY 

PURCHASING DEPARTMENT 
75 North Pace Blvd.  

Pensacola, FL  32505 
 

BID AWARD NOTICE 



DATE:  October 24, 2012

BID NBR:  131003
BID TITLE:  Cafeteria Equipment

Top Price: Warehouse Delivery Only Bottom Price:  Full Installation
ITEM

2 Door Reach Undercounter Dual Access Cold Wall
Quantity: 40 ea 15 ea 40 ea 20 ea

ITEM NUMBER 1 2 3 4
Beltram 2,675.00        1,779.00        3,240.50        2,530.00        
Tampa, FL NO BID NO BID  NO BID NO BID
Gulf Ice Systems NO BID 1,542.00        NO BID NO BID
Pensacola, FL 1,817.00        
Kesco 2,775.00        1,659.00        3,200.00        2,112.00        
Pensacola, FL 2,775.00        1,690.00        3,200.00        2,112.00        
Alack Refrigeration Co 2,848.00        1,750.00        3,131.00        a 2,171.00        
Hammond, LA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Calico Industries 2,778.00        1,974.00        3,074.00        NO BID
Annapolis Junction, MD NO BID NO BID NO BID
Culinary Depot 2,714.08        1,811.06        2,765.93        2,111.96        
Monsey, NY 2,814.08        2,261.06        2,915.93        2,261.96        
East Bay Restaurant 2,609.00        1,651.00        3,089.00        1,429.14        
Oakland, CA 2,694.00        1,776.00        3,164.00        1,504.00        
Great Lakes Hotel Supply 3,212.00        2,001.00        3,855.00        2,792.00        
Detroit, MI 3,323.00        2,101.00        3,955.00        2,892.00        
Hotel & Resturant Supply 2,480.00        1,695.00        2,749.00        2,095.00        
Gulfport, MS 2,529.00        1,895.00        2,799.00        2,195.00        
Kamran & Company 2,627.00        1,715.00        2,850.00        2,319.00        
Santa Barbara, CA 2,877.00        2,115.00        2,950.00        2,419.00        
Mobile Fixture & Equip 2,715.00        1,575.00        3,137.00        2,099.00        
Mobile, AL 2,715.00        1,775.00        3,137.00        2,099.00        
Pasco Brokerage 2,825.00        m 1,850.00        3,125.00        2,625.00        
Plano, TX 2,825.00        u 2,250.00        3,500.00        3,000.00        
QC Storage NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Jennings, LA
Sam Tell & Son 2,962.61        2,039.03        3,751.43        2,302.09        
Farmingdale, NY NO BID NO BID NO BID  NO BID
Thompson & Little 2,749.84        2,332.68        3,044.82        2,096.08        
Fayetteville, NC 2,939.84        2,632.68        3,234.82        2,326.08        

Item  2 Gulf Ice bid 2 models, same pricing
Items 3 & 4 Awarded as a lot. 

THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

75 NORTH PACE BOULEVARD
PENSACOLA, FLORIDA 32505

BID TABULATION

Awarded Items are highlighted

Refrigerator/ Ice Machine/ Milk Cooler/ Milk Cooler/
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ITEM
Display/Med. Tabletop 20 qt 60"x24" 72"x24"

Quantity: 15 ea 30 ea 4,000 ea 1,000 ea

ITEM NUMBER 5 6 7 8
Beltram 4,192.50        NO BID 375.00           412.50           
Tampa, FL NO BID NO BID NO BID
Gulf Ice Systems NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Pensacola, FL
Kesco 4,200.00        2,000.00        a 250.00           285.00           
Pensacola, FL 4,200.00        2,000.00        u 250.00           285.00           
Alack Refrigeration Co 4,444.00        NO BID  NO BID NO BID
Hammond, LA NO BID
Calico Industries 4,624.00        2,914.00        414.00           474.00           m
Annapolis Junction, MD NO BID NO BID NO BID  NO BID
Culinary Depot 4,328.00        2,610.50        294.75           a 339.75           a
Monsey, NY 4,578.00        2,810.50        394.75           u 439.75           u
East Bay Restaurant 4,612.00        2,790.00        264.00           301.00           
Oakland, CA 4,887.00        2,865.00        354.00           391.00           
East Bay Restaurant-ALT 4,833.00        1,987.00        NA NA
Oakland, CA 4,928.00        2,062.00        
Great Lakes Hotel Supply 5,018.00        1,948.00        560.00           560.00           
Detroit, MI 5,118.00        2,048.00        593.00           565.00           
Hotel & Resturant Supply NO BID 2,495.00        249.00           289.00           
Gulfport, MS 2,525.00        299.00           339.00           
Kamran & Company 3,920.00        2,518.00        258.00           295.00           
Santa Barbara, CA 4,050.00        u 2,593.00        333.00           370.00           
Mobile Fixture & Equip 4,291.00        1,925.00        255.00           291.00           
Mobile, AL 4,478.00        1,975.00        275.00           305.00           
Pasco Brokerage 5,075.00        2,625.00        400.00           425.00           
Plano, TX 5,475.00        2,800.00        575.00           600.00           
QC Storage NO BID NO BID 249.00           283.00           
Jennings, LA 320.00           354.00           
Sam Tell & Son 5,083.70        2,721.13        269.61           308.88           
Farmingdale, NY NO BID NO BID  NO BID NO BID
Thompson & Little 6,616.74        2,666.79        277.60           61.12             
Fayetteville, NC 6,846.74        2,786.79        397.60           121.12           

Refrigerated Mixer/ Shelving HD Shelving HD
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ITEM
48"x24" Heavy Duty 2 shelf 3 shelf

Quantity: 1,000 ea 20 ea 150 ea 100 ea

ITEM NUMBER 9 10 11 12
Beltram 337.50           679.00           NO BID NO BID
Tampa, FL NO BID NO BID
Gulf Ice Systems NO BID NO BID NO BID  NO BID
Pensacola, FL
Kesco 229.50           300.00           NO BID 135.00           
Pensacola, FL 229.50           300.00           135.00           
Alack Refrigeration Co NO BID NO BID 149.00           179.00           
Hammond, LA NO BID NO BID
Calico Industries 364.00           m NO BID 104.72           156.37           
Annapolis Junction, MD NO BID u NO BID NO BID
Culinary Depot 263.25           a 587.57           156.20           144.54           
Monsey, NY 363.25           u 662.57           156.20           144.54           
East Bay Restaurant 230.00           400.00           149.00           138.00           
Oakland, CA 320.00           475.00           199.00           188.00           
Great Lakes Hotel Supply 490.00           750.00           240.00           360.00           
Detroit, MI 492.00           820.00           262.00           389.00           
Hotel & Resturant Supply 218.00           629.00           87.00             161.00           
Gulfport, MS 268.00           679.00           107.00           181.00           
Kamran & Company 223.00           456.00           127.00           197.00           
Santa Barbara, CA 298.00           546.00           197.00           267.00           
Mobile Fixture & Equip 220.00           389.00           97.00             145.00           
Mobile, AL 235.00           389.00           97.00             145.00           
Pasco Brokerage 300.00           550.00           92.40             m 136.65           m
Plano, TX 475.00           715.00           260.40           u 304.65           u
QC Storage 214.00           NO BID NO BID NO BID
Jennings, LA 285.00           
Sam Tell & Son 233.73           364.00           97.68             138.33           
Farmingdale, NY NO BID NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 
Thompson & Little 242.56           628.69           88.00             133.99           
Fayetteville, NC 302.56           673.69           162.00           208.00           

Items 11 & 12 Awarded as a lot.

Shelving HD Can Rack/ Utility Kitchen Utility Kitchen
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ITEM
Electric Gas Griddle

Quantity: 20 ea 20 ea 20 ea 50 ea

ITEM NUMBER 13 14 15 16
Beltram 3,373.50        3,742.00        534.00           870.75           
Tampa, FL NO BID NO BID  NO BID  NO BID
Gulf Ice Systems NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID
Pensacola, FL
Kesco 2,240.00        2,900.00        415.00           620.00           
Pensacola, FL 2,240.00        2,900.00        415.00           620.00           
Alack Refrigeration Co 2,749.00        3,109.00        579.00           725.00           
Hammond, LA NO BID NO BID NO BID  NO BID
Calico Industries 4,348.00        4,284.00        584.00           1,068.00        
Annapolis Junction, MD NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Culinary Depot 2,704.22        3,265.00        434.91           710.68           
Monsey, NY 2,904.22        3,465.00        434.91           710.68           
East Bay Restaurant 2,551.00        2,551.00        3,202.00        652.00           
Oakland, CA 2,951.00        2,951.00        3,602.00        700.00           
Great Lakes Hotel Supply 3,900.00        6,247.00        750.00           1,595.00        
Detroit, MI 4,002.00        6,374.00        796.00           1,612.00        
Hotel & Resturant Supply 2,598.00        3,095.00        399.00           895.00           
Gulfport, MS 2,798.00        3,295.00        399.00           995.00           
Kamran & Company 2,721.00        3,109.00        495.00           804.00           
Santa Barbara, CA 3,121.00        3,509.00        545.00           879.00           
Mobile Fixture & Equip 3,749.00        3,095.00        520.00           549.00           a
Mobile, AL 3,925.00        3,245.00        520.00           549.00           u
Pasco Brokerage 3,828.70        3,171.20        575.00           755.00           
Plano, TX 4,721.20        4,116.20        750.00           925.00           
QC Storage NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Jennings, LA
Sam Tell & Son 2,927.64        3,248.91        452.39           684.70           
Farmingdale, NY NO BID NO BID  NO BID  NO BID
Thompson & Little 3,941.29        3,109.00        463.99           720.92           
Fayetteville, NC 4,016.29        3,184.00        538.99           795.92           

Griddle, Griddle, Panini Grill Stand for 48"
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ITEM
6 burner Conveyor Oven, Gas Oven, Electric

Quantity: 25 ea 40 ea 120 ea 50 ea

ITEM NUMBER 17 18 19 20
Beltram 1,769.00        a 977.50           8,795.00        6,637.00        
Tampa, FL NO BID u  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID
Beltram-ALT NA NA NA 7,811.00        
Tampa, FL NO BID
Gulf Ice Systems NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID
Pensacola, FL
Kesco 1,250.00        1,007.00        7,500.00        5,400.00        
Pensacola, FL 1,250.00        1,007.00        7,500.00        5,400.00        
Kesco-ALT NA NA NA 5,000.00        
Pensacola, FL 5,000.00        
Alack Refrigeration Co 1,399.00        a 949.00           9,122.00        5,656.00        
Hammond, LA NO BID u NO BID NO BID NO BID
Calico Industries 1,554.00        1,034.00        10,034.00      9,148.00        
Annapolis Junction, MD NO BID NO BID  NO BID  NO BID
Culinary Depot 1,545.00        a 961.28           8,974.00        400.00           
Monsey, NY 1,745.00        u 961.28           9,324.00        5,750.00        
East Bay Restaurant 1,385.00        915.00           6,451.00        6,688.00        
Oakland, CA 1,785.00        965.00           6,851.00        7,088.00        
Great Lakes Hotel Supply 2,490.00        1,218.00        10,418.00      10,418.00      a
Detroit, MI 2,532.00        1,318.00        10,518.00      10,518.00      u
Hotel & Resturant Supply 1,339.00        1,007.05        8,660.00        5,195.00        
Gulfport, MS 1,539.00        1,007.05        9,049.00        5,345.00        
Kamran & Company 1,495.00        a 965.00           8,208.00        5,445.00        
Santa Barbara, CA 2,085.00        u 1,075.00        8,958.00        5,955.00        
Mobile Fixture & Equip 1,395.00        a 1,007.50        8,650.00        5,495.00        
Mobile, AL 1,545.00        u 1,007.50        8,950.00        5,795.00        
Pasco Brokerage 1,371.90        1,007.05        8,839.70        5,610.00        
Plano, TX 2,080.65        1,132.05        9,774.20        6,528.75        
QC Storage NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Jennings, LA
Sam Tell & Son 1,405.53        a 1,016.21        9,532.98        5,747.50        
Farmingdale, NY NO BID u NO BID NO BID  NO BID
Thompson & Little 1,345.00        a 1,007.05        9,099.66        5,500.00        
Fayetteville, NC 1,480.00        u 1,082.05        9,224.66        5,685.00        

Item 20 Kesco bid 2 models
Items 19 & 20 Awarded as a lot.

Gas Range, Toaster/ Convection Convection
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ITEM
Gas Electric Steamer, Gas Oven

Quantity: 15 ea 5 ea 100 ea 30 ea

ITEM NUMBER 21 22 23 24
Beltram 12,525.00      11,150.00      13,830.00      7,207.75        
Tampa, FL NO BID NO BID  NO BID NO BID
Beltram-ALT NA NA 13,350.00      NA
Tampa, FL NO BID
Gulf Ice Systems NO BID  NO BID  NO BID NO BID
Pensacola, FL
Kesco 9,300.00        6,500.00        
Pensacola, FL 9,300.00        6,500.00        
Kesco-Bid 2 NA NA 9,300.00        NA
Pensacola, FL 9,300.00        
Alack Refrigeration Co 12,500.00      11,000.00      11,553.00      7,399.00        
Hammond, LA NO BID u NO BID NO BID NO BID
Calico Industries 15,508.00      24,364.00      12,712.00      8,408.00        
Annapolis Junction, MD NO BID u NO BID NO BID NO BID
Culinary Depot 19,062.00      13,428.00      11,297.58      7,261.49        
Monsey, NY 21,162.00      15,528.00      12,097.58      7,336.49        
East Bay Restaurant 19,144.00      15,380.00      10,385.00      6,500.00        
Oakland, CA 20,759.00      16,880.00      14,385.00      6,575.00        
Great Lakes Hotel Supply 14,298.00      a 18,264.00      11,700.00      7,950.00        
Detroit, MI 14,398.00      u 18,364.00      11,788.00      8,032.00        
Hotel & Resturant Supply 18,495.00      14,115.00      10,369.00      6,295.00        a
Gulfport, MS 18,995.00      14,615.00      10,869.00      6,495.00        u
Kamran & Company 12,287.00      a 10,904.00      9,820.00        7,590.00        
Santa Barbara, CA 13,137.00      u 11,704.00      10,520.00      7,840.00        
Mobile Fixture & Equip 18,500.00      14,350.00      10,369.00      7,499.00        
Mobile, AL 19,250.00      14,995.00      10,875.00      7,499.00        
Pasco Brokerage 18,000.00      a 15,075.00      10,575.00      7,150.00        
Plano, TX 19,050.00      u 16,025.00      11,315.00      7,725.00        
QC Storage NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Jennings, LA
Sam Tell & Son 19,704.99      13,910.57      12,340.34      6,662.50        
Farmingdale, NY NO BID u NO BID  NO BID  NO BID
Thompson & Little 20,682.29      15,520.43      11,524.88      6,565.00        
Fayetteville, NC 20,872.29      15,720.43      11,714.88      6,685.00        

Item 21 & 22 - First Price Machine, 2nd price Machine and Stand 
Item 23-Kesco bid both approved brands
Items 21 & 22 Awarded as a lot.  

Combi Oven, Combi Oven, Convection Retherm 

19,454.00/20500
19,454.00/20500

15,754.00/16800
15,754.00/16800
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ITEM
8 1/4 cubic 14 cubic 19 1/3 cubic Machine

Quantity: 75 ea 120 ea 40 ea 20 ea

ITEM NUMBER 25 26 27 28
Beltram 1,438.50        1,644.75        2,486.75        26,598.00      
Tampa, FL NO BID  NO BID NO BID NO BID
Gulf Ice Systems NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Pensacola, FL
Kesco 1,464.00        1,674.00        2,531.00        19,000.00      
Pensacola, FL 1,464.00        1,674.00        2,531.00        19,000.00      
Alack Refrigeration Co 1,515.00        1,727.00        a 2,599.00        a 23,444.00      
Hammond, LA NO BID NO BID u  NO BID u  NO BID
Calico Industries 1,908.00        2,064.00        2,284.00        NO BID
Annapolis Junction, MD NO BID NO BID NO BID
Culinary Depot 1,844.01        2,109.24        3,189.06        16,581.60      
Monsey, NY 1,919.00        2,184.24        3,264.06        19,381.60      
East Bay Restaurant 1,464.00        1,674.00        2,531.00        20,893.00      
Oakland, CA 1,539.00        1,749.00        2,606.00        22,093.00      
Great Lakes Hotel Supply 1,900.00        2,199.00        3,095.00        21,700.00      
Detroit, MI 1,925.00        2,246.00        3,121.00        21,852.00      
Hotel & Resturant Supply 1,459.00        1,669.00        2,494.00        NO BID
Gulfport, MS 1,499.00        1,699.00        2,525.00        
Kamran & Company 1,556.00        1,816.00        2,731.00        21,521.00      
Santa Barbara, CA 1,656.00        1,916.00        2,831.00        25,421.00      
Mobile Fixture & Equip 1,595.00        2,975.00        2,975.00        20,950.00      
Mobile, AL 1,595.00        2,975.00        2,975.00        22,150.00      
Pasco Brokerage 1,615.00        m 1,820.00        m 2,800.00        22,975.00      
Plano, TX 2,060.00        u 2,395.00        u 3,350.00        27,075.00      
QC Storage NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Jennings, LA
Sam Tell & Son 1,500.60        1,715.85        2,594.28        22,998.68      
Farmingdale, NY NO BID NO BID  NO BID  NO BID
Thompson & Little 1,478.64        1,690.74        2,556.31        20,898.34      
Fayetteville, NC 1,598.64        1,810.74        2,676.31        21,458.34      

Items 25-27 Awarded as a lot.  

Hot Cabinet Hot Cabinet, Hot Cabinet, Dish
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ITEM
Refrigerator Display, 36" Display, 30" Display, 24"

Quantity: 20 ea 20 ea 20 ea 10 ea
N N

ITEM NUMBER 29 30 31 32
Beltram NO BID 2,569.00        2,331.25        2,095.50        y
Tampa, FL NO BID  NO BID  NO BID
Gulf Ice Systems NO BID  NO BID  NO BID NO BID
Pensacola, FL
Kesco NO BID 2,436.00        2,286.00        2,156.00        y
Pensacola, FL 2,436.00        2,286.00        2,156.00        
Alack Refrigeration Co NO BID NO BID  NO BID  NO BID
Hammond, LA
Calico Industries NO BID 2,524.00        2,374.00        2,244.00        y
Annapolis Junction, MD NO BID  NO BID NO BID
Culinary Depot 3,432.59        2,414.35        2,266.11        1,992.52        y
Monsey, NY 3,652.59        y 2,489.35        2,341.00        2,067.00        
East Bay Restaurant 2,754.00        2,215.00        2,079.00        3,275.00        u
Oakland, CA 2,829.00        u 2,290.00        2,154.00        3,350.00        
Great Lakes Hotel Supply 4,408.00        2,873.00        2,773.00        2,568.00        y
Detroit, MI 4,508.00        y 2,973.00        2,883.00        2,668.00        
Hotel & Resturant Supply NO BID 2,436.50        2,286.90        NO BID
Gulfport, MS 2,476.50        2,306.90        
Kamran & Company NO BID 2,287.00        2,147.00        NO BID
Santa Barbara, CA 2,437.00        2,297.00        
Mobile Fixture & Equip 2,875.00        2,436.50        2,286.90        2,156.00        y
Mobile, AL 2,875.00        y 2,436.50        2,286.90        2,156.00        
Pasco Brokerage 3,050.00        2,436.50        2,286.90        2,156.00        y
Plano, TX 3,700.00        u 2,861.50        2,686.90        2,556.00        
QC Storage NO BID NO BID NO BID  NO BID
Jennings, LA
Sam Tell & Son 3,406.47        y 2,458.65        2,307.69        2,029.08        y
Farmingdale, NY NO BID NO BID  NO BID  NO BID
Thompson & Little NO BID 2,436.50        2,286.90        NO BID
Fayetteville, NC 2,556.50        2,406.90        

Items 30-32 Awarded as a lot. 

Tabletop Hot Food Hot Food Hot Food
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ITEM
Automatic Gravity 72"x30"x36" 60"x30"x36"

Quantity: 20 ea 10 ea 50 ea 50 ea

ITEM NUMBER 33 34 35 36
Beltram 4,895.00        3,965.00        399.00           356.00           
Tampa, FL NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Gulf Ice Systems NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Pensacola, FL
Kesco 4,837.00        3,176.00        150.00           135.00           
Pensacola, FL 4,837.00        3,176.00        150.00           135.00           
Alack Refrigeration Co 5,181.00        2,999.00        NO BID  NO BID
Hammond, LA NO BID NO BID
Calico Industries 5,384.00        4,738.00        404.00           374.00           
Annapolis Junction, MD NO BID NO BID NO BID  NO BID
Culinary Depot 4,895.32        3,585.00        339.90           303.60           
Monsey, NY 4,895.32        3,585.00        439.90           403.60           
East Bay Restaurant 4,538.00        3,415.00        432.00           403.00           
Oakland, CA 4,613.00        3,465.00        507.00           478.00           
Great Lakes Hotel Supply 5,095.00        3,897.00        665.00           615.00           
Detroit, MI 5,101.00        3,997.00        765.00           715.00           
Hotel & Resturant Supply 4,769.00        3,395.00        213.95           191.98           
Gulfport, MS 4,769.00        3,395.00        263.95           241.98           
Kamran & Company 4,639.00        3,321.00        324.00           a 298.00           a
Santa Barbara, CA 4,699.00        3,381.00        464.00           u 438.00           u
Mobile Fixture & Equip 4,739.00        3,499.00        218.00           195.00           
Mobile, AL 4,739.00        3,499.00        218.00           195.00           
Pasco Brokerage 5,050.00        3,483.30        275.00           275.00           
Plano, TX 5,250.00        3,693.30        550.00           550.00           
QC Storage NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Jennings, LA
Sam Tell & Son 4,904.48        3,380.85        223.45           210.13           
Farmingdale, NY NO BID NO BID  NO BID  NO BID
Thompson & Little 4,604.49        4,348.05        301.83           270.22           
Fayetteville, NC 4,724.49        4,468.05        421.83           390.22           

Items 33 & 34 Awarded as a lot.
Items 35 & 36 Awarded as a lot. 

Food Slicer, Food Slicer, Prep Table, Prep Table,
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ITEM
Salad Bar, 79" Table, 79"

Quantity: 30 ea 30 ea 20 ea

ITEM NUMBER 37 38 39
Beltram 10,200.00      8,980.00        7,556.50        
Tampa, FL NO BID NO BID  NO BID
Gulf Ice Systems NO BID NO BID NO BID
Pensacola, FL
Kesco 8,184.00        7,092.00        6,070.00        
Pensacola, FL 8,184.00        7,092.00        6,070.00        
Alack Refrigeration Co 11,099.00      9,696.00        8,252.00        
Hammond, LA NO BID NO BID  NO BID
Calico Industries 7,434.00        u 6,342.00        u 5,880.00        
Annapolis Junction, MD NO BID NO BID NO BID
Culinary Depot 11,836.83      10,129.20      9,343.88        
Monsey, NY 12,036.83      10,329.20      9,543.88        
East Bay Restaurant 9,829.00        8,568.00        7,399.00        
Oakland, CA 10,229.00      8,968.00        7,799.00        
Great Lakes Hotel Supply 9,870.00        8,800.00        7,490.00        
Detroit, MI 9,950.00        8,865.00        7,501.00        
Hotel & Resturant Supply 6,195.00        u 5,279.00        u 5,194.00        
Gulfport, MS 6,295.00        5,379.00        5,294.00        
Kamran & Company 6,331.00        u 5,410.00        u 5,390.00        
Santa Barbara, CA 6,681.00        5,760.00        5,740.00        
Mobile Fixture & Equip 8,595.00        7,475.00        6,375.00        
Mobile, AL 8,595.00        7,475.00        6,375.00        
Pasco Brokerage 9,475.00        8,525.00        6,150.00        
Plano, TX 9,750.00        9,175.00        6,550.00        
QC Storage NO BID NO BID NO BID
Jennings, LA
Sam Tell & Son 6,853.48        u 5,851.42        u 5,673.73        
Farmingdale, NY
Thompson & Little 10,471.31      9,073.39        7,765.33        
Fayetteville, NC 10,671.31      9,273.39        7,970.33        

Items 37 & 38 Awarded as a lot. 

N - No prior approved brand
a = Alternate bid 
m = Vendor bid minimum shipment
u = No sample sent, sample not approved, minimum shipment not acceptable

Refrigerated Refrigerated Hot Food
Salad Bar, 64.5"
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BID TABULATION, RECOMMENDATIONS, AND PROTEST
Bid tabulations with award recommendations are posted for 72 hours in the Purchasing 
Department Office and are also posted to the School District's website address at: 
http://old.escambia.k12.fl.us/adminoff/finance/purchasing/current_bid_activity.html

Failure to file a protest within the time prescribed in
Section 120.57(3) Florida Statutes, and School Board Rules shall constitute a waiver of proceedings.
Bid tabulations or recommendations will be distributed solely through the Purchasing 
website address.  Notices will not be automatically mailed.

I hereby certify that the prices and bidders reflected herein are valid, and have been received
in compliance to Escambia County School Board Rules and Florida Law.

John Dombroskie, Director
Purchasing Department
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