
 

 
 
 
DATE: BID TITLE & REFERENCE: 
October 1, 2012    Miscellaneous Food Items II, RFP #130603 
 
DESCRIPTION OF PURCHASE: 

 
A nine (9) month agreement to provide miscellaneous frozen, canned and packaged foods as 
stocked and distributed by the Central Warehouse for school cafeterias throughout the District.  
Thirty-five (35) items bid; twenty-six (26) awarded.  Items will be purchased as needed to meet 
breakfast and lunch menu requirements.  Bid award(s) to the lowest bidder(s) meeting specifications.   
 
Effective Dates:  November 1, 2012 – July 31, 2013. 
 
 
 
 
 

  
REQUESTED BY: 

 
Food Services 
 

    
SUPPLIER NAME:                           ITEMS AWARDED:  ESTIMATED EXPENDITURE: 

 
Alpha Foods, Waller, TX      2   $112,200.00  
Butler Foods of Pensacola, Cantonment, FL            11     214,800.00       
Butter Buds, Racine, WI      1         3,600.00 
Jennie-O Turkey, Wilmar, MN      2       61,000.00 
JTM Provisions, Harrison, OH     5     178,300.00 
Kelley Foods, Elba, AL      2           205,400.00 
Proview Foods LLC, Gainesville, GA    1       11,800.00 
Sysco Gulf Coast, Geneva, AL     2         3,200.00 

 
    
AMOUNT OF PURCHASE: FUNDING SOURCE: 

 
$790,300.00 Est. / 9 Mos.   Food Services Fund (4110) 
 

      
METHOD OF PROCUREMENT: 

 
ECSD Bid                            Responses Received:  9              Bids Rejected:  1 
 

  
DATE AND TIME POSTED: 

 
    October 1, 2012, 1:30 PM CST 
 
 
9500PUR101 (11/10) Retention - 5 Years 

 
THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY 

PURCHASING DEPARTMENT 
75 North Pace Boulevard  

Pensacola, FL  32505 
 

BID AWARD NOTICE 



DATE:  9/26/2012

BID NBR: 130603
BID TITLE:  Miscellaneous Food Items II

ITEM
Breaded Roasted Dill

Quantity: 3,000 cs 1,600 cs 450 cs 200 cs
0516550 0516540 0517500 0517510

ITEM NUMBER 1 2 3 4
Butler Foods No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pensacola, FL 
Alpha Foods No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Waller, TX
Butter Buds No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Racine, WI
Jennie-O Turkey No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Willmar, MN
JTM Provisions No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Harrison, OH
Kelley Foods of Alabama 44.65 a 44.65 a No Bid No Bid
Elba, AL Y Y
Pilgrim's Pride No Bid No Bid
Tucker, GA 63.93 63.24
Proview Foods No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.6413 m
Gainesville, GA 59.00 Y
Sysco Gulf Coast No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Geneva, AL

Not Awarded

Awarded Items are highlighted

Chicken, 8 piece Chicken, 8 piece Turkey Breast, Chicken Breast,
Cracked Pepper

THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

75 NORTH PACE BOULEVARD
PENSACOLA, FLORIDA 32505

BID TABULATION
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ITEM
Smoked lb Frozen Steak ea Turkey

Quantity: 900 cs 200 cs 200 cs 200 cs
0517520 0516240 0517530 0517540

ITEM NUMBER 5 6 7 8
Butler Foods No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pensacola, FL 
Alpha Foods No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Waller, TX
Butter Buds No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Racine, WI
Jennie-O Turkey 2.9500 m No Bid No Bid 26.26 m
Willmar, MN 61.95 Y
JTM Provisions No Bid No Bid 0.7841 m No Bid
Harrison, OH 128.60
Kelley Foods of Alabama No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Elba, AL
Pilgrim's Pride No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tucker, GA
Proview Foods No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Gainesville, GA
Sysco Gulf Coast No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Geneva, AL

Not Awarded

Beef Philly Bacon,Turkey Breast, Ham,

Page 2



ITEM
ea Cheese ea Sugar free

Quantity: 200 cs 250 cs 250 cs 100 cs
0515200 0517550 0517560

ITEM NUMBER 9 10 11 12
Butler Foods No Bid 0.1862 0.1591 No Bid
Pensacola, FL 35.75 Y 30.55 Y
Alpha Foods No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Waller, TX
Butter Buds No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Racine, WI
Jennie-O Turkey No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Willmar, MN
JTM Provisions No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Harrison, OH
Kelley Foods of Alabama No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Elba, AL
Pilgrim's Pride No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tucker, GA
Proview Foods No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Gainesville, GA
Sysco Gulf Coast No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Geneva, AL

Not Awarded Not Awarded

Roast Beef Swiss Cheese Provolone Syrup,

Page 3



ITEM
Spray cn Cheese ea Cheddar lb Jalapeno lb

Quantity: 200 cs 300 cs 900 cs 900 cs
0502100 0502140 0508000 0507170

ITEM NUMBER 13 14 15 16
Butler Foods No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pensacola, FL 
Alpha Foods No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Waller, TX
Butter Buds 2.9783 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Racine, WI 17.87 Y
Jennie-O Turkey No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Willmar, MN
JTM Provisions No Bid 0.5074 m 1.7333 m 1.7333 m
Harrison, OH 40.59 Y 52.00 52.00
Kelley Foods of Alabama 3.4500 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Elba, AL 20.70 Y
Pilgrim's Pride No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tucker, GA
Proview Foods No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Gainesville, GA
Sysco Gulf Coast No Bid No Bid 1.8365 1.8365
Geneva, AL 73.00 73.00

Cheese Sauce,Pan/Food Macaroni and Cheese Sauce,
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ITEM
Queso Blanco ea Crackers Grahams Portion Packs

Quantity: 900 cs 400 cs 400 cs 400 cs
0507900 0505090 0506170 0502200

ITEM NUMBER 17 18 19 20
Butler Foods No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pensacola, FL 
Alpha Foods No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Waller, TX
Butter Buds No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Racine, WI
Jennie-O Turkey No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Willmar, MN
JTM Provisions 1.7333 m No Bid No Bid No Bid
Harrison, OH 52.00
Kelley Foods of Alabama No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Elba, AL
Pilgrim's Pride No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tucker, GA
Proview Foods No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Gainesville, GA
Sysco Gulf Coast 2.7810 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Geneva, AL 73.00

Not Awarded Not Awarded Not Awarded

Cheese Sauce, Baked Snack Giant Cinn. Jelly,
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ITEM
Pepperoni 7", Wh grain ea 7" ea Steak Patty ea

Quantity: 300 cs 2,000 cs 2,000 cs 750 cs
0516760 0517430 0517420 0516131

ITEM NUMBER 21 22 23 24
Butler Foods No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pensacola, FL 
Alpha Foods No Bid 0.3940 m 0.6150 m No Bid
Waller, TX 31.52 Y 24.60 Y
Butter Buds No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Racine, WI
Jennie-O Turkey No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Willmar, MN
JTM Provisions No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Harrison, OH
Kelley Foods of Alabama No Bid No Bid 0.2075 u 0.3310 U
Elba, AL 24.90 p 26.48
Pilgrim's Pride No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tucker, GA
Proview Foods No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Gainesville, GA
Sysco Gulf Coast No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.3181 U
Geneva, AL 25.45

Not Awarded Not Awarded

Bkfst. BeefSliced Pizza Dough, Pizza Dough,
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ITEM
Cheese.grated lb Bulk pack Bulk pack ea

Quantity: 200 cs 50 cs 50 cs 4,500 cs
0502150 0506010 0506010 0580030

ITEM NUMBER 25 26 27 28
Butler Foods 2.3550 a No Bid No Bid 0.4600
Pensacola, FL 47.10 Y 7.36
Alpha Foods No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Waller, TX
Butter Buds No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Racine, WI
Jennie-O Turkey No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Willmar, MN
JTM Provisions No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Harrison, OH
Kelley Foods of Alabama No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Elba, AL
Pilgrim's Pride No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tucker, GA
Proview Foods No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Gainesville, GA
Sysco Gulf Coast No Bid 28.00 36.45 No Bid
Geneva, AL

Parmesan Cereal, Granola, Tea
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ITEM
No calorie ea 100% 100%

Quantity: 4,500 cs Instructional 245,000 ea 121,500 ea
0580040 Information 0570670

ITEM NUMBER 29 30 31 32
Butler Foods 0.4600 0.2550 0.2250
Pensacola, FL 7.36
Alpha Foods No Bid No Bid No Bid
Waller, TX
Butter Buds No Bid No Bid No Bid
Racine, WI
Jennie-O Turkey No Bid No Bid No Bid
Willmar, MN
JTM Provisions No Bid No Bid No Bid
Harrison, OH
Kelley Foods of Alabama No Bid No Bid No Bid
Elba, AL
Pilgrim's Pride No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tucker, GA
Proview Foods No Bid No Bid No Bid
Gainesville, GA
Sysco Gulf Coast No Bid No Bid No Bid
Geneva, AL

Apple Juice,Tea, Orange Juice,
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ITEM
100% Portion pack Flavored.port ea Portion pack ea

Quantity: 121,500 ea 1,200 cs 2,100 cs 8,000 cs
0570690 0540240 0540230 0540220

ITEM NUMBER 33 34 35 36
Butler Foods 0.2625 0.1675 Y 0.1675 Y 0.0354 Y
Pensacola, FL 16.75 25.50
Alpha Foods No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Waller, TX
Butter Buds No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Racine, WI
Jennie-O Turkey No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Willmar, MN
JTM Provisions No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Harrison, OH
Kelley Foods of Alabama No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Elba, AL
Pilgrim's Pride No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tucker, GA
Proview Foods No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Gainesville, GA
Sysco Gulf Coast No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Geneva, AL

BID TABULATION, RECOMMENDATIONS, AND PROTEST
Bid tabulations with award recommendations are posted for 72 hours in the Purchasing 
Department Office and are also posted to the School District's website address at: 
http://old.escambia.k12.fl.us/adminoff/finance/purchasing/current_bid_activity.html

Failure to file a protest within the time prescribed in
Section 120.57(3) Florida Statutes, and School Board Rules shall constitute a waiver of proceedings.
Bid tabulations or recommendations will be distributed solely through the Purchasing 
website address.  Notices will not be automatically mailed.

I hereby certify that the prices and bidders reflected herein are valid, and have been received
in compliance to Escambia County School Board Rules and Florida Law.

John Dombroskie, Director
Purchasing Department

Other, 6oz Cream Cheese, Cream Cheese, Butter,
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