. THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY
< PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

75 North Pace Blvd.
Pensacola, FL 32505

432 1?

BID AWARD NOTICE

DATE: BID TITLE & REFERENCE:
August 13, 2012 Bread, RFP #130303

DESCRIPTION OF PURCHASE:

An agreement, in conjunction with Santa Rosa and Okaloosa County School Districts, for the supply
and delivery of fresh bread products to school cafeterias for use in the preparation of breakfast and
lunch meals. Products are delivered fresh on a continuous and frequent basis to cafeterias and
distribution sites in all three counties; this solicitation is awarded to one (1) vendor and not split by
low price per item. The Evaluation Committee assessed points for each vendor based on vendor’'s
overall proposal. Award to vendor with highest overall points. The agreement will initially be
awarded for a period of eleven plus (11+) months with the right to terminate or to renew the
agreement for four (4) more successive one (1) year periods (July 1 — June 30™) by mutual written
agreement of awardee and the District.

Effective Dates: August 22, 2012 through July 31, 2013.

REQUESTED BY:

Food Services

SUPPLIER NAME:

Sara Lee Bakery Group, Inc., dba: Earthgrains Baking Co., Inc., Mobile, AL

AMOUNT OF PURCHASE: FUNDING SOURCE:

$220,000.00 Est. / Yr. Food Services Fund (4110)

METHOD OF PROCUREMENT:

ECSD RFP Responses Received: 3

DATE & TIME POSTED:

August 13, 2012, 11:50 AM CST

9500PUR101 (11/10) Retention - 5 Years



THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
75 NORTH PACE BOULEVARD
PENSACOLA, FL 32505
BID TABULATION

DATE: July 25, 2012
BID NBR: 130303

Awarded Items are highlighted

BID TITLE: Bread, Fresh for Direct Delivery to School Cafeterias

Award is made based on Points Awarded as detailed in the RFP document.

Cost to District

Vendor Reliability, history, by reference or District history
Product test results in approved District taste testing
Maximum Possible Points To Be Earned

50 Maximum Points
20 Maximum Points
30 Maximum Points

100

Because of variances in pack sizes, some products had to be evaluated by cost of item, i.e.

price per roll/serving. In those cases, the Individual prices is listed on the line below the item.

| | IBC Corporation Flowers Baking Co. Earthgrains
VENDOR POINTS 27 22 95
Est'd
Qty Unit [Unit Cost |Total Cost Unit Cost |Total Cost Unit Cost |Total Cost
1| 12,000|loaf 1.18| 14,160.00|a, y 1.20| 14,400.00 1.05| 12,600.00
2| 1,000|loaf 1.22 1,220.00|a, y 1.20 1,200.00 1.05 1,050.00
3a| 28,000(tray 1.10| 30,800.00|a,y; p 2.94 82,320.00 2.00{ 56,000.00
Individual Price 0.0917 0.0980 0.0667
3b| 28,000|pkg |No bid 0.00 3.90( 109,200.00 3.00( 84,000.00
3c| 28,000|pkg |No bid 0.00 3.90( 109,200.00 3.00( 84,000.00
3d 250|pkg 0.80 200.00(a, u 1.15 287.50(a 3.30 825.00(a,p
Individual Price 0.1000 0.1438 0.1100
4a| 20,000|pkg No bid 0.00 0.95| 19,000.00|a 1.46| 29,200.00|a,y
Individual Price 0.1188 0.0608
4b 250|pkg |No bid 0.00 No bid 0.00 No bid 0.00
4c| 14,000|pkg [No bid 0.00 No bid 0.00 No bid 0.00
5a| 14,000|pkg 1.65| 23,100.00|a,y 1.80| 25,200.00 1.15| 16,100.00
5b| 14,000|pkg |No bid 0.00 2.00( 28,000.00 1.65| 23,100.00
5c 250|pkg 0.80 200.00(a, u 1.15 287.50(a 2.05 512.50
Individual Price 0.1000 0.1438 0.1281
6| 250|pkg No bid 0.00 1.85 462.50(a 6.72 1,680.00
Individual Price 0.1542 0.1400
7a| 14,000|bag 1.40| 19,600.00|a,y 4.60| 64,400.00(a, u 1.73| 24,220.00
Individual Price 0.2333 0.1917 0.2883
7b]  100[bag [No bid 0.00 4.80 480.00]a, u 1.85 185.00
Individual Price 0.2000 0.3083
8| 14,000|pkg 1.70| 23,800.00|a,y; p 2.05( 28,700.00(a, u 1.38| 19,320.00
Individual Price 0.0708 0.0854 0.0431
9a| 10,000|case No bid 0.00 1.22| 12,200.00(a, u 1.90| 19,000.00
Individual Price 0.1220 0.1900
9b 200|case|No bid 0.00 1.22 244.00|a, u[No bid 0.00
10a| 10,000|case [No bid 0.00 1.64| 16,400.00|a, u|No bid 0.00
10b 200|case|No bid 0.00 No Bid 0.00 2.40 480.00

a Alternate Product Bid

y Altenate Product Approved in District Testing

p Pack Size differs from specifications
u Alternate Product Not Accepted or No Sample was Sent




Bid Tabulation, Recommendation and Protest:

Bid tabulations with award recommendations are posted for 72 Hours in the Purchasing Department
Office and are also posted to the School District's website address at:
http://old.escambia.k12.fl.us/adminoff/finance/purchasing/current_bid_activity.html

Failure to file a protest within the time prescribed in Section 120.53(5) Florida Statutes, and
School Board Rules shall constitute a waiver of proceedings. Bid tabulations or recommendations
will be distributed solely through the Purchasing website address. Notices will not be automatically
mailed.

| hereby certify that the prices and bidders reflected herein are valid, and have been received
in compliance to Escambia County School Board Rules and Florida Law.

Johw Dombroskie

John Dombroskie, Director of Purchasing



