THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY
&n PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

75 North Pace Blvd.

Pensacola, FL 32505

432 1?

BID AWARD NOTICE

DATE: BID TITLE & REFERENCE:
June 11, 2012 Breakfast & Lunch Entrees, RFP #123903

DESCRIPTION OF PURCHASE:

A semi-annual agreement to provide breakfast and lunch entrees as stocked and distributed by the
Central Warehouse for school cafeterias throughout the District. Seventy-four (74) items bid and
seventy (70) are awarded. Items will be purchased as needed to meet breakfast and lunch menu

requirements. Bid award(s) to the lowest bidder(s) meeting specifications.

Effective Dates: August 1, 2012 through January 31, 2013.

REQUESTED BY:

Food Services

SUPPLIER NAME: ITEMS AWARDED: ESTIMATED EXPENDITURE:
Advance Pierre Foods, Enid, OK 1 $ 49,600.00
Agora Foods, Dawsonville, GA 1 10,300.00
American Foods Group, Oklahoma City, OK 2 83,900.00
Asian Food Solutions, Oviedo, FL 2 21,800.00
Cargill Kitchen Solutions, Monticello, MN 2 20,300.00
Don Lee Farms, Inglewood, CA 1 79,300.00
ES Foods, Woodbury, NY 7 40,400.00
Global Foods, Las Vegas, NV 2 25,700.00
Jennie-O Turkey, Willmar, MN 5 32,700.00
JNS Foods, LLC, Tamarac, FL 1 5,400.00
JTM Provisions, Harrison, OH 4 52,500.00
Kelley Foods of Alabama, Elba, AL 9 242,200.00
Opportunity Sales, Inc., Holt, FL 1 16,000.00
Pilgrim’s Pride Co., Tucker, GA 6 57,300.00
ProView Foods, LLC, Gainesville, GA 1 31,200.00
Super Bakery, Cleveland, OH 2 63,600.00
Sysco Gulf Coast, Geneva, AL 6 24,800.00
Tasty Brands, Hicksville, NY 2 52,200.00
The Father’s Table, Sanford, FL 1 3,900.00
US Foodservice-Lakeland, Lakeland, FL 6 123,000.00
US Foodservice-Montgomery, Montgomery, AL 8 184,900.00

AMOUNT OF PURCHASE: FUNDING SOURCE:
$1,221,000.00 Est. / 6 Mos. Food Services Fund (4110)

METHOD OF PROCUREMENT:

ECSD Bid Responses Received: 28 Bids Rejected: 2

DATE AND TIME POSTED:

June 11, 2012, 6:00 PM CST

9500PUR101 (11/10) Retention - 5 Years



DATE: June 20, 2012
BID NBR: 123903

THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY

PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
75 NORTH PACE BOULEVARD, PENSACOLA, FL 32505

BID TABULATION

BID TITLE: Breakfast and Lunch Entrees

Awarded Items are highlighted

ITEM Toaster Pastries Toaster Pastries Texas Cereal
Single Double Cinn. Toast Bar ea
Quantity: 100 cs 100 cs 1,500 cs 450 cs
0505980 0505990
ITEM NUMBER 1 2 3 4

Asian Food Solutions NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Oviedo, FL

CEM NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Lakeland, FL

JNS Foods, LLC NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Tamarac, FL

Opportunity Sales, Inc. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Holt, FL

The Fathers Table NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Sanford, FL

US Foods-Lakeland NO BID NO BID NO BID 0.2844

Lakeland, FL 27.30

AdvancePierre Foods NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Cincinnati, OH

American Foods Group NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Oklahoma City, OK

American Pride SeaFoods NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

New Bedford, MA

Agora Foods NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Dawsonville, GA

Beaver Valley Baking, Inc NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Aliguippa, PA

Cargill Kitchen Solutions NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Monticello, MN

Don Lee Farms NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Inglewood, CA

ES Foods NO BID NO BID NO BID 0.2500 aY

Woodbury, NY 50.00 mu

Global Foods NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Las Vegas, NV

Hadley Farms, Inc. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Smithsburg, MD

JTM Provisions Co NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Harrison, OH

Jennie O Turkey Store NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Willmar, MN

Kelley Foods NO BID NO BID 0.4552 0.2711

Elba, AL 38.24 26.03

Lings NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

South El Monte, CA

MCI Foods, Inc NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Santa Fe Springs, CA

Pilgrim's Pride Co. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Tucker, GA

ProView Foods LLC NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Gainesville, GA

Right Start Foods NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Hauppauge, NY

Super Bakery NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Cleveland, OH

Sysco Gulf Coast 0.5347 au 0.4778 0.4554 0.2865

Geneva, AL 38.50 34.40 38.25 27.50

Tasty Brands NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Hicksville, NY

US Foods-Montgomery NO BID 0.4258 NO BID 0.2841

Montgomery, AL 30.66 27.27

Not Awarded
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ITEM Cereals, Pastry, Mini-Cinnamon Whole Grain
Ready to eat ea | Whole grain Rolls Bar ea
Quantity: 500 cs 1,400 cs 1,400 cs 400 cs
ITEM NUMBER 5 6 7 8
Asian Food Solutions NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Oviedo, FL
CEM NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Lakeland, FL
JNS Foods, LLC NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Tamarac, FL
Opportunity Sales, Inc. NO BID NO BID NO BID 0.1849
Holt, FL 39.94
The Fathers Table NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Sanford, FL
US Foods-Lakeland 0.1910 NO BID NO BID 0.1861 mu
Lakeland, FL 18.34 40.20
AdvancePierre Foods NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Cincinnati, OH
American Foods Group NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Oklahoma City, OK
American Pride SeaFoods NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
New Bedford, MA
Agora Foods NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Dawsonville, GA
Beaver Valley Baking, Inc NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Aliguippa, PA
Cargill Kitchen Solutions NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Monticello, MN
Don Lee Farms NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Inglewood, CA
ES Foods NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Woodbury, NY
Global Foods NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Las Vegas, NV
Hadley Farms, Inc. NO BID 0.3240 au 0.3094 au NO BID
Smithsburg, MD 14.58 11.14
JTM Provisions Co NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Harrison, OH
Jennie O Turkey Store NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Willmar, MN
Kelley Foods 0.1778 0.4246 0.4246 NO BID
Elba, AL 17.07 30.57 30.57
Lings NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
South El Monte, CA
MCI Foods, Inc NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Santa Fe Springs, CA
Pilgrim's Pride Co. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Tucker, GA
ProView Foods LLC NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Gainesville, GA
Right Start Foods NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Hauppauge, NY
Super Bakery NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Cleveland, OH
Sysco Gulf Coast 0.2943 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Geneva, AL 28.25
Tasty Brands NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Hicksville, NY
US Foods-Montgomery 0.1965 0.4568 0.4568 NO BID
Montgomery, AL 18.86 32.89 32.89
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ITEM Whole Grain Whole Grain Muffin, Sdwch Stuffer,
Bkfst Bar ea | Gordita Bread Variety Pizza
Quantity: 1,200 cs 150 cs 600 cs 125 cs
0517170
ITEM NUMBER 9 10 11 12

Asian Food Solutions NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Oviedo, FL

CEM NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Lakeland, FL

JNS Foods, LLC NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Tamarac, FL

Opportunity Sales, Inc. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Holt, FL

The Fathers Table 0.2625 au 0.1800 NO BID NO BID

Sanford, FL 31.50 25.92

US Foods-Lakeland NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Lakeland, FL

AdvancePierre Foods NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Cincinnati, OH

American Foods Group NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Oklahoma City, OK

American Pride SeaFoods NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

New Bedford, MA

Agora Foods NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Dawsonville, GA

Beaver Valley Baking, Inc NO BID 0.1684 au NO BID NO BID

Aliguippa, PA 24.25

Cargill Kitchen Solutions NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Monticello, MN

Don Lee Farms NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Inglewood, CA

ES Foods NO BID NO BID NO BID 0.6105 m

Woodbury, NY 58.61

Global Foods NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Las Vegas, NV

Hadley Farms, Inc. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Smithsburg, MD

JTM Provisions Co NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Harrison, OH

Jennie O Turkey Store NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Willmar, MN

Kelley Foods 0.4102 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Elba, AL 19.69

Lings NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

South El Monte, CA

MCI Foods, Inc NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Santa Fe Springs, CA

Pilgrim's Pride Co. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Tucker, GA

ProView Foods LLC NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Gainesville, GA

Right Start Foods NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Hauppauge, NY

Super Bakery NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Cleveland, OH

Sysco Gulf Coast NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Geneva, AL

Tasty Brands NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Hicksville, NY

US Foods-Montgomery 0.4292 au NO BID 0.6396 NO BID

Montgomery, AL 20.60 30.70
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ITEM Bkfst Stuffed Bkfst Stuffed Egg Patties, Pancakes
Sdwch, Sau  ea |[Sdwch, Pot. ea Grilled
Quantity: 125 cs 125 cs 250 cs 125 cs
0516090 0517000

ITEM NUMBER 13 14 15 16
Asian Food Solutions NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Oviedo, FL
CEM NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Lakeland, FL
JNS Foods, LLC NO BID NO BID NO BID 0.0680 au
Tamarac, FL 9.75
Opportunity Sales, Inc. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Holt, FL
The Fathers Table NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Sanford, FL
US Foods-Lakeland NO BID NO BID NO BID 0.0670
Lakeland, FL 9.65
AdvancePierre Foods NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Cincinnati, OH
American Foods Group NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Oklahoma City, OK
American Pride SeaFoods NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
New Bedford, MA
Agora Foods NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Dawsonville, GA
Beaver Valley Baking, Inc NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Aliguippa, PA
Cargill Kitchen Solutions NO BID NO BID 0.1090 0.3174 aY
Monticello, MN 32.69 39.99 pu
Don Lee Farms NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Inglewood, CA
ES Foods 0.3925 m 0.3789 m NO BID NO BID
Woodbury, NY 62.80 60.62
Global Foods NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Las Vegas, NV
Hadley Farms, Inc. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Smithsburg, MD
JTM Provisions Co NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Harrison, OH
Jennie O Turkey Store NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Willmar, MN
Kelley Foods NO BID NO BID NO BID 0.0731
Elba, AL 10.54
Lings NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
South El Monte, CA
MCI Foods, Inc NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Santa Fe Springs, CA
Pilgrim's Pride Co. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Tucker, GA
ProView Foods LLC NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Gainesville, GA
Right Start Foods NO BID NO BID 0.1144 aY 0.0677 mu
Hauppauge, NY 17.50 mu 9.75
Super Bakery NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Cleveland, OH
Sysco Gulf Coast NO BID NO BID NO BID 0.0952
Geneva, AL 13.70
Tasty Brands NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Hicksville, NY
US Foods-Montgomery NO BID NO BID NO BID 0.1250
Montgomery, AL 18.00
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ITEM Mini- French Bagels Mini Cheese
Pancakes ea| Toast Sticks stk ea | Pizza Bagels
Quantity: 400 cs 250 cs 400 cs 300 cs
0516990 0517010 0517070
ITEM NUMBER 17 18 19 20
Asian Food Solutions NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Oviedo, FL
CEM 0.3529 au NO BID NO BID NO BID
Lakeland, FL 18.35
JNS Foods, LLC NO BID 0.0660 mu 0.1880 NO BID
Tamarac, FL 12.40 13.49
Opportunity Sales, Inc. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Holt, FL
The Fathers Table NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Sanford, FL
US Foods-Lakeland 0.3471 au 0.0650 mu 0.1854 mu NO BID
Lakeland, FL 18.05 11.75 13.35
AdvancePierre Foods NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Cincinnati, OH
American Foods Group NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Oklahoma City, OK
American Pride SeaFoods NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
New Bedford, MA
Agora Foods NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Dawsonville, GA
Beaver Valley Baking, Inc NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Aliguippa, PA
Cargill Kitchen Solutions NO BID 0.1310 aY NO BID NO BID
Monticello, MN 47.27
Don Lee Farms NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Inglewood, CA
ES Foods NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Woodbury, NY
Global Foods NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Las Vegas, NV
Hadley Farms, Inc. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Smithsburg, MD
JTM Provisions Co NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Harrison, OH
Jennie O Turkey Store NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Willmar, MN
Kelley Foods NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Elba, AL
Lings NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
South El Monte, CA
MCI Foods, Inc NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Santa Fe Springs, CA
Pilgrim's Pride Co. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Tucker, GA
ProView Foods LLC NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Gainesville, GA
Right Start Foods 0.3442 aY NO BID NO BID NO BID
Hauppauge, NY 17.90 mu
Super Bakery NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Cleveland, OH
Sysco Gulf Coast 0.3667 0.0820 0.2341 NO BID
Geneva, AL 26.40 14.75 16.85
Tasty Brands NO BID NO BID NO BID 0.6560
Hicksville, NY 78.77
US Foods-Montgomery 0.4147 0.0658 0.2031 NO BID
Montgomery, AL 29.86 12.50 14.62
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ITEM Whole Grain Donuts, Donuts, Waffle
Lasagna Rollup Frozen, 1.5 grain Frozen, 2 grain
Quantity: 400 cs 1,500 cs 1,500 cs 1,500 cs
0517090 0517320 0517021
ITEM NUMBER 21 22 23 24

Asian Food Solutions NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Oviedo, FL

CEM NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Lakeland, FL

JNS Foods, LLC NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Tamarac, FL

Opportunity Sales, Inc. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Holt, FL

The Fathers Table NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Sanford, FL

US Foods-Lakeland NO BID NO BID NO BID 0.4165

Lakeland, FL 29.99

AdvancePierre Foods NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Cincinnati, OH

American Foods Group NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Oklahoma City, OK

American Pride SeaFoods NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

New Bedford, MA

Agora Foods NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Dawsonville, GA

Beaver Valley Baking, Inc NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Aliguippa, PA

Cargill Kitchen Solutions NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Monticello, MN

Don Lee Farms NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Inglewood, CA

ES Foods NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Woodbury, NY

Global Foods NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Las Vegas, NV

Hadley Farms, Inc. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Smithsburg, MD

JTM Provisions Co NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Harrison, OH

Jennie O Turkey Store NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Willmar, MN

Kelley Foods NO BID NO BID NO BID 0.4519

Elba, AL 32.54

Lings NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

South El Monte, CA

MCI Foods, Inc NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Santa Fe Springs, CA

Pilgrim's Pride Co. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Tucker, GA

ProView Foods LLC NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Gainesville, GA

Right Start Foods NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Hauppauge, NY

Super Bakery NO BID 0.2400 0.2900 NO BID

Cleveland, OH 19.20 23.20

Sysco Gulf Coast NO BID NO BID NO BID 0.4188

Geneva, AL 30.15

Tasty Brands 0.6500 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Hicksville, NY 71.52

US Foods-Montgomery NO BID NO BID NO BID 0.4489

Montgomery, AL 32.32
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ITEM Chicken Colby Beef, Ground Beef
Sau Biscuit ea [Ch. Omelet ea | MiniBurgers ea Patties
Quantity: 400 cs 200 cs 400 cs 2,000 cs
0515090 0516115
ITEM NUMBER 25 26 27 28

Asian Food Solutions NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Oviedo, FL

CEM NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Lakeland, FL

JNS Foods, LLC NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Tamarac, FL

Opportunity Sales, Inc. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Holt, FL

The Fathers Table NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Sanford, FL

US Foods-Lakeland NO BID 0.2142 au 0.2998 ay NO BID

Lakeland, FL 30.85 89.95 pu

AdvancePierre Foods NO BID NO BID 0.2242 0.4859

Cincinnati, OH 62.78 43.73

AdvancePierre Foods-alt NA NA NA 0.4893

Cincinnati, OH 56.76

American Foods Group NO BID NO BID 0.1728 aY 0.5087

Oklahoma City, OK 69.11 101.74

American Pride SeaFoods NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

New Bedford, MA

Agora Foods NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Dawsonville, GA

Beaver Valley Baking, Inc NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Aliguippa, PA

Cargill Kitchen Solutions NO BID 0.2688 NO BID NO BID

Monticello, MN 60.47

Don Lee Farms NO BID NO BID 0.1943 ay 0.3885

Inglewood, CA 34.97 mu 39.63

ES Foods NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Woodbury, NY

Global Foods 0.4250 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Las Vegas, NV 40.80

Hadley Farms, Inc. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Smithsburg, MD

JTM Provisions Co NO BID NO BID 0.1857 0.4801

Harrison, OH 77.43 93.62

Jennie O Turkey Store NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Willmar, MN

Kelley Foods NO BID NO BID 0.2311 0.5009

Elba, AL 64.72 45.08

Lings NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

South El Monte, CA

MCI Foods, Inc NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Santa Fe Springs, CA

Pilgrim's Pride Co. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Tucker, GA

ProView Foods LLC NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Gainesville, GA

Right Start Foods NO BID 0.2257 aY NO BID NO BID

Hauppauge, NY 32.50 mu

Super Bakery NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Cleveland, OH

Sysco Gulf Coast NO BID NO BID 0.2306 0.5012

Geneva, AL 64.55 45.10

Tasty Brands NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Hicksville, NY

US Foods-Montgomery NO BID NO BID 0.2323 0.5066

Montgomery, AL 65.05 45.59
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ITEM Ground Beef Smoked Bkfst Beef Ground Beef
Patties, Broiler ea Sausage Steak Patty Bulk Ib
Quantity: 1,500 cs 100 cs 500 cs 400 cs
0516116 0516120 0516131 0516140
ITEM NUMBER 29 30 31 32
Asian Food Solutions NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Oviedo, FL
CEM NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Lakeland, FL
JNS Foods, LLC NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Tamarac, FL
Opportunity Sales, Inc. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Holt, FL
The Fathers Table NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Sanford, FL
US Foods-Lakeland NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Lakeland, FL
AdvancePierre Foods NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Cincinnati, OH
American Foods Group NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Oklahoma City, OK
American Pride SeaFoods NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
New Bedford, MA
Agora Foods NO BID NO BID NO BID 0.8600 au
Dawsonville, GA 34.40
Beaver Valley Baking, Inc NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Aliguippa, PA
Cargill Kitchen Solutions NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Monticello, MN
Don Lee Farms NO BID NO BID 0.2320 au NO BID
Inglewood, CA 27.84
ES Foods NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Woodbury, NY
Global Foods NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Las Vegas, NV
Hadley Farms, Inc. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Smithsburg, MD
JTM Provisions Co NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Harrison, OH
Jennie O Turkey Store NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Willmar, MN
Kelley Foods NO BID 2.5400 NO BID NO BID
Elba, AL 25.40
Lings NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
South El Monte, CA
MCI Foods, Inc NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Santa Fe Springs, CA
Pilgrim's Pride Co. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Tucker, GA
ProView Foods LLC NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Gainesville, GA
Right Start Foods NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Hauppauge, NY
Super Bakery NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Cleveland, OH
Sysco Gulf Coast 0.7344 au 2.3100 NO BID NO BID
Geneva, AL 58.75 23.10
Tasty Brands NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Hicksville, NY
US Foods-Montgomery 0.5589 au 2.3660 NO BID 0.4063
Montgomery, AL 55.89 23.66 65.00
Not Awarded Not Awarded
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ITEM Country Beef, Seasoned Taco Beef Meatballs,
Fried Steak Cooked Tips Meat Italian ea
Quantity: 1,000 cs 100 cs 400 cs 800 cs
0516151 0516170 0516190
ITEM NUMBER 33 34 35 36

Asian Food Solutions NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Oviedo, FL

CEM NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Lakeland, FL

JNS Foods, LLC NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Tamarac, FL

Opportunity Sales, Inc. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Holt, FL

The Fathers Table NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Sanford, FL

US Foods-Lakeland NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Lakeland, FL

AdvancePierre Foods 0.5829 NO BID NO BID 0.0810

Cincinnati, OH 49.55 77.60

American Foods Group NO BID NO BID NO BID 0.0730 aY

Oklahoma City, OK 70.29

American Pride SeaFoods NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

New Bedford, MA

Agora Foods NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Dawsonville, GA

Beaver Valley Baking, Inc NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Aliguippa, PA

Cargill Kitchen Solutions NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Monticello, MN

Don Lee Farms NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Inglewood, CA

ES Foods NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Woodbury, NY

Global Foods NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Las Vegas, NV

Hadley Farms, Inc. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Smithsburg, MD

JTM Provisions Co 0.5890 0.9623 aY 0.3675 aY 0.0870

Harrison, OH 77.80 119.32 55.50 74.69

Jennie O Turkey Store NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Willmar, MN

Kelley Foods 0.6009 NO BID NO BID 0.0833

Elba, AL 51.08 80.00

Lings NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

South El Monte, CA

MCI Foods, Inc NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Santa Fe Springs, CA

Pilgrim's Pride Co. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Tucker, GA

ProView Foods LLC NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Gainesville, GA

Right Start Foods NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Hauppauge, NY

Super Bakery NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Cleveland, OH

Sysco Gulf Coast 0.5983 NO BID NO BID 0.0821

Geneva, AL 50.85 78.80

Tasty Brands NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Hicksville, NY

US Foods-Montgomery 0.6025 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Montgomery, AL 51.21
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ITEM Sausage Link, Sausage Patty, Deli Style Turkey
Turkey ea Turkey ea | Turkey Ham Roast
Quantity: 200 cs 200 cs 2,000 Ib 6,000 b
0516200 0516210 0516220 0516311
ITEM NUMBER 37 38 39 40

Asian Food Solutions NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Oviedo, FL

CEM NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Lakeland, FL

JNS Foods, LLC NO BID NO BID No Bid NO BID

Tamarac, FL

Opportunity Sales, Inc. 0.1163 au 0.1175 au 2.1200 au 2.4800 a

Holt, FL 19.30 18.80

The Fathers Table NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Sanford, FL

US Foods-Lakeland NO BID NO BID 2.2000 au 2.5800 au

Lakeland, FL m m

AdvancePierre Foods NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Cincinnati, OH

American Foods Group NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Oklahoma City, OK

American Pride SeaFoods NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

New Bedford, MA

Agora Foods NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Dawsonville, GA

Beaver Valley Baking, Inc NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Aliguippa, PA

Cargill Kitchen Solutions NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Monticello, MN

Don Lee Farms NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Inglewood, CA

ES Foods NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Woodbury, NY

Global Foods NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Las Vegas, NV

Hadley Farms, Inc. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Smithsburg, MD

JTM Provisions Co NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Harrison, OH

Jennie O Turkey Store 0.1794 m 0.1794 m 1.9000 m 2.2000 m

Willmar, MN 28.70 28.70

Kelley Foods NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Elba, AL

Lings NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

South El Monte, CA

MCI Foods, Inc NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Santa Fe Springs, CA

Pilgrim's Pride Co. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Tucker, GA

ProView Foods LLC NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Gainesville, GA

Right Start Foods NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Hauppauge, NY

Super Bakery NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Cleveland, OH

Sysco Gulf Coast 0.2007 0.1872 1.9600 2.4600

Geneva, AL 32.10 29.95

Tasty Brands NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Hicksville, NY

US Foods-Montgomery 0.2006 0.1904 2.01 2.51

Montgomery, AL 32.10 30.46

Iltems 37 - 41 Awarded as a Lot
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ITEM Turkey, Pork Rib Pork Chicken
Ground b Patty ea | Spaghetti Sauce Nuggets por
Quantity: 150 cs 200 cs 100 cs 300 cs
0516321 0516520
ITEM NUMBER 41 42 43 44

Asian Food Solutions NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Oviedo, FL

CEM NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Lakeland, FL

JNS Foods, LLC NO BID NO BID NO BID 0.2572 au

Tamarac, FL 15.69

Opportunity Sales, Inc. 1.5800 au NO BID NO BID NO BID

Holt, FL 63.20

The Fathers Table NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Sanford, FL

US Foods-Lakeland 2.5800 au NO BID NO BID 0.4040 mu

Lakeland, FL 103.20 20.20

AdvancePierre Foods NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Cincinnati, OH

American Foods Group NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Oklahoma City, OK

American Pride SeaFoods NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

New Bedford, MA

Agora Foods NO BID 0.3720 au NO BID NO BID

Dawsonville, GA 18.60

Beaver Valley Baking, Inc NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Aliguippa, PA

Cargill Kitchen Solutions NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Monticello, MN

Don Lee Farms NO BID 0.2968 aY NO BID NO BID

Inglewood, CA 32.05 mu

ES Foods NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Woodbury, NY

Global Foods NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Las Vegas, NV

Hadley Farms, Inc. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Smithsburg, MD

JTM Provisions Co NO BID 0.4168 0.5395 NO BID

Harrison, OH 70.03 43.70

Jennie O Turkey Store 1.4000 p NO BID NO BID NO BID

Willmar, MN 28.00 m

Kelley Foods NO BID NO BID NO BID 0.4418

Elba, AL 22.09

Lings NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

South El Monte, CA

MCI Foods, Inc NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Santa Fe Springs, CA

Pilgrim's Pride Co. NO BID NO BID NO BID 0.2781

Tucker, GA 13.90

ProView Foods LLC NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Gainesville, GA

Right Start Foods NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Hauppauge, NY

Super Bakery NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Cleveland, OH

Sysco Gulf Coast 1.4000 NO BID NO BID 0.2940

Geneva, AL 28.00 14.70

Tasty Brands NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Hicksville, NY

US Foods-Montgomery 1.3720 NO BID NO BID 0.2083

Montgomery, AL 27.44 13.80
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ITEM Grilled White Chicken, Diced Chicken Breast Chicken Tender-
Chicken Patty ea Frozen Ib |Fillet, Breaded ea | loins, Buffalo Ib
Quantity: 1,600 cs 100 cs 400 cs 400 cs
0516562 0516572 0516580 0516610
ITEM NUMBER 45 46 47 48
Asian Food Solutions NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Oviedo, FL
CEM NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Lakeland, FL
JNS Foods, LLC 0.3500 au NO BID NO BID 2.2100 au
Tamarac, FL 39.79 22.10
Opportunity Sales, Inc. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Holt, FL
The Fathers Table NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Sanford, FL
US Foods-Lakeland 0.6020 mu 1.8260 mu NO BID NO BID
Lakeland, FL 60.20 18.26
AdvancePierre Foods 0.3636 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Cincinnati, OH 36.36
American Foods Group NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Oklahoma City, OK
American Pride SeaFoods NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
New Bedford, MA
Agora Foods NO BID NO BID 0.3440 2.1000 au
Dawsonville, GA 25.80 21.10
Beaver Valley Baking, Inc NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Aliguippa, PA
Cargill Kitchen Solutions NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Monticello, MN
Don Lee Farms NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Inglewood, CA
ES Foods NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Woodbury, NY
Global Foods NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Las Vegas, NV
Hadley Farms, Inc. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Smithsburg, MD
JTM Provisions Co NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Harrison, OH
Jennie O Turkey Store NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Willmar, MN
Kelley Foods 0.3402 3.1330 0.4166 2.5250
Elba, AL 21.77 31.33 33.33 50.49
Lings NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
South El Monte, CA
MCI Foods, Inc NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Santa Fe Springs, CA
Pilgrim's Pride Co. 0.3543 2.4500 0.4400 1.6820
Tucker, GA 21.26 73.50 35.20 50.47
ProView Foods LLC 0.3047 NO BID 0.3688 2.5000
Gainesville, GA 19.50 29.50 50.00
Right Start Foods NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Hauppauge, NY
Super Bakery NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Cleveland, OH
Sysco Gulf Coast 0.3755 2.9100 NO BID NO BID
Geneva, AL 37.55 29.10
Tasty Brands NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Hicksville, NY
US Foods-Montgomery 0.3197 2.9260 0.4608 NO BID
Montgomery, AL 20.46 29.26 36.86

Page 12




ITEM Breaded Chicken Smoked BBQ Chicken Wings, Mandarin Orange
Breast Tender Ib | Teriyaki Chicken Hot Chicken
Quantity: 500 cs 100 cs 200 cs 100 cs
0516650 0516830 0516631 0516840
ITEM NUMBER 49 50 51 52

Asian Food Solutions NA 0.4653 NA 2.5087

Oviedo, FL 111.67 106.17

CEM NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Lakeland, FL

JNS Foods, LLC 1.5680 au NO BID NO BID NO BID

Tamarac, FL 15.68

Opportunity Sales, Inc. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Holt, FL

The Fathers Table NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Sanford, FL

US Foods-Lakeland NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Lakeland, FL

AdvancePierre Foods 3.0350 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Cincinnati, OH 30.35

American Foods Group NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Oklahoma City, OK

American Pride SeaFoods NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

New Bedford, MA

Agora Foods NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Dawsonville, GA

Beaver Valley Baking, Inc NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Aliguippa, PA

Cargill Kitchen Solutions NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Monticello, MN

Don Lee Farms NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Inglewood, CA

ES Foods NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Woodbury, NY

Global Foods NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Las Vegas, NV

Hadley Farms, Inc. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Smithsburg, MD

JTM Provisions Co NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Harrison, OH

Jennie O Turkey Store NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Willmar, MN

Kelley Foods 1.5840 NO BID 3.3350 NO BID

Elba, AL 15.84 33.35

Lings NO BID 0.5017 mu NO BID 2.8842 mu

South El Monte, CA 103.86 100.34

MCI Foods, Inc NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Santa Fe Springs, CA

Pilgrim's Pride Co. 1.3800 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Tucker, GA 27.60

ProView Foods LLC 1.3900 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Gainesville, GA 13.90

Right Start Foods NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Hauppauge, NY

Super Bakery NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Cleveland, OH

Sysco Gulf Coast Not enough u NO BID 3.7250 NO BID

Geneva, AL info to eval 37.25

Tasty Brands NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Hicksville, NY

US Foods-Montgomery 2.2620 NO BID 3.3060 NO BID

Montgomery, AL 22.62 33.06

w=with commaodity
c=commercial price
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ITEM Chicken Popcorn Popcorn Chicken Grilled Chicken
Tenders b Chicken Ib Spicy Ib | Fajita Meat Ib
Quantity: 100 cs 100 cs 100 cs 100 cs
0516860 0516870 0516880 0516890
ITEM NUMBER 53 54 55 56

Asian Food Solutions NO BID NO BID NO BID 1.9350 au

Oviedo, FL 77.40

CEM NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Lakeland, FL

JNS Foods, LLC 2.3450 au 1.8180 au NO BID 2.6780 au

Tamarac, FL 23.45 18.18 26.78

Opportunity Sales, Inc. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Holt, FL

The Fathers Table NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Sanford, FL

US Foods-Lakeland NO BID 1.8480 mu 1.6300 mu 3.0850 mu

Lakeland, FL 55.45 48.98 123.40

AdvancePierre Foods NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Cincinnati, OH

American Foods Group NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Oklahoma City, OK

American Pride SeaFoods NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

New Bedford, MA

Agora Foods NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Dawsonville, GA

Beaver Valley Baking, Inc NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Aliguippa, PA

Cargill Kitchen Solutions NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Monticello, MN

Don Lee Farms NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Inglewood, CA

ES Foods NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Woodbury, NY

Global Foods NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Las Vegas, NV

Hadley Farms, Inc. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Smithsburg, MD

JTM Provisions Co NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Harrison, OH

Jennie O Turkey Store NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Willmar, MN

Kelley Foods NO BID 1.9870 1.8230 3.1220

Elba, AL 59.61 52.68 31.22

Lings NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

South El Monte, CA

MCI Foods, Inc NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Santa Fe Springs, CA

Pilgrim's Pride Co. 1.6490 1.8095 NO BID 2.4500

Tucker, GA 49.47 36.19 73.50

Pilgrim's Pride Co.-alt NA 0.4020 NA NA

Tucker, GA 41.39

ProView Foods LLC NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Gainesville, GA

Right Start Foods NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Hauppauge, NY

Super Bakery NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Cleveland, OH

Sysco Gulf Coast NO BID 1.8784 1.7094 2.4917

Geneva, AL 56.35 49.40 74.75

Tasty Brands NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Hicksville, NY

US Foods-Montgomery NO BID 1.9667 1.7583 2.5153

Montgomery, AL 59.00 52.75 75.46

Not Awarded
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ITEM Breaded Chicken | Breaded Chicken Frozen Popcorn Cod Nuggets,
Patty ea | Patty, Spicy ea Shrimp Ib | Oven Style por
Quantity: 100 cs 100 cs 100 cs 2,000 cs
0516900 0516910 0515020 0515070
ITEM NUMBER 57 58 59 60

Asian Food Solutions NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Oviedo, FL

CEM NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Lakeland, FL

JNS Foods, LLC 0.4005 au NO BID NO BID NO BID

Tamarac, FL 16.02

Opportunity Sales, Inc. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Holt, FL

The Fathers Table NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Sanford, FL

US Foods-Lakeland 0.4873 mu 0.3739 mu 2.5500 mu NO BID

Lakeland, FL 51.17 56.09 25.50

AdvancePierre Foods NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Cincinnati, OH

American Foods Group NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Oklahoma City, OK

American Pride SeaFoods NO BID NO BID NO BID 0.5906 mu

New Bedford, MA 18.90

Agora Foods NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Dawsonville, GA

Beaver Valley Baking, Inc NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Aliguippa, PA

Cargill Kitchen Solutions NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Monticello, MN

Don Lee Farms NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Inglewood, CA

ES Foods NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Woodbury, NY

Global Foods NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Las Vegas, NV

Hadley Farms, Inc. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Smithsburg, MD

JTM Provisions Co NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Harrison, OH

Jennie O Turkey Store NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Willmar, MN

Kelley Foods 0.2734 0.2904 NO BID 0.6548

Elba, AL 14.49 15.39 26.19

Lings NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

South El Monte, CA

MCI Foods, Inc NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Santa Fe Springs, CA

Pilgrim's Pride Co. 0.3280 0.3197 NO BID NO BID

Tucker, GA 47.27 49.87

Pilgrim's Pride Co.- alt 0.3150 NA NA NA

Tucker, GA 49.07

ProView Foods LLC NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Gainesville, GA

Right Start Foods NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Hauppauge, NY

Super Bakery NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Cleveland, OH

Sysco Gulf Coast 0.5038 0.3750 3.2000 NO BID

Geneva, AL 52.40 56.25 32.00

Tasty Brands NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Hicksville, NY

US Foods-Montgomery 0.5186 0.3977 NO BID 0.6615

Montgomery, AL 54.45 59.65 26.46
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ITEM Corn Dog Frankfurters, Frankfurters, Frankfurters,
ea Blend Beef Turkey
Quantity: 800 cs 2,100 cs 2,100 cs 2,100 cs
0516052 0516070 0516070 0516070
ITEM NUMBER 61 62 63 64

Asian Food Solutions NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Oviedo, FL

CEM NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Lakeland, FL

JNS Foods, LLC NO BID NO BID NO BID 0.1035

Tamarac, FL 16.56

Opportunity Sales, Inc. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Holt, FL

The Fathers Table NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Sanford, FL

US Foods-Lakeland 0.3010 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Lakeland, FL 21.67

AdvancePierre Foods NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Cincinnati, OH

American Foods Group NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Oklahoma City, OK

American Pride SeaFoods NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

New Bedford, MA

Agora Foods NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Dawsonville, GA

Beaver Valley Baking, Inc NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Aliguippa, PA

Cargill Kitchen Solutions NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Monticello, MN

Don Lee Farms 0.2910 mu NO BID NO BID NO BID

Inglewood, CA 10.48

ES Foods NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Woodbury, NY

Global Foods NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Las Vegas, NV

Hadley Farms, Inc. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Smithsburg, MD

JTM Provisions Co NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Harrison, OH

Jennie O Turkey Store NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Willmar, MN

Kelley Foods 0.3050 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Elba, AL 21.97

Lings NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

South El Monte, CA

MCI Foods, Inc NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Santa Fe Springs, CA

Pilgrim's Pride Co. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Tucker, GA

ProView Foods LLC NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Gainesville, GA

Right Start Foods NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Hauppauge, NY

Super Bakery NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Cleveland, OH

Sysco Gulf Coast 0.3118 0.1844 NO BID 0.1172

Geneva, AL 22.45 14.75 18.75

Tasty Brands NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Hicksville, NY

US Foods-Montgomery 0.3139 0.1860 0.4180 0.1204

Montgomery, AL 22.60 14.88 33.44 19.26

62 - 64 Awarded as a Lot
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ITEM Egg, Cheese Pepperoni Ham & Cheese Stuffed
Burrito Pocket Sdwh Pocket Sdwh Sandwich
Quantity: 300 cs 100 cs 75 cs 75 cs
0516801 0516810
ITEM NUMBER 65 66 67 68
Asian Food Solutions NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Oviedo, FL
CEM NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Lakeland, FL
JNS Foods, LLC NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Tamarac, FL
Opportunity Sales, Inc. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Holt, FL
The Fathers Table NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Sanford, FL
US Foods-Lakeland NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Lakeland, FL
AdvancePierre Foods NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Cincinnati, OH
American Foods Group NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Oklahoma City, OK
American Pride SeaFoods NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
New Bedford, MA
Agora Foods NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Dawsonville, GA
Beaver Valley Baking, Inc NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Aliguippa, PA
Cargill Kitchen Solutions NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Monticello, MN
Don Lee Farms NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Inglewood, CA
ES Foods NO BID NO BID NO BID 0.5516 m
Woodbury, NY 52.95
Global Foods 0.3250 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Las Vegas, NV 31.20
Hadley Farms, Inc. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Smithsburg, MD
JTM Provisions Co NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Harrison, OH
Jennie O Turkey Store NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Willmar, MN
Kelley Foods NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Elba, AL
Lings NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
South El Monte, CA
MCI Foods, Inc 0.3993 aY NO BID NO BID NO BID
Santa Fe Springs, CA 38.34 mu
Pilgrim's Pride Co. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Tucker, GA
ProView Foods LLC NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Gainesville, GA
Right Start Foods NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Hauppauge, NY
Super Bakery NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Cleveland, OH
Sysco Gulf Coast NO BID 0.5615 0.5813 NO BID
Geneva, AL 26.95 13.95
Tasty Brands NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Hicksville, NY
US Foods-Montgomery NO BID 0.6783 0.6608 NO BID
Montgomery, AL 32.56 15.86
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ITEM Grape PB&J Strawberry PB&J Breakfast Meal Breakfast Meal
Crustless ea Crustless ea w/milk Thaw & Serve
Quantity: 100 cs 50 cs 100 cs 100 cs
0517460 0517480
ITEM NUMBER 69 70 71 72
Asian Food Solutions NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Oviedo, FL
CEM NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Lakeland, FL
JNS Foods, LLC NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Tamarac, FL
Opportunity Sales, Inc. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Holt, FL
The Fathers Table NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Sanford, FL
US Foods-Lakeland 0.8140 0.8199 NO BID NO BID
Lakeland, FL 58.61 59.11
US Foods-Lakeland-Bid 2 0.7936 NA NA NA
Lakeland, FL 57.14
AdvancePierre Foods NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Cincinnati, OH
American Foods Group NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Oklahoma City, OK
American Pride SeaFoods NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
New Bedford, MA
Agora Foods NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Dawsonville, GA
Beaver Valley Baking, Inc NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Aliguippa, PA
Cargill Kitchen Solutions NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Monticello, MN
Don Lee Farms NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Inglewood, CA
ES Foods NO BID NO BID 1.2000 m 0.8400 m
Woodbury, NY 36.00 40.32
Global Foods NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Las Vegas, NV
Hadley Farms, Inc. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Smithsburg, MD
JTM Provisions Co NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Harrison, OH
Jennie O Turkey Store NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Willmar, MN
Kelley Foods NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Elba, AL
Lings NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
South El Monte, CA
MCI Foods, Inc NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Santa Fe Springs, CA
Pilgrim's Pride Co. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Tucker, GA
ProView Foods LLC NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Gainesville, GA
Right Start Foods NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Hauppauge, NY
Super Bakery NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Cleveland, OH
Sysco Gulf Coast NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Geneva, AL
Tasty Brands NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Hicksville, NY
US Foods-Montgomery 0.8250 0.8250 NO BID NO BID
Montgomery, AL 59.40 59.40
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ITEM Lunch Meal, Chili Fiesta
Thaw & serve Stix ea
Quantity: 100 cs 2,000 cs
0516510
ITEM NUMBER 73 74

Asian Food Solutions NO BID NO BID

Oviedo, FL

CEM NO BID NO BID

Lakeland, FL

JNS Foods, LLC NO BID NO BID

Tamarac, FL

Opportunity Sales, Inc. NO BID 0.3963

Holt, FL 25.36

The Fathers Table NO BID NO BID

Sanford, FL

US Foods-Lakeland NO BID 0.3961

Lakeland, FL 25.35

AdvancePierre Foods NO BID NO BID

Cincinnati, OH

American Foods Group NO BID NO BID

Oklahoma City, OK

American Pride SeaFoods NO BID NO BID

New Bedford, MA

Agora Foods NO BID NO BID

Dawsonville, GA

Beaver Valley Baking, Inc NO BID NO BID

Aliguippa, PA

Cargill Kitchen Solutions NO BID NO BID

Monticello, MN

Don Lee Farms NO BID NO BID

Inglewood, CA

ES Foods 2.0000 m NO BID

Woodbury, NY 60.00

ES Foods - Bid 2 1.9000 m NA

Woodbury, NY 57.00

Global Foods NO BID NO BID

Las Vegas, NV

Hadley Farms, Inc. NO BID NO BID

Smithsburg, MD

JTM Provisions Co NO BID NO BID

Harrison, OH

Jennie O Turkey Store NO BID NO BID

Willmar, MN

Kelley Foods NO BID 0.4067

Elba, AL 26.03

Lings NO BID NO BID

South El Monte, CA

MCI Foods, Inc NO BID NO BID

Santa Fe Springs, CA

Pilgrim's Pride Co. NO BID NO BID

Tucker, GA

ProView Foods LLC NO BID NO BID

Gainesville, GA

Right Start Foods NO BID NO BID

Hauppauge, NY

Super Bakery NO BID NO BID

Cleveland, OH

Sysco Gulf Coast NO BID NO BID

Geneva, AL

Tasty Brands NO BID NO BID

Hicksville, NY

US Foods-Montgomery NO BID NO BID

Montgomery, AL
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a = Alternate Product Bid

m = Minimum Bid by Vendor

au = Alternate product bid. Product not approved in taste test or no sample was sent by bidder.
Y = Product was approved in Taste Test

m = Bidder bid minimum ship quantities

mu = Minimum ship quantity bid is not acceptable for that item

p = Pack size unacceptable

BID TABULATION, RECOMMENDATIONS, AND PROTEST

Bid tabulations with award recommendations are posted for 72 hours in the Purchasing
Department Office and are also posted to the School District's website address at:
http://old.escambia.k12.fl.us/adminoff/finance/purchasing/current_bid_activity.html

Failure to file a protest within the time prescribed in

Section 120.57(3) Florida Statutes, and School Board Rules shall constitute a waiver of proceedings.
Bid tabulations or recommendations will be distributed solely through the Purchasing

website address. Notices will not be automatically mailed.

| hereby certify that the prices and bidders reflected herein are valid, and have been received
in compliance to Escambia County School Board Rules and Florida Law.

John Dombroskie, Director
Purchasing Department
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