&3 THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY
PURCHASING & BUSINESS SERVICES DEPARTMENT

432 1?

BID AWARD NOTICE

DATE: BID TITLE & REFERENCE:
June 7, 2012 Bid Award: Produce, RFP #123403

DESCRIPTION OF PURCHASE:

An annual agreement to provide delivery of fresh produce to all school cafeterias in the District. All
items are awarded to all three (3) vendors. The purpose of this bid was to develop a list of approved
produce vendors and to identify the specific products that may be purchased. This bid will be used by
cafeteria managers to provide fresh produce for school cafeteria meals. Each vendor will be assigned
schools by the Food Services Department at the start of the school year. Bid awarded to more than
one vendor to provide better service and flexibility in product quality to the District’'s cafeterias. The
Evaluation Committee reviewed a sampling of all vendor’s prices and invoices and were satisfied that
vendor prices are comparable enough to warrant award to all three (3) vendors.

The prices on the tabulation reflect the vendor’s distribution fee per product. On a bi-weekly basis,
each vendor will provide the District with their product cost for the upcoming two (2) week period.
The cost of the product will be vendor’s actual cost, plus the distribution fee.

Effective Dates: July 1, 2012 through June 30, 2013 (with four (4) one-year renewal options).

REQUESTED BY:

Food Services

SUPPLIER NAME:

Big Charlie’s Produce, Mobile, AL
Farmer Fresh Produce, Mobile, AL
Gulf Coast Produce, Biloxi, MS

AMOUNT OF PURCHASE: FUNDING SOURCE:

$458,000.00 Est. / Yr. Food Services Fund (4110)

METHOD OF PROCUREMENT:

ECSD Bid Responses Received: 3

POSTING DATE & TIME:

June 7, 2012, 11:50 am Central Time

9500 PUR101 (11/10) Retention — 5 Years



THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY

PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

75 NORTH PACE BOULEVARD

PENSACOLA, FLORIDA 32505
BID TABULATION

DATE: 5/24/2012
Awarded Items are highlighted
BID NBR: 123403
BID TITLE: Produce
Big Charlie's Farmer Fresh Gulf Coast
Distribution Fee for Distribution Fee for Distribution Fee for
Minimum Case Minimum Case Minimum Case
ltem| Qty. |[Unit Description Item No. |Pack Size [Pack Size ||Pack Size [Pack Size | [Pack Size |Pack Size
1] 3,500 [ea |Apple, Golden 0550010 UM 3.50 2.50 4.00 UM 4.00
2| 3,500 |ea |Apple, Red 0550010 UM 3.50 2.50 4.00 UM 4.00
3] 3,000 |ea [Apple, Granny Smith 0550010 UM 3.50 2.50 4.00 UM 4.00
4] 7,700 |cs [Bananas 0550150 0.90 3.00 2.50 4.00 1.46 3.00
5[ 2,000 |pt [Blueberries 0550160 0.75 3.50 1.75 3.50 0.58 3.00
6/ 4,000 |Ib |[Broccoli Florets 0560010 1.00 3.00 1.75 4.00 1.16 3.00
7 725 |Ib  |Cabbage, Green 0560020 0.90 2.50 2.50 4.00 0.47 3.00
8 725 |lb  |Cabbage, Red 0560030 1.00 3.00 1.75 4.00 0.47 3.00
9] 7,100 |[ea |[Cantaloupe 0550200 0.70 3.00 1.75 3.50 0.58 3.00
10) 1,100 |Ib |Carrots, Jumbo 0560110 0.60 2.75 1.75 3.50 0.50 3.00
11) 2,000 |[Ib |Carrots, Baby UM 4.00 2.00 3.50 UM 3.00
12| 2,000 [Ib |Carrot, Sticks 0560110 1.00 2.75 2.00 3.00 1.75 3.00
13| 1,050 |Ib |Cauliflower, Florets 0560120 1.00 3.00 2.00 3.00 1.75 3.00
14| 1,090 [Ib [Celery 0560200 0.75 2.50 2.25 4.50 0.58 3.00
15 250 |Ib  |Celery, Chopped 0560590 1.00 3.00 1.75 3.00 UM 1.75
16| 1,775 [Ib |Celery, Sticks 0560200 1.00 3.00 2.00 3.50 1.75 3.00
17 100 [Ib  |Cherries No Bid|No Bid 2.50 3.50 UM 4.00
18 100 |Ib  |Chives 0560520 1.50 3.00 2.50 4.50 UM 3.00
19 50 [Ib_ [Cilantro 0560570 1.00 3.00 2.00 2.00 UM 0.58
20 400 |lb  [Collard Greens 1.50 3.00 1.75 3.00 UM 3.00
21) 1,100 {Ib [Coleslaw Mix 0560020 1.00 2.75 1.75 3.00 1.75 3.00
22| 4,750 [Ib  [Cucumbers 0560300 0.90 2.75 1.75 4.00 0.47 3.00
23 50 Jjar [Garlic 0560620 1.50 2.75 1.75 3.50 No Bid|No Bid
24 750 |Ib  |Grapes, Red 0550250 0.90 2.75 2.00 3.50 0.78 3.00
25| 1,200 |[Ib [Grapes, Green 0550250 0.90 2.75 2.00 3.50 0.78 3.00
26 500 |Ib |Green Beans 3.00 3.00 2.00 3.50 No Bid|No Bid
27 500 |ea |[Honeydew Melon 0550200 0.90 3.00 1.75 3.50 1.17 3.00
28 500 [Ib  |Kiwi Fruit 0550100 1.00 2.50 2.50 3.50 UM 3.00
29| 1,500 [ea [Lemons 0550300 1.10 2.75 1.50 3.50 0.54 3.00
30] 4,300 [Ib [Lettuce, Romaine 0560400 1.20 2.75 2.25 3.50 0.90 3.00




Big Charlie's Farmer Fresh Gulf Coast
Distribution Fee for Distribution Fee for Distribution Fee for
Minimum Case Minimum Case Minimum Case
ltem| Qty. |Unit Description Item No. |Pack Size [Pack Size ||Pack Size [Pack Size | [Pack Size |Pack Size

31| 5,287 |Ib [Lettuce, Shred or Chop |0560400 1.00 2.75 1.75 3.00 1.75 3.00
32 2,500 |Ib [Lettuce, Romaine Mix 0560410 1.00 2.75 1.75 3.00 1.75 3.00
33 50 |ea [Mango 0.50 3.00 0.75 3.00 No Bid|No Bid

34 450 |lb  [Mushrooms 0560440 0.60 2.75 1.75 3.00 UM 3.00
35 600 [Ib |Onions, Green 0560550 1.25 2.75 1.75 3.00 1.75 3.00
36 925 [Ib _ |Onions, Red 0560550 0.90 3.00 2.00 3.00 0.88 4.00
37 1,850 |Ib [Onions, Yellow 0560550 0.75 3.00 1.75 3.50 0.44 4.00
38 100 [Ib  |Onions, Yellow, Diced 0560560 1.00 2.75 1.75 3.00 1.75 3.00
39 100 |Ib  |Onions, Yellow, Sliced 0560520 1.00 2.75 2.00 3.00 1.75 3.00
40| 1,650 [ea [Oranges 0550400 UM 3.00 1.75 3.50 UM 3.00
41| 1,650 |ea |Pears 0550460 UM 3.00 2.00 3.50 UM 3.00
42| 1,150 |ea |Peppers, Red 0560640 1.20 3.00 2.00 3.50 0.88 3.00
43| 2,575 [ea [Peppers, Green 0560640 1.20 3.00 1.75 3.50 0.88 3.00
44 700 [Ib |Peppers, Chopped 050590 1.00 2.75 2.25 3.50 1.75 3.00
45| 1,650 |cs [Plums 0550470 UM 3.00 2.25 3.50 UM 3.00
46 50 |ea |Pineapple 1.00 3.00 1.50 3.50 UM 3.00
47 950 |Ib |Potatoes, New Red 0560700 UM 3.00 2.00 4.00 UM 4.00
48| 1,000 |Ib [Potatoes, Russet 0560700 UM 3.00 1.75 3.50 UM 4.00
49 2,075 |Ib [Potatoes, Sweet 0560460 UM 2.75 1.75 3.00 UM 4.00
50 500 |Ib |Potatoes, Sweet, Sticks 1.00 2.75 2.50 4.00 No Bid|No Bid

51) 1,050 [oz [Radishes, Cello 0560800 0.90 2.50 0.50 3.00 0.30 3.00
52 25 |lb  |Snow Peas 2.00 4.00 0.75 3.50 No Bid|No Bid

53] 32,050 [Ib [Spinach, Cello 0560430 1.25 3.00 0.75 3.50 1.75 3.00
54 800 [Ib |Spring Mix 0560400 UM 2.50 3.00 3.00 UM 3.00
55| 1,000 {Ib [Squash, Yellow 0560850 0.90 3.00 2.00 3.00 1.00 3.00
56 2,050 |pt |Strawberries 0550500 1.00 2.75 0.75 3.00 0.90 3.00
57| 4,500 [Ib [Tomatoes 0560900 0.90 3.00 2.00 3.50 0.90 3.00
58 1,000 |Ib |[Tomatoes, Cherry 0560900 0.75 3.00 0.75 3.00 0.60 3.00
59 1,600 |lb |Tomatoes, Grape 0560900 0.75 3.00 0.75 3.00 0.60 3.00
60 41 |lb  [Tomatoes, Wedge Cut 0560710 2.75 2.75 2.75 5.00 No Bid|No Bid

61 4,650 |lea [Watermelon, Seedless 0550550 1.50 1.50 2.50 2.50 UM 3.00

BID TABULATION, RECOMMENDATIONS, AND PROTEST

Bid tabulations with award recommendations are posted for 72 hours in the Purchasing
Department Office and are also posted to the School District's website address at:
http://old.escambia.k12.fl.us/adminoff/finance/purchasing/current_bid_activity.html

Failure to file a protest within the time prescribed in

Section 120.57(3) Florida Statutes, and School Board Rules shall constitute a waiver of proceedings.
Bid tabulations or recommendations will be distributed solely through the Purchasing

website address. Notices will not be automatically mailed.

| hereby certify that the prices and bidders reflected herein are valid, and have been received

in compliance to Escambia County School Board Rules and Florida Law.

John Dombroskie, Director
Purchasing Department




