
 

 
 
 
DATE: BID TITLE & REFERENCE: 
December 1, 2011        Frozen Pizza & Cheese, RFP #121303 
 
DESCRIPTION OF PURCHASE: 

 
A six (6) month pricing agreement to provide cheese products and frozen pizza as stocked and 
distributed by the Central Warehouse for school cafeterias throughout the District.  Thirteen (13) 
items bid; twelve (12) items awarded.  Items will be purchased as needed to meet breakfast and 
lunch menu requirements.  Bid award(s) to the lowest bidder(s) meeting specifications.  
 
Effective Dates:  January 1, 2012 through June 30, 2012. 
 
 
 
 
 

  
REQUESTED BY: 

 
Food Services 
 
 

    
SUPPLIER NAME:        ITEMS AWARDED:   ESTIMATED EXPENDITURE: 
  

ConAgra Foods, Troy, OH        2        $    52,700.00 
Schwan’s Food Service, Inc., Marshall, MN      4   46,900.00 
Sysco Gulf Coast, Geneva, AL        1                5,000.00 
US Foodservice-Montgomery, Montgomery, AL      5            116,200.00 

 
 
   
AMOUNT OF PURCHASE: FUNDING SOURCE: 

 
$220,800.00 Est. / 6 Mos.   Food Services Fund (4110) 
     

  
METHOD OF PROCUREMENT: 

 
ECSD Bid      Responses Received:  6 
   

  
DATE AND TIME POSTED: 

 
December 1, 2011, 1:25PM, CST 

 
 
9500PUR101 (11/10) Retention - 5 Years 

 
THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY 

PURCHASING DEPARTMENT 
75 North Pace Blvd.  

Pensacola, FL  32505 
 

BID AWARD NOTICE 



DATE: November 8, 2011

BID NBR: 121303
BID TITLE:  Cheese & Frozen Pizza

Item Breakfast Turkey Pizza, Cheese
Sausage Pizza Rounded Edge

900 cs 150 cs
0516400

Item Number
ConAgra Portion Size/oz 2.66 oz 4.67 oz
Foods Portions/Case 192 96

Unit Price 0.2021 0.3698
Case Price 38.80 35.50

Kelley Foods Portion Size/oz NO BID NO BID
of Alabama Portions/Case

Unit Price
Case Price

Nardone Bros. Portion Size/oz 2.85 oz 5.0 oz
Baking Co. Portions/Case 80 72

Unit Price 0.2750 0.500
Case Price 22.00 36.00

Schwan's Food Portion Size/oz 3.20 oz 4.61 oz
Service, Inc. Portions/Case 128 80

Unit Price 0.2195 0.3498
Case Price 28.09 27.98

Sysco Gulf Portion Size/oz NO BID NO BID
Coast Portions/Case

Unit Price
Case Price

US Foods Portion Size/oz NO BID NO BID
Montgomery Portions/Case

Unit Price
Case Price

THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

75 NORTH PACE BOULEVARD
PENSACOLA, FLORIDA 32505

BID TABULATION

Awarded Items are highlighted
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Item Stuffed Crust Cheese Filled
Wedge Pepperoni Pizza Sticks

100 cs 300 cs
0516440 0516640

Item Number
ConAgra Portion Size/oz 5.75 oz 1.93 oz
Foods Portions/Case 72 192

Unit Price 0.4931 0.1924
Case Price 35.50 36.95 a

Kelley Foods Portion Size/oz NO BID NO BID
of Alabama Portions/Case

Unit Price
Case Price

Nardone Bros. Portion Size/oz 5.65 oz 3.0 oz
Baking Co. Portions/Case 72 72

Unit Price 0.541 0.375
Case Price 39.00 27.00

Schwan's Food Portion Size/oz 5.98 oz 2.10 oz
Service, Inc. Portions/Case 72 200

Unit Price 0.4639 0.1899
Case Price 33.40 37.98

Sysco Gulf Portion Size/oz NO BID NO BID
Coast Portions/Case

Unit Price
Case Price

US Foods Portion Size/oz NO BID NO BID
Montgomery Portions/Case

Unit Price
Case Price
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Item Pizza, Pepperoni
Pepperoni

900 cs 150 cs
0516672 0516640

Item Number
ConAgra Portion Size/oz 4.67 oz NO BID
Foods Portions/Case 96

Unit Price 0.3745
Case Price 35.95

Kelley Foods Portion Size/oz NO BID 6.0 oz
of Alabama Portions/Case 48

Unit Price 0.7270
Case Price 34.90

Nardone Bros. Portion Size/oz 5.0 oz NO BID
Baking Co. Portions/Case 72

Unit Price 0.5410
Case Price 39.00

Schwan's Food Portion Size/oz 4.70 oz NO BID
Service, Inc. Portions/Case 80

Unit Price 0.3738
Case Price 29.90

Sysco Gulf Portion Size/oz NO BID 6.0 oz
Coast Portions/Case 48

Unit Price 0.6979
Case Price 33.50

US Foods Portion Size/oz NO BID NO BID
Montgomery Portions/Case

Unit Price
Case Price

Round Edge, Wedge
Pizza Puff, 
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Item Am. Cheese, Yellow,
Round Edge Sliced, Red. Fat

500 cs 300 cs
0516790 0516350

Item Number
ConAgra Portion Size/oz 4.74 oz NO BID
Foods Portions/Case 96

Unit Price 0.3818
Case Price 35.65

Kelley Foods Portion Size/oz NO BID NO BID
of Alabama Portions/Case

Unit Price
Case Price

Nardone Bros. Portion Size/oz NO BID NO BID
Baking Co. Portions/Case

Unit Price
Case Price

Schwan's Food Portion Size/oz NO BID NO BID
Service, Inc. Portions/Case

Unit Price
Case Price

Sysco Gulf Portion Size/oz NO BID 30 lbs
Coast Portions/Case

Unit Price 2.3383 lb
Case Price 70.15

US Foods Portion Size/oz NO BID 30 lbs
Montgomery Portions/Case

Unit Price 2.318 lb
Case Price 69.54

8

Pizza, Turkey Saus.
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Item Cheese, Cheddar,
Shredded

900 cs 400 cs
0516341 0516360

Item Number
ConAgra Portion Size/oz NO BID NO BID
Foods Portions/Case

Unit Price
Case Price

Kelley Foods Portion Size/oz NO BID NO BID
of Alabama Portions/Case

Unit Price
Case Price

Nardone Bros. Portion Size/oz NO BID NO BID
Baking Co. Portions/Case

Unit Price
Case Price

Schwan's Food Portion Size/oz NO BID  NO BID
Service, Inc. Portions/Case

Unit Price
Case Price

Sysco Gulf Portion Size/oz 30 lbs 20 lbs
Coast Portions/Case

Unit Price 2.3383 lb 2.6075 lb
Case Price 70.15 52.15

US Foods Portion Size/oz 30 lbs 20 lbs
Montgomery Portions/Case

Unit Price 2.3243 lb 2.3243 lb
Case Price 69.73 51.39

9 10

Cheese, American
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Item Cheese, Mozzerella,
Shredded

3000 lb 100 cs
0516361 0516410

Item Number
ConAgra Portion Size/oz NO BID NO BID
Foods Portions/Case

Unit Price
Case Price

Kelley Foods Portion Size/oz NO BID NO BID
of Alabama Portions/Case

Unit Price
Case Price

Nardone Bros. Portion Size/oz NO BID NO BID
Baking Co. Portions/Case

Unit Price
Case Price

Schwan's Food Portion Size/oz NO BID NO BID
Service, Inc. Portions/Case

Unit Price
Case Price

Sysco Gulf Portion Size/oz NO BID 20 lbs
Coast Portions/Case

Unit Price 2.585 lb
Case Price 51.70

US Foods Portion Size/oz NO BID 20 lbs
Montgomery Portions/Case

Unit Price 2.5465 lb
Case Price 50.93

Not Awarded

Mozzarella Cheese
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Item
Low Fat Mozz.

200 cs
0517030

Item Number
ConAgra Portion Size/oz NO BID
Foods Portions/Case

Unit Price
Case Price

Kelley Foods Portion Size/oz NO BID
of Alabama Portions/Case

Unit Price
Case Price

Nardone Bros. Portion Size/oz NO BID
Baking Co. Portions/Case

Unit Price
Case Price

Schwan's Food Portion Size/oz NO BID
Service, Inc. Portions/Case

Unit Price
Case Price

Sysco Gulf Portion Size/oz 1.0 oz
Coast Portions/Case 168

Unit Price 0.2098
Case Price 35.25

US Foods Portion Size/oz 1.0 oz
Montgomery Portions/Case 168

Unit Price 0.2059
Case Price 34.59

13

String Cheese,
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BID TABULATION, RECOMMENDATIONS, AND PROTEST
Bid tabulations with award recommendations are posted for 72 hours in the 
Purchasing Department Office and are also posted to the School District's website 
address at: http://old.escambia.k12.fl.us/adminoff/finance/purchasing/ 

Failure to file a protest within the time prescribed in Section 120.57(3) Florida 
Statutes, and School Board Rules shall constitute a waiver of proceedings.
Bid tabulations or recommendations will be distributed solely through the Purchasing 
website address.  Notices will not be automatically mailed.

I hereby certify that the prices and bidders reflected herin are valid, and have been 
received in compliance to Escambia County School Board Rules and Florida Law.

John Dombroskie, Director
Purchasing Department
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