
 

 
 
DATE:      BID TITLE & REFERENCE: 
     October 6, 2011    Paper Products & Cleaning Supplies for School  
      Cafeterias, RFP #120503 
           
DESCRIPTION OF PURCHASE: 

 
An annual pricing agreement to provide paper products and cleaning supplies as stocked and 
distributed by the Central Warehouse for school cafeterias throughout the District.  Seventy-four (74) 
items bid and awarded.  Items will be purchased as needed to meet cafeteria usage requirements.  
Bid award(s) to the lowest bidder(s) meeting specifications.   
 
Effective Dates:  November 1, 2011 through October 31, 2012. 
 
 
 
 

 
REQUESTED BY: 
 

     Food Services 
 

            
SUPPLIER NAME:            ITEMS AWARDED: ESTIMATED EXPENDITURE: 
 

Calico Industries, Inc., Annapolis Junction, MD  13        $    31,300.00 
Crest Supply, Crestview, FL      3   26,500.00 
Merchants Paper Company, Pensacola, FL  13   35,900.00 
PR Chemical & Paper, Pensacola, FL     1     2,500.00 
Supreme Paper Supplies, Pensacola, FL  42            473,800.00 
Wallace Packaging, Tucson, AZ      2   18,000.00 
 
  

  
AMOUNT OF PURCHASE:     FUNDING SOURCE: 

 
$588,000 Est. / Yr.           Food Services Fund (4110) 
 

 
METHOD OF PROCUREMENT: 

 
ECSD Bid                                    Responses Received:  14    Bids Rejected:  1    
 

 
POSTING DATE & TIME: 
      
     October 6, 2011, 1:30 pm Central Time 
 
 
9500 PUR100 (11/10) Retention – 5 Years 

 
 

THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY 
PURCHASING & BUSINESS SERVICES DEPARTMENT 

 
 

BID AWARD NOTICE 



DATE: 9-13-2011

BID NBR: 120503
BID TITLE:  Paper Products & Cleaning Supplies for School Cafeterias

ITEM
ea Souffle (4oz) (6oz) ea (10oz) ea

Quantity: 1,800 cs 100 cs 50 cs 50 cs
0702090 0702140 0145147 0145150

ITEM NUMBER 1 2 3 4

Crest Supply NO BID NO BID 0.0050 a 0.0067 a
Crestview, FL 12.45 y 16.74 y

Merchants Paper Co. NO BID NO BID 0.01158 0.0069
Pensacola, FL 11.58 17.19

PR Chemical & Paper 0.0069 a NO BID NO BID NO BID
Pensacola, FL 41.22 u

Pyramid School Products NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Tampa, FL 

Supreme Paper Supplies 0.0053 0.0116 0.0116 0.0172
Pensacola, FL 31.59 57.99 11.55 17.17

All American Poly NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Piscataway, NJ 

Calico Industries, Inc NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Annapolis Junction, MD

Central Poly Corp. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Linden, NJ

Dash Medical Gloves NO BID NO BID  NO BID  NO BID
Franklin, WI

Interboro Packaging NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Montgomery, NY
Oliver Packaging NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Walker, MI
Quill Corporation NO BID NO BID 0.02116 0.02919
Lincolnshire, IL 21.16 29.19
Wallace Packaging NO BID NO BID  NO BID NO BID
Tucson, AZ

BID TABULATION

Awarded Items are highlighted

THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

75 NORTH PACE BOULEVARD
PENSACOLA, FLORIDA 32505

Napkins Cups, Paper Cups, Hot/Cold Cups, Hot/Cold
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ITEM
(16oz) ea (12oz) ea (1/4lb) ea  (1/2lb) ea

Quantity: 190 pk 300 cs 500 cs 1,000 cs
0145155 0702240 0702450 0702460

ITEM NUMBER 5 6 7 8
Crest Supply NO BID 0.0155 a 0.0128 a 0.0148 a
Crestview, FL 18.98 y 12.77 u 14.84 u
Merchants Paper Co. 0.0590 0.01913 0.0109 a 0.0125 a
Pensacola, FL 2.95 19.13 10.86 n 12.48 n
PR Chemical & Paper NO BID NO BID 0.0121 0.0157
Pensacola, FL 12.11 15.64
Pyramid School Products NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Tampa, FL 
Supreme Paper Supplies 0.0558 0.01910 0.0108 0.0125
Pensacola, FL 2.79 19.10 10.75 12.47
All American Poly NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Piscataway, NJ 
Calico Industries, Inc NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Annapolis Junction, MD
Central Poly Corp. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Linden, NJ
Dash Medical Gloves NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Franklin, WI
Interboro Packaging NO BID NO BID  NO BID NO BID
Montgomery, NY
Oliver Packaging NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Walker, MI
Quill Corporation 0.1240 0.0296 NO BID NO BID
Lincolnshire, IL 6.20 29.56
Wallace Packaging NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Tucson, AZ

Cups, Cold Cups, Cold Trays, Trays,
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ITEM
(1lb) ea Pie ea Salad ea Salad

Quantity: 300 cs 100 cs 150 cs 75 cs
0702470 0702520 0702260 0702261

ITEM NUMBER 9 10 11 12
Crest Supply 0.0172 a 0.0134 a NO BID NO BID
Crestview, FL 17.23 u 13.40 y
Merchants Paper Co. 0.0146 a 0.0136 0.2159 0.1486
Pensacola, FL 14.58 n 13.55 53.97 74.30
PR Chemical & Paper 0.0180 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Pensacola, FL 18.04
Pyramid School Products NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Tampa, FL 
Supreme Paper Supplies 0.0146 0.0131 0.2118 0.1456
Pensacola, FL 14.55 13.10 52.95 72.80
All American Poly NO BID NO BID  NO BID  NO BID
Piscataway, NJ 
Calico Industries, Inc NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Annapolis Junction, MD
Central Poly Corp. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Linden, NJ
Dash Medical Gloves NO BID NO BID  NO BID  NO BID
Franklin, WI
Interboro Packaging NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Montgomery, NY
Oliver Packaging NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Walker, MI
Quill Corporation NO BID 0.0255 NO BID NO BID
Lincolnshire, IL 25.54
Wallace Packaging NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Tucson, AZ

Trays, Plates, Container, Container, 
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ITEM
Black (12oz) ea

Quantity: 200 cs 200 cs 400 cs 400 cs
0700020 0700030 0700060 0700070

ITEM NUMBER 13 14 15 16
Crest Supply NO BID NO BID 0.0394 0.0453
Crestview, FL 39.35 45.26
Merchants Paper Co. 0.0699 0.0622 0.0254 0.0889
Pensacola, FL 34.93 31.12 25.38 88.85
PR Chemical & Paper NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Pensacola, FL
Pyramid School Products NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Tampa, FL 
Supreme Paper Supplies 0.0695 0.0620 0.0024 0.0888
Pensacola, FL 34.75 30.99 25.35 88.82
All American Poly NO BID NO BID NO BID  NO BID
Piscataway, NJ 
Calico Industries, Inc NO BID NO BID NO BID  NO BID
Annapolis Junction, MD
Central Poly Corp. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Linden, NJ
Dash Medical Gloves NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Franklin, WI
Interboro Packaging NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Montgomery, NY
Oliver Packaging NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Walker, MI
Quill Corporation NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Lincolnshire, IL
Wallace Packaging NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Tucson, AZ

15 and 16 awarded as a lot

Bowl (8oz) Bowl (12oz)
Salad Bowl Lid, Salad Bowl, Foam Lid, Foam

(8oz)
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ITEM Salad Bowl Lid, Salad Dipping Cup, Sub Container,
(24oz) ea Bowl (24oz) ea 2 comp ea 8 inches ea

Quantity: 300 cs 300 cs 50 cs 200 cs
0700160 0700170 0700080 0700150

ITEM NUMBER 17 18 19 20
Crest Supply NO BID NO BID NO BID 0.2019
Crestview, FL 50.47
Merchants Paper Co. 0.0987 0.0712 0.0675 0.1445
Pensacola, FL 49.36 35.62 33.73 36.12
PR Chemical & Paper NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Pensacola, FL
Pyramid School Products NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Tampa, FL 
Supreme Paper Supplies 0.0670 0.0730 0.0784 0.0876
Pensacola, FL 33.52 36.49 39.20 21.90
All American Poly NO BID NO BID  NO BID NO BID
Piscataway, NJ 
Calico Industries, Inc NO BID NO BID NO BID 0.1127
Annapolis Junction, MD 28.18
Central Poly Corp. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Linden, NJ
Dash Medical Gloves NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Franklin, WI
Interboro Packaging NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Montgomery, NY
Oliver Packaging NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Walker, MI
Quill Corporation NO BID NO BID NO BID  NO BID
Lincolnshire, IL
Wallace Packaging NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Tucson, AZ

17 & 18 Awarded as a lot
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ITEM
Non-Comp Cookie ea Vinyl Film Zip Top

Quantity: 200 cs 125 cs 800 rl 150 cs
0702551 0702910 0702760 0702820

ITEM NUMBER 21 22 23 24
Crest Supply NO BID NO BID 11.3600 NO BID
Crestview, FL
Merchants Paper Co. 0.0406 0.0071 a 12.4000 a 0.0130
Pensacola, FL 20.30 14.28 u y 13.01
PR Chemical & Paper NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Pensacola, FL
Pyramid School Products NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Tampa, FL 
Supreme Paper Supplies 0.0386 0.0049 10.1000 0.0131
Pensacola, FL 19.30 49.00 13.10
All American Poly NO BID NO BID NO BID 0.0173 a
Piscataway, NJ 17.25 u
Calico Industries, Inc NO BID NO BID 10.8300 0.0118
Annapolis Junction, MD 11.84
Central Poly Corp. NO BID NO BID 18.6600 0.0432
Linden, NJ 43.20
Dash Medical Gloves NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Franklin, WI
Interboro Packaging NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Montgomery, NY
Oliver Packaging NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Walker, MI
Quill Corporation NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Lincolnshire, IL
Wallace Packaging NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Tucson, AZ

Platter,Salad Bags, Plastic, Bags, Plastic
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ITEM
Gallon/zip top ea Quart/zip top ea (1oz) ea (1oz) ea

Quantity: 1,200 pk 1,800 pk 150 cs 300 cs
0145669 0145668 0702110 0702111

ITEM NUMBER 25 26 27 28
Crest Supply NO BID NO BID NO BID 0.0080 a
Crestview, FL 20.12 n
Merchants Paper Co. 0.0346 0.0130 NO BID 0.0085 a
Pensacola, FL 3.457 1.30 21.15 u
PR Chemical & Paper NO BID NO BID 0.0091 NO BID
Pensacola, FL 45.71
Pyramid School Products NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Tampa, FL 
Supreme Paper Supplies 0.0340 0.0186 p 0.0075 0.0075
Pensacola, FL 33.98 u 18.55 u 37.60 37.60
All American Poly 0.0046 a Not enough a NO BID NO BID
Piscataway, NJ 4.60 u info to evaluate u
Calico Industries, Inc 0.0324 0.0119 NO BID NO BID 
Annapolis Junction, MD 1.62 1.19
Central Poly Corp. 0.0467 0.0144 p NO BID NO BID
Linden, NJ 46.66 86.10 u
Dash Medical Gloves NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Franklin, WI
Interboro Packaging NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Montgomery, NY
Oliver Packaging NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Walker, MI
Quill Corporation NO BID NO BID 0.0124 NO BID
Lincolnshire, IL 62.04
Wallace Packaging NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Tucson, AZ

Cups, ColdBags, Plastic Bags, Plastic, Cups, Cold
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ITEM
(2oz) ea Cold (2oz) (4oz) Cold (4oz)

Quantity: 250 cs 100 cs 500 cs 140 cs
0702130 0702190 0702120 0702161

ITEM NUMBER 29 30 31 32
Crest Supply 0.0084 a 0.0073 a 0.0140 a 0.0132 a
Crestview, FL 20.99 y 18.14 y 34.96 y 32.94 y
Merchants Paper Co. 0.0083 a 0.0095 0.0143 0.0132
Pensacola, FL 20.84 u 23.63 35.74 32.96
PR Chemical & Paper 0.0102 1.2000 0.0168 0.0163
Pensacola, FL 25.50 25.00 42.00 40.75
Pyramid School Products NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Tampa, FL 
Supreme Paper Supplies 0.0082 0.0079 0.0133 0.0127
Pensacola, FL 20.60 19.87 33.25 31.79
All American Poly NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Piscataway, NJ 
Calico Industries, Inc 0.0105 0.0136 0.0216 0.0198
Annapolis Junction, MD 26.28 34.08 53.98 49.62
Central Poly Corp. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Linden, NJ
Dash Medical Gloves NO BID NO BID  NO BID  NO BID
Franklin, WI
Interboro Packaging NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Montgomery, NY
Oliver Packaging NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Walker, MI
Quill Corporation NO BID NO BID 0.0248 0.0219
Lincolnshire, IL 62.04 54.74
Wallace Packaging NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Tucson, AZ

29 and 30 awarded as a lot 31 and 32 awarded as a lot

Cups, Cold Lids, for Cups, Cups, Cold Lids, for Cups,
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ITEM
(5.5oz) ea Cold (5oz) ea

Quantity: 350 cs 100 cs 3,200 cs 125 cs
0702151 0702162 0702010 0702020

ITEM NUMBER 33 34 35 36
Crest Supply 0.0157 a 0.0163 a 0.0063 a 0.0063 a
Crestview, FL 39.24 u 40.65 u 6.27 y 6.27 n
Merchants Paper Co. 0.0163 0.0132 0.0075 a 0.0075 a
Pensacola, FL 39.05 32.96 7.50 y 7.50 y
PR Chemical & Paper 0.0219 0.0163 NO BID NO BID
Pensacola, FL 54.65 40.75
Pyramid School Products NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Tampa, FL 
Supreme Paper Supplies 0.0169 0.0127 0.0064 a 0.0064 a
Pensacola, FL 42.36 31.79 6.40 y 6.40 u
All American Poly NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Piscataway, NJ 
Calico Industries, Inc 0.0243 0.0198 0.0067 0.0067 a
Annapolis Junction, MD 60.78 49.62 6.74 6.74 n
Central Poly Corp. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Linden, NJ
Dash Medical Gloves NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Franklin, WI
Interboro Packaging NO BID NO BID NO BID  NO BID
Montgomery, NY
Oliver Packaging NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Walker, MI
Quill Corporation NO BID NO BID 0.0139 0.01386
Lincolnshire, IL 13.86 13.86
Wallace Packaging NO BID NO BID 0.0067 0.0067
Tucson, AZ 6.72 6.72

Cups, Cold Lids, for Cups, Forks Knives

Page 9



ITEM
pk Milkshake ea Milk ea

Quantity: 2,550 cs 3,800 cs 30 cs 300 cs
0702030 0702060 0702350 0702360

ITEM NUMBER 37 38 39 40
Crest Supply 0.0063 a NO BID NO BID NO BID
Crestview, FL 6.27 n
Merchants Paper Co. 0.0075 a 0.6500 a 0.0050 0.0024
Pensacola, FL 7.50 n y 35.73 28.92
PR Chemical & Paper NO BID  0.6600 a 0.0055 a 0.0028
Pensacola, FL 0.69 u 39.85 u 33.05
Pyramid School Products NO BID  0.6900 NO BID NO BID
Tampa, FL 
Supreme Paper Supplies 0.0064 a NO BID 0.0050 0.0024
Pensacola, FL 6.40 u 35.95 29.35
All American Poly NO BID  NO BID NO BID NO BID
Piscataway, NJ 
Calico Industries, Inc 0.0067 0.3800 NO BID 0.0024
Annapolis Junction, MD 6.74 28.88
Central Poly Corp. NO BID  NO BID NO BID  NO BID
Linden, NJ
Dash Medical Gloves NO BID  0.0302 a,m NO BID NO BID
Franklin, WI 3.02 n
Interboro Packaging NO BID  0.4400 a,m NO BID NO BID
Montgomery, NY n
Oliver Packaging NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Walker, MI
Quill Corporation 0.0139 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Lincolnshire, IL 13.86
Wallace Packaging 0.0067 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Tucson, AZ 6.72

Spoons Gloves Straws-wrapped Straws-wrapped
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ITEM
12x20x4 ea 12x20x6 ea 18x26 ea w/hinged lid ea

Quantity: 100 cs 75 cs 300 cs 200 cs
0702480 0702490 0702500 0702380

ITEM NUMBER 41 42 43 44
Crest Supply 0.4460 0.5942 0.2388 0.0429
Crestview, FL 44.60 29.71 23.88 21.44
Merchants Paper Co. 0.1650 0.2463 0.1448 0.0407
Pensacola, FL 33.00 49.25 28.95 20.35
PR Chemical & Paper NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Pensacola, FL
Pyramid School Products NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Tampa, FL 
Supreme Paper Supplies 0.1650 0.2440 0.1232 0.0455
Pensacola, FL 33.00 48.80 24.62 22.75
All American Poly NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Piscataway, NJ 
Calico Industries, Inc 0.3670 0.4592 0.2347 0.0431
Annapolis Junction, MD 36.70 22.96 23.47 21.54
Central Poly Corp. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Linden, NJ
Dash Medical Gloves NO BID NO BID  NO BID  NO BID
Franklin, WI
Interboro Packaging NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Montgomery, NY
Oliver Packaging NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Walker, MI
Quill Corporation NO BID NO BID NO BID 0.1314
Lincolnshire, IL 65.69
Wallace Packaging NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Tucson, AZ

41, 42, & 43 Awarded as a lot

Pan Liners Pan Liners Pan Liners Trays, Hot dog
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ITEM
Non-Comp ea Cold (5oz) ea Cold (10oz) ea Cont (10 oz) ea

Quantity: 10 cs 485 cs 300 cs 225 cs
0150320 0702390 0702420 0702200

ITEM NUMBER 45 46 47 48
Crest Supply NO BID 0.0158 0.0192 NO BID
Crestview, FL 15.78 19.24
Merchants Paper Co. 0.0385 a 0.0146 0.0170 0.0254
Pensacola, FL 19.25 n 14.57 16.97 25.44
PR Chemical & Paper NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Pensacola, FL
Pyramid School Products NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Tampa, FL 
Supreme Paper Supplies 0.0396 0.0132 0.0142 0.0254
Pensacola, FL 19.80 13.22 14.20 25.40
All American Poly NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Piscataway, NJ 
Calico Industries, Inc NO BID 0.0150 NO BID NO BID
Annapolis Junction, MD 14.98
Central Poly Corp. NO BID NO BID NO BID  NO BID
Linden, NJ
Dash Medical Gloves NO BID NO BID  NO BID NO BID
Franklin, WI
Interboro Packaging NO BID NO BID NO BID  NO BID
Montgomery, NY
Oliver Packaging NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Walker, MI
Quill Corporation NO BID 0.0292 NO BID NO BID
Lincolnshire, IL 29.19
Wallace Packaging NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Tucson, AZ

Bowls, Hot or Hot FoodTrays, Bowls, Hot or
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ITEM
Cont(10oz) ea Wrap ea Deli sh w/open top ea

Quantity: 125 cs 500 cs 1,070 bx 110 cs
0702210 0702790 0702800

ITEM NUMBER 49 50 51 52
Crest Supply NO BID NO BID 0.0086 a NO BID
Crestview, FL 4.28 n
Merchants Paper Co. 0.01353 0.0220 0.0090 a 0.0136 a

13.53 54.95 4.50 y 27.25 y
   # 50-Red & Blue - 0.0220 - -
   # 50-Yellow, Green, Purple - 43.95 - -
PR Chemical & Paper NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Pensacola, FL
Pyramid School Products NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Tampa, FL 
Supreme Paper Supplies 0.01345 0.0196 a NO BID 0.0098
Pensacola, FL 13.45 48.98 u 19.50
All American Poly NO BID NO BID  NO BID NO BID
Piscataway, NJ 
Calico Industries, Inc NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Annapolis Junction, MD
Central Poly Corp. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Linden, NJ
Dash Medical Gloves NO BID NO BID  NO BID NO BID
Franklin, WI
Interboro Packaging NO BID NO BID NO BID  NO BID
Montgomery, NY
Oliver Packaging NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Walker, MI
Quill Corporation NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Lincolnshire, IL
Wallace Packaging NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Tucson, AZ

Lids, for Hot Food Sandwich Paper, Bags,Paper,
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ITEM
Foil Liners (20gal) ea Liners (32gal) ea Fryer Boilout ea

Quantity: 580 rl 65 cs 170 cs 30 cs
0702730 0702890 0702930 0701110

ITEM NUMBER 53 54 55 56
Crest Supply 0.0378 a 0.0758 a 0.1062 NO BID
Crestview, FL 18.88 u 18.94 u 26.54
Merchants Paper Co. 21.8000 a 0.0616 0.0740 a NO BID 
Pensacola, FL y 15.40 18.50 u
PR Chemical & Paper NO BID 0.0724 0.1152 NO BID
Pensacola, FL 18.75 14.40
Pyramid School Products NO BID NO BID NO BID 18.4900 m
Tampa, FL 36.98
Supreme Paper Supplies 20.3000 0.0701 0.0970 14.2000
Pensacola, FL 17.52 24.24 28.40
All American Poly NO BID 0.0814 0.1136 NO BID
Piscataway, NJ 20.36 28.41
Calico Industries, Inc 21.1800 0.0666 0.0764 15.8400
Annapolis Junction, MD 16.65 19.10 31.68
Central Poly Corp. NO BID 0.0596 a 0.0896 a NO BID
Linden, NJ 14.90 n 22.40 n
Dash Medical Gloves NO BID NO BID NO BID  NO BID
Franklin, WI
Interboro Packaging-"A" NO BID 0.0747 a 0.1008 a NO BID
Montgomery, NY 18.68 n 25.20 n
Interboro Packaging-"B" NO BID 0.0637 a 0.0839 a NO BID
Montgomery, NY 15.92 n 20.98 n
Interboro Packaging-"C" NO BID 0.0533 a 0.0709 a NO BID
Montgomery, NY 13.32 n 17.72 n
Interboro Packaging-"D" NO BID 0.0185 a 0.0599 a NO BID
Montgomery, NY 9.24 n 14.98 n
Oliver Packaging NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Walker, MI
Quill Corporation 25.5400 a NO BID  NO BID NO BID
Lincolnshire, IL n
Wallace Packaging NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Tucson, AZ

Aluminum Garbage Can Garbage Can Cleaner, Keating
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ITEM
Aluminum Detergent  Acid Type Powder

Quantity: 30 gl 25 cs 150 gl 20 bg
0701160 0701070 0701080 0701140

ITEM NUMBER 57 58 59 60
Crest Supply NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Crestview, FL
Merchants Paper Co. 21.3000 NO BID 8.5300 NO BID
Pensacola, FL
PR Chemical & Paper 22.2200 25.0000 11.2500 NO BID
Pensacola, FL 100.00 45.00
Pyramid School Products 33.9500 NO BID NO BID 40.9500
Tampa, FL 
Supreme Paper Supplies NO BID NO BID 7.2000 28.9000
Pensacola, FL
All American Poly NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Piscataway, NJ 
Calico Industries, Inc NO BID NO BID NO BID 31.9400
Annapolis Junction, MD
Central Poly Corp. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Linden, NJ
Dash Medical Gloves NO BID NO BID  NO BID  NO BID
Franklin, WI
Interboro Packaging NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Montgomery, NY
Oliver Packaging NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Walker, MI
Quill Corporation NO BID NO BID  NO BID  NO BID
Lincolnshire, IL
Wallace Packaging NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Tucson, AZ

Polish Liquid Hood Oven Cleaner, Filtering
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ITEM
for Frymaster ea Pads, coarse ea Pads, Fine Scouring Sponge ea

Quantity: 20 cs 10 bx 20 bx 810 cs
0701330 0701250 0701240 0701270

ITEM NUMBER 61 62 63 64
Crest Supply NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Crestview, FL
Merchants Paper Co. NO BID 0.2625 a NO BID 0.4500 a
Pensacola, FL 5.25 y 5.40 u
PR Chemical & Paper NO BID NO BID 0.2495 0.5367
Pensacola, FL 4.99 u 6.44
Pyramid School Products 0.6695 0.4490 a 0.3980 a 0.3800 a
Tampa, FL 66.95 8.98 u 3.98 u 4.56 u
Supreme Paper Supplies 0.3660 NO BID NO BID 0.3800
Pensacola, FL 36.60 4.56
All American Poly NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Piscataway, NJ 
Calico Industries, Inc 0.3954 0.4867 0.1940 a 0.3750
Annapolis Junction, MD 39.54 5.84 1.94 y
Central Poly Corp. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Linden, NJ
Dash Medical Gloves NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID
Franklin, WI
Interboro Packaging NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Montgomery, NY
Oliver Packaging NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Walker, MI
Quill Corporation NO BID NO BID NO BID  NO BID
Lincolnshire, IL
Wallace Packaging NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Tucson, AZ

Filter Paper Scouring Scouring Stainless Steel
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ITEM

Quantity: 250 cs 200 ea 200 ea 250 ea
0701060 0305052 0305053 0305068

ITEM NUMBER 65 66 67 68
Crest Supply NO BID 3.2300 a a a
Crestview, FL u 3.71 u 5.77 u
Merchants Paper Co. 5.0200 2.1000 2.4000 4.6200 a
Pensacola, FL 75.30 u
PR Chemical & Paper 5.0000 2.4300 a 3.0100 a 4.8200 a
Pensacola, FL 75.00 u u u
Pyramid School Products 5.9987 2.9800 a 3.5900 a 3.6900 m
Tampa, FL 89.98 u 7.18 u 44.28
Supreme Paper Supplies 4.6867 2.8600 3.3000 a 3.6400
Pensacola, FL 70.30
All American Poly NO BID NO BID  NO BID  NO BID
Piscataway, NJ 
Calico Industries, Inc NO BID 2.4900 a 2.8700 a 2.3800
Annapolis Junction, MD n n
Central Poly Corp. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Linden, NJ
Dash Medical Gloves NO BID NO BID  NO BID  NO BID
Franklin, WI
Interboro Packaging NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Montgomery, NY
Oliver Packaging NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Walker, MI
Quill Corporation NO BID NO BID  NO BID NO BID
Lincolnshire, IL
Wallace Packaging NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Tucson, AZ

Soap Head, Mop  Head, Mop Mop
Powder Wet, 18" (20oz) Wet, 18" (24oz) (20oz)
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ITEM
(24oz) ea Non-Comp ea w/hinged lid ea

Quantity: 200 ea 200 cs 2,100 cs 1,200 cs
0305138 0702570 0702590

ITEM NUMBER 69 70 71 72
Crest Supply a NO BID NO BID 0.0759
Crestview, FL 6.69 u 11.39
Merchants Paper Co. 5.4600 a 0.6500 0.0385 a 0.0658
Pensacola, FL u 19.25 n 13.15
PR Chemical & Paper 7.0000 a 0.7700 NO BID NO BID
Pensacola, FL u
Pyramid School Products 3.9900 m 1.0400 m NO BID NO BID
Tampa, FL 47.88
Supreme Paper Supplies 3.6400 0.6500 0.0393 0.0628
Pensacola, FL 19.65 9.42
All American Poly NO BID  NO BID NO BID  NO BID
Piscataway, NJ 
Calico Industries, Inc 2.6400 0.64750 NO BID 0.0749
Annapolis Junction, MD 14.98
Central Poly Corp. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Linden, NJ
Dash Medical Gloves NO BID NO BID  NO BID  NO BID
Franklin, WI
Interboro Packaging NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Montgomery, NY
Oliver Packaging NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Walker, MI
Quill Corporation NO BID NO BID NO BID 0.1642
Lincolnshire, IL 32.84
Wallace Packaging NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Tucson, AZ

Mop Scouring Powder Trays Trays, 3 Comp-
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ITEM
Compartment ea Compartment ea

Quantity: 3,200 cs 3,200 cs
0702600 0702620

ITEM NUMBER 73 74
Crest Supply 0.0376 0.0496
Crestview, FL 18.80 24.78
Merchants Paper Co. 0.0345 a 0.0470 a
Pensacola, FL 17.25 y 23.50 y
PR Chemical & Paper NO BID NO BID
Pensacola, FL
Pyramid School Products NO BID NO BID
Tampa, FL 
Supreme Paper Supplies 0.0323 0.0428
Pensacola, FL 16.15 21.41
All American Poly NO BID NO BID
Piscataway, NJ 
Calico Industries, Inc NO BID NO BID
Annapolis Junction, MD
Central Poly Corp. NO BID NO BID
Linden, NJ
Dash Medical Gloves NO BID NO BID
Franklin, WI
Interboro Packaging NO BID NO BID
Montgomery, NY
Oliver Packaging 0.0810 a NO BID
Walker, MI 40.50 n
Quill Corporation NO BID NO BID
Lincolnshire, IL
Wallace Packaging NO BID NO BID
Tucson, AZ

a= Alternate product bid
m= Minimum shipment requirement by bidder
u= Unacceptable (Alternate product or pack size not accepted or product was not sent for testing)
y= Yes, sample was received/tested and was approved

BID TABULATION, RECOMMENDATIONS, AND PROTEST
Bid tabulations with award recommendations are posted for 72 hours in the Purchasing 
Department Office and are also posted to the School District's website address at: 
http://old.escambia.k12.fl.us/adminoff/finance/purchasing/ 

Failure to file a protest within the time prescribed in
Section 120.57(3) Florida Statutes, and School Board Rules shall constitute a waiver of proceedings.
Bid tabluations or recommendations will be distributed solely thorugh the Purchasing 
website address.  Notices will not be automatically mailed.

I hereby certify that the prices and bidders reflected herin are valid, and have been received
in compliance to Escambia County School Board Rules and Florida Law.

John Dombroskie, Director
Purchasing Department

Tray, 4-5 Tray, 6
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