&3 THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY
PURCHASING & BUSINESS SERVICES DEPARTMENT

432 1?

BID AWARD NOTICE

DATE: BID TITLE & REFERENCE:
August 2, 2011 Food Processing: USDA Commodities Il, RFP #120203

DESCRIPTION OF PURCHASE:

A ten (10) month pricing agreement to provide food processing of USDA commodity chicken into
ready to use products (five (5) items bid and five (5) items awarded) for use in the preparation of
school lunches and breakfasts. Product packaging varies significantly; low price was determined by
portion cost and not by case price.

Effective Dates: September 1, 2011 through June 30, 2012.

REQUESTED BY:

Food Services

SUPPLIER NAME: ITEMS AWARDED: ESTIMATED EXPENDITURE:
Ling’s, South El Monte, CA 4 $375,000.00
Tyson Prepared Foods, Inc., Springdale, AR 1 27,300.00

AMOUNT OF PURCHASE: FUNDING SOURCE:
$402,300.00 Est. /10 Mos. Food Services Fund (4110)

METHOD OF PROCUREMENT:

ECSD Bid Responses Received: 4

POSTING DATE & TIME:

August 2, 2011, 4:35pm Central Time

9500 PUR100 (11/10) Retention — 5 Years



THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY

DATE: July 20, 2011

BID NBR: 120203
BID TITLE: Food Processing: USDA Commodities I

PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
75 NORTH PACE BOULEVARD
PENSACOLA, FLORIDA 32505

BID TABULATION

Awarded Items are highlighted

Chef's Tyson
Iltem Vendor Asian Food Corner Prepared
No. Solutions Foods Ling's Foods
1|Sweet & Sour Chicken (@) (a) NO BID
Portion Size 3.96 0z 3.92 0z 3.92 0z
Portion Per Case 171 171 142
Case Cost w/ Commodity 93.20 87.65 69.76
Portion Cost w/ Commodity 0.5450 u 0.5126 0.4913
Case Cost w/o Commodity 114.38 105.59 u 100.34
Portion Cost w/o Commodity 0.6689 0.6175 0.7066
2|Smoked BBQ Teriyaki Chicken (@) (a) (@)
Portion Size 2.85 0z 2.80 0z 2.60 0z 5.00 0z
Portion Per Case 240 200 207 100
Case Cost w/ Commodity 82.08 u 70.96 71.84 53.17 u
Portion Cost w/ Commodity 0.3420 0.3548 0.3471 0.5317
Case Cost w/o Commaodity 109.61 86.29 103.86 72.75
Portion Cost w/o Commodity 0.4567 0.4315 0.5017 0.7275
3[Mandarin Orange Chicken (@) (a) (@)
Portion Size 3.96 3.92 0z 3.92 0z 5.00 0z
Portion Per Case 171 171 142 100
Case Cost w/ Commodity 93.20 u 85.65 69.76 53.17
Portion Cost w/ Commodity 0.5450 0.5009 0.4913 0.5317
Case Cost w/o Commodity 114.38 105.59 100.34 72.75 u
Portion Cost w/o Commodity 0.6689 0.6175 0.7066 0.7275
4|Kung Pao Chicken w/ Veg. (@) (a) NO BID
Portion Size 2.85 0z 3.92 0z 5.33 0z
Portion Per Case 240 171 142
Case Cost w/ Commodity 82.08 u 82.08 NO BID
Portion Cost w/ Commodity 0.3420 0.4800
Case Cost w/o Commaodity 109.61 105.59 u 28.83
Portion Cost w/o Commodity 0.4567 0.6175 0.2030
5/Chicken Tenders NO BID NO BID NO BID
Portion Size 3.39 0z
Portion Per Case 144
Case Cost w/ Commodity 27.26
Portion Cost w/ Commodity 0.1893
Case Cost w/o Commodity 41.42
Portion Cost w/o Commaodity 0.2876




u=sample unacceptable

BID TABULATION, RECOMMENDATIONS, AND PROTEST

Bid tabulations with award recommendations are posted for 72 hours in the Purchasing
Department Office and are also posted to the School District's website address at:
http://old.escambia.k12.fl.us/adminoff/finance/purchasing/

Failure to file a protest within the time prescribed in Section 120.57(3)

Florida Statutes, and School Board rules shall constitute a waiver of proceedings.
Bid tabulations or recommendations will be distributed solely through the Purchasing
website address. Notices will not be automatically mailed.

| hereby certify that the prices and bidders reflected herin are valid, and have been received

in compliance to Escambia County School Board Rules and Florida Law.

John Dombroskie, Director
Purchasing Department



