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DATE:      BID TITLE & REFERENCE: 
     June 9, 2011     Breakfast & Lunch Entrees, RFP #112303 
 
           
DESCRIPTION OF PURCHASE: 

 
A semi-annual pricing agreement to provide breakfast and lunch food entrees (fifty-one (51) items 
bid; forty-seven (47) awarded) as stocked and distributed by the Central Warehouse for school 
cafeterias throughout the District.  Items will be purchased as needed to meet breakfast and lunch 
menu requirements.  Bid award(s) to the lowest bidder(s) meeting specifications.   
 
Effective Dates:  July 1, 2011 through December 31, 2011. 
 
 

 
REQUESTED BY: 
 

Food Services 
   
            
SUPPLIER NAME:                           ITEMS AWARDED:  ESTIMATED EXPENDITURE: 

 
Agora Foods, Dawsonville, GA      3    $   71,800.00 
Don Lee Farms, Inglewood, CA      2         85,000.00 
JNS Foods, Tamarac, FL       1           5,500.00 
JTM Provisions, Harrison, OH      1         26,000.00 
Kelley Foods of Alabama, Elba, AL     4         52,500.00 
ProView Foods, Gainesville, GA      3         82,500.00 
Sysco Gulf Coast, Geneva, AL    18       227,500.00 
US FoodService – Lakeland, Lakeland, FL    8       275,000.00 
US FoodService – Montgomery, Montgomery, AL   7       150,000.00 
 
 

  
AMOUNT OF PURCHASE:     FUNDING SOURCE: 

 
$975,800.00 Est./6 Mos.   Food Services Fund (4110)   
 

 
METHOD OF PROCUREMENT: 

 
ECSD Bid                            Responses Received:  11             Bids Rejected:  2 
 

 
POSTING DATE & TIME: 
 

June 9, 2011, 1:15pm Central Time 
 

 
9500 PUR101 (11/10) Retention – 5 Years 

 
 

THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY 
PURCHASING & BUSINESS SERVICES DEPARTMENT 

 
 

BID AWARD NOTICE 



THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

75 NORTH PACE BOULEVARD
PENSACOLA, FL  32505

BID TABULATION

DATE:  May 17, 2011
 Awarded Items are highlighted
BID NBR: 112303
BID TITLE:  Breakfast & Lunch Entrees

If 2 prices are listed, top price is unit/portion cost, i.e. ea (each), lb (pound);  bottom price is vendor unit 
of purchase, i.e. cs (case).  Differences in pack sizes require Items to be awarded by portion cost.

ITEM Toaster Past. Toaster Past. Egg Patties, 
Single Count ea Whole grain ea Two Count Grilled ea

Quantity: 600 cs 200 cs 600 cs 300 cs
0505970 0505980 0516090

ITEM NUMBER 1 2 3 4
JNS Foods No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.1540 a
Tamarac, FL 46.27 m/u
US Foodservice (Lakeland) No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.1070
Lakeland, FL 32.10
Agora Foods No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Dawsonville, GA
Amy Foods No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Houston, TX
Don Lee Farms No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Inglewood, CA
JTM Provisions No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Harrison, OH
Kelley Foods of Alabama 0.2990 No Bid 0.4760 No Bid
Elba, AL 23.98 34.31
ProView Foods No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Gainesville, GA
Sky Blue Foods No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Calabasas, CA
Sysco Gulf Coast 0.3163 No Bid 0.4855 0.1094
Geneva, AL 25.30 34.95 32.80
US Foodservice (Montgomery) 0.2670 No Bid 0.4175 No Bid
Montgomery, AL 21.36 30.06

Not Awarded

Toaster Past. Sing
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ITEM Cereal Cereals, Pancakes French Toast
Bar Ready to eat ea Sticks ea

Quantity: 400 cs 1000 cs 600 cs 1500 cs
0517000

ITEM NUMBER 5 6 7 8
JNS Foods No Bid No Bid 0.1830 0.0709
Tamarac, FL 13.1800 12.4100
US Foodservice (Lakeland) No Bid No Bid 0.0688 No Bid
Lakeland, FL 9.9200
Agora Foods No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Dawsonville, GA
Amy Foods No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Houston, TX
Don Lee Farms No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Inglewood, CA
JTM Provisions No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Harrison, OH
Kelley Foods of Alabama No Bid 0.2220 0.0750 0.0700
Elba, AL                          Bid 1 21.3900 10.9200 12.2800
Kelley Foods of Alabama n/a 0.2230 n/a n/a
Elba, AL                          Bid 2 21.4700
ProView Foods No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Gainesville, GA
Sky Blue Foods 0.2572 a No Bid No Bid No Bid
Calabasas, CA 24.6900 u
Sysco Gulf Coast 0.2912 0.1709 0.0945 0.0823
Geneva, AL 27.950 16.400 13.600 14.800
US Foodservice (Montgomery) 0.2735 0.1699 No Bid 0.0658
Montgomery, AL 26.26 16.31 12.50

0505990 0517010
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ITEM Bagels Donuts, Donuts, Waffle
ea Frozen Frozen, 3oz

Quantity: 400 cs 1200 cs 1200 cs 1000 cs
0517090 0517320 0517021

ITEM NUMBER 9 10 11 12
JNS Foods 0.1966 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tamarac, FL 14.1600
US Foodservice (Lakeland) No Bid 0.2410 0.2895 No Bid
Lakeland, FL 19.2800 23.1600
Agora Foods No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Dawsonville, GA
Amy Foods No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Houston, TX
Don Lee Farms No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Inglewood, CA
JTM Provisions No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Harrison, OH
Kelley Foods of Alabama 0.1968 0.2616 0.3180 0.4397
Elba, AL 14.1700 20.9300 25.4400 31.6600
ProView Foods No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Gainesville, GA
Sky Blue Foods No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Calabasas, CA
Sysco Gulf Coast 0.2355 No Bid No Bid 0.4146
Geneva, AL 16.9500 29.850
US Foodservice (Montgomery) 0.2118 No Bid No Bid 0.4185
Montgomery, AL 15.25 30.13

0517070
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ITEM Beef, Ground Beef Smoked Breakfast Beef
Mini Burgers ea Patties Sausage lb Steak Patty ea

Quantity: 1000 cs 2000 cs 100 cs 300 cs
0515090 0516115 0516120 0516131

ITEM NUMBER 13 14 15 16
JNS Foods 0.2000 a 0.4041 a No Bid 0.3797
Tamarac, FL 32.030 u 40.410 u 36.450
US Foodservice (Lakeland) 0.2150 0.4600 No Bid 0.3340
Lakeland, FL 60.20 53.36 35.40
Agora Foods No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Dawsonville, GA
Amy Foods No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Houston, TX
Don Lee Farms 0.2003 a 0.3555 No Bid No Bid
Inglewood, CA 36.85 u 36.26
JTM Provisions 0.1320 a 0.4410 a No Bid 0.5500 a
Harrison, OH 55.040 u 86.000 u 73.1500 u
Kelley Foods of Alabama No Bid 0.4588 2.6560 0.3364
Elba, AL 91.7500 26.5600 35.6600
ProView Foods No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Gainesville, GA
Sky Blue Foods No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Calabasas, CA
Sysco Gulf Coast 0.2750 0.4550 3.065 0.3387
Geneva, AL 88.000 91.000 30.650 35.900
US Foodservice (Montgomery) No Bid 0.4563 3.1200 0.3461
Montgomery, AL 91.26 31.20 36.69
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ITEM Ground Beef, Country Fried Taco Beef Meatballs,
Bulk Steak ea Meat lb Italian lb

Quantity: 900 cs 1500 cs 500 cs 600 cs
0516140 0516170 0516190

ITEM NUMBER 17 18 19 20
JNS Foods No Bid 0.4890 a 2.0240 a No Bid
Tamarac, FL 33.800 u 30.360 u
US Foodservice (Lakeland) No Bid 0.6100 No Bid No Bid
Lakeland, FL 51.850
Agora Foods No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Dawsonville, GA
Amy Foods No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Houston, TX
Don Lee Farms No Bid 0.3697 a No Bid 2.1000
Inglewood, CA 26.6200 u 2.9400
JTM Provisions No Bid 0.5500 a 1.7620 2.1940 a
Harrison, OH 72.600 u 52.8500 65.8400 u
Kelley Foods of Alabama No Bid 0.6544 No Bid No Bid
Elba, AL 55.6300
ProView Foods No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Gainesville, GA
Sky Blue Foods No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Calabasas, CA
Sysco Gulf Coast No Bid 0.6130 3.2250 a 2.4600
Geneva, AL 52.1000 32.2500 u 24.6000
US Foodservice (Montgomery) No Bid 0.6224 No Bid No Bid
Montgomery, AL 52.90

Not Awarded

0516151
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ITEM Chicken, Sausage Link, Sausage Patty, Deli Style
Chunk, Canned cn Turkey Turkey Turkey Ham lb

Quantity: 100 cs 1500 cs 1200 cs 600 cs
0504130 0516200 0516210

ITEM NUMBER 21 22 23 24
JNS Foods No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tamarac, FL
US Foodservice (Lakeland) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Lakeland, FL
Agora Foods No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Dawsonville, GA
Amy Foods No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Houston, TX
Don Lee Farms No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Inglewood, CA
JTM Provisions No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Harrison, OH
Kelley Foods of Alabama No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Elba, AL
ProView Foods No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Gainesville, GA
Sky Blue Foods No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Calabasas, CA
Sysco Gulf Coast 10.8334 0.1766 0.1632 1.8800
Geneva, AL 65.000 28.250 26.100 47.000
US Foodservice (Montgomery) No Bid 0.1748 0.1641 2.0500
Montgomery, AL 27.96 26.26 26.65

0516220
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ITEM Turkey Turkey Turkey, Roast Turkey
Roast Roll Ground Breast, Sliced

Quantity: 7000 lb 3000 lb 200 cs 300 cs
0516311 0516320 0516321 0516340

ITEM NUMBER 25 26 27 28
JNS Foods No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tamarac, FL
US Foodservice (Lakeland) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Lakeland, FL
Agora Foods No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Dawsonville, GA
Amy Foods No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Houston, TX
Don Lee Farms No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Inglewood, CA
JTM Provisions No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Harrison, OH
Kelley Foods of Alabama No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Elba, AL
ProView Foods No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Gainesville, GA
Sky Blue Foods No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Calabasas, CA
Sysco Gulf Coast 2.3500 1.5900 1.2200 3.0900
Geneva, AL 94.0000 31.800 24.400 37.0800
US Foodservice (Montgomery) 2.8100 1.8000 1.2650 3.3400
Montgomery, AL 112.40 36.00 25.30 40.08
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ITEM Chicken Gr. White Chicken Breast
Nuggets lb Chicken Patty ea Frozen lb Filet, Breaded lb

Quantity: 2500 cs 2000 cs 300 cs 2000 cs
0516562 0516572 0516580

ITEM NUMBER 29 30 31 32
JNS Foods 1.4310 a 0.3566 a 2.2500 a 2.5200 a
Tamarac, FL 14.3100 u/p 18.4000 u 22.5000 u 25.2000 u
US Foodservice (Lakeland) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Lakeland, FL
Agora Foods No Bid No Bid No Bid 2.6900
Dawsonville, GA 26.9000
Amy Foods No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Houston, TX
Don Lee Farms No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Inglewood, CA
JTM Provisions No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Harrison, OH
Kelley Foods of Alabama 1.2400 0.3077 No Bid 2.9900
Elba, AL 12.4000 19.6900 29.9000 u
ProView Foods 1.2050 m 0.2805 m No bid 2.5520 a/m
Gainesville, GA 12.050 17.950 25.5200 u
Sky Blue Foods No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Calabasas, CA
Sysco Gulf Coast 1.6634 0.6102 3.0950 3.3200
Geneva, AL 24.9500 32.950 30.950 33.2000
US Foodservice (Montgomery) 1.5500 0.3108 No Bid No Bid
Montgomery, AL 15.50 19.89
JNS - p - nugget size larger (29)  Also 30

0516520

Chicken, Diced,
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ITEM Spicy Breaded Chicken Wings,
Buffalo Style lb Chicken Breast Breast Tender ea Hot lb

Quantity: 600 cs 200 cs 700 cs 600 cs
0516610 0516620 0516650 0516631

ITEM NUMBER 33 34 35 36
JNS Foods 1.4455 a 2.6800 a 0.3060 a 2.3150 a
Tamarac, FL 23.150 u/p 26.800 15.3000 u 23.1500 u
US Foodservice (Lakeland) No Bid  No Bid No Bid No Bid
Lakeland, FL
Agora Foods 2.1900 2.4500 No Bid No Bid
Dawsonville, GA 21.9000 24.500
Amy Foods No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Houston, TX
Don Lee Farms No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Inglewood, CA
JTM Provisions No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Harrison, OH
Kelley Foods of Alabama 2.4700 a 0.6528 a 0.2798 a 3.1250
Elba, AL 49.4000 30.0300 y/m 14.8300 y 31.2500
ProView Foods 2.1000 a 0.6500 a 0.2549 m 2.8000 m
Gainesville, GA 42.000 y/m 26.000 y/m 13.000 y 28.0000
Sky Blue Foods No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Calabasas, CA
Sysco Gulf Coast 2.2950 2.7950 u 0.1517 2.7000 a
Geneva, AL 22.9500 27.950 22.000 54.0000 u
US Foodservice (Montgomery) 2.3960 No Bid 0.3616 3.2260
Montgomery, AL 23.96 57.86 32,26
p - JNS pack size smaller (33)
u - Sysco - not enough information bid on 34, not accepted.  

Chicken Tender, Breaded Chicken
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ITEM Tuna Frozen Popcorn Cod Portion Cod Nuggets,
Shrimp lb ea Oven Style lb

Quantity: 100 cs 100 cs 1500 bx 200 cs
0504100 0515020 0515032 0515070

ITEM NUMBER 37 38 39 40
JNS Foods No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tamarac, FL
US Foodservice (Lakeland) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Lakeland, FL
Agora Foods No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Dawsonville, GA
Amy Foods No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Houston, TX
Don Lee Farms No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Inglewood, CA
JTM Provisions No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Harrison, OH
Kelley Foods of Alabama 8.9280 No Bid 0.1649 1.2900
Elba, AL 53.5700 26.3900 25.8000
ProView Foods No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Gainesville, GA
Sky Blue Foods No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Calabasas, CA
Sysco Gulf Coast No Bid 3.2800 0.8988 a 2.4150
Geneva, AL 32.800 35.950 u 24.1500
US Foodservice (Montgomery) No Bid No Bid No Bid 2.4890
Montgomery, AL 24.89

Page 10



ITEM Corn Frankfurters, Frankfurters, Frankfurters,
Dog Blend Beef Turkey

Quantity: 2000 cs 1400 cs 1400 cs 1400 cs
0516052 0516070 0516070 0516070

ITEM NUMBER 41 42 42 42
JNS Foods No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tamarac, FL
US Foodservice (Lakeland) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Lakeland, FL
Agora Foods No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Dawsonville, GA
Amy Foods No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Houston, TX
Don Lee Farms 0.3600 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Inglewood, CA 12.9600
JTM Provisions No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Harrison, OH
Kelley Foods of Alabama 0.2911 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Elba, AL 20.9600
ProView Foods No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Gainesville, GA
Sky Blue Foods No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Calabasas, CA
Sysco Gulf Coast 0.2757 0.2113 0.2869 No Bid
Geneva, AL 19.8500 16.900 22.950
US Foodservice (Montgomery) 0.2792 0.2011 0.2820 0.1277
Montgomery, AL 20.10 16.09 22.56 20.43
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ITEM Egg Chili Pepperoni Ham & Cheese
Roll Fiesta Stix ea Pocket Sdwh ea Pocket Sdwh ea

Quantity: 500 cs 2400 cs 150 cs 150 cs
0516460 0516510 0516801 0516810

ITEM NUMBER 43 44 45 46
JNS Foods No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tamarac, FL
US Foodservice (Lakeland) No Bid 0.3910 No Bid No Bid
Lakeland, FL 25.0200
Agora Foods No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Dawsonville, GA
Amy Foods 0.5000 a,u No Bid No Bid No Bid
Houston, TX 20.0000 m
Don Lee Farms No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Inglewood, CA
JTM Provisions No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Harrison, OH
Kelley Foods of Alabama No Bid 0.3968 0.7288 0.7288
Elba, AL 25.4090 17.4900 17.4900
ProView Foods No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Gainesville, GA
Sky Blue Foods .4696 - .5870 a No Bid No Bid No Bid
Calabasas, CA 23.4800 u
Sysco Gulf Coast No Bid No Bid 0.5563 0.5813
Geneva, AL 26.700 13.9500
US Foodservice (Montgomery) No Bid No Bid 0.5644 0.5663
Montgomery, AL 27.09 13.59

Not Awarded 45 & 46 Awarded as a lot
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ITEM PB&J Sdwh, PB&J Sdwh, Beef, Seasoned Teriyaki Beef
Crustless, Sm ea Crustless, Lg ea Cooked Tips lb Blasters

Quantity: 50 cs 50 cs 100 cs 100 cs
0517450 0517460 0516760

ITEM NUMBER 47 48 49 50
JNS Foods No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tamarac, FL
US Foodservice (Lakeland) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Lakeland, FL
Agora Foods No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Dawsonville, GA
Amy Foods No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Houston, TX
Don Lee Farms No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.4838
Inglewood, CA 38.7000
JTM Provisions No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Harrison, OH
Kelley Foods of Alabama 0.5744 0.7985 No Bid No Bid
Elba, AL              Whole Wheat 41.36 57.49
ProView Foods No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Gainesville, GA
Sky Blue Foods No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Calabasas, CA
Sysco Gulf Coast 0.5382 0.7459 4.4350 a 0.4533
Geneva, AL 38.75 53.70 44.35 u 68.75
US Foodservice (Montgomery) 0.5575 0.7592 No Bid 0.4626
Montgomery, AL 40.14 54.66 46.26

Not Awarded
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ITEM Beef, 
Shaved Steak lb

Quantity: 100 cs
0515100

ITEM NUMBER 51
JNS Foods No Bid
Tamarac, FL
US Foodservice (Lakeland) No Bid
Lakeland, FL
Agora Foods No Bid
Dawsonville, GA
Amy Foods No Bid
Houston, TX
Don Lee Farms No Bid
Inglewood, CA
JTM Provisions 4.3000 a
Harrison, OH 129.000 u
Kelley Foods of Alabama No Bid
Elba, AL
ProView Foods No Bid
Gainesville, GA
Sky Blue Foods No Bid
Calabasas, CA
Sysco Gulf Coast 3.9584
Geneva, AL 95.0000
US Foodservice (Montgomery) No Bid
Montgomery, AL

a =   Alternate Product Bid.
m =  Bidder has Minimum Shipment Requirement.
p =   Pack size too large or too small.
u =   No sample received; did not meet specificatins or sample was not approved in student taste test.
y =   Sample Received and approved in student taste test.

BID TABULATION, RECOMMENDATIONS, AND PROTEST
Bid tabulations with award recommendations are posted for 72 hours in the Purchasing

http://old.escambia.k12.fl.us/adminoff/finance/purchasing/

Failure to file a protest within the time prescribed in 
Section 120.57(3) Florida Statutes, and School Board Rules shall constitute a waiver of proceedings.
Bid tabulations or recommendations will be distributed solely through the Purchasing
website address. Notices will not be automatically mailed.

I hereby certify that the prices and bidders reflected herein are valid, and have been received
in compliance to Escambia County School Board Rules and Florida Law.

John Dombroskie
Director

Department Office and are also posted to the School District's website address at
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