
 

 
 
 
DATE: BID TITLE & REFERENCE: 
November 23, 2010      Frozen Pizza and Cheese Products, RFP #110803 
 
DESCRIPTION OF PURCHASE: 

 
The Bid is for a semi-annual pricing agreement to provide frozen pizza and cheese products (8 items 
bid; 6 awarded) as stocked and distributed by the Central Warehouse for school cafeterias 
throughout the District.  Items will be purchased as needed to meet breakfast and lunch menu 
requirements.  Bid award(s) to the lowest bidder(s) meeting specifications.   
 
Effective Dates:  January 1, 2011 through June 30, 2011. 
 
 
 
 
 
 

  
REQUESTED BY: 

 
Food Services 
 

    
SUPPLIER NAME:       ITEMS AWARDED: EST. ANNUAL EXPENDITURE: 
  

Nardone Brothers Baking Co., Hanover, PA  1      $   8,400.00 
Schwan’s Food Service, Marshall, MN   2         64,800.00     
Sysco Gulf Coast, Geneva, AL    1         10,100.00 
US Foodservice-Lakeland, Lakeland, FL   2         42,800.00 

 
    
AMOUNT OF PURCHASE: FUNDING SOURCE: 

 
$126,100.00 Est./6 Mos.   Food Services Fund (4110) 

     
   

METHOD OF PROCUREMENT: 
 
ECSD Bid      Responses Received: 6 
   

  
DATE AND TIME POSTED: 

 
November 23, 2010, 2:30 pm Central Time 

 
 
9500PUR101 (11/10) Retention - 5 Years 

 
THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY 

PURCHASING DEPARTMENT 
215 West Garden Street  

Pensacola, FL  32502 
 

BID AWARD NOTICE 



DATE: October 29, 2010
 Awarded Items Are Highlighted
BID NBR: 110803
BID TITLE: Frozen Pizza and Cheese Products
Pack and Portion Sizes Vary - Award is Based on Unit/Portion Cost

ITEM 
#0516380 #0516380

1,000 cs 1,000 cs
ITEM NUMBER 1-With Comm. Proc

Portion Size/oz u u
Cheney Brothers Portions/Case 192 192
Ocala, FL Unit Price 0.1836 0.2286

Case Price 35.25 43.89
Extended Price 35,250.00 43,890.00
Portion Size/oz u

Cheney Brothers Portions/Case No Bid 192 a
Ocala, FL Unit Price 0.2120
ALTERNATE BID Case Price 40.70

Extended Price 40,700.00
Portion Size/oz 1.66 1.66

US Food Service-Lakeland Portions/Case 192 192
Lakeland, FL Unit Price 0.1775 0.2059

Case Price 34.08 39.54
Extended Price 34,080.00 39,540.00
Portion Size/oz 2.66

Kelley Foods of Alabama Portions/Case No Bid 192
Elba, AL Unit Price 0.2354

Case Price 45.20
Extended Price 45,200.00
Portion Size/oz 3.20 3.20

Nardone Bros. Baking Co. Portions/Case 80 80
Hanover, PA Unit Price 0.1956 0.2750

Case Price 15.65 22.00
Extended Price 15,650.00 22,000.00
Portion Size/oz 3.20 3.20

Schwan's Food Service, Inc. Portions/Case 128 128
Marshall, MN Unit Price 0.2195 0.2195

Case Price 28.09 28.09
Extended Price 28,090.00 28,090.00
Portion Size/oz 3.20 3.20

Sysco Gulf Coast Portions/Case 80 80
Geneva, AL Unit Price 0.2080 0.2874

Case Price 16.64 22.99
Extended Price 16,640.00 22,990.00

BID TABULATION

THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
215 WEST GARDEN STREET

PENSACOLA, FL  32502

Breakfast Sausage Pizza

1-Without Comm. Proc



ITEM 
#0516400 #0516400

400 cs 400 cs
ITEM NUMBER 2-With Comm. Proc

Portion Size/oz 5.00 4.67
Cheney Brothers Portions/Case 96 96
Ocala, FL Unit Price 0.2378 0.3642

Case Price 22.83 34.96
Extended Price 9,132.00 13,984.00
Portion Size/oz 5.00 4.67

US Food Service-Lakeland Portions/Case 96 96
Lakeland, FL Unit Price 0.2323 0.3581

Case Price 22.30 34.38
Extended Price 8,920.00 13,752.00
Portion Size/oz

Kelley Foods of Alabama Portions/Case No Bid No Bid
Elba, AL Unit Price

Case Price
Extended Price
Portion Size/oz 5.00 5.00

Nardone Bros. Baking Co. Portions/Case 96 96
Hanover, PA Unit Price 0.2367 0.4063

Case Price 22.72 39.00
Extended Price 9,088.00 15,600.00
Portion Size/oz 4.61 4.61 a

Schwan's Food Service, Inc. Portions/Case 80 80
Marshall, MN Unit Price 0.3546 0.3546

Case Price 28.37 28.37
Extended Price 11,348.00 11,348.00
Portion Size/oz 5.00 5.00

Sysco Gulf Coast Portions/Case 96 96
Geneva, AL Unit Price 0.2470 0.4166

Case Price 23.71 39.99
Extended Price 9,484.00 15,996.00

Cheese Pizza Rounded Edge

2-Without Comm. Proc



ITEM 
#0516440 #0516440

100 cs 100 cs
ITEM NUMBER

Portion Size/oz 5.65 5.65
Cheney Brothers Portions/Case 72 72
Ocala, FL Unit Price 0.4414 0.5460

Case Price 31.78 39.31
Extended Price 3,178.00 3,931.00
Portion Size/oz 5.75 m 5.75 m

US Food Service-Lakeland Portions/Case 72 72
Lakeland, FL Unit Price 0.3581 0.4500

Case Price 25.78 32.40
Extended Price 2,578.00 3,240.00
Portion Size/oz 5.75

Kelley Foods of Alabama Portions/Case No Bid 72
Elba, AL Unit Price 0.5375

Case Price 38.70
Extended Price 3,870.00
Portion Size/oz 5.65 5.65

Nardone Bros. Baking Co. Portions/Case 72 72
Hanover, PA Unit Price 0.4274 0.5278

Case Price 30.77 38.00
Extended Price 3,077.00 3,800.00
Portion Size/oz 5.98 5.98

Schwan's Food Service, Inc. Portions/Case 72 72
Marshall, MN Unit Price 0.4519 0.4519

Case Price 32.54 32.54
Extended Price 3,254.00 3,254.00
Portion Size/oz 5.65 5.65

Sysco Gulf Coast Portions/Case 72 72
Geneva, AL Unit Price 0.4411 0.5415

Case Price 31.76000 38.99000
Extended Price 3,176.00 3,899.00

3-Without Comm. Proc3-With Comm. Proc

Stuffed Crust Wedge Pepperoni Pizza



ITEM 
#0516640 #0516640

300 cs 300 cs
ITEM NUMBER

Portion Size/oz 1.93 1.93
Cheney Brothers Portions/Case 192 192
Ocala, FL Unit Price 0.1456 0.1986

Case Price 27.95 38.13
Extended Price 8,385.00 11,439.00
Portion Size/oz 1.93 m 1.93 m

US Food Service-Lakeland Portions/Case 192 192
Lakeland, FL Unit Price 0.1450 0.1920

Case Price 27.84 36.86
Extended Price 8,352.00 11,058.00
Portion Size/oz 1.30

Kelley Foods of Alabama Portions/Case No bid 192
Elba, AL Unit Price 0.2172

Case Price 41.70
Extended Price 12,510.00
Portion Size/oz 3.00 3.00

Nardone Bros. Baking Co. Portions/Case 192 192
Hanover, PA Unit Price 0.1082 0.1458

Case Price 20.77 28.00
Extended Price 6,231.00 8,400.00
Portion Size/oz 2 sticks 2 sticks

Schwan's Food Service, Inc. Portions/Case 100 100
Marshall, MN Unit Price 0.3798 0.3798

Case Price 37.98 37.98000
Extended Price 11,394.00 11,394.00
Portion Size/oz 3.00 3.00

Sysco Gulf Coast Portions/Case 192 192
Geneva, AL Unit Price 0.1133 0.1510

Case Price 21.76 28.99
Extended Price 6,528.00 8,697.00

4-Without Comm. Proc4-With Comm. Proc

Cheese Filled Pizza Sticks



ITEM 
#0516672 #0516672

1,500 cs 1,500 cs
ITEM NUMBER

Portion Size/oz 5.00 5.00
Cheney Brothers Portions/Case 96 96
Ocala, FL Unit Price 0.2832 0.3800

Case Price 27.19 36.48
Extended Price 40,785.00 54,720.00
Portion Size/oz 5.00 4.67

US Food Service-Lakeland Portions/Case 96 96
Lakeland, FL Unit Price 0.2765 0.3715

Case Price 26.54 35.66
Extended Price 39,810.00 53,490.00
Portion Size/oz 0.4190

Kelley Foods of Alabama Portions/Case No Bid 96
Elba, AL Unit Price 0.4188

Case Price 40.20
Extended Price 60,300.00
Portion Size/oz 5.00 5.00

Nardone Bros. Baking Co. Portions/Case 96 96
Hanover, PA Unit Price 0.2808 0.4063

Case Price 26.96 39.00
Extended Price 40,440.00 58,500.00
Portion Size/oz 4.70 4.70

Schwan's Food Service, Inc. Portions/Case 80 80
Marshall, MN Unit Price 0.3683 0.3683

Case Price 29.46 29.46
Extended Price 44,190.00 44,190.00
Portion Size/oz 5.00 5.00

Sysco Gulf Coast Portions/Case 96 96
Geneva, AL Unit Price 0.2911 0.4166

Case Price 27.95 39.99
Extended Price 41,925.00 59,985.00

Pepperoni Pizza, Rounded Edge

5-With Comm. Proc 5-Without Comm. Proc



ITEM 
#0516680 #0516680

300 cs 300 cs
ITEM NUMBER

Portion Size/oz
Cheney Brothers Portions/Case No Bid No Bid
Ocala, FL Unit Price

Case Price
Extended Price
Portion Size/oz

US Food Service-Lakeland Portions/Case No Bid No Bid
Lakeland, FL Unit Price

Case Price
Extended Price
Portion Size/oz

Kelley Foods of Alabama Portions/Case No Bid No Bid
Elba, AL Unit Price

Case Price
Extended Price
Portion Size/oz

Nardone Bros. Baking Co. Portions/Case No Bid No Bid
Hanover, PA Unit Price

Case Price
Extended Price
Portion Size/oz

Schwan's Food Service, Inc. Portions/Case No Bid No Bid
Marshall, MN Unit Price

Case Price
Extended Price
Portion Size/oz 6.00

Sysco Gulf Coast Portions/Case No Bid 192
Geneva, AL Unit Price 0.1755

Case Price 33.70
Extended Price 10,110.00

Pizza Puff, Pepperoni

6-With Comm. Proc 6-Without Comm. Proc



ITEM 
#0516361 #0517030

4,000 lb 150 cs
ITEM NUMBER 7 8

Portion Size/oz
Cheney Brothers Portions/Case No Bid No Bid
Ocala, FL Unit Price

Case Price
Extended Price
Portion Size/oz

US Food Service-Lakeland Portions/Case No Bid No Bid
Lakeland, FL Unit Price

Case Price
Extended Price
Portion Size/oz

Kelley Foods of Alabama Portions/Case No Bid No Bid
Elba, AL Unit Price

Case Price
Extended Price
Portion Size/oz

Nardone Bros. Baking Co. Portions/Case No Bid No Bid
Hanover, PA Unit Price

Case Price
Extended Price
Portion Size/oz

Schwan's Food Service, Inc. Portions/Case No Bid No Bid
Marshall, MN Unit Price

Case Price
Extended Price
Portion Size/oz

Sysco Gulf Coast Portions/Case No Bid No Bid
Geneva, AL Unit Price

Case Price
Extended Price

Not Awarded Not Awarded
a = Alternate Product Bid
u = Product or Bid Not Acceptable
m = Minimum Order Bid

BID TABULATION, RECOMMENDATIONS, AND PROTEST
Bid tabulations with award recommendations are posted for 72 hours in the Purchasing
Department Office and are also posted to the School District's website address at

Failure to file a protest within the time prescribed in
Section 120.57(3) Florida Statutes, and School Board rules shall constitute a waiver of proceedings.
Bid tabulations or recommendations will be distributed solely through the Purchasing
website address. Notices will not be automatically mailed.

I hereby certify that the prices and bidders reflected herein are valid, and have been received
in compliance to Escambia County School Board Rules and Florida Law.

John Dombroskie, Director of Purchasing

http://old.escambia.k12.fl.us/adminoff/finance/purchasing/

Mozzarella Cheese String Cheese, low fat


