
 

 
 
 
DATE: BID TITLE & REFERENCE: 
October 1, 2010    Cafeteria Equipment, RFP #110603 
 
DESCRIPTION OF PURCHASE: 

 
An annual purchasing agreement to provide cafeteria equipment (24 items bid; 23 recommended for 
award).  Bid award(s) to the lowest bidder(s) meeting specifications.  District specifications for Item 
11 will be updated and this product obtained by quote or bid at a later date.  Items will be purchased 
on an as needed basis.   
 
Effective Dates:  October 20, 2010 through October 19, 2011. 
 
 
 
 

  
REQUESTED BY: 

 
Food Services 
 

 
PURPOSE OR END USE: 

 
For use in the preparation of meals in school cafeterias. 
 

    
SUPPLIER NAME:                 ITEMS:        ESTIMATED ANNUAL EXPENDITURE: 

 
Great Lakes Hotel Supply Co., Detroit, MI    1    $   4,700.00 
Kesco Kitchen Equipment, Pensacola, FL      8     62,500.00 
Mobile Fixture, Mobile, AL    10     71,100.00 
Strategic Equipment & Supply, Tampa, FL    4     15,300.00 

 
     
AMOUNT OF PURCHASE: FUNDING SOURCE: 

 
$153,600.00  Est./Yr.   Food Services Fund (4110) 
    

  
METHOD OF PROCUREMENT: 

 
ECSD Bid      Responses Received: 5       
    
  

DATE AND TIME POSTED: 
 
October 1, 2010,   3:30pm CST 
 

 
9500PUR101 (07/02) Retention - 5 Years 

 
THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY 

PURCHASING DEPARTMENT 
215 West Garden Street  

Pensacola, FL  32502 
 

BID AWARD NOTICE 



THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
215 WEST GARDEN STREET

PENSACOLA, FL  32502
BID TABULATION

DATE:  September 24, 2010
 Awarded Items are highlighted
BID NBR: 110603
BID TITLE: Cafeteria Equipment

ITEM Convection Convection Refrigerator, Utility
Oven, Gas Steamer, Gas 2 section cart, small

Quantity: 1 ea 1 ea 1 ea 6 ea

ITEM NUMBER 1 2 3 4
Kesco Kitchen Equipment 11,030.00     13,830.00     5,795.00       940.00           
Pensacola, Fl
Strategic Equipment & Supply 11,346.48     18,953.40     7,465.67       675.53           a
Tampa, FL u
Calico Industries, Inc. No bid No bid 5,468.00       a No bid
Annapolis Junction, MD u
Great Lakes Hotel Supply Co. 12,230.00     16,826.00     6,687.00       No bid
Detroit, Michigan
Mobile Fixture 11,241.42     14,969.86     7,893.25       988.20           
Mobile, AL

ITEM Utility Platform Platform Tray Dispenser
cart, large cart, small cart, large Cart

Quantity: 6 ea 6 ea 6 ea 4 ea

ITEM NUMBER 5 6 7 8
Kesco Kitchen Equipment 985.00          705.00          745.00          1,300.00        
Pensacola, Fl
Strategic Equipment & Supply 748.98          a 685.33          719.85          1,892.25        
Tampa, FL u
Calico Industries, Inc. No bid 794.00          914.00          No bid
Annapolis Junction, MD
Great Lakes Hotel Supply Co. No bid 1,390.00       a 1,460.00       a 1,909.00        
Detroit, Michigan u u
Mobile Fixture 1,018.44       715.53          837.65          No bid
Mobile, AL
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ITEM Mobile sheet Can opener, Food slicer,
electric Manual

Quantity: 1 ea 6 ea 1 ea 2 ea

ITEM NUMBER 9 10 11 12
Kesco Kitchen Equipment No bid 1,100.00       2,250.00       1,850.00        
Pensacola, Fl
Strategic Equipment & Supply 279.15          a 1,093.49       3,255.70       1,656.48        
Tampa, FL
Calico Industries, Inc. No bid 1,198.00       974.00          a 1,708.00        
Annapolis Junction, MD u
Great Lakes Hotel Supply Co. No bid 2,856.00       3,622.00       2,421.00        
Detroit, Michigan
Mobile Fixture 410.23          a 1,144.37       2,768.21       1,608.79        
Mobile, AL u

Not Awarded *
* District needs to revise specs.  Item not awarded.

ITEM

Quantity: 4 ea 4 ea 2 ea 4 ea

ITEM NUMBER 13 14 15 16
Kesco Kitchen Equipment 1,850.00       2,400.00       2,050.00       2,200.00        
Pensacola, Fl
Strategic Equipment & Supply 1,940.16       2,449.96       1,902.95       2,192.92        
Tampa, FL
Calico Industries, Inc. 2,024.00       2,508.00       1,944.00       2,274.00        
Annapolis Junction, MD
Great Lakes Hotel Supply Co. 2,711.00       3,210.00       2,632.00       2,942.00        
Detroit, Michigan
Mobile Fixture 1,916.48       2,382.67       1,835.00       2,157.95        
Mobile, AL

Milk cooler, single

Milk Cooler, doubleMilk Cooler, double
1,387 half pints 1,095 half pints

Milk Cooler, single
1,095 half pints

Milk Cooler, double

pan rack, side load 730 half pints

730 half pints
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ITEM Refrigerator/ Cold Cabinet Hot Cabinet Hot Cabinet
freezer, 2 sect. Low Cube lift High Cube Lift

Quantity: 1 ea 2 ea 4 ea 2 ea

ITEM NUMBER 17 18 19 20
Kesco Kitchen Equipment 7,700.00       5,100.00       2,700.00       3,295.00        
Pensacola, Fl
Strategic Equipment & Supply 9,634.46       5,244.66       2,755.27       3,294.29        
Tampa, FL
Calico Industries, Inc. 7,678.00       a 5,234.00       2,804.00       3,374.00        
Annapolis Junction, MD u
Great Lakes Hotel Supply Co. 8,766.00       5,855.00       3,408.00       3,998.00        
Detroit, Michigan
Mobile Fixture 8,394.00       5,006.99       2,618.46       2,755.46        
Mobile, AL

ITEM Hot Cabinet Refrigerator, Cook's/Work Cook's/Work
1 section table, 8ft table, 6ft

Quantity: 2 ea 1 ea 3 ea 3 ea

ITEM NUMBER 21 22 23 24
Kesco Kitchen Equipment 4,600.00       7,795.00       No bid No bid
Pensacola, Fl
Strategic Equipment & Supply 5,273.83       5,078.52       1,943.11       a 1,565.70        a
Tampa, FL u
Calico Industries, Inc. 4,878.00       4,194.00       a No bid No bid
Annapolis Junction, MD u
Great Lakes Hotel Supply Co. No Bid 4,733.00       2,968.00       a 2,768.00        a
Detroit, Michigan u
Mobile Fixture 4,573.51       5,153.69       1,960.09       1,675.81        
Mobile, AL

a = Alternate Product Bid
u = Alternate Product Not Acceptable
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BID TABULATION, RECOMMENDATIONS, AND PROTEST
Bid tabulations with award recommendations are posted for 72 hours in the Purchasing
Department Office and are also posted to the School District's website address at

Failure to file a protest within the time prescribed in
Section 120.57(3) Florida Statutes, and School Board Rules shall constitute a waiver of proceedings.
Bid tabulations or recommendations will be distributed solely through the Purchasing
website address. Notices will not be automatically mailed.

I hereby certify that the prices and bidders reflected herein are valid, and have been received
in compliance to Escambia County School Board Rules and Florida Law.

John Dombroskie, Director
Purchasing Department

http://old.escambia.k12.fl.us/adminoff/finance/purchasing/
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